

	Pace		RFQ# 424786												
WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL													
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified															
	SKU	Winning bid	Cummins	Interstate Power	A&A Auto	Filter Services	Muncie	Midwest Transit	P&G	Neopart	Kirks	Eldorado	Vehicle Maintenance	Mohawk	Aftermarket Parts
NO # of Bids															
4	130684	9.39		10.46			9.50							9.39	18.90
Mohawk	237596	-		stock			30d							4w	8w
3	290616	136.60					179.09			136.60					183.59
Neopart	237592	-					stock			6w					stock
2	250601	34.07								34.07					46.56
Neopart	237592	-								4w					5w
5	220080	3.08					3.08				11.45		9.91	193.73	3.50
Muncie	237591						30d				stock		stock	5w	stock
2	290590	21.64					21.64								25.90
Muncie	237591	-					stock								7w
3	290537	220.40					277.29			220.40					285.14
Neopart	237592	-					stock			6w					stock
2	250595	8.24								8.24					9.71
Neopart	237592	-								4w					6w
2	290289	14.03					38.39								14.03
Aftermarket Parts	237597	-					21d								stock
3	290643	14.11					21.21					18.67	14.11		
Vehicle Maintenance	237595	-					30d					3w	stock		
4	130611	152.71		467.09			466.06							152.71	593.61
Muncie	237591			stock			stock							unapproved part	5w
7	120488	21.06		22.54	21.19		22.99		22.12				21.06	21.93	35.92

	Pace		RFQ# 424786												
WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL													
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified															
	Sku	Winning bid	Cummins	Interstate Power	A&A Auto	Filter Services	Muncie	Midwest Transit	P&G	Neopart	Kirks	Eldorado	Vehicle Maintenance	Mohawk	Aftermarket Parts
NO # of Bids															
Vehicle Maintenance	237595			2w	2w		stock		stock				stock	stock	9w
1	250600	79.66								79.66					
Neopart	237592									4w					
3	290652	6.78					7.29			6.78					8.00
Neopart	237592						21d			4w					7w
4	120363	1.62	4.01				4.79							1.62	6.84
Cummins	237587	-	stock				21d							unapproved part	5w
7	110136	98.86		118.45	98.86		129.06		106.83			158.27	98.88		212.25
A&A Auto	237589			2w	2w		30d		stock			12w	stock		4w
3	290063	1.59					1.59							1.61	2.56
Muncie	237591						stock							stock	stock
4	290674	288.34					329.09			288.34		584.93			352.12
Neopart	237592	-					stock			4w		8w			stock
1	290675	36.43										36.43			
Eldorado	237594	-										5w			
1	290684	15.40										15.40			
Eldorado	237594	-										4w			
2	220391	5,700.00										5,700.00			5,855.41
Eldorado	237594	-										14w			13w
4	290690	580.00					789.12			613.95		580.00			842.47
Eldorado	237594	-					21d			6w		6w			9w

	Pace		RFQ# 424786												
WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL													
		0			0	0	0	0	0		0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified															
	SKU	Winning bid	Cummins	Interstate Power	A&A Auto	Filter Services	Muncie	Midwest Transit	P&G	Neopart	Kirks	Eldorado	Vehicle Maintenance	Mohawk	Aftermarket Parts
NO # of Bids															
3	290695	66.93					74.99					66.93			104.58
Eldorado	237594	-					stock					22w			stock
4	290696	28.50					37.97					28.75		30.89	28.50
Aftermarket Parts	237597	-					stock					18w		no lead time	stock
4	220419	3.93					4.18	4.25				3.93			4.18
Eldorado	237594	-					21d	2w				6w			stock
3	290700	212.11					212.11					213.08			266.62
Muncie	237591	-					stock					stock			stock
3	290701	211.11					211.11					211.55			266.62
Muncie	237591	-					stock					stock			16w
4	1110000	53.34			62.00		64.79						53.34		85.41
Vehicle Maintenance	237595	-			2w		30d						stock		5w
6	1210002	33.45		35.72	33.70		42.30						33.45	35.03	33.73
Vehicle Maintenance	237595	-		2w	2w		stock						stock	4w	2w
4	1210003	23.11			23.49		31.88						23.11		42.42
Muncie	237591	-			unapproved part		stock						unapproved part		9w
5	1210005	14.29			14.29		18.99						15.26	17.46	28.09
A&A Auto	237589	-			2w		stock						stock	no lead time	8w
2	1410000	882.86										888.85			882.86
Aftermarket Parts	237597	-										14w			stock
4	2910005	15.99					15.99			16.70		16.64			20.19

	Pace		RFQ# 424786													
WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL														
		0			0	0	0	0	0		0	0	0	0	0	
Green=Disqualified																
NO # of Bids		Sku	Winning bid	Cummins	Interstate Power	A&A Auto	Filter Services	Muncie	Midwest Transit	P&G	Neopart	Kirks	Eldorado	Vehicle Maintenance	Mohawk	Aftermarket Parts
4	2910025	745.04						949.79			747.13		745.04			1,015.82
Eldorado	237594	-						stock			6w		4w			stock
1	6710011	420.14														420.14
Aftermarket Parts	237597	-														10w
1	6710012	700.24														700.24
Aftermarket Parts	237597	-														14w
2	1210078	1,104.29											1,104.29			1,436.64
Eldorado	237594	-											12w			stock
1	6710014	1,150.97														1,150.97
Aftermarket Parts	237597	-														7w
2	2910031	444.49						444.49								449.72
Muncie	237591	-						stock								stock
3	1010048	699.99	886.54					699.99								1,111.00
Muncie	237591	-	stock					90d								9w
4	1210096	168.43	168.43					204.47							209.09	230.79
Cummins	237587	-	stock					30d							4w	stock
2	2910036	98.16						98.16								104.82
Muncie	237591	-						stock								stock
3	1010052	140.39	140.39					169.87								192.38
Cummins	237591	-	stock					30d								stock
4	1010054	5.99	13.38					16.94				5.99				18.07

[illegible]

	Pace		RFQ# 424786												
WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL													
		0			0	0	0	0	0		0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified															
Sku		Winning bid	Cummins	Interstate Power	A&A Auto	Filter Services	Muncie	Midwest Transit	P&G	Neopart	Kirks	Eldorado	Vehicle Maintenance	Mohawk	Aftermarket Parts
NO # of Bids															
		-													
3	2110217	135.90					135.90	144.17							169.71
Muncie	237591	-					60d	10w							28 ONLY, need 30