

Pace		RFQ# 424784									
WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL									
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified											
Sku		Winning bid	Cummins	Interstate Power	Neopart	Kirks	Aftermarket Parts	Muncie	Vehicle Maintenance	Eldorado	Mohawk
NO # of Bids											
1	71733	98.38					98.38				
Aftermarket Parts	237581	-					stock				
1	180651	57.11					57.11				
Aftermarket Parts	237581	-					15w				
3	151458	237.21					314.14	245.21		237.21	
Eldorado	237585	-					stock	stock		9w	
5	71441	7.87				10.68	16.34	8.55		13.56	7.87
Mohawk	237586					stock	26w	stock		stock	stock
4	72143	11.00			12.76		15.12	14.41		11.00	
Eldorado	237585	-			10w		11w	stock		12w	
1	160590	10.36								10.36	
Eldorado	237585	-								stock	
3	160600	11.56					15.89	13.39		11.56	
Eldorado	237585	-					6w	stock		stock	
3	151457	237.21					314.14	241.75		237.21	

Pace		RFQ# 424784									
WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL									
		0			0	0	0	0	0		0
Green=Disqualified											
Sku		Winning bid	Cummins	Interstate Power	Neopart	Kirks	Aftermarket Parts	Muncie	Vehicle Maintenance	Eldorado	Mohawk
NO # of Bids											
Eldorado		237585	-				7w	stock		10w	
4	72142	11.17			11.47		15.09	12.43		11.17	
Eldorado		237585	-		10w		stock	stock		12w	
3	72058	9.08					14.12		9.08	36.05	
Vehicle Maintenance		237584					stock		stock	10w	
2	72077	42.77						99.79		42.77	
Eldorado		237585						stock		6w	
3	160690	347.51					398.30	347.51		441.01	
Muncie		237583					stock	90d		8w	
4	71179	0.64					1.17	0.67		0.73	0.64
Mohawk		237586					stock	stock		stock	stock
5	72094	23.53					23.61	27.78	23.53	23.73	28.83
Vehicle Maintenance		237584	-				5w	30d	stock	3w	3w
4	71442	7.30					12.99	8.90		12.37	7.30
Mohawk		237586					14w	30d		5w	stock

		Pace		RFQ# 424784								
WHITE=NO BID			TOTAL									
		0			0	0	0	0	0		0	
Green=Disqualified												
NO # of Bids		Sku	Winning bid	Cummins	Interstate Power	Neopart	Kirks	Aftermarket Parts	Muncie	Vehicle Maintenance	Eldorado	Mohawk
5	70908	3.05			5.50			3.98	3.05	3.77		3.12
Mohawk	237586				3w			4w	MOQ requirement	stock		stock
4	180661	82.75						82.75	114.46		126.10	264.75
Aftermarket Parts	237582	-						stock	stock		14w	5w
2	71001	0.50						0.50	0.76			
Aftermarket Parts	237582	-						stock	stock			
2	72109	1,928.70						2,842.86			1,928.70	
Eldorado	237585	-						13w			stock	
1	151960	5.27									5.27	
Eldorado	237585	-									stock	
4	72156	24.05			39.64			45.90	46.46		24.05	
Eldorado	237585	-			10w			8w	stock		12w	
4	72162	24.68						42.51	38.48		24.68	40.18
Eldorado	237585	-						stock	stock		10w	5w

Pace		RFQ# 424784									
WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL									
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified											
Sku		Winning bid	Cummins	Interstate Power	Neopart	Kirks	Aftermarket Parts	Muncie	Vehicle Maintenance	Eldorado	Mohawk
NO # of Bids											
Eldorado		237585	-							4w	
3	170715	842.00					1,118.46	947.38		842.00	
Eldorado		237585	-				7w	30d		8w	
2	170716	1,291.01						1,299.98		1,291.01	
Eldorado		237585	-					30d		8w	
3	170718	78.59					112.40	83.66		78.59	
Eldorado		237585	-				7w	stock		6w	
1	1710010	262.41					262.41				
Aftermarket Parts		237582	-				3 ONLY, need 5				
3	1710014	26.00					36.85	29.94		26.00	
Eldorado		237585	-				stock	stock		6w	
1	710008	101.72								101.72	
Eldorado		237585	-							6w	
2	1510007	21.04					21.04			28.05	
Aftermarket Parts		237582	-				30 ONLY, need 40			stock	

		Pace	RFQ# 424784									
WHITE=NO BID			TOTAL									
			0			0	0	0	0	0	0	
Green=Disqualified												
		Sku	Winning bid	Cummins	Interstate Power	Neopart	Kirks	Aftermarket Parts	Muncie	Vehicle Maintenance	Eldorado	Mohawk
NO # of Bids												
4	710019	112.20						201.10	143.52		137.14	112.20
Mohawk	237586	-						5w	30d		4w	stock
1	710021	74.67									74.67	
Eldorado	237585	-									stock	
1	710022	8.61									8.61	
Eldorado	237585	-									stock	
3	710026	549.15						549.15			550.00	550.73
Aftermarket Parts	237582	-						6w			18w	stock
2	710027	46.94						55.89	46.94			
Muncie	237583	-						8w	stock			
1	710029	22.14									22.14	
Eldorado	237585	-									4w	
1	710038	69.54						69.54				
Aftermarket Parts	237582	-						10w				

Pace		RFQ# 424784									
WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL									
		0			0	0	0	0	0		0
Green=Disqualified											
Sku		Winning bid	Cummins	Interstate Power	Neopart	Kirks	Aftermarket Parts	Muncie	Vehicle Maintenance	Eldorado	Mohawk
NO # of Bids											
4	710134	373.00	673.75			373.00	406.43	790.26			
Kirks	237581	-	stock			stock	stock	30d			
4	710149	610.89		668.78			1,546.60	610.89			641.32
Muncie	237583	-		stock			7w	stock			5w
1	710153	480.67					480.67				
Aftermarket Parts	237582	-					stock				
1	710154	7.60								7.60	
Eldorado	237585	-								4w	
3	710166	361.51	361.51				901.40	374.11			
Cummins	237580	-	stock				5w	30d			
1	1610086	320.00								320.00	
Eldorado	237585	-								8w	
3	710216	2.50					5.55		4.56		2.50
Vehicle Maintenance	237584	-					18w		stock		unapproved part

		Pace	RFQ# 424784									
WHITE=NO BID			TOTAL									
			0		0	0	0	0	0	0	0	
Green=Disqualified												
		Sku	Winning bid	Cummins	Interstate Power	Neopart	Kirks	Aftermarket Parts	Muncie	Vehicle Maintenance	Eldorado	Mohawk
NO # of Bids												
3	710233	49.14						232.32		78.86	49.14	
Eldorado	237585	-						11w		stock	stock	
1	1510208	28.78						28.78				
Aftermarket Parts	237582	-						stock				
1	710247	613.67									613.67	
Eldorado	237585	-									10w	
1	710278	1,983.93									1,983.93	
Eldorado	237585	-									10w	
2	1710082	58.28						71.67	58.28			
Muncie	237583	-						5w	30d			
-	710304	-										
		-										
1	1710095	7,067.80						7,067.80				
Aftermarket Parts	237582	-						stock				
2	710315	26.48								47.50	26.48	

