O pace
Connecting Communities

NOTE: Information contained within this document is a result of the public opening and
reading of bids. Award information announcing the lowest responsive and responsible
bidder(s) will be posted on Pace's website under the "Awarded Bids" page after

Bid Tabulation

determination of the lowest responsive and responsible bid(s).

Bid Solicitation Date

6/30/2025

IFB No:
424018

Bid Opening Time
2:00 PM

Bid Opening Date
7/29/2025

_ o Name(S)

Kaplan Paving, LLC

Arctic Snow & Ice Control, Inc.

Polar Group LLC

Campos Landscaping LLC

Line Qty Item Description Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total
1 1 Group 1 Grand Total - Plainfield Division 634986.00 | $ 634,986.00 | 163586.00 | $ 163,586.00 | 215940.00 | $ 215,940.00 No Bid No Bid
2 1 Group 2 Grand Total - West Division 238764.00 | $§ 238,764.00 | 132411.00 | $132,411.00 [ 215940.00 | $§ 215,940.00 No Bid No Bid
3 1 Group 3 Grand Total - South Division 266781.00 | $§ 266,781.00 | 155886.00 | $ 155,886.00 [ 215940.00 | $§ 215,940.00 [ 1353293.00 | $ 1,353,293.00
4 1 Group 4 Grand Total - North Shore Division 175599.00 | $ 175,599.00 89696.00 $ 89,696.00 | 122838.75 | $ 122,838.75 No Bid No Bid
5 1 Group 5 Grand Total - Northwest Division 177117.00 | $ 177,117.00 83444.00 $ 83,444.00 | 122838.75 | $ 122,838.75 No Bid No Bid
6 1 Group 6 Grand Total - South Campus 358455.00 358,455.00 | 281819.00 | $281,819.00 | 232028.75 232,028.75 | 2652954.00 | $ 2,652,954.00

Total Bid Amount
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O pace
Connecting Communities

Bid Tabulation

NOTE: Information contained within this document is a result of the public opening and
reading of bids. Award information announcing the lowest responsive and responsible
bidder(s) will be posted on Pace's website under the "Awarded Bids" page after
determination of the lowest responsive and responsible bid(s).

Bid Solicitation Date IFB No: Bid Opening Time | Bid Opening Date
6/30/2025 424018 2:00 PM 7/29/2025
_ Bidder Name(s) Shigizfsir:’i)ifgns Snowpusher Inc. Winter Services LLC Mark 1 Landscape, Inc.
Line Qty Item Description Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total
1 1 Group 1 Grand Total - Plainfield Division No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 156150.00 | $ 156,150.00 | 439590.00 439,590.00
2 1 Group 2 Grand Total - West Division No Bid No Bid 103111.00 | $ 103,111.00 117075.00 | $ 117,075.00 | 337260.00 337,260.00
3 1 Group 3 Grand Total - South Division No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 130845.00 | $ 130,845.00 No Bid No Bid
4 1 Group 4 Grand Total - North Shore Division No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 116160.00 | $ 116,160.00 No Bid No Bid
5 1 Group 5 Grand Total - Northwest Division No Bid No Bid 78422.00 $ 78,422.00 85350.00 $ 85,350.00 | 255345.00 255,345.00
6 1 Group 6 Grand Total - South Campus 444150.00 | $ 444,150.00 No Bid No Bid 215400.00 | $ 215,400.00 No Bid No Bid
Total Bid Amount [T s 1000 UMY s +5+.55 oo (HRTAIRTATATAIY s s20.950 0o MM s 1.052.195.00
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O pace
Connecting Communities

NOTE: Information contained within this document is a result of the public opening and
reading of bids. Award information announcing the lowest responsive and responsible
bidder(s) will be posted on Pace's website under the "Awarded Bids" page after

Bid Tabulation

determination of the lowest responsive and responsible bid(s).

Bid Solicitation Date IFB No: Bid Opening Time | Bid Opening Date
6/30/2025 424018 2:00 PM 7/29/2025

_ Bidder Name(s) HLS, Inc. Paw Palace Enterprises Snow ag:nll?segalzigemem Semper Fi Land Services, Inc.

Line Qty Item Description Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total
1 1 Group 1 Grand Total - Plainfield Division No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 144855.00 | $ 144,855.00 | 317400.00 | $ 317,400.00

2 1 Group 2 Grand Total - West Division 172500.00 | $ 172,500.00 No Bid No Bid 105480.00 | $ 105,480.00 No Bid No Bid

3 1 Group 3 Grand Total - South Division 198300.00 | $ 198,300.00 136620.00 | $ 136,620.00 184230.00 | $ 184,230.00 No Bid No Bid

4 1 Group 4 Grand Total - North Shore Division No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 56580.00 $ 56,580.00 No Bid No Bid

5 1 Group 5 Grand Total - Northwest Division No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 55170.00 $ 55,170.00 No Bid No Bid

6 1 Group 6 Grand Total - South Campus 228900.00 | $228,900.00 No Bid No Bid 175140.00 | $ 175,140.00 No Bid No Bid
Total Bid Amount [ s soo.7o0 oo MM s +56.c20 oo HIIHIEIAINIIEL s -1.¢55 oo IMAHTAINIL s =17.400.00
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