
IFB No: Bid Opening Time Bid Opening Date

Bidder Name(s)

Line Qty Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total

1 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 783709.68 783,709.68$    127728.00 127,728.00$  

2 1 No Bid No Bid 201040.00 201,040.00$  1281557.88 1,281,557.88$ 188892.00 188,892.00$  

3 -$               -$               -$                 -$               

4 -$               -$               -$                 -$               

5 -$               -$               -$                 -$               

6 -$               -$               -$                 -$               

7 -$               -$               -$                 -$               

8 -$               -$               -$                 -$               

9 -$               -$               -$                 -$               

10 -$               -$               -$                 -$               

11 -$               -$               -$                 -$               

No Bid 201,040.00$  2,065,267.56$ 316,620.00$  

Bid Tabulation

4/4/2025 423770 2:00 PM

Eco Clean Maintenance, Inc.

Bid Solicitation Date

5/30/2025

NOTE:  Information contained within this document is a result of the public opening and 
reading of bids.  Award information announcing the lowest responsive and responsible 
bidder(s) will be posted on Pace's website under the "Awarded Bids" page after 
determination of the lowest responsive and responsible bid(s).  

Total Bid Amount

Make A Wish Home Care 
LLC

ECR Professional Services, 
LLC DE Cleaning Service, Inc.

South Region

Item Description

North Region
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IFB No: Bid Opening Time Bid Opening Date

Bidder Name(s)

Line Qty

1 1

2 1
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Bid Tabulation

4/4/2025 423770 2:00 PM

Bid Solicitation Date

5/30/2025

NOTE:  Information contained within this document is a result of the public opening and 
reading of bids.  Award information announcing the lowest responsive and responsible 
bidder(s) will be posted on Pace's website under the "Awarded Bids" page after 
determination of the lowest responsive and responsible bid(s).  

Total Bid Amount

South Region

Item Description

North Region

Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total

49608.00 49,608.00$    516960 516,960.00$     85140.00 85,140.00$    79200 79,200.00$    

124020.00 124,020.00$  708360 708,360.00$     163440.00 163,440.00$  No Bid No Bid

-$               -$                  -$               -$               

-$               -$                  -$               -$               

-$               -$                  -$               -$               

-$               -$                  -$               -$               

-$               -$                  -$               -$               

-$               -$                  -$               -$               

-$               -$                  -$               -$               

-$               -$                  -$               -$               

-$               -$                  -$               -$               

173,628.00$  1,225,320.00$  248,580.00$  79,200.00$    

Wiley's Lawn Care, LLC Cosmopolitan Building 
Services, Inc. Best Quality CleaningSynergy Development Limited

August 2015 Revision 1 2 of 3



IFB No: Bid Opening Time Bid Opening Date

Bidder Name(s)

Line Qty

1 1

2 1

3

4

5

6
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8
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11

Bid Tabulation

4/4/2025 423770 2:00 PM

Bid Solicitation Date

5/30/2025

NOTE:  Information contained within this document is a result of the public opening and 
reading of bids.  Award information announcing the lowest responsive and responsible 
bidder(s) will be posted on Pace's website under the "Awarded Bids" page after 
determination of the lowest responsive and responsible bid(s).  

Total Bid Amount

South Region

Item Description

North Region

Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total

92430.00 92,430.00$    83160.00 83,160.00$    

149058.00 149,058.00$  160020.00 160,020.00$  

-$               -$               

-$               -$               

-$               -$               

-$               -$               

-$               -$               

-$               -$               

-$               -$               

-$               -$               

-$               -$               

241,488.00$  243,180.00$  

Vega Building Maintenance 
and Supply, Inc. Paw Palace Enterprise
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