Opoce Bid Tabulation

Connecting Communifies

NOTE: Information contained within this document is a result of the public opening and
reading of bids. Award information announcing the lowest responsive and responsible
bidder(s) will be posted on Pace's website under the "Awarded Bids" page after
determination of the lowest responsive and responsible bid(s).

Bid Solicitation Date IFB No: Bid Opening Time | Bid Opening Date
8/30/2023 422384 2:00 PM 9/25/2023
_ Bidder Name(s) Cumrgiglse,slr;(;ddgzratég]mins Interstate Power Systems, Inc. Chandler Services, Inc.
Line Qty Item Description Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total

1 1 Grand Total for Group 1 Cummins Diesel Engnes 355976.00 | $355,976.00 | 408848.00 | $ 408,848.00 | 352580.00 | $ 352,580.00

2 $ - $ - $

3 1 Grand Total for Group 2 - Cummins GNC Engines 358176.00 | $ 358,176.00 No Bid No Bid 352580.00 | $ 352,580.00

4 $ - $ - $

5 1 Grand Total for Group 3 - Allison Transmissions in Diesel Buses No Bid No Bid 379148.00 $ 379,148.00 352580.00 $ 352,580.00

6 $ $ - $

7 1 Grand Total for Group 4 - Allison Transmissions in CNG Buses No Bid No Bid 379148.00 $ 379,148.00 352580.00 $ 352,580.00

8 $ $ $

9 $ $ $

10 $ $ $

11 $ $ $

12 $ $ $

13 $ $ $

14 $ $ $

15 $ $ $

16 $ $ $

17 $ $ $

18 $ $ $

19 $ $ $

20 $ $ $

21 $ $ $

22 $ $ $

23 $ $ $

24 $ - $ - $ -

25 $ - $ - $ -
Total Bid Amount MY s 7+e.152 oo CMINININIAINIL s +.ve7.122.00 (UATMIATATIY s +.410.520.00
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