Due 05/25/23 @

3:00 PM Pace RFQ# 422539
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
_
Sku Winning bid | Vehicle P&G Battery | Interstate | Muncie Kirks Neopart Illinois Gillig Aftermarket | Mohawk | Eldorado Filter
Maintenance Service |Power - NO Auto Parts Services
NO # of Bids ~NOBID BID
220309 46.96 46.96 55.80 52.22
Muncie 234187 - 45d 4w stock
70629 0.77 1.05 3.83 1.84 0.77
Mohawk 234189 - 45d 4w stock stock
290536 94.00 109.32 97.20 94.00 119.68
Gillig 234186 - 21d 3w stock 3w
180359 60.83 147.32 162.35 60.83
unapproved
Gillig 234186 12w 11w part
71441 6.65 6.65 10.25 7.08 15.14 7.42 17.95
Muncie 234187 - stock 4w stock 19w 4w stock
220340 761.57 790.42 829.00 761.57 1,277.36
Aftermarket Parts 234188 - 90d 16w stock stock
72143 11.25 13.00 12.55 11.25 12.30 19.31
Gillig 234186 - stock A stock stock stock
290653 18.99 22.45 18.99 26.16 43.42
unapproved
Gillig 234186 - stock stock stock part
70958 6.09 6.09 6.67
Aftermarket Parts 234188 - 7w stock




Due 05/25/23 @

3:00 PM Pace RFQ# 422539

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

Sku Winning bid | Vehicle P&G Battery | Interstate | Muncie Kirks Neopart Illinois Gillig Aftermarket | Mohawk | Eldorado Filter
Maintenance Service |Power - NO Auto Parts Services
NO # of Bids ~NOBID BID
290537 187.00 211.89 191.18 187.00 235.40
Gillig 234186 45d 3w stock stock
290643 13.89 13.89 27.03
Muncie 234187 30d 4w
150830 0.30 0.30 0.67 2.07 0.31
Muncie 234187 stock stock 7w stock
160596 170.94 191.77 170.94 227.71
Gillig 234186 60d stock stock
72135 57.63 75.71 69.09 57.63 65.61 128.06
Gillig 234186 - 75d 7W stock stock 2w
290540 125.71 261.92 125.71 165.32
Neopart 234184 45d 3w 3w
71442 6.77 6.77 15.14 7.30 17.95
Muncie 234187 30d 19w 30d stock
160700 120.27 123.43 120.27
Aftermarket Parts 234188 - stock stock
72156 21.99 23.00 21.99 27.67
Neopart 234184 - 45d 7w 10w




Due 05/25/23 @

3:00 PM Pace RFQ# 422539
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
_
Sku Winning bid | Vehicle P&G Battery | Interstate | Muncie Kirks Neopart Illinois Gillig Aftermarket | Mohawk | Eldorado Filter
Maintenance Service |Power - NO Auto Parts Services
NO # of Bids ~NOBID BID
72170 33.66 33.66 49.47 79.72
Muncie 234187 - 90d 16w 8w
72171 33.66 33.66 52.23 37.30
Muncie 234187 - 90d 16w stock
72172 33.66 33.66 47.07 72.83
Muncie 234187 - 90d Ow 6w
151975 1,208.40 1,208.40 1,521.40 2,315.93
Muncie 234187 - 37d 6w 6w
72216 169.67 169.67 285.27 383.01
Gillig 234186 - stock stock stock
152033 172.42 172.42 231.25 298.16
Muncie 234187 - stock S5w stock
72256 9.22 9.22
Aftermarket Parts 234188 - stock
211079 1,825.77 1,825.77
Aftermarket Parts 234188 - 17w
250764 /71.51 30.43 82.28 /71.51
Aftermarket Parts 234188 - 10d 2W stock




Due 05/25/23 @

3:00 PM Pace RFQ# 422539
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
_
Sku Winning bid | Vehicle P&G Battery | Interstate | Muncie Kirks Neopart Illinois Gillig Aftermarket | Mohawk | Eldorado Filter
Maintenance Service |Power - NO Auto Parts Services
NO # of Bids ~NOBID BID
160899 82.19 82.19
Eldorado 234183 - 8w
72301 338.00 339.97 338.00 595.75
Kirks 234185 - 3w stock 7w
290696 9.60 29.15 32.30 28.38 9.60 53.94
unapproved
Aftermarket Parts 234188 - stock stock stock part 16w
170715 781.41 799.88 781.41 913.91
Gillig 234186 - 30d 5w stock
170716 1,149.00 1,149.00 1,200.00 1,725.96
Muncie 234187 - 30d Sw stock
72388 39.50 79.51 73.13 39.50 69.67 41.62 101.74
Gillig 234186 - stock 7W stock stock stock 12w
170720 -
170722 88.41 207.77 88.41
Eldorado 234183 - 30d 2W
1710000 630.64 630.64
Aftermarket Parts 234188 - stock




Due 05/25/23 @
3:00 PM Pace RFQ# 422539

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

_
Sku Winning bid | Vehicle P&G Battery | Interstate | Muncie Kirks Neopart Illinois Gillig Aftermarket | Mohawk | Eldorado Filter
Maintenance Service |Power - NO Auto Parts Services

NO # of Bids ~NOBID BID

1| 1710010 262.41 262.41
Aftermarket Parts 234188 - 15w

4 710007 17.92 17.92 20.52 31.31 32.66

no lead

Muncie 234187 - stock 4w time given stock

1| 1510004 253.08 253.08
Eldorado 234183 - stock

3| 1610016 295.78 341.78 295.78 400.74
Gillig 234186 - 30d stock stock

3| 1610017 145.42 166.76 145.42 195.36
Gillig 234186 - stock stock stock

2| 1510008 20.03 20.03 26.64
Aftermarket Parts 234188 - 6w 2W

2| 2110015 569.90 569.90 1,652.96
P&G 234191 - stock 2W

3| 1610051 21.95 24.15 21.95 27.54
Gillig 234186 - stock stock stock

6| 2110021 474.21 534.50 474.21 479.39 543.44 693.05 494.00
Neopart 234184 - stock stock 2w stock stock stock




Due 05/25/23 @

3:00 PM Pace RFQ# 422539
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
_
Sku Winning bid | Vehicle P&G Battery | Interstate | Muncie Kirks Neopart Illinois Gillig Aftermarket | Mohawk | Eldorado Filter
Maintenance Service |Power - NO Auto Parts Services
NO # of Bids ~NOBID BID
2910007 64.13 64.13 33.82
Aftermarket Parts 234188 - stock 16w
2110037 320.00 320.00 2,574.45 6/8.32
P&G 234191 - stock Ow 21d
710105 1,011.71 1,011.71
Eldorado 234183 - 12w
1510062 35.03 35.03
Eldorado 234183 - stock
1810033 .
710130 336.67 336.67
Eldorado 234183 - 12w
1510115 45.55 45.55
Aftermarket Parts 234188 - stock
2110074 2,233.24 2,541.18 2,233.24
lllinois Auto 234198 - 45d 8w
2510067 936.71 975.57 936.71| 1,281.21
Gillig 234186 - 10d 2W W




Due 05/25/23 @
3:00 PM Pace RFQ# 422539

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

_
Sku Winning bid | Vehicle P&G Battery | Interstate | Muncie Kirks Neopart Illinois Gillig Aftermarket | Mohawk | Eldorado Filter
Maintenance Service |Power - NO Auto Parts Services

NO # of Bids ~NOBID BID

3| 2210028 372.75 372.75 517.25 1,222.06
Muncie 234187 - 77d stock 20w

2| 2210030 212.79 212.79 271.91
Muncie 234187 - 60d 10w

2| 2510073 232.29 232.29 277.50
Gillig 234186 - bw 11w

2| 1610106 6.41 6.99 6.41
Aftermarket Parts 234188 - 6w 13w

3 710241 37.20 39.00 49.85 37.20
Aftermarket Parts 234188 - 30d 6w 13w

3 710260 540.46 561.00 540.46 737.26
Gillig 234186 - 60d 12w 14w

1| 1610134 1.13 1.13
Aftermarket Parts 234188 - 5w

1| 2310001 66.13 66.13
Aftermarket Parts 234188 - 20w

2| 1610160 134.32 134.32 213.11
Gillig 234186 - bw 21w




Due 05/25/23 @

3:00 PM Pace RFQ# 422539
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
_
Sku Winning bid | Vehicle P&G Battery | Interstate | Muncie Kirks Neopart Illinois Gillig Aftermarket | Mohawk | Eldorado Filter
Maintenance Service |Power - NO Auto Parts Services
NO # of Bids ~NOBID BID
1610161 77.33 77.33 96.47 153.05
Muncie 234187 - 30d 6w 10w
1510231 -
1610185 17.23 20.89 17.23
Aftermarket Parts 234188 - stock stock
1610186 232.54 238.66 232.54
Aftermarket Parts 234188 - stock stock
710366 334.77 334.77
Eldorado 234183 - 6w
710439 130.50 130.50
Eldorado 234183 - stock
710446 575.97 575.97
Eldorado 234183 - 6w
1810103 93.60 93.60
Gillig 234186 - stock
710461 4.89 26.60 4.89
Aftermarket Parts 234188 - 30d stock




Due 05/25/23 @
3:00 PM Pace RFQ# 422539

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

Sku Winning bid | Vehicle P&G Battery | Interstate | Muncie Kirks Neopart Illinois Gillig Aftermarket | Mohawk | Eldorado Filter

Maintenance Service |Power - NO Auto Parts Services

NO # of Bids -NOBID BID

1| 1810108 10.71 10.71

Aftermarket Parts 234188 - 5w

- 170539 -

- 71641 =

- 1710004 -

1| 2110016 3.25 3.25

Filter Services 234199 - 60d

- 710097 -

1 710297 228.36 228.36

Eldorado 234183 - 4w

- 710345 -

1| 2510207 659.24 659.24

Aftermarket Parts 234188 - 7w




Due 05/25/23 @
3:00 PM Pace RFQ# 422539

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

Sku Winning bid | Vehicle P&G Battery | Interstate | Muncie Kirks Neopart Illinois Gillig Aftermarket | Mohawk | Eldorado Filter
Maintenance Service |Power - NO Auto Parts Services
NO # of Bids ~NOBID BID

- 110142 -




	422539

