Due 05/25/23 @

3:00 PM Pace RFQ# 422537
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL ..
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
I N
Sku Winning bid Vehicle P&G Illinois A&A Auto Rome Neopart | Interstate Kirks CBM Crossline | Cummins | Suburban Gillig Eldorado |Aftermarket| Coffman Muncie Mohawk
Maintenance Auto - NO Truck - NO Power Truck Parts
NO # of Bids BID BID
3 60734 2.67 4.17 5.42 2.67
Muncie 234187 - stock stock 30d
9 81262 6.28 6.28 6.59 12.28 7.56 8.17 10.77 7.09 6.99 6.95
Vehicle Maintenance 234190 - stock 2W 3w stock stock stock stock stock stock
4 81063 8.11 8.30 8.11 8.35 9.99
Aftermarket Parts 234188 - 3d stock stock 30d
1 110135 50.76 50.76
Eldorado 234183 stock
10 120488 20.23 20.23 21.00 31.63 21.56 25.00 21.56 32.31 21.01 20.99 20.48
Vehicle Maintenance 234190 - stock 2W 3w stock stock stock Ow stock 30d 30d
8 60494 12.49 12.49 22.64 13.76 13.76 24.08 12.98 14.23 13.04
A&A Auto 234192 - 2W 3w stock stock 4w stock 30d 30d
3 60375 8.47 46.38 8.47 37.29
Muncie 234187 - 14w 60d 30d
8 110136 96.00 96.00 146.43 103.52 107.00 214.98 107.17 103.50 99.18
A&A Auto 234192 - 2W 3w stock stock stock 4w 30d 30d
3 110058 3.34 8.16 6.69 3.34
Mohawk 234189 - stock 30d stock
3 60748 71.22 78.90 72.68 71.22
Muncie 234187 stock stock 60d
7 100223 60.27 78.40 74.00 123.22 174.82 122.14 140.20 60.27
unapproved
Crossline 234193 stock stock stock stock stock stock part
3 120502 117.61 117.61 148.14 135.00
Gillig 234186 stock 11w stock
1 60770 73.92 73.92




Due 05/25/23 @

3:00 PM Pace RFQ# 422537
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
I I .
Sku Winning bid Vehicle P&G Illinois A&A Auto Rome Neopart | Interstate Kirks CBM Crossline | Cummins | Suburban Gillig Eldorado |Aftermarket| Coffman Muncie Mohawk
Maintenance Auto - NO Truck - NO Power Truck Parts
NO # of Bids BID BID
Eldorado 234183 20w
4 81378 21.47 44.00 81.62 27.57 21.47
bid 23,
Mohawk 234189 - 1w stock need 25 stock
7 100226 1,115.00 1,120.00 1,115.00 2,512.32 3,597.68| 2,487.28| 3,305.36 | 1,170.00
Kirks 234185 10d stock 3d Ow stock 30d 2W
7 100227 878.00 891.87 878.00 1,563.32 2,079.10| 1,547.84| 1,808.97 | 1,035.12
Kirks 234185 10d stock 3d 12w stock 30d 2W
1 60772 37.97 37.97
Eldorado 234183 - 4w
5 81409 25.49 45.70 48.97 45.39 43.46 25.49
unapproved
Muncie 234187 - stock stock stock stock part
4 81441 45.07 55.19 99.02 62.12 45.07
unapproved
Cummins 234194 - 3d stock stock part
5 81444 59.40 73.44 71.50 90.63 79.99 59.40
Mohawk 234189 - 4w 2W 8w 60d stock
4 120542 56.49 56.80 85.04 56.49 66.96
Coffman 234196 - stock 11w stock 30d
7 81519 84.00 105.82 84.00 85.00 146.44 95.75 88.01 102.33
Kirks 234185 - stock stock stock stock stock stock stock
10 81521 19.19 19.19 33.27 23.20 25.25 23.20 33.25 33.71 22.18 19.35 20.65
Vehicle Maintenance 234190 - stock 3w stock stock stock stock stock stock stock stock
3 81534 39.00 39.00 94.43 44.03
A&A Auto 234192 - 2W stock 15w
7| 1210003 23.20 23.20 23.86 37.25 37.89 24.93 28.90 24.27
Vehicle Maintenance 234190 - stock stock stock stock stock stock stock




Due 05/25/23 @

3:00 PM Pace RFQ# 422537
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sku Winning bid Vehicle P&G Illinois A&A Auto Rome Neopart | Interstate Kirks CBM Crossline | Cummins | Suburban Gillig Eldorado |Aftermarket| Coffman Muncie Mohawk
Maintenance Auto - NO Truck - NO Power Truck Parts
NO # of Bids BID BID
810007 395.37 395.37 555.00 514.25 588.69 551.75
P&G 234191 - stock stock stock stock 30d
810010 284.59 371.37 339.00 727.86 284.59 1,087.14 720.73 837.95
Suburban Truck 234195 - 4w stock stock stock 5w stock 30d
1010007 318.48 318.48
Eldorado 234183 - 20w
1010003 11.99 16.25 34.79 57.89 24.59 39.62 11.99
no lead unapproved
Kirks 234185 - stock 3d time given stock 30d part
610018 19.60 50.76 72.14 52.01 57.90 19.60
unapproved
Cummins 234194 - 3d 5w stock 30d part
610019 80.50 94.12 80.50 190.69 132.65 194.89 227.25 235.74
Kirks 234185 - 5w stock 4d 7w stock 30d 3w
810027 653.11 848.85 658.84 876.39 653.11 750.50
Coffman 234196 - 6w 3d Ow stock 30d
610026 120.19 120.19 128.65 124.48 349.00 388.27 580.10 382.64 168.85 125.43
unapproved
Neopart 234184 - 4w stock stock stock stock stock stock stock part
1010015 987.00 1,035.25 987.00 1,763.72 2,499.47 | 1,746.28| 2,079.85| 1,193.00
Kirks 234185 - 10d stock 3d 13w stock 21d stock
610028 32.00 59.95 32.00 94.02 110.03 49.67 61.25 38.35
unapproved unapproved
Coffman 234196 - stock part stock stock stock stock part
610036 2,100.00 2,100.00 3,858.09
unapproved
Eldorado 234183 - part 16w
610051 2.06 2.06 2.36 2.60
Cummins 234194 - 4d stock 30d
810060 25.49 52.06 38.00 45.65 64.97 45.39 43.46 25.49




Due 05/25/23 @

3:00 PM Pace RFQ# 422537
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL ..
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
ENER .
Sku Winning bid Vehicle P&G Illinois A&A Auto Rome Neopart | Interstate Kirks CBM Crossline | Cummins | Suburban Gillig Eldorado |Aftermarket| Coffman Muncie Mohawk
Maintenance Auto - NO Truck - NO Power Truck Parts
NO # of Bids BID BID
unapproved
Crossline 234193 - stock stock stock stock stock stock part
810064 5,155.65 5,972.83| 5,155.65
Coffman 234196 - stock stock
810068 28.80 50.00 67.06 95.31 66.19 28.80
unapproved no lead
Mohawk 234189 - part 5d 8w time given 30d
610058 48.87 100.36 110.99 395.49 48.87
unapproved
Cummins 234194 - 4d 2W stock part
810079 449.00 449.00 463.77 657.45 457.01 462.65
Crossline 234193 - stock 3d Sw stock stock
810084 909.00 909.00 934.00 976.24 1,390.06 966.68 | 1,060.73
Neopart 234184 - 4w stock stock 6w stock stock
1010027 40.78 1,201.00 40.78
Eldorado 234183 - stock stock
1210038 2,620.00 2,620.00| 2,653.42 4,251.90| 2,627.08
Crossline 234193 - stock 3d Ow stock
610064 08.84 99.54 132.63 08.84 117.68
Coffman 234196 - 3d stock stock 30d
810110 1,402.00 1,402.00 1,864.71| 1,699.18
Cummins 234194 - 3d stock stock
810126 43.66 43.66 58.33 44.06
Cummins 234194 - 4d Ow stock
810128 724.38 731.50 1,036.82 724.38 819.78
Coffman 234196 - 3d Ow stock 30d
1010044 310.30 313.23 444.13 310.30 310.30
Coffman 234196 - stock stock stock stock




Due 05/25/23 @

3:00 PM Pace RFQ# 422537
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL ..
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
I N
Sku Winning bid Vehicle P&G Illinois A&A Auto Rome Neopart | Interstate Kirks CBM Crossline | Cummins | Suburban Gillig Eldorado |Aftermarket| Coffman Muncie Mohawk
Maintenance Auto - NO Truck - NO Power Truck Parts
NO # of Bids BID BID
610082 20.74 20.74
Eldorado 234183 - 4w
810170 17.65 17.65
Eldorado 234183 - 4w
810173 13.30 27.49 29.00 41.29 29.54 33.42 13.30
unapproved
Crossline 234193 - stock 3d 6w stock 21d part
810176 344.00 344.00 439.43 622.96 646.42 496.05
Crossline 234193 - stock stock 7w stock 21d
810184 75.97 75.97 101.29 77.17
Cummins 234194 - 3d 4w 10d
810187 10.01 11.24 14.65 10.01
Coffman 234196 - 3d 4w stock
810194 53.51 54.18 75.54 53.51
Coffman 234196 - 3d stock stock
810203 3,043.76 3,074.30 4,366.54| 3,043.76
Coffman 234196 - 5d Ow stock
810204 1,299.00 1,299.00 1,468.83 1,953.52| 1,785.91| 1,681.97
Kirks 234185 - stock stock stock stock 30d
810208 0.16 1.46 2.47 1.67 1.92 0.16
unapproved
Cummins 234194 - 3d Ow stock 30d part
810230 3.65 3.65 5.46 3.87 4.39
Cummins 234194 - 3d 5w stock 30d
810232 434.00 434.00 463.77 657.45 459.33 455.99
Crossline 234193 - stock stock 4w stock stock
810234 232.00 232.00 255.25 354.87 255.44 251.32




Due 05/25/23 @

3:00 PM Pace RFQ# 422537
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL ..
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
I N
Sku Winning bid Vehicle P&G Illinois A&A Auto Rome Neopart | Interstate Kirks CBM Crossline | Cummins | Suburban Gillig Eldorado |Aftermarket| Coffman Muncie Mohawk
Maintenance Auto - NO Truck - NO Power Truck Parts
NO # of Bids BID BID
Crossline 234193 - stock stock 7w stock stock
1010068 541.10 638.80 715.00 1,659.74 1,553.11| 1,375.85 541.10
Muncie 234187 - 8w stock 3d stock stock stock
610129 194.86 196.52 256.47 194.86 231.40
Coffman 234196 - 3d Ow stock 21d
810271 29.94 29.94 98.96 129.26
Kirks 234185 - stock 3d 8w
810276 1,764.00 1,764.00| 1,851.48 4,421.41| 1,840.09| 2,696.92
Crossline 234193 - stock 3d 6w stock 30d
1010084 3,810.05 6,166.52| 3,810.05
Coffman 234196 - 15w 10d
810412 3,734.48 3,734.48 6,472.57| 4,072.33| 4,719.09
Cummins 234194 - 3d Ow stock 21d
810413 250.04 252.36 357.88 250.04
Coffman 234196 - 3d Ow stock
810414 503.16 503.16
Coffman 234196 - 7d
810435 1,299.00 1,299.00 1,402.00 1,864.71| 1,699.18
Kirks 234185 - stock 3d stock stock
610191 1,909.09 2,100.00 2,175.00 1,909.09 1,920.89
Availability - Kirks 234185 - stock 8w 23w 126d
810460 4,437.35 4,437.35 8,161.58| 4,450.54| 5,779.59
Cummins 234194 - 3d 12w stock 21d
810461 470.22 489.22 8,161.58 470.22 558.20
Coffman 234196 - 4d 12w stock 30d
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WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sku Winning bid Vehicle P&G Illinois A&A Auto Rome Neopart | Interstate Kirks CBM Crossline | Cummins | Suburban Gillig Eldorado |Aftermarket| Coffman Muncie Mohawk
Maintenance Auto - NO Truck - NO Power Truck Parts
NO # of Bids BID BID
810462 5.59 6.52 11.13 6.61 5.59
unapproved
Cummins 234194 - stock 4w stock part
810463 8.24 8.24 13.98 8.54
Cummins 234194 - 3d 4w stock
810464 3.05 3.05 5.38 3.14 3.67
umapproved
Cummins 234194 - stock stock stock part
1210171 503.24 508.12 720.29 503.24
Coffman 234196 stock 11w stock
1010047 :
610173 -
1210162 -
610190 -
810459 29.05 29.05
Coffman 234196 - stock
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