
Due 05/25/23 @ 
3:00 PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Vehicle 
Maintenance

Illinois 
Auto - NO 

BID

Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Eldorado Cummins - 
NO BID

Neopart Interstate 
Power

Kirks Gillig Muncie Aftermarket 
Parts

Suburban 
Truck

Mohawk

                                   6 40108 3.52                          6.42             4.18             3.55             5.27             3.73             3.52 

Mohawk 234189 -                 3w  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                   6 40615 37.00                  125.93          92.28          94.93          96.89        121.07          37.00 

Mohawk 234189 -                 4w  stock  4w  30d  5w  stock 

                                   5 41131 50.04                  103.27        125.00        123.98        126.86          50.04 

Mohawk 234189 -                 8w  4w  60d  9w  stock 

                                   5 200522 21.15                  118.74          53.20          37.50          67.30          21.15 

Mohawk 234189  4w  stock  stock  5w  stock 

                                   4 200547 573.62                573.62        603.53        740.95        618.85 

Neopart 234184 -                 4w  30d  8w  30d 

                                   6 40174 1.58                       25.58          25.17          29.68          33.07          28.38             1.58 

Mohawk 234189 -                 stock  stock  MOQ  stock  stock  stock 

                                   7 200863 9.40                       15.50          10.83          12.00          11.95          11.00          10.83             9.40 

Mohawk 234189 -                 3w  stock  stock 30d  stock  stock  stock 

                                   4 200897 35.19                    63.83          75.79          67.15          35.19 

Aftermarket Parts 234188 -                 4w 
 no lead 

time given  21d  stock 

                                   6 41014 21.74                    23.23          25.38          22.73          31.61          25.67          21.74 

Mohawk 234189 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 

Pace RFQ# 422535



Due 05/25/23 @ 
3:00 PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Vehicle 
Maintenance

Illinois 
Auto - NO 

BID

Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Eldorado Cummins - 
NO BID

Neopart Interstate 
Power

Kirks Gillig Muncie Aftermarket 
Parts

Suburban 
Truck

Mohawk

Pace RFQ# 422535

                                   6 40079 8.10                       18.13          16.99          19.59          23.16          20.08             8.10 

Mohawk 234189  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                   5 200542 64.78                  160.84          64.78          79.55        217.20          67.87 

Gillig 234186  stock  stock  120d  stock  stock 

                                   6 41132 51.75                  104.46        125.00        123.15        126.86        115.92          51.75 

Mohawk 234189  stock  4w  60d  9w  stock  stock 

                                   1 20712 547.21                547.21 

Eldorado 234183  stock 

                                   5 41293 112.10                281.57        124.58        112.15        143.10        112.10 

Mohawk 234189 -                 4w  4w  30d  6w  4w 

                                   2 41294 2,237.06         2,356.77    2,237.06 

Aftermarket Parts 234188  16w  29w 

                                   1 30472 139.52                139.52 

Aftermarket Parts 234188  5w 

                                   5 41332 317.27                585.96        575.00        654.12        317.27        605.14 

Gillig 234186 -                 stock  8w  30d 
 unapproved 

part  stock 

                                   1 110003 322.40                322.40 

Eldorado 234183 -                 8w 



Due 05/25/23 @ 
3:00 PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Vehicle 
Maintenance

Illinois 
Auto - NO 

BID

Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Eldorado Cummins - 
NO BID

Neopart Interstate 
Power

Kirks Gillig Muncie Aftermarket 
Parts

Suburban 
Truck

Mohawk

Pace RFQ# 422535

                                   7 410006 120.00                234.84        120.00        229.14        228.99        307.96        312.28        343.52 

Muncie 234187 -                 22w 
 unapproved 

part  stock  stock  stock  stock  3w 

                                   8 410010 124.93                440.58        202.36        147.00        175.00        231.79        174.94        376.71        124.93 

Aftermarket Parts 234188 -                 1w  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock  stock  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part 

                                   1 210002 446.61                446.61 

Eldorado 234183 -                 16w 

                                   5 2010021 28.14                  200.24        192.99        214.35        259.13          28.14 

Gillig 234186 -                 4w  stock  30d  5w 
 unapproved 

part 

                                   2 210004 193.97                451.94        193.97 

Aftermarket Parts 234188 -                 stock  stock 

                                   5 410034 277.01                277.01        305.00        295.88        376.33        351.50 

Neopart 234184 -                 4w  4w  30d  stock  2w 

                                   5 410035 487.78                487.78        559.38        508.20        668.25        516.18 

Neopart 234184 -                 4w  8w  21d  6w  3w 

                                   5 410036 508.20                510.15        559.38        508.20        668.25        516.18 

Muncie 234187 -                 4w  8w  21d  6w  3w 

                                   2 410045 10.45                    10.45          10.50 

Kirks 234185 -                 stock  21d 



Due 05/25/23 @ 
3:00 PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Vehicle 
Maintenance

Illinois 
Auto - NO 

BID

Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Eldorado Cummins - 
NO BID

Neopart Interstate 
Power

Kirks Gillig Muncie Aftermarket 
Parts

Suburban 
Truck

Mohawk

Pace RFQ# 422535

                                   1 410074 387.18                387.18 

Eldorado 234183 -                 6w 

                                   4 410083 131.29                215.47        245.03        131.29        132.70 

Muncie 234187 -                 5w  6w  30d  10w 

                                   6 310048 38.50                    64.77          65.25          69.99          82.63          71.54          38.50 

Neopart 234184 -                 stock  2w  stock  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part 

                                   6 410095 98.78                  188.44        122.58          98.78        112.99        129.81        157.40 

Gillig 234186 -                 4w  7w  4w  30d  stock  stock 

                                   1 2010066 4,567.22         4,567.22 

Aftermarket Parts 234188 -                 11w 


	422535

