
DUE 05/11/23 @ 
3:00 PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Vehicle 
Maintenance - 

NO BID

P&G Cummins Translite Interstate 
Power

Kirks Battery 
Service

Illinois Auto Gillig Crossline Neopart Lakeside 
Intl

Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie Eldorado

                                    4 290415 601.34                  618.67         601.34         788.99         685.44 

Neopart 234149 -                  2w  3w  stock  45d 

                                    5 71089 0.06                           0.43             3.91             0.41             0.06             0.10 

Aftermarket Parts 234153 -                  7d  8w  7d  stock  stock 

                                    1 71733 90.79                      90.79 

Aftermarket Parts 234153 -                  3w 

                                    5 72079 242.60                  372.23         461.75         410.75         323.26         242.60 

Muncie 234155  90d  3m  4w  stock  stock 

                                    4 72121 63.88                      73.89           93.22           63.88           72.93 

Muncie 234155 -                  8w  5w  45d  4w 

                                    5 71441 6.65                           7.08           10.37           15.14             6.65           17.95 

Muncie 234155 -                  stock  4w  19w  stock  2w 

                                    2 180669 252.78           10w         252.78         572.76 

Aftermarket Parts 234153 -                  stock  stock 

                                    1 160590 12.79                      12.79 

Eldorado 234151 -                  2w 

                                    3 72133 64.52                      64.52           68.22           79.74 

Neopart 234149 -                  9w  MOQ  stock 

                                    2 71178 0.06                           1.88             0.06 

Aftermarket Parts 234153  MOQ  stock 

                                    3 290589 12.22                      12.22           14.19         191.77 

Neopart 234149  3w  stock  stock 

Pace RFQ# 422512



DUE 05/11/23 @ 
3:00 PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Vehicle 
Maintenance - 

NO BID

P&G Cummins Translite Interstate 
Power

Kirks Battery 
Service

Illinois Auto Gillig Crossline Neopart Lakeside 
Intl

Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 422512

                                    3 290658 127.00                  127.00         160.03         147.66 

Gillig 234152  stock  stock  21d 

                                    2 71357 12.37                      12.37           27.01 

Aftermarket Parts 234153  stock  2w 

                                    3 160596 170.94                  170.94         227.71         191.77 

Gillig 234152 -                  stock  stock  stock 

                                    2 170013 29.41                      29.41         147.67 

Aftermarket Parts 234153  10w  21d 

                                    2 250600 73.65                      85.54           73.65 

Neopart 234149  2w  10w 

                                    1 72120 114.60                  114.60 

Eldorado 234151 -                  stock 

                                    2 290063 1.68                           2.45             1.68 

Muncie 234155 -                  stock  42d 

                                    4 72156 21.99                      24.05           21.99           27.67           23.00 

Neopart 234149 -                  12w  9w  13w  45d 

                                    3 72184 6.10                           6.10             6.13           21.70 

Aftermarket Parts 234153 -                  stock  stock  stock 

                                    2 72206 13.16                      13.16           13.16 

Aftermarket Parts 234153 -                  stock  stock 

                                    3 72301 339.97                  440.00         339.97         628.39 

Battery Service 234165 -                  stock  3w  5w 



DUE 05/11/23 @ 
3:00 PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Vehicle 
Maintenance - 

NO BID

P&G Cummins Translite Interstate 
Power

Kirks Battery 
Service

Illinois Auto Gillig Crossline Neopart Lakeside 
Intl

Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 422512

                                    1 152059 61.69                      61.69 

Aftermarket Parts 234153 -                  stock 

                                    3 250784 289.78                  289.78         357.24         302.11 

Gillig 234152 -                  stock  stock  21d 

                                    4 290696 28.38                      32.56           28.38           29.15           53.94 

Aftermarket Parts 234153 -                  stock  stock  stock  8w 

                                    3 170715 781.41                  781.41         913.91         799.88 

Gillig 234152 -                  6w  stock  30d 

                                    3 170716 1,149.00           1,200.00     1,149.00     1,725.96 

Muncie 234155 -                  10w  30d  stock 

                                    3 290700 239.29                  245.95         239.29         315.64 

Muncie 234155 -                  26w  stock  12w 

                                    3 290701 190.31                  257.63         190.31         315.64 

Muncie 234155 -                  stock  stock  20w 

                                    4 170718 68.03                      71.31           94.74           68.03         124.16 

Muncie 234155 -                  4w  5w  21d  4w 

                                    1 1710007 192.71                  192.71 

Translite 234164 -                  7d 

                                    2 1510007 31.48                      64.67           31.48 

Eldorado 234151 -                  stock  12w 

                                    2 1510008 20.03                      20.03           26.64 

Aftermarket Parts 234153 -                  8w  2w 



DUE 05/11/23 @ 
3:00 PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Vehicle 
Maintenance - 

NO BID

P&G Cummins Translite Interstate 
Power

Kirks Battery 
Service

Illinois Auto Gillig Crossline Neopart Lakeside 
Intl

Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 422512

                                    3 2510007 727.70                  727.70         765.62     1,006.83 

Gillig 234152 -                  4w  10d  stock 

                                     - 2110016 -                 

-                 

                                     - 710097 -                 

-                 

                                    1 1710054 46.36                      46.36 

Eldorado 234151 -                  stock 

                                    1 710130 336.57                  336.57 

Eldorado 234151 -                  4w 

                                    1 710131 4.44                           4.44 

Aftermarket Parts 234153 -                  stock 

                                    3 2110064 11,205.88      11,608.78   13,844.32   11,205.88 

Eldorado 234151 -                  7d  21d  stock 

                                    1 2110069 269.00                  269.00 

Aftermarket Parts 234153 -                  stock 

                                    2 2110090 40.97                      51.21           40.97 

Muncie 234155 -                  5w  60d 

                                    4 710194 0.16                           1.18             0.16             0.23           37.40 

Aftermarket Parts 234153 -                  stock  stock  stock  2w 

                                    3 2510075 171.47                  171.47         171.57         211.25 

Gillig 234152 -                  4w  10d  5w 



DUE 05/11/23 @ 
3:00 PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Vehicle 
Maintenance - 

NO BID

P&G Cummins Translite Interstate 
Power

Kirks Battery 
Service

Illinois Auto Gillig Crossline Neopart Lakeside 
Intl

Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 422512

                                    4 2210034 1,225.00           1,354.00     1,225.00     1,425.78     2,111.71 

Gillig 234152 -                  45d  12w  30d  4w 

                                    5 710213 2,109.00           2,759.00     2,109.00     2,557.22     3,066.36     3,229.85 

Crossline 234162 -                  3d  stock  7d  12w  21d 

                                    1 710247 507.51                  507.51 

Eldorado 234151 -                  4w 

                                    3 710260 540.46                  540.46         737.26         561.05 

Gillig 234152 -                  12w  14w  60d 

                                    3 2510154 67.98                      73.44           67.98         103.57 

Neopart 234149 -                  2w  10d  5w 

                                    2 2510155 35.60                      38.60           35.60 

Neopart 234149 -                  2w  10d 

                                    1 710304 6.15                           6.15 

Eldorado 234151 -                  stock 

                                    2 2110145 3,197.56           3,197.56     4,871.79 

Illinois Auto 234166 -                  8w  25w 

                                    1 1710095 7,044.31           7,044.31 

Aftermarket Parts 234153 -                  17w 

                                    3 2110152 97.69                      97.69         150.29         145.88 

Illinois Auto 234166 -                  stock  8w  9w 

                                    2 2110157 2,449.24           2,449.24     3,731.65 

Illinois Auto 234166 -                  stock  9w 



DUE 05/11/23 @ 
3:00 PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Vehicle 
Maintenance - 

NO BID

P&G Cummins Translite Interstate 
Power

Kirks Battery 
Service

Illinois Auto Gillig Crossline Neopart Lakeside 
Intl

Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 422512

                                    2 1610166 87.21                    112.31           87.21 

Aftermarket Parts 234153 -                  stock  5w 

                                     - 710345 -                 

-                 

                                    1 1510307 124.12                  124.12 

Aftermarket Parts 234153 -                  5w 

                                    2 2110238 1,508.91           1,837.01     1,508.91 

Muncie 234155 -                  25w  60d 

                                    1 2510205 108.61                  108.61 

Aftermarket Parts 234153 -                  8w 

                                    1 1810107 111.99                  111.99 

Aftermarket Parts 234153 -                  13w 

                                    1 2510206 48.66                      48.66 

Aftermarket Parts 234153 -                  stock 

                                     - 2510207 -                 

-                 

                                    1 2510208 341.52                  341.52 

Aftermarket Parts 234153 -                  13w 

                                    1 2510209 3,147.41           3,147.41 

Gillig 234152 -                  stock 

                                    1 2510210 3,147.41           3,147.41 

Gillig 234152 -                  6w 



DUE 05/11/23 @ 
3:00 PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Vehicle 
Maintenance - 

NO BID

P&G Cummins Translite Interstate 
Power

Kirks Battery 
Service

Illinois Auto Gillig Crossline Neopart Lakeside 
Intl

Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 422512

                                     - 170539 -                 

-                 

                                     - 71641 -                 

-                 

                                     - 1710004 -                 

-                 

                                     - 710297 -                 

-                 

                                    2 1510280 51.25                      51.25         217.85 

Neopart 234149 -                  stock  4w 

                                     - 2110230 -                 

-                 

                                     - 1610209 -                 

-                 


	422512

