DUE 05/11/23 @

3:00 PM Pace RFQ# 422509
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
- 4 ./ . | ' | |/ | | | | |
Sku Winning bid Rome |lllinois Auto| Vehicle A&A Auto CBM Interstate Kirks Neopart Gillig Suburban | Coffman | Cummins | Crossline | Eldorado | Lakeside | Aftermarket | Muncie
Truck-NO | -NOBID |Maintenance Power Truck Intl Parts
NO # of Bids BID
5 80883 1.89 20.16 16.20 20.40 16.99 1.89
Mohawk 234154 - 6w stock stock 21d stock
7 130581 57.66 7221 68.75 57.66 67.70 84.87 61.32 62.10
Coffman 234160 - stock stock stock 5d stock 45d stock
10 81262 6.39 6.39 7.56 8.35 12.43 7.56 7.09 7.70 8.11 6.68 7.05
A&A Auto 234157 - stock stock stock 3w stock stock 1d stock stock stock
3 60529 3.07 16.06 3.07 4.49
Aftermarket Parts 234153 stock 5w 30d
7 60739 27.89 36.28 52.75 47.26 47.63 27.89 53.35 41.04
Aftermarket Parts 234153 - stock stock stock 3d 6w stock stock
4 81090 98.92 98.92 99.32 140.88 109.90
Coffman 234160 - stock 3d 7w stock
6 100223 61.19 81.55 122.14 123.27 76.00 174.82 61.19
unapproved
Crossline 234162 - stock stock stock stock stock part
1 60760 395.88 395.88
Aftermarket Parts 234153 - stock
1 140076 1,172.68 1,172.68
Eldorado 234151 - 12w
2 110144 51.73 SiL73 56.25
Aftermarket Parts 234153 10w 30d
4 81444 71.50 73.44 71.50 90.63 79.99
Gillig 234152 Aw 4w 8w 60d
4 81452 98.50 98.50 99.31 113.47 100.10
Neopart 234149 stock stock stock 21d
4 100240 61.29 61.29 74.59 102.57 87.90




DUE 05/11/23 @

3:00 PM Pace RFQ# 422509
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
- - !  J [ '/ [ J | J | [ [ | | | |
Sku Winning bid Rome |lllinois Auto| Vehicle A&A Auto CBM Interstate Kirks Neopart Gillig Suburban | Coffman | Cummins | Crossline | Eldorado | Lakeside | Aftermarket | Muncie
Truck-NO | -NOBID |Maintenance Power Truck Intl Parts

NO # of Bids BID
Coffman 234160 stock stock stock 30d

4 120540 60.68 60.68 61.01 91.26 71.89
Coffman 234160 - stock stock 9w 30d

4 120541 57.93 57.93 58.24 87.12 67.92
Coffman 234160 stock stock 5w 30d

4 81499 26.41 26.41 26.44 35.29 30.99
Coffman 234160 stock stock 6w stock

4 81518 6.99 6.99 7.70 9.99 8.98
Coffman 234160 - stock 3d 7w 21d

3 81534 38.98 39.64 94.43 38.98
Aftermarket Parts 234153 - 5d stock stock

8 1210003 20.23 20.23 23.86 37.48 24.93 27.06 37.89 29.12 24.19
Vehicle Maintenance 234156 - stock stock 4w stock 1d 9w stock stock

3 610009 1.83 13.83 1.83 5.78
Aftermarket Parts 234153 - 4w stock 30d

4 1210009 43.75 43.75 44.00 56.53 50.40
Coffman 234160 - stock stock 9w 30d

7 610014 15.99 22.84 17.75 17.83 19.00 25.41 15.99 22.78
Muncie 234155 - stock stock stock stock 6w stock 30d

5 610018 19.90 56.57 51.91 50.81 72.14 19.90

unapproved

Cummins 234161 - stock stock stock stock part

8 610019 83.00 83.00 94.33 192.89 190.79 119.48 132.65 97.35 84.54
Kirks 234159 - stock 6w stock stock 7d 7w 30d stock

7 1010011 999.00 999.00 1,171.60 1,613.99 1,630.00 2,310.12 1,853.13 1,170.00
Kirks 234159 - stock 10d stock 3d 6w 21d 2w




DUE 05/11/23 @

3:00 PM Pace RFQ# 422509
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sku Winning bid Rome |lllinois Auto| Vehicle A&A Auto CBM Interstate Kirks Neopart Gillig Suburban | Coffman | Cummins | Crossline | Eldorado | Lakeside | Aftermarket | Muncie
Truck-NO | -NOBID |Maintenance Power Truck Intl Parts
NO # of Bids BID
6 1010012 1,239.00 1,239.00| 1,330.25 2,417.48 3,873.85| 2,747.72 | 1,298.00
Kirks 234159 - stock 10d 4d w 30d stock
2 1210016 1,495.00 1,500.00 1,495.00
Aftermarket Parts 234153 - 8w stock
5 810026 1,119.78 1,119.78| 1,129.75 1,253.11| 1,958.32| 1,284.95
Coffman 234160 - stock 3d 10d w 120d
5 810027 653.11 653.11 658.84 730.88 876.39 750.50
Coffman 234160 - stock stock 10d w 30d
7 1010013 4.40 8.05 4.40 13.00 35.24 50.15 10.99 11.40
unapproved
Neopart 234149 - stock stock stock 3d stock 45d part
6 1010014 2.75 2.75 11.20 11.15 16.03 6.80 4.98
unapproved
Kirks 234159 - stock stock stock stock stock part
5 810028 44.00 68.63 209.50 109.00 132.25 44.00
Mohawk 234154 - stock 8w 22w 210d stock
6 810030 1.39 3.73 2.83 2.75 4.05 3.18 1.39
unapproved
Cummins 234161 - stock stock stock stock stock part
7 610026 119.55 119.55 129.50 120.46 388.32 329.00 580.10 127.34
unapproved
CBM 234158 - stock stock 4w stock stock 4w part
7 1010015 989.00 989.00 1,035.25 1,746.28 1,763.72 2,499.47 | 2,079.85 1,100.25
Kirks 234159 - stock 10d stock stock 13w 21d stock
5 1010018 10.00 38.50 10.00 17.40 24.80 55.32
Coffman 234160 - stock stock 2d w 70d
7 610033 700.00 700.00 871.63 880.30 819.00 976.40 1,247.57 1,401.85
unapproved
kirks 234159 - 30d stock 3d stock 10d 5w part
2 1210020 63.80 154.62 63.80




DUE 05/11/23 @

3:00 PM Pace RFQ# 422509
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sku Winning bid Rome |lllinois Auto| Vehicle A&A Auto CBM Interstate Kirks Neopart Gillig Suburban | Coffman | Cummins | Crossline | Eldorado | Lakeside | Aftermarket | Muncie
Truck-NO | -NOBID |Maintenance Power Truck Intl Parts
NO # of Bids BID
Aftermarket Parts 234153 - 12w stock
2 610036 2,100.00 2,100.00 3,858.09
unapproved
Eldorado 234151 - part 20w
7 6100150 22.99 23.13 34.69 23.10 32.19 155.92 38.43 22.99
Muncie 234155 - stock 7d stock 4w 3d stock stock
4 610053 21.20 31.94 32.05 48.08 21.20
Mohawk 234154 - stock 3d stock stock
4 810064 4,214.95 5,145.65 4,214.95 4,674.57 5,972.83
no lead
Cummins 234161 - time given 4d 10d stock
6 810073 125.00 138.12 139.36 125.00 197.69 126.06 165.83
Crossline 234162 - stock stock stock 7w stock Aw
5 810076 149.62 149.62 171.40 214.47 167.49 165.61
Coffman 234160 - stock 3d stock 30d Aw
5 610058 48.87 111.73 100.41 395.49 115.68 48.87
Mohawk 234154 - 2w stock stock 30d stock
4 810086 93.75 95.90 93.75 124.87 109.78
Cummins 234161 - stock 3d stock 30d
5 1210038 2,627.08 2,627.08| 2,653.42| 2,900.00 2,842.86| 4,251.90
Coffman 234160 - stock 3d stock 10d 9w
6 1010030 63.88 120.05 120.85 109.00 171.49 121.00 63.88
unapproved
Crossline 234162 - stock 3d stock stock stock part
8 1010032 64.39 76.48 144.00 139.53 140.80 104.00 199.71 128.69 64.39
unapproved
Neopart 234149 - stock stock stock stock stock stock stock part
5 610064 98.84 98.84 99.60 132.63 112.39 117.68
Coffman 234160 - stock 3d stock stock 30d




DUE 05/11/23 @

3:00 PM Pace RFQ# 422509
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
- 4 ./ . | ' | |/ | | | | |
Sku Winning bid Rome |lllinois Auto| Vehicle A&A Auto CBM Interstate Kirks Neopart Gillig Suburban | Coffman | Cummins | Crossline | Eldorado | Lakeside | Aftermarket | Muncie
Truck-NO | -NOBID |Maintenance Power Truck Intl Parts
NO # of Bids BID
4 810101 264.78 265.31 267.30 378.98 264.78
Muncie 234155 - stock stock stock stock
5 810102 3.63 3.70 3.63 5.29 4.17 4.95
Cummins 234161 - stock stock stock 30d 4w
4 810110 1,582.00 1,582.00 1,965.25| 1,672.10 2,137.21
Kirks 234159 - stock stock 3d stock
4| 1010043 82.95 82.95 83.51 138.53 97.00
Coffman 234160 - stock 3d 6w 21d
7 810141 22.03 51.20 77.73 78.41 53.33 111.25 58.98 22.03
unapproved
Neopart 234149 - stock stock 3d stock stock stock part
1 1210078 1,500.00 1,500.00
Eldorado 234151 - 6w
5 810154 8.49 10.30 10.28 17.20 11.85 8.49
unapproved
Cummins 234161 - stock stock stock stock part
5 810155 318.00 330.65 327.90 318.00 454.36 373.29
Crossline 234162 - stock stock stock 4w 21d
4 810158 66.89 97.22 66.89 130.45 113.89
Cummins 234161 - stock 3d 3w stock
4 810159 46.47 46.47 46.70 98.30 53.85
Coffman 234160 - stock stock w stock
5 810167 58.99 58.99 83.38 127.83 82.24 104.19
Gillig 234152 - stock stock 20w stock 120d
2 810169 31.00 41.92 31.00
Availability -
Eldorado 234151 - stock 19w
- 810170 -




DUE 05/11/23 @

3:00 PM Pace RFQ# 422509
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
- - !  J [ '/ [ J | J | [ [ | | | |
Sku Winning bid Rome |lllinois Auto| Vehicle A&A Auto CBM Interstate Kirks Neopart Gillig Suburban | Coffman | Cummins | Crossline | Eldorado | Lakeside | Aftermarket | Muncie
Truck-NO | -NOBID |Maintenance Power Truck Intl Parts

NO # of Bids BID

4 810179 83.28 83.28 83.28 112.65 105.19

unapproved

Coffman 234160 - stock stock stock part

5 810180 7.61 7.66 7.61 12.77 8.96 9.72
Cummins 234161 - stock 3d stock 30d 4w

4 810181 271 2.80 2.71 4.66 3.26
Cummins 234161 - stock stock 6w 30d

5 810188 35.39 35.39 35.61 59.16 42.21 43.00
Coffman 234160 - stock 3d 7w 30d 30d

4 610098 2.69 5.53 3.04 2.74 2.69
Mohawk 234154 - stock stock 45d stock

5 810213 65.00 65.00 67.67 90.87 81.35 65.06
Coffman 234160 - stock 7d stock 30d stock

4 810222 223.93 229.70 223.93 292.14 258.58
Cummins 234161 - stock 3d 5w 30d

3 810231 279.35 279.35 385.92 313.35
Coffman 234160 - stock stock 30d

4 810237 33.41 33.85 33.41 43.68 38.38
Cummins 234161 - stock 3d 5w 30d

5 810241 3.87 3.94 3.87 5.63 4.61 5.25
Cummins 234161 - stock stock 6w 30d Aw

4 1210109 602.76 611.09 602.76 619.00 786.03
Cummins 234161 - stock 3d stock stock

3 810251 631.99 631.99 723.64 1,209.44
Coffman 234160 - stock 3d 5w




DUE 05/11/23 @

3:00 PM Pace RFQ# 422509
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sku Winning bid Rome |lllinois Auto ‘_/ehicle A&A Auto CBM Interstate Kirks Neopart Gillig Suburban | Coffman | Cummins | Crossline | Eldorado | Lakeside | Aftermarket | Muncie
Truck-NO | -NOBID |Maintenance Power Truck Intl Parts

NO # of Bids BID

3 1010070 513.43 513.43 885.04 716.59
Coffman 234160 - stock 5w 67d

4 810277 33.40 34.45 37.40 52.35 33.40
Mohawk 234154 - stock 1d w stock

3 810301 696.54 696.54 702.00 1,125.05
Availability - no lead
Cummins 234161 - time given 3d 9w

1 1210134 666.58 666.58
Eldorado 234151 - stock

1 610143 93.81 93.81
Eldorado 234151 - 2w

4 610146 112.91 112.91 113.90 151.66 132.05

no lead

Cummins 234161 - time given 3d 5w 30d

4 810420 1.37 1.47 1.37 2.16 1.97
Cummins 234161 - stock stock w 30d

4 1210170 13.84 13.85 13.84 20.90 16.37
Cummins 234161 - stock 3d 8w 30d

- 110142 -

5 1210037 478.83 3,499.80| 3,565.58| 2,885.00 478.83 | 5,433.16
Availability - no lead
Crossline 234162 - stock 3d stock time given 9w

- 1010047 -

- 610173 -

- 1210162 -




DUE 05/11/23 @

3:00 PM Pace RFQ# 422509
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sku Winning bid Rome |lllinois Auto| Vehicle A&A Auto CBM Interstate Kirks Neopart Gillig Suburban | Coffman | Cummins | Crossline | Eldorado | Lakeside | Aftermarket | Muncie
Truck-NO | -NOBID |Maintenance Power Truck Intl Parts
NO # of Bids BID

- 610190 =
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