

DUE 05/11/23 @
3:00 PM

Pace

RFQ# 422508

WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL														
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0		0
Green=Disqualified																
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Rome Truck - NO BID	Vehicle Maintenance - NO BID	Illinois Auto - NO BID	Cummins	Neopart	Kirks	Interstate Power	Suburban Truck	Eldorado	Gillig	Lakeside Intl	Aftermarket Parts	Mohawk	Muncie
7	40615	37.00					92.28				125.93	94.93	98.80	121.07	37.00	96.89
	Mohawk	234154	-				4w				2w	2w	2d	stock	stock	30d
5	41131	50.04					103.27						121.93	126.86	50.04	123.98
	Mohawk	234154	-				7w						7d	9w	stock	60d
5	200522	21.15							53.20				26.83	67.30	21.15	37.50
	Mohawk	234154	-						stock				2d	5w	stock	stock
6	30014	3.41					4.52					5.82	6.88	5.64	3.41	7.23
	Mohawk	234154					stock					2w	7d	5w	stock	35d
5	200547	574.14					574.14						594.01	740.95	599.85	603.53
	Neopart	234149	-				4w						10d	8w	2w	30d
6	200529	16.37					33.64			21.70		62.47	46.91	16.37		63.05
	Availability - Suburban Truck	234150	-				7w			stock		stock	7d	13w		21d
7	41216	252.00					399.54				617.20	252.32	301.77	252.00	330.00	341.14
	Aftermarket Parts	234153	-				9w				2w	2w	30d	stock	2w	115d
5	200072	11.68					14.98					19.11	13.37	14.89		11.68
	Muncie	234155	-				4w					stock	2d	5w		30d
5	200622	58.94					116.54			119.05				63.48	58.94	73.11
	Mohawk	234154	-				3w			stock				stock	stock	stock
5	30361	5.58					9.42						16.74	11.90	5.58	11.35
	Mohawk	234154					MOQ						7d	stock	stock	21d
7	40922	17.35					51.94				61.92	37.20	64.38	45.77	17.35	32.12

DUE 05/11/23 @
3:00 PM

Pace

RFQ# 422508

WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL														
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																
	Sku	Winning bid	Rome Truck - NO BID	Vehicle Maintenance - NO BID	Illinois Auto - NO BID	Cummins	Neopart	Kirks	Interstate Power	Suburban Truck	Eldorado	Gillig	Lakeside Intl	Aftermarket Parts	Mohawk	Muncie
NO # of Bids																
Mohawk	234154						7w				2w	stock	3d	stock	stock	60d
5	40842	5.54					10.50						13.53	9.74	5.54	8.60
Mohawk	234154						3w						20d	5w	stock	stock
6	40596	0.46					1.88					2.29	3.29	2.36	0.46	1.00
Mohawk	234154						stock					2w	7d	4w	stock	stock
5	41132	51.75					104.50						121.93	126.86	51.75	123.15
Mohawk	234154	-					7w						7d	9w	stock	60d
6	41240	110.25					112.45					113.17	168.32	139.94	123.41	110.25
Muncie	234155						stock					stock	15d	stock	no lead time given	stock
1	30411	370.42									370.42					
Eldorado	234151										4w					
7	41270	38.07					40.10				82.70	38.07	59.37	44.65	60.71	40.36
Gillig	234152	-					stock				1w	stock	7d	5w	2w	stock
5	41271	38.07					40.10				82.70	38.07		44.65	60.71	
Gillig	234152	-					stock				1w	stock		5w	2w	
1	200956	176.77									176.77					
Eldorado	234151	-									stock					
7	200964	8.40					101.46				49.92	40.76	40.53	49.67	8.40	40.25
Mohawk	234154	-					4w				stock	stock	3d	5w	stock	21d
6	41332	317.27					587.19					575.00	630.62	317.27	606.14	784.88

DUE 05/11/23 @
3:00 PM

Pace

RFQ# 422508

WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL														
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Rome Truck - NO BID	Vehicle Maintenance - NO BID	Illinois Auto - NO BID	Cummins	Neopart	Kirks	Interstate Power	Suburban Truck	Eldorado	Gillig	Lakeside Intl	Aftermarket Parts	Mohawk	Muncie
	Gillig	234152	-				9w					8w	7d	unapproved part	21d	30d
1	110003	322.40									322.40					
	Eldorado	234151	-								8w					
6	410001	1,284.11					1,284.11				2,142.47		1,585.09	1,481.03	1,574.91	1,402.00
	Neopart	234149	-				stock				2w		7d	5w	2w	stock
6	410002	1,284.11					1,284.11				2,142.47		1,585.09	1,481.03	1,574.91	1,402.00
	Neopart	234149	-				stock				2w		7d	stock	2w	stock
7	410006	120.00					235.05	120.00				229.14	340.64	307.96	343.52	235.31
	Gillig	234152	-				22w	unapproved part				stock	20d	stock	2w	stock
1	110006	338.30									338.30					
	Eldorado	234151	-								16w					
1	110007	338.30									338.30					
	Eldorado	234151	-								stock					
-	410074	-														
		-														
5	410080	525.00					564.54					525.00	665.26	777.34		675.57
	Gillig	234152	-				stock					stock	7d	10w		45d
1	110039	0.22									0.22					
	Eldorado	234151	-								stock					
1	110040	533.26									533.26					
	Eldorado	234151	-								4w					

DUE 05/11/23 @
3:00 PM

Pace

RFQ# 422508

WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL															
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0		0	
Green=Disqualified																	
	NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Rome Truck - NO BID	Vehicle Maintenance NO BID	Illinois Auto - NO BID	Cummins	Neopart	Kirks	Interstate Power	Suburban Truck	Eldorado	Gillig	Lakeside Intl	Aftermarket Parts	Mohawk	Muncie
	1	210028	38.23												38.23		
Aftermarket Parts		234153	-												stock		
	2	210031	4.56												8.60	4.56	
Mohawk		234154	-												stock	1w	
	3	2010093	1,024.50												1,197.85	1,050.53	1,024.50
Muncie		234155	-												stock	unapproved part	stock
	1	2010094	1,520.66												1,520.66		
Aftermarket Parts		234153	-												13w		
	2	2010095	12.15				30.04										12.15
Muncie		234155	-				stock										21d
	5	41266	1,392.64					1,392.64					1,423.99	1,578.53	1,660.82		2,006.89
Neopart		234149	-					7w					16w	30d	12w		70d