Due 04/27/23 @ 3:00

PM Pace RFQ# 422475
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sku Winning bid | Coffman P&G Neopart Illinois Battery Kirks Filter Lakeside Muncie Eldorado Mohwk | Aftermarket | Translite Gillig
NO # of Bids Auto Service Services Intl Parts
4 220309 46.96 269.23 46.96 52.22 55.80
Availability - unapproved
Aftermarket Parts 234115 - part 45d stock stock
2 71733 90.79 90.79 91.50
Aftermarket Parts 234115 - stock stock
71294 0.16 0.23 0.16 0.19
unapproved
Mohawk 234120 - part stock stock
5 72079 242.60 372.23 450.00 242.60 323.26 415.47
Muncie 234121 8w 6w stock stock 4w
6 71441 6.87 10.68 6.87 17.95 7.41 15.14 7.08
Muncie 234121 - stock stock 2w 90d 19w stock
5 211005 1.49 15.21 1.49 17.78 4.65 20.23
Filter Services 234132 - 8w 60d 45d stock 10w
1 160590 12.79 12.79
Eldorado 234116 - stock
5 210995 522.21 522.21 585.00 656.69 795.63 569.23
Illinois Auto 234129 - stock 21d 2w stock 4w
6 290028 20.14 36.55 20.14 29.86 28.13 26.57 31.51
unapproved
Aftermarket Parts 234115 - 4w part 45d 2w stock stock
1 290471 19.53 19.53
Eldorado 234116 stock




Due 04/27/23 @ 3:00

PM Pace RFQ# 422475
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
[N D O N
Sku Winning bid | Coffman P&G Neopart Illinois Battery Kirks Filter Lakeside Muncie Eldorado Mohwk | Aftermarket | Translite Gillig
NO # of Bids Auto Service Services Intl Parts
4 210993 694.00 737.62 694.00| 1,123.84 875.00
Mohawk 234120 stock 3w 9w 8w
1 151910 25.03 25.03
Aftermarket Parts 234115 stock
3 220346 55.02 64.36 62.63 55.02
Gillig 234119 90d stock stock
1 71539 36.79 36.79
Eldorado 234116 - stock
3 160596 170.94 203.93 227.71 170.94
Gillig 234119 stock stock 2w
6 71100 0.08 0.47 3.17 1.84 0.12 0.08 0.09
unapproved
Mohawk 234120 stock 8w part stock stock 3w
5 72135 57.63 69.25 75.71 128.06 65.61 57.63
Gillig 234119 - 9w 90d stock stock stock
3 170615 231.51 231.51 321.28 350.00
Muncie 234121 - 37d 8w 4w
3 210976 26.31 51.87 26.31 58.62
Mohawk 234120 - stock stock 7w
3 170579 199.54 296.98 199.54 485.50
Aftermarket Parts 234115 - 30d stock stock




Due 04/27/23 @ 3:00

PM Pace RFQ# 422475
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
[N D O N
Sku Winning bid | Coffman P&G Neopart Illinois Battery Kirks Filter Lakeside Muncie Eldorado Mohwk | Aftermarket | Translite Gillig

NO # of Bids Auto Service Services Intl Parts

3 160690 241.12 241.12 379.63 297.98
Muncie 234121 - stock 5w 4w

6 71179 0.52 0.59 3.28 17.54 0.94 0.52 0.75

unapproved

Mohawk 234120 - stock stock part stock stock stock

4 71442 6.45 6.45 17.95 7.30 15.14
Muncie 234121 - stock stock 4w 19w

3 70730 0.17 0.21 0.17 1.42

unapproved

Mohawk 234120 - part stock 13w

3 72156 21.99 21.99 23.18 27.67
Neopart 234117 - 9w 60d 13w

3 151975 1,143.23 1,143.23 2,315.93 1,521.40
Muncie 234121 - 45d 6w 6w

4 72194 70.98 70.98 93.23 153.07 92.79
Neopart 234117 - 9w 60d 12w stock

3 290679 61.00 70.11 81.98 61.00
Gillig 234119 - 21d 2w stock

1 72253 104.48 104.48
Eldorado 234116 - stock

3 72294 35.88 35.88 39.13 38.21
Muncie 234121 - 30d 12w 4w




Due 04/27/23 @ 3:00

PM Pace RFQ# 422475
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
[N D O N
Sku Winning bid | Coffman P&G Neopart Illinois Battery Kirks Filter Lakeside Muncie Eldorado Mohwk | Aftermarket | Translite Gillig

NO # of Bids Auto Service Services Intl Parts

4 72301 339.97 339.97 455.00 373.07 595.75

unapproved

Battery Service 234130 - 2w stock part 7w

1 72366 396.59 396.59
Eldorado 234116 - 4w

4 72384 7.25 12.78 19.38 24.25 7.25
Gillig 234119 - stock stock 16w stock

4 170718 68.03 68.03 124.16 94.74 73.99
Muncie 234121 - 30d 4w stock 4w

3 170722 88.41 208.90 88.41 350.44
Eldorado 234116 - 30d 2w stock

3 1710015 37.65 37.65 46.98 48.43
Muncie 234121 - 30d stock stock

4 1710016 28.33 28.33 57.89 33.99 39.63
Muncie 234121 - 30d 4w stock 4w

1 710008 210.59 210.59
Eldorado 234116 - 2w

2 2510002 2,127.00 3,374.75 2,127.00
Gillig 234119 - 13w 6w

3 2510007 727.70 765.62 1,006.83 727.70
Gillig 234119 - 10d stock 4w




Due 04/27/23 @ 3:00
PM Pace

WHITE=NO BID

TOTAL

RFQ# 422475

Sku Winning bid | Coffman P&G Neopart Illinois Battery Kirks Filter Lakeside Muncie Eldorado Mohwk | Aftermarket | Translite Gillig
NO # of Bids Auto Service Services Intl Parts
2 710056 68.68 117.86 68.68
Aftermarket Parts 234115 - 4w stock
6 2110021 479.37 529.74 479.37 535.22 515.00 693.05 555.80
no lead
Illinois Auto 234129 - stock stock 21d 3w time given stock
2 1810017 263.05 263.05 273.00
Aftermarket Parts 234115 - stock stock
3 2210018 8.08 8.08 15.98 9.14
Muncie 234121 - 65d 4w stock
1 1710054 46.36 46.36
Eldorado 234116 - stock
4 710120 432.32 432.32 475.00 514.66 809.77
P&G 234128 - 6w stock 30d stock
1 710130 336.67 336.67
Eldorado 234116 - 6w
1 710131 4.44 4.44
Aftermarket Parts 234115 - stock
1 2110067 935.16 935.16
Aftermarket Parts 234115 - 14w
2 1810036 146.20 146.20 146.28
Aftermarket Parts 234115 - 12w stock




Due 04/27/23 @ 3:00

PM Pace RFQ# 422475
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
[N B
Sku Winning bid | Coffman P&G Neopart Illinois Battery Kirks Filter Lakeside Muncie Eldorado Mohwk | Aftermarket | Translite Gillig

NO # of Bids Auto Service Services Intl Parts

3| 2510048 71.81 72.08 93.85 71.81
Gillig 234119 - 10d stock 2w

6 710149 447.47 447.47 478.57 467.50 512.56 707.27 564.99
Coffman 234123 - stock 20d stock 2w stock stock

4| 2510064 32.84 32.84 41.10 40.53 37.92

bid 2, need

Neopart 234117 - 10d 4 5w 2w

2| 1510130 58.09 60.24 58.09
Aftermarket Parts 234115 - 5w stock

3| 2110075 3,513.94 3,513.94 4,085.23 5,353.82
Illinois Auto 234129 - 8w 30d 10w

2 710177 7.65 7.65 8.80

bid 2, need

Aftermarket Parts 234115 - 6 stock

3| 2510067 936.71 975.57 1,281.21 936.71
Gilllig 234119 - 10d 7w 2w

3| 2210030 212.79 212.79 397.67 271.91
Muncie 234121 - 60d stock 10w

1| 2110088 2,473.91 2,473.91
Aftermarket Parts 234115 - 9w

3| 2510075 145.71 171.57 145.71 175.51
Aftermarket Parts 234115 - 10w 5w 2w




Due 04/27/23 @ 3:00

PM Pace RFQ# 422475
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0
[N D O N
Sku Winning bid | Coffman P&G Neopart Illinois Battery Kirks Filter Lakeside Muncie Eldorado Mohwk | Aftermarket | Translite Gillig
NO # of Bids Auto Service Services Intl Parts
2 1810054 218.40 244.60 218.40
Gillig 234119 - 14w 12w
3 710244 75.00 76.55 75.00 75.00
Aftermarket Parts 234115 - 30d 12w 14w
1 710278 1,695.99 1,695.99
Eldorado 234116 - 120d
- 710297 -
1 2110142 21.89 21.89
Aftermarket Parts 234115 - stock
1 710310 699.06 699.06
no lead
Aftermarket Parts 234115 - time given
1 1710121 0.41 0.41
Aftermarket Parts 234115 - stock
1 710321 610.04 610.04
Eldorado 234116 -
2 710324 21.77 34.39 21.77
Aftermarket Parts 234115 - 42d 24w
2 710356 16.97 16.97 25.29
Mohawk 234120 - stock stock




Due 04/27/23 @ 3:00

PM Pace RFQ# 422475
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sku Winning bid | Coffman P&G Neopart Illinois Battery Kirks Filter Lakeside Muncie Eldorado Mohwk | Aftermarket | Translite Gillig

NO # of Bids Auto Service Services Intl Parts

- 1510280 -

1 710266 1,555.34 1,555.34
Eldorado 234116 - 8w

6 710459 3,149.72 3,149.72 3,450.00 3,654.23 6,492.55 4,749.00 3,551.50
P&G 234128 - stock 8w 60d 4w stock stock

2 2510203 59.22 70.55 59.22
Gillig 234119 - 10d 2w

2 2510204 4.01 11.80 4.01
cancelled - 10d 2w

- 170539 -

- 71641 -

4 72094 24.83 24.83 33.95 26.50 28.66
Muncie 234121 - 30d stock stock stock

- 1710004 -

1 1810033 182.79 182.79
Eldorado 234116 - stock




Due 04/27/23 @ 3:00

PM Pace RFQ# 422475
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0
Sku Winning bid | Coffman P&G Neopart Illinois Battery Kirks Filter Lakeside Muncie Eldorado Mohwk | Aftermarket | Translite Gillig

NO # of Bids Auto Service Services Intl Parts

-| 2110230 -

1 2110249 11,035.91 11,035.91
cancelled - 21w

-| 1610209 -

710460




	422475

