
Due 04/27/23 @ 3:00 
PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Coffman Neopart Kirks Lakeside 
Intl

Crossline CBM Eldorado Gillig Cummins Mohawk Muncie Aftermarket 
Parts

                                    5 130684 6.89                           7.12           15.37             6.89             7.42           14.85 

Mohawk 234120 -                  stock  10d  4w  30d  stock 

                                    5 60734 2.67                           5.39             6.24             2.74             2.72             2.67 

Muncie 234121 -                  stock  10d  stock  stock  30d 

                                    2 60735 1,457.06           1,457.06     4,488.05 

Eldorado 234116 -                  stock  19w 

                                    5 120439 2.27                           2.36             2.53             2.27             2.87             3.93 

Cummins 234127  stock  7d  stock  30d  stock 

130473 0.15                           2.27             0.18             0.16             0.15 

Aftermarket Parts 234115 -                  10d  stock  stock  stock 

                                    7 60494 11.13                      11.13           12.98           23.54           14.10           13.34           14.23           16.07 

Vehicle Maintenance 234122 -                  stock  stock  3w  7d  4w  30d  stock 

                                    4 81286 143.40                  148.50         159.14         143.40         165.11 

Cummins 234127 -                 
 no lead 

time given  7d  4d  30d 

                                    4 110100 2.49                           2.50             3.60             3.20             2.49 

Aftermarket Parts 234115 -                  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                    3 60748 55.15                    100.68           55.15           72.68 

Muncie 234121 -                  stock  60d  3w 

                                    7 100223 62.12                    122.37           81.67         131.81           76.00         123.27           62.12         174.82 

Crossline 234125  stock  4w  7d  stock  3d 
 unapproved 

part  9w 

Pace RFQ# 422474



Due 04/27/23 @ 3:00 
PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Coffman Neopart Kirks Lakeside 
Intl

Crossline CBM Eldorado Gillig Cummins Mohawk Muncie Aftermarket 
Parts

Pace RFQ# 422474

                                    7 81345 105.48                  184.50         199.20         147.00         186.35         105.48         215.95         264.20 

Crossline 234125  stock  3d  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part  30d  stock 

                                    1 60770 73.92                      73.92 

Eldorado 234116  20w 

                                    6 60771 86.32                    166.50           91.00           86.32         166.94         193.39         236.70 

Kirks 234118  stock stock
 unapproved 

part  stock  30d  9w 

                                    8 100226 1,119.00           2,487.35     1,120.00     1,119.00     1,337.22     2,512.37     1,170.00     2,907.47     3,597.68 

Kirks 234118 -                  stock  10d  stock 
 unapproved 

part  4d  4w  30d  9w 

                                    8 100227 880.00              1,547.84         891.96         880.00         891.48     1,563.37     1,008.24     1,808.97     2,079.10 

Kirks 234118  stock  10d stock
 unapproved 

part  3d  4w  30d  12w 

                                    1 60772 10.39                      10.39 

Eldorado 234116  4w 

                                    5 81387 143.20                  150.30         158.92         143.20         165.80         190.56 

Cummins 234127 -                  stock  7d  stock  30d  5w 

                                    3 81423 20.92                      32.79           20.92           26.99 

Muncie 234121 -                  stock  stock  stock 

                                    5 60793 18.26                      38.42           18.26           41.02           47.62           53.49 

Coffman 234123 -                  stock 
 unapproved 

part  3d  30d  stock 

                                    6 81437 4.39                         15.00             4.74           15.00             4.39           17.65           21.40 

Coffman 234123 -                  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock 
 unapproved 

part  30d  9w 



Due 04/27/23 @ 3:00 
PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Coffman Neopart Kirks Lakeside 
Intl

Crossline CBM Eldorado Gillig Cummins Mohawk Muncie Aftermarket 
Parts

Pace RFQ# 422474

                                    6 81441 45.07                      70.88           74.66           83.28           45.07           51.59         112.65 

Muncie 234121 -                  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock  stock 

                                    5 81444 59.40                      73.44           71.50           59.40           75.99           90.63 

Mohawk 234120 -                  6w  2w  stock  60d  6w 

                                    5 81515 9.32                           9.62           10.45             9.32           10.96           13.35 

Cummins 234127 -                  stock  7d  3d  30d  6w 

                                    6 81516 11.78                      12.08           13.33           11.78           14.05           14.00           16.83 

Cummins 234127 -                  stock  7d  4d 
 unapproved 

part  30d  stock 

                                    9 81521 18.36                      18.36           22.18           21.49           28.00           24.08           33.50           20.85           19.46           28.10 

Vehicle Maintenance 234122 -                  stock  stock  stock  30d  10d  1w  stock  stock  3w 

                                    5 81528 0.93                           2.56             0.93             2.47             3.07             2.87 

Cummins 234127 -                  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock  30d  stock 

                                    1 810000 46.14                      46.14 

Eldorado 234116 -                  stock 

                                    8 1210003 22.05                      22.22           24.93           23.89           27.06           37.48           22.05           29.12           37.89 

Mohawk 234120 -                  stock  stock  stock  7d  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                    3 610009 2.49                         13.83             5.78             2.49 

Aftermarket Parts 234115 -                  stock  stock  stock 

                                    7 810010 371.37                  720.73         371.37         399.00         807.36         727.91         838.76     1,087.14 

Neopart 234117 -                  stock  3w  stock  7d  3d  30d  5w 



Due 04/27/23 @ 3:00 
PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Coffman Neopart Kirks Lakeside 
Intl

Crossline CBM Eldorado Gillig Cummins Mohawk Muncie Aftermarket 
Parts

Pace RFQ# 422474

                                    1 1010005 552.02                  552.02 

Eldorado 234116 -                  4w 

                                    8 610019 82.00                    200.98           94.33           82.00         211.70         190.79         257.40         206.62         132.65 

Kirks 234118 -                  stock  6w  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock  4w  stock  7w 

                                    4 810026 1,118.66           1,118.66     1,268.18     1,129.85     1,958.32 
Availability - 
Cummins 234127 -                 

 no lead 
time given  7d  4d  9w 

                                    6 810027 652.46                  652.46         739.66         685.00         658.94         750.50         876.39 

Coffman 234123 -                  stock  7d  stock  3d  30d  9w 

                                    7 1010014 2.66                         10.00             2.66             7.30           11.21             5.06             7.50           16.03 

Kirks 234118 -                  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                    5 810028 44.50                    209.50           69.41           44.50         132.50         109.00 

Mohawk 234120 -                  20w  stock  stock  60d  18w 

                                    7 810030 1.39                           2.85             3.76             2.26             2.76             1.39             3.29             4.05 

Cummins 234127 -                  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock  stock 

                                    5 810031 2.34                           9.55             3.26             9.52             2.34           13.63 

Cummins 234127 -                  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock 
 unapproved 

part  4w 

                                    9 610026 119.13                  380.70         120.46         131.00         234.85         329.00         155.25         388.37         119.13         126.50 

Neopart 234117 -                  stock  3w  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock 

                                    7 1010015 989.00              1,746.28     1,156.45         989.00     1,136.00     1,763.82     1,300.25     2,499.47 

Kirks 234118 -                  stock  10d stock  7d  3d  stock  13w 



Due 04/27/23 @ 3:00 
PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Coffman Neopart Kirks Lakeside 
Intl

Crossline CBM Eldorado Gillig Cummins Mohawk Muncie Aftermarket 
Parts

Pace RFQ# 422474

                                    3 1010016 2,892.27           2,892.27     3,223.64     4,657.57 

Coffman 234123 -                  stock 
 no lead 

time given  9w 

                                    7 610031 26.74                      35.33           26.74           38.12           35.58           26.92           34.47           50.56 

Kirks 234118 -                  stock  stock  7d  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock  stock 

                                    1 610036 3,858.09           3,858.09 

Eldorado 234116 -                  stock 

                                    5 610050 22.55                      42.09           22.55         155.92           22.99           38.43 

CBM 234126 -                 
 unapproved 

part  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                    8 810060 25.88                      45.40           52.06           48.99           36.85           45.75           25.88           43.46           64.97 

Crossline 234125 -                  stock  stock  7d  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock  stock 

                                    3 810064 4,674.57           5,145.65     4,674.57     5,972.83 

Coffman 234123 -                  stock 
 no lead 

time given  stock 

                                    5 810068 28.80                      66.79           74.59           67.16           28.80           95.31 

Mohawk 234120 -                  stock  7d  stock  2w  8w 

                                    7 810084 909.00                  966.68         909.00     1,095.89         914.96         976.34         956.91     1,390.06 

Neopart 234117 -                  stock  4w 
 unapproved 

part  stock  4d  stock  6w 

                                    6 1210037 1,885.00           3,068.48     3,304.73     1,885.00     3,093.13     3,075.00     4,956.28 

Crossline 234125 -                  stock  7d  stock  3d  stock  9w 

                                    4 810086 93.80                      96.90         100.32           93.80         124.87 

Cummins 234127 -                  stock  7d  stock  stock 



Due 04/27/23 @ 3:00 
PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Coffman Neopart Kirks Lakeside 
Intl

Crossline CBM Eldorado Gillig Cummins Mohawk Muncie Aftermarket 
Parts

Pace RFQ# 422474

                                    7 810093 17.20                      17.29           17.20           40.83           28.80           36.62           34.86           61.00 

Kirks 234118 -                  stock  stock  7d  stock  stock  stock  5w 

                                    6 610064 98.84                      98.84         106.56           99.64         125.68         112.90         132.63 

Coffman 234123 -                  stock  10d  3d 
 unapproved 

part  stock  stock 

                                    5 810101 264.78                  265.31         285.74         267.35         264.78         378.98 

Muncie 234121 -                  stock  7d  3d  stock  stock 

                                    5 810110 1,220.00           1,715.18     1,220.00     1,555.10     1,402.15     1,864.71 

Kirks 234118 -                  stock  stock 
 no lead 

time given  3d  stock 

                                    4 810128 724.39                  724.39         811.46         731.60     1,036.82 

Coffman 234123 -                  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock  stock 

                                    5 810132 146.82                  146.82         158.12         147.90         230.47         196.81 

Coffman 234123 -                  stock 
 no lead 

time given  5d  stock  8w 

                                    5 810137 138.98                  193.04         138.98         178.00         192.98         334.63 

Crossline 234125 -                  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock  stock  5w 

                                    6 1210071 164.38                  238.61         266.75         240.43         164.38         240.20         319.86 

Coffman 234123 -                  stock  7d  3d 
 unapproved 

part  stock  9w 

                                    3 1210072 254.19                  254.19         284.17         256.14 

Coffman 234123 -                  stock  7d  stock 

                                    8 810141 22.37                      77.73           51.20           87.07           54.90           78.41           22.37           58.98         111.25 

Neopart 234117 -                  stock  stock  7d  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock  stock 



Due 04/27/23 @ 3:00 
PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Coffman Neopart Kirks Lakeside 
Intl

Crossline CBM Eldorado Gillig Cummins Mohawk Muncie Aftermarket 
Parts

Pace RFQ# 422474

                                    6 1010044 310.30                  310.30         347.59         368.74         313.33         310.30         444.13 

Coffman 234123 -                  stock  7d  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                    4 810180 7.61                           7.65             8.55             7.61           12.77 

Cummins 234127 -                  stock  7d  stock  stock 

                                    5 810189 42.00                      53.00           57.12           42.00           51.41           72.99 

Crossline 234125 -                  stock  7d  stock  stock  stock 

                                    3 810203 3,124.50           3,124.50     3,409.62     4,366.54 

Coffman 234123 -                  stock 
 no lead 

time given  9w 

                                    5 810204 1,275.00           1,805.91     1,275.00     1,629.15     1,468.93     1,953.52 

Kirks 234118 -                  stock  stock  7d  3d  stock 

                                    3 1010055 113.14                  113.14         126.48         136.13 

Coffman 234123 -                  stock  7d  3d 

                                    5 810230 3.75                           4.00             4.27             3.75             4.42             5.46 

Cummins 234127 -                  stock  7d  stock  30d  5w 

                                    5 810231 272.25                  282.50         302.04         272.25         313.98         385.92 

Cummins 234127 -                  stock  7d  stock  30d  stock 

                                    4 1010060 2,794.72           2,794.72     3,130.65     3,240.95     4,797.93 

Coffman 234123 -                  stock  20d  30d  9w 

                                    8 1010061 908.80              1,468.46         993.60         975.00         908.80     1,483.19     1,168.40     1,708.45     1,972.48 

Kirks 234118 -                  stock  10d  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock  4w  30d  9w 



Due 04/27/23 @ 3:00 
PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Coffman Neopart Kirks Lakeside 
Intl

Crossline CBM Eldorado Gillig Cummins Mohawk Muncie Aftermarket 
Parts

Pace RFQ# 422474

                                    4 610113 141.03                  169.25         156.51         141.03         166.78 

Cummins 234127 -                  stock  7d  3d  30d 

                                    4 610118 35.22                      36.14           39.17           35.22           41.32 

Cummins 234127 -                  stock  7d  4d  30d 

                                    6 1010068 700.00              1,375.85         700.00     1,541.23         979.00     1,659.84     1,553.11 

Kirks 234118 -                  stock  30d  7d  stock  stock  stock 

                                    5 1210113 801.83                  801.83         898.21         809.83         949.88     1,077.04 

Coffman 234123 -                  stock  7d  3d  30d  4w 

                                    6 810271 29.94                      31.00           29.94         107.79           99.04         111.76         129.26 

Kirks 234118 -                  stock  stock  7d  3d  30d  8w 

                                    5 810346 30.96                      30.96           33.23           32.89           38.42           42.45 

Coffman 234123 -                  stock  7d  stock  21d  5w 

                                    3 1010084 3,810.06           3,810.06     4,268.03     3,848.44 
Availability - 
Cummins 234127 -                 

 no lead 
time given 

 unapproved 
part  5d 

                                    5 810372 868.50                  868.60         963.28         868.50         999.85     1,230.81 

Cummins 234127 -                  stock  3d  3d  21d  12w 

                                    3 810384 229.65                  235.75         254.79         229.65 

Cummins 234127 -                  stock  7d  4d 

                                    5 810412 4,074.35           4,074.35     4,640.51     4,139.58     4,740.83     6,881.02 

Cummins 234127 -                  stock  7d  3d  30d  9w 



Due 04/27/23 @ 3:00 
PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Coffman Neopart Kirks Lakeside 
Intl

Crossline CBM Eldorado Gillig Cummins Mohawk Muncie Aftermarket 
Parts

Pace RFQ# 422474

                                    7 1210160 32.37                      33.55           33.72           36.43           49.95           32.37           40.68           50.98 

Mohawk 234120 -                  stock  4w  7d  stock  stock  30d  stock 

                                    5 1210161 49.65                      53.18           49.65           78.99           52.75           80.83 

Lakeside Intl 234124 -                  stock  7d  1w  stock  stock 

                                    5 810449 291.64                  291.64         326.03         293.89         335.98         452.58 

Coffman 234123 -                  stock  7d  stock  65d  6w 

                                    4 610193 72.95                      72.95           81.56           88.41           84.59 

Lakeside Intl 234124 -                 
 no lead 

time given  7d  4d  21d 

                                    4 610194 469.49                  469.49         525.92         564.98         669.84 
availability - 
Cummins 234127 -                 

 no lead 
time given 

 no lead 
time given  4d  30d 

                                    1 610195 6.69                           6.69 

Aftermarket Parts 234115 -                  5w 

                                    1 610196 24.51                      24.51 

Aftermarket Parts 234115 -                  stock 

                                    1 610197 36.94                      36.94 

Aftermarket Parts 234115 -                  17w 

                                    1 610198 21.57                      21.57 

Aftermarket Parts 234115 -                  7w 

                                    1 810459 27.64                      27.64 

Coffman 234123 -                 
 no lead 

time given 



Due 04/27/23 @ 3:00 
PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Coffman Neopart Kirks Lakeside 
Intl

Crossline CBM Eldorado Gillig Cummins Mohawk Muncie Aftermarket 
Parts

Pace RFQ# 422474

                                     - 110142 -                    

-                 

                                     - 1010047 -                 

-                 

                                     - 610173 -                 

-                 

                                     - 1210162 -                 

-                 

                                     - 610190 -                 

-                 


	422474

