

Due 04/27/23 @  
3:00 PM

Pace

RFQ# 422473

WHITE=NO BID

Green=Disqualified

		TOTAL														
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
	Sku	Winning bid	Rome Truck - NO BID	Vehicle Maintenance	Cummins	Aftermarket Parts	Eldorado	Neopart	Coffman	Interstate Power	Kirks	Lakeside Intl	Gillig	CBM	Mohawk	Muncie
NO # of Bids																
8	40953	14.00		14.75		14.00		22.08			49.76	36.80	14.50		41.39	15.15
Availability - Gillig	234119	-		stock		6w		stock			stock	10d	stock		4w	stock
7	41215	159.27				216.71	393.21	159.27				163.97	164.53		192.93	192.93
Neopart	234117	-				5w	2w	stock				30d	stock		4w	stock
7	200863	9.40				10.54		15.53	9.61	10.83		10.43			9.40	10.71
Mohawk	234120	-				stock		3w	stock	stock		7d			stock	30d
6	200897	17.12				35.19		63.97		130.69		17.12			51.30	67.67
Aftermarket Parts	234115					stock		4w		stock		unapproved part			unapproved part	30d
7	200072	7.51				14.89		15.77			18.99	7.51	21.02		13.35	11.68
Muncie	234121	-				5w		4w			stock	unapproved part	stock		3w	stock
6	41213	181.09				181.09	560.39	290.55				187.63	182.80		305.22	
Aftermarket Parts	234121	-				stock	4w	20w				3d	stock		stock	
6	30361	5.58				7.28		9.42				16.16	9.05		5.58	11.35
Mohawk	234120	-				stock		MOQ				10d	stock		stock	30d
6	40079	8.10				23.16		18.17				31.17	17.25		8.10	19.59
Mohawk	234120	-				stock		stock				10d	2w		stock	stock
7	40922	17.35				45.77	61.92	51.95				37.21	37.20		17.35	32.12
Mohawk	234120	-				stock	4w	7w				3d	2w		stock	75d
5	41205	0.61				1.16		1.09				0.61			1.10	1.48
Availability - Neopart	234117					stock		stock				unapproved part			30d	30d
4	20535	47.37				58.07							52.29		47.37	81.18
Mohawk	234120					9w							stock		stock	stock
6	200913	14.92				17.05		22.05				18.53		26.55	22.11	14.92

Due 04/27/23 @  
3:00 PM

Pace

RFQ# 422473

WHITE=NO BID

TOTAL

Green=Disqualified

	Sku	Winning bid	Rome Truck - NO BID	Vehicle Maintenance	Cummins	Aftermarket Parts	Eldorado	Neopart	Coffman	Interstate Power	Kirks	Lakeside Intl	Gillig	CBM	Mohawk	Muncie
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
NO # of Bids																
Muncie	234121					stock		7w				10d		stock	4w	stock
2	200932	44.14				44.14	217.11									
Aftermarket Parts	234115					stock		2w								
1	41283	63.62					63.62									
Eldorado	234116	-					stock									
7	41288	73.99				144.25	169.41	129.54				169.98	98.78		73.99	132.98
Gillig	234119					stock	4w	7w				3d	stock		unapproved part	stock
6	41332	317.27				317.27		587.19				575.42	575.00		625.14	668.12
Gillig	234119					unapproved part		stock				10d	12w		21d	30d
1	110003	322.40					322.40									
Eldorado	234116	-					6w									
6	410000	106.10				106.10	198.59	126.08				180.74			126.58	131.81
Aftermarket Parts	234115	-				stock	6w	4w				10d			28d	30d
6	410006	97.01				307.96		235.49				97.01	229.14		343.52	245.31
Gillig	234119	-				stock		12w				unapproved part	stock		4w	30d
6	410009	126.58				146.90	198.59	128.12				180.74			126.58	132.96
Mohawk	234120	-				8w	6w	4w				unapproved part			stock	30d
5	2010020	13.23				76.28		59.21				21.10			13.23	62.26
Neopart	234117	-				5w		4w				unapproved part			unapproved part	30d
1	110019	53.75					53.75									
Eldorado	234116	-					stock									
6	410034	277.01				376.33		277.01				353.05	315.01		333.50	297.48

