Due 04/13/23 @ 3:00

PM Pace RFQ# 422438
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
-l ! ' ( | |/ [ | | [ | [ [ | | |
Sku Winning bid |lllinois Auto| Coffman P&G Genfare - Prevost Eldorado Kirks Muncie Interstate | Lakeside Mohawk | Cummins Gillig Aftermarket | Neopart
-NOBID NON Power - NO Intl Parts
NO # of Bids RESPONSIVE BID
4 290619 601.34 693.10 618.67 788.99 601.34
Neopart 234079 - 42d 2w stock 3w
1 620204 7.17 7.17
Aftermarket Parts 234078 - 8w
1 620202 3.81 3.81
Aftermarket Parts 234078 - 8w
1 620050 25.51 25.51
Aftermarket Parts 234078 7w
2 160795 7.90 7.90 11.37
Eldorado 234083 - 2w 6w
4 151458 167.42 245.73 388.00 167.42 292.32
Gillig 234084 - 75d 6w stock stock
3 71804 22.70 27.36 26.67 22.70
Neopart 234079 - 42d stock 6w
1 620202 37.39 37.39
Aftermarket Parts 234078 - 8w
6 70220 7.75 60.83 15.60 7.75 16.94 27.79 31.76
Mohawk 234085 - 2w stock stock stock stock stock
5 72059 436.16 580.75 995.25 436.16 562.50 741.05
Muncie 234086 stock stock stock 4w 12w
5 72143 11.25 19.31 13.00 11.25 12.30 12.55




Due 04/13/23 @ 3:00

PM Pace RFQ# 422438
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
-l ! ' ( | |/ [ | | [ | [ [ | | |
Sku Winning bid |lllinois Auto| Coffman P&G Genfare - Prevost Eldorado Kirks Muncie Interstate | Lakeside Mohawk | Cummins Gillig Aftermarket | Neopart
-NOBID NON Power - NO Intl Parts
NO # of Bids RESPONSIVE BID
Gillig 234084 stock 70d stock stock 10w
1 160590 12.79 12.79
Eldorado 234083 stock
2 72133 64.52 79.74 64.52
Neopart 234079 stock 20w
5 151457 169.32 245.73 388.00 227.22 169.32 292.32
Gillig 234084 - 75d 6w 21d stock Sw
- 170539 -
5 290537 187.02 252.89 211.89 187.02 235.40 191.18
Gillig 234084 75d 28d stock 3w 3w
2 620092 18.72 18.72 131.13
Mohawk 234085 - stock stock
1 620203 0.52 0.52
Aftermarket Parts 234078 - 8w
3 71807 11.20 11.20 19.05 12.48
Muncie 234086 - stock stock stock
1 620052 43.26 43.26
Aftermarket Parts 234078 - 5w
6 72094 19.95 21.00 33.95 22.30 19.95 26.00 28.66




Due 04/13/23 @ 3:00

PM Pace RFQ# 422438
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
-l ! ' ( | |/ [ | | [ | [ [ | | |
Sku Winning bid |lllinois Auto| Coffman P&G Genfare - Prevost Eldorado Kirks Muncie Interstate | Lakeside Mohawk | Cummins Gillig Aftermarket | Neopart
-NOBID NON Power - NO Intl Parts
NO # of Bids RESPONSIVE BID
unapproved

Prevost 234082 - stock 2w stock part 4w stock

5 71442 6.45 17.95 6.45 7.41 15.14 7.70
Muncie 234086 - stock stock 4w stock MoQ

3 151964 42.80 62.46 42.80 48.96
Muncie 234086 - 6w 35d stock

3 72162 37.20 39.13 37.20 70.41
Muncie 234086 - stock 42d 7w

1 72164 2,048.94 2,048.94
Aftermarket Parts 234078 - 14w

1 72185 10.49 10.49
Eldorado 234083 - stock

5 72184 6.13 21.70 6.13 14.21 25.35 6.33

unapproved

Muncie 234086 - stock stock part 8w stock

1 72204 24.32 24.32
Eldorado 234083 - stock

2 152006 35.53 35.53 137.98
Eldorado 234083 - stock 13w

1 152026 6.02 6.02
Eldorado 234083 - stock

1 72249 3.83 3.83
Eldorado 234083 - stock




Due 04/13/23 @ 3:00

PM Pace RFQ# 422438
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
-l ! ' ( | |/ [ | | [ | [ [ | | |
Sku Winning bid |lllinois Auto| Coffman P&G Genfare - Prevost Eldorado Kirks Muncie Interstate | Lakeside Mohawk | Cummins Gillig Aftermarket | Neopart
-NOBID NON Power - NO Intl Parts

NO # of Bids RESPONSIVE BID

6 290690 557.95 771.89 | 1,267.26 691.22 557.95 768.58 585.79
Gillig 234084 - 75d 3w 21d stock stock stock

4 220406 4.00 4.00 9.00 16.43 9.71
Kirks 234081 - stock stock 4w 3w

3 211121 35.99 35.99 36.21 51.75
Muncie 234086 - stock stock stock

4 72382 312.50 565.31 312.50 332.32 315.00
Muncie 234086 - 4w 90d 15w 13w

3 290700 173.00 315.64 173.00 245.95
Muncie 234086 - 16w stock 26w

6 72388 39.50 101.74 80.02 42.25 39.50 69.67 73.13
Gillig 234084 - 6w 42d stock stock 4w 6w

5 170718 68.03 99.16 124.16 68.03 78.92 94.74
Muncie 234086 - 75d 4w 21d 8w 5w

1 152082 99.67 99.67
Eldorado 234083 - 4w

5| 1610013 85.86 439.64 217.33 85.86 178.76 253.17

unapproved

Gillig 234084 - 2w stock part stock stock

2| 1510008 20.03 26.64 20.03
Aftermarket Parts 234078 - 2w stock




Due 04/13/23 @ 3:00

PM Pace RFQ# 422438
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
-l ! ' ( | |/ [ | | [ | [ [ | | |
Sku Winning bid |lllinois Auto| Coffman P&G Genfare - Prevost Eldorado Kirks Muncie Interstate | Lakeside Mohawk | Cummins Gillig Aftermarket | Neopart
-NOBID NON Power - NO Intl Parts

NO # of Bids RESPONSIVE BID

6 710025 34.65 121.27 189.09 36.22 90.11 40.88 34.65
Neopart 234079 - stock 8w 42d stock stock 6w

2 710037 0.31 0.31 5.93

unapproved

Aftermarket Parts 234078 - part stock

5 710048 68.95 68.95 82.00 71.91 72.16 94.84

no lead

Coffman 234092 - stock 30d time given 3d Sw

3 710052 2,685.00 2,685.00 4,134.13 2,850.00
P&G 234089 - stock 4w 6w

2 2910007 64.13 83.82 64.13
Aftermarket Parts 234078 - 16w stock

- 1810033 =

3 710136 738.17 738.17 760.20 1,507.17
Eldorado 234083 - stock 12w 18w

3 710137 569.43 1,088.74 570.15 569.43
Aftermarket Parts 234078 - stock 12w 9w

1 710138 90.12 90.12
Aftermarket Parts 234078 - stock

3 2510046 27.88 42.28 27.88 40.52
Aftermarket Parts 234078 - stock Sw 10d




Due 04/13/23 @ 3:00

PM Pace RFQ# 422438
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
-l ! ' ( | |/ [ | | [ | [ [ | | |
Sku Winning bid |lllinois Auto| Coffman P&G Genfare - Prevost Eldorado Kirks Muncie Interstate | Lakeside Mohawk | Cummins Gillig Aftermarket | Neopart
-NOBID NON Power - NO Intl Parts

NO # of Bids RESPONSIVE BID

5 710166 262.08 293.50 262.08 312.40 293.51 416.05
Muncie 234086 - stock stock 3d stock stock

1| 1510141 29.72 29.72
Eldorado 234083 - stock

3 2510070 4.69 4.98 5.58 4.69
Neopart 234079 - stock stock 10d

1 2910030 331.51 331.51
Aftermarket Parts 234078 - stock

1 1510209 6.17 6.17
Eldorado 234083 - stock

2 1810062 808.78 808.78 1,147.66
Gillig 234084 - 12w 10w

1 710278 1,695.99 1,695.99
Eldorado 234083 - 8w

1 710288 44.95 44.95
Aftermarket Parts 234078 - stock

1 1710084 709.45 709.45
Aftermarket Parts 234078 - 8w

1 710310 699.06 699.06

no lead

Aftermarket Parts 234078 - time given

2 1810083 2,500.00 2,500.00 3,483.57




Due 04/13/23 @ 3:00

PM Pace RFQ# 422438
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
-l ! ' ( | |/ [ | | [ | [ [ | | |
Sku Winning bid |lllinois Auto| Coffman P&G Genfare - Prevost Eldorado Kirks Muncie Interstate | Lakeside Mohawk | Cummins Gillig Aftermarket | Neopart
-NOBID NON Power - NO Intl Parts

NO # of Bids RESPONSIVE BID
Gillig 234084 - 12w 15w

1 710321 610.04 610.04
Eldorado 234083 - 2w

1 2910062 1,217.24 1,217.24
Eldorado 234083 - 4w

1 2910063 2,718.27 2,718.27
Eldorado 234083 - 12w

4 710374 16.43 16.43 45.30 16.99 17.17
Muncie 234086 - stock 30d 2w 9w

- 2110230 =

4 710449 18.64 18.64 23.56 19.30 20.26
Coffman 234092 - stock 30d 7d 3d

1 2110277 78.95 78.95
Eldorado 234083 - 8w

- 710460 =

1 1510339 6.72 6.72
Eldorado 234083 - stock

4 72121 33.37 33.37 72.93 64.51 93.22
Prevost 234082 - stock 6w MoQ 5w




Due 04/13/23 @ 3:00
PM Pace

WHITE=NO BID

TOTAL

RFQ# 422438

Sku Winning bid |lllinois Auto| Coffman P&G Genfare - Prevost Eldorado Kirks Muncie Interstate | Lakeside Mohawk | Cummins Gillig Aftermarket | Neopart
-NOBID NON Power - NO Intl Parts

NO # of Bids RESPONSIVE BID

- 71641 -

- 1710004 -

1 710097 40.24 40.24

bid 3, need

Muncie 234086 - 5

- 1610209 -




	422438

