Due 04/13/23 @

3:00 PM Pace RFQ# 422437
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sku Winning bid Rome Illinois Vehicle Interstate P&G Genfare - | Neopart | Crossline | Coffman Prevost | Suburban | Eldorado Kirks Lakeside Gillig Cummins Aftermarket | Suburban
Truck - NO | Auto - NO |Maintenance|  poyer NO BID Truck Intl Parts Truck
NO # of Bids BID BID
6 130684 6.89 8.33 7.12 8.33 6.89 14.85 7.44
no lead
Mohawk 234085 - 10d stock time given 3w stock 21d
3 60734 2.67 5.39 10.02 2.67
Muncie 234086 - stock 3d 30d
1 60735 1,457.06 1,457.06
Eldorado 234083 - stock
7 130581 57.56 72.21 57.56 62.68 70.00 61.88 84.87 61.32
Coffman 234092 stock stock 7d stock stock 6w 30d
11 81262 5.61 5.61 7.56 12.94 7.09 8.01 11.65 12.25 7.10 8.11 7.56 6.68
Vehicle Maintenance 234087 - stock stock 3w stock stock 3d stock stock stock stock stock
10 110136 99.18 132.02 103.52 147.11 214.98 108.00 168.42 99.18 107.17 103.52 119.19
no lead time
Mohawk 234085 - stock 10d 3w stock 30d 30d Aw given stock 30d
5 60373 8.41 17.46 58.75 35.82 8.41 42.10
unapproved
Aftermarket Parts 234078 - stock part aw stock 21d
7 130618 321.82 376.67 321.82 560.74 410.90 338.63 508.66 344.19
Coffman 234092 - stock stock 10d stock stock stock 30d
4 81397 686.25 686.25 740.87 688.91 1,194.12
Coffman 234092 - stock 5d 3d Sw
7 81444 43.11 73.44 114.98 43.11 71.50 59.40 90.63 79.99
unapproved
Mohawk 234085 6w stock part 4w stock 8w 100d
9 81502 22.43 36.37 28.67 41.50 28.13 28.67 28.18 22.43 31.01 35.77
unapproved
Mohawk 234085 stock stock 3w stock stock part stock stock stock
5 110150 25.87 25.87 26.50 25.90 106.62 29.82
unapproved
Coffman 234092 stock part 3d Sw 21d
6 81516 11.78 12.00 12.63 11.78 14.26 16.83 14.00
Cummins 234080 stock 3d 3d 4w stock 21d
8 81519 64.67 118.68 106.01 95.75 64.67 105.16 85.00 102.33 146.44
Kirks 234078 - stock stock stock stock 20d stock stock stock
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Sku Winning bid Rome Illinois Vehicle Interstate P&G Genfare - | Neopart | Crossline | Coffman Prevost | Suburban | Eldorado Kirks Lakeside Gillig Cummins Aftermarket | Suburban
Truck - NO | Auto - NO |Maintenance|  poyer NO BID Truck Intl Parts Truck
NO # of Bids BID BID
11 81521 16.92 17.97 23.20 33.42 22.18 23.20 28.00 36.44 33.50 20.95 28.10 16.92
Muncie 234086 stock stock 3w stock stock 30d 10d 2w stock 3w 30d
9 610001 41.76 55.20 48.55 74.91 42.69 48.55 70.13 41.76 79.13 52.62
Mohawk 234085 stock stock 3w stock stock 20d stock 6w stock
4 1110000 55.00 55.00 73.52 68.01 58.90
unapproved
Kirks 234078 - 30d part stock 21d
9 1210002 31.15 4131 33.93 50.00 31.94 33.93 52.47 31.15 31.38 38.92
unapproved
Mohawk 234085 - stock stock 3w stock stock part 2w Aw stock
4 810007 436.00 436.00 514.25 555.00 588.69
P&G 234089 - stock stock stock 16w
7 1210005 14.16 18.32 14.16 24.84 23.27 14.76 26.14 16.81
Coffman 234092 - stock stock stock 5d 2w 8w stock
6 810017 61.57 88.14 71.95 61.57 68.90 82.90 94.15
Lakeside Intl 234093 - stock stock 20d 2w 1iw stock
4 1010002 5.25 12.25 7.91 6.96 5.25
unapproved
Aftermarket Parts 234078 - stock stock part stock
1 1010005 552.02 552.02
Eldorado 234083 - 4w
9 610019 82.00 94.33 192.89 93.37 82.00 203.07 190.79 89.18 132.65 206.62
Eldorado 234083 - 4w stock stock stock 7d 3d stock 7w stock
6 810027 604.00 604.00 652.45 701.10 658.94 876.39 757.57
Crossline 234091 - stock stock 7d stock stock 30d
7 610031 26.99 35.51 26.99 37.95 35.58 27.33 50.56 34.47
Kirks 234081 - stock stock 7d stock stock stock stock
2 610035 16.82 16.82 25.12
Aftermarket Parts 234078 - stock stock
1 610036 3,858.09 3,858.09
Eldorado 234083 - 12w
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3:00 PM Pace RFQ# 422437
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Sku Winning bid Rome Illinois Vehicle Interstate P&G Genfare - | Neopart | Crossline | Coffman Prevost | Suburban | Eldorado Kirks Lakeside Gillig Cummins Aftermarket | Suburban
Truck - NO | Auto - NO |Maintenance|  poyer NO BID Truck Intl Parts Truck
NO # of Bids BID BID
8 810060 25.88 54.98 42.00 45.63 48.77 45.75 25.88 64.97 43.46
Mohawk 234085 - stock stock stock 7d stock stock stock stock
6| 1210030 361.00 361.00 385.97 362.71 457.14 581.33 417.17
Coffman 234092 - stock 7d stock 4w stock stock
5 810064,  4,215.02 5,295.65 4,484.17 4,215.02 5,972.83 4,898.62
Cummins 234080 - stock 14d 4d stock 30d
7 810066 81.25 81.37 81.25 185.87 178.11 92.00 247.58 204.88
unapproved
Kirks 234081 - stock stock 7d stock part stock 30d
8 1210033 29.53 40.82 38.78 56.39 31.56 51.86 29.53 38.90 37.97
Mohawk 234085 - stock 14d 3w 1od 20d stock 7w 30d
6 610058 48.87 124.00 106.97 115.59 100.46 48.87 395.49
Mohawk 234085 - 3w 7d 4w 3d stock stock
6 810078 444.39 444.39 459.35 488.97 463.87 657.45 533.29
Crossline 234091 - stock stock 7d 3d stock 30d
6 810079 455.00 455.00 459.35 488.97 463.87 657.45 462.65
Crossline 234091 - stock stock 7d 3d stock stock
7 810084 775.00 775.00 920.00 976.45 1,038.76 976.34 1,390.06 956.91
Availability -
Crosslline 234091 - 8w stock stock 7d 3d 6w stock
5| 1210039 1.48 1.57 1.68 1.48 2.19 1.90
Cummins 234080 - stock 7d 3d Sw 30d
8 1010028 5.81 6.97 14.65 5.81 16.50 18.48 8.11 8.86 21.58
unapproved
Kirks 234081 - stock stock stock 7d stock part stock 30d
5 810110 1,215.00 1,745.50 1,215.00| 1,491.75 2,086.59 1,864.71
Kirks 234081 - stock stock 7d 4d 5w
6| 1210071 166.88 238.61 255.88 240.43 166.88 319.86 263.79
unapproved
Coffman 234092 - stock 7d stock part 9w stock
1 610070 85.72 85.72
Eldorado 234083 - 6w
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Sku Winning bid Rome Illinois Vehicle Interstate P&G Genfare - | Neopart | Crossline | Coffman Prevost | Suburban | Eldorado Kirks Lakeside Gillig Cummins Aftermarket | Suburban
Truck - NO | Auto - NO |Maintenance|  poyer NO BID Truck Intl Parts Truck

NO # of Bids BID BID

8 810141 2271 51.20 53.98 77.89 83.52 78.41 22.71 111.25 58.98

unapproved

Neopart 234079 - stock stock stock 7d stock part stock stock

8 610073 6.19 6.19 7.08 8.17 11.63 12.25 6.35 10.76 8.44
Vehicle Maintenance 234087 - stock stock stock 20d stock 4w 5w 21d

2 610076 23.55 33.52 23.55
Muncie 234086 - stock 30d

7 810173 16.55 28.00 29.64 31.00 29.04 16.55 41.29 33.50

unapproved

Crossline 234091 - stock stock 7d stock part stock 21d

6 810180 7.61 7.67 8.20 7.61 9.20 12.77 8.99

no lead

Cummins 234080 - time given 7d 3d 4w stock 21d

5 810181 271 2.78 2.98 2.71 4.66 3.30
Cummins 234080 - stock 7d stock 6w 30d

7 810192 1,150.00 1,150.00 1,695.00 1,732.60 1,789.98 1,716.14 2,237.51 1,714.00
Neopart 234079 - 8w stock stock 7d 4d 6w stock

5 810222 223.98 225.70 233.71 223.98 292.14 260.55
Cummins 234080 - stock 7d 3d 5w 30d

6 1010049 1,259.01 1,495.00 1,259.01 1,352.90 1,521.60 2,718.83 1,811.50

no lead

Coffman 234092 - 3w stock time given 4d 9w 21d

4 1010050 5,003.05 5,003.05 5,322.39 5,985.00 10,213.30
Coffman 234092 - stock 7d 4d 6w

5 1010052 113.14 113.14 121.32 136.13 151.66 160.22
Coffman 234092 - stock 7d stock Iw 30d

5 1010055 113.14 113.14 121.32 136.13 137.36 164.13
Coffman 234092 - stock 7d 3d 14w 30d

7 810232 440.00 495.00 440.00 459.35 493.66 463.87 657.45 457.90

bid 9, need

Crossline 234091 - 10 stock stock 7d stock Sw stock

5 1010062 33.15 33.15 35.44 33.21 55.19 39.10
Coffman 234092 - stock 7d 3d stock 30d
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Sku Winning bid Rome Illinois Vehicle Interstate P&G Genfare - | Neopart | Crossline | Coffman Prevost | Suburban | Eldorado Kirks Lakeside Gillig Cummins Aftermarket | Suburban
Truck - NO | Auto - NO |Maintenance|  poyer NO BID Truck Intl Parts Truck

NO # of Bids BID BID

5 810237 33.41 33.55 34.95 33.41 43.68 38.45
Cummins 234080 - stock 7d stock Sw 30d

5 1010067 268.60 290.55 310.22 291.46 413.14 268.60
Muncie 234086 - stock 7d stock stock stock

1 810244 120.97 120.97
Eldorado 234083 - 4w

5 810245 280.39 280.39 293.01 280.80 390.23 319.22
Coffman 234092 - stock 7d 3d Iw 30d

5 810279 355.79 355.79 381.60 358.55 867.86 402.90
Coffman 234092 - stock 7d stock Iw 21d

6 810309 5.66 19.00 20.30 18.98 5.66 27.04 21.90

unapproved

Cummins 234080 - stock 7d 3d part aw 21d

3 1010078 701.00 701.00 718.21 897.63
Coffman 234092 - 90d 20d w

3 810372 868.60 868.60 924.19 1,230.81
Coffman 234092 - 90d 20d 12w

5 810389 363.00 363.00 370.20 498.40 479.49 510.40

no lead

Crossline 234091 - stock time given 14d 4d aw

- 610173 -

5 1210156 35.19 45.51 35.19 57.81 53.46 43.08
Coffman 234092 - stock stock 20d 6w 21d

4 810412 3,699.35 3,699.35 3,973.70 3,734.58 6,472.57
Coffman 234092 - stock 7d 3d 9w

8 1210160 33.72 43.39 33.72 35.35 55.12 50.50 36.60 50.98 41.08
Neopart 234079 - stock 4w stock 20d stock stock 1lw 21d

6 1210161 52.75 68.31 53.18 75.14 78.99 52.75 80.83
Mohawk 234085 - stock stock 20d stock 4w Iw
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Sku Winning bid Rome Illinois Vehicle Interstate P&G Genfare - | Neopart | Crossline | Coffman Prevost | Suburban | Eldorado Kirks Lakeside Gillig Cummins Aftermarket | Suburban
Truck - NO | Auto - NO |Maintenance|  poyer NO BID Truck Intl Parts Truck

NO # of Bids BID BID

5 810437 1.44 4.92 5.29 4.87 1.44 7.04

unapproved

Cummins 234080 - stock 7d 3d part stock

3 810439 19.07 19.29 19.99 19.07
Cummins 234080 - stock 7d 3d

1 810450 197.46 197.46
Aftermarket Parts 234078 - stock

1 810451 197.46 197.46
Aftermarket Parts 234078 - 3w

1 1210168 4.82 4.82
Aftermarket Parts 234078 - stock

1 1210169 67.75 67.75
Aftermarket Parts 234078 - 10w

4 810458 750.56 937.47 798.70 750.56 1,063.69

no lead

Cummins 234080 - time given 7d 4d Sw

- 110142 =

- 1010047 =

- 1210162 =

- 610190 =
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