
Due 04/13/23 @ 3:00 
PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Vehicle 
Maintenance - 

NO BID

Rome Truck 
- NO BID

Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Aftermarket 
Parts

Interstate 
Power

Coffman Neopart Genfare - 
NO BID

Cummins Lakeside 
Intl

Kirks Suburban 
Truck

Prevost Eldorado Gillig Mohawk Muncie

                                    5 41236 180.37                  246.95         180.37         259.91         208.17 195.45       

Neopart 234079 -                  5w  4w  8d  30d 21d

                                    3 20705 42.55                      66.00           42.55 72.99         

Mohawk 234085 -                  stock  stock 42d

                                    6 200522 21.50                      67.30           37.45           58.77           26.69           21.50 37.50         

Mohawk 234085 -                  5w  14d  4w  3d  stock stock

                                    7 200548 8.44                         26.65           20.69             8.44           20.66           24.42           24.17 22.66         

Prevost 234082  5w  4w 
 unapproved 

part  stock  stock  30d 30d

                                    6 200598 9.90                         17.51           12.30           12.26           13.01             9.90 14.56         

Cummins 234080 -                  stock  stock  3d  5d 
 unapproved 

part 21d

                                    7 40165 3.35                         14.73           11.47           45.08           36.01           11.99             3.35 5.40            

Mohawk 234085 -                  5w  stock  10d  stock  4w  stock 
 bid 36, 
need 60 

                                    2 30389 221.49                  272.32 221.49       

Aftermarket Parts 234078 -                  stock MOQ

                                    8 200525 63.29                    168.67         156.06         133.33         232.32         418.03           63.29           69.99 141.95       

Gillig 234084 -                  stock  14d  stock  7d  stock  stock  stock 30d

                                    7 40090 0.71                           0.72             0.91             1.07             1.11             0.75             0.97 0.71            

Muncie 234086 -                  stock  stock  7d  stock  stock  stock stock

                                    3 20535 47.35                      58.07           47.35 78.45         

Mohawk 234085  9w  stock stock

                                    5 41266 1,143.96            1,454.95      1,395.81      1,143.96      1,171.05 2,006.89    

Gillig 234084  12w  7w 
 no lead 

time given  6w 70d

                                    7 41288 75.12                    144.25         129.83         151.25         169.41           98.78           75.12 132.98       

Gillig 234084  stock  7w  3d  4w  stock 
 unapproved 

part stock

Pace RFQ# 422436



Due 04/13/23 @ 3:00 
PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Vehicle 
Maintenance - 

NO BID

Rome Truck 
- NO BID

Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Aftermarket 
Parts

Interstate 
Power

Coffman Neopart Genfare - 
NO BID

Cummins Lakeside 
Intl

Kirks Suburban 
Truck

Prevost Eldorado Gillig Mohawk Muncie

Pace RFQ# 422436

                                    8 30161 24.25                      43.80           45.86           45.08           62.66           37.42           24.25           44.06 54.32         

Gillig 234084  stock  stock  10d  stock  75d  stock  stock 42d

                                    1 30483 182.77                  182.77 

Eldorado 234083 -                  stock 

                                    1 110004 182.77                  182.77 

Eldorado 234083  stock 

                                    6 410006 110.71                  307.96         236.03         110.71         229.14         334.60 245.31       

Gillig 234084  stock  2w 
 unapproved 

part  2w  2w  21d 

                                    7 410010 126.83                  174.94         202.36         234.59         853.49         175.00         126.83 242.02       

Aftermarket Parts 234078 -                  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part  3w  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock 

                                    1 110006 338.30                  338.30 

Eldorado 234083 -                  12w 

                                    1 110007 326.20                  326.20 

Eldorado 234083 -                  stock 

                                    5 2010016 139.66                  227.18         182.44         139.66         215.21 201.15       

Eldorado 234083 -                  5w  stock  6w  2w 30d

                                    6 2010018 32.36                      69.98           65.53           32.36           88.14           98.85 67.82         
Availability - 
Aftermarket Parts 234078 -                  stock  7w 

 unapproved 
part  stock  2w 70d

                                    5 110014 123.28                  144.21         209.85         129.15         350.50 123.28       

Aftermarket Parts 234078 -                  stock  stock  stock  30d  stock 

                                    4 310008 107.64                  129.46         107.64         316.40         217.65 

Neopart 234079 -                  stock  7w  20d  stock 

                                    1 110018 1,031.09            1,031.09 

Eldorado 234083 -                  stock 



Due 04/13/23 @ 3:00 
PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Vehicle 
Maintenance - 

NO BID

Rome Truck 
- NO BID

Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Aftermarket 
Parts

Interstate 
Power

Coffman Neopart Genfare - 
NO BID

Cummins Lakeside 
Intl

Kirks Suburban 
Truck

Prevost Eldorado Gillig Mohawk Muncie

Pace RFQ# 422436

                                    6 410034 277.01                  376.33         277.01         402.89         303.91         336.01 297.48       

Neopart 234079 -                  stock  4w  7d  stock  stock 30d

                                    1 110022 39.48                      39.48 

Eldorado 234083 -                  stock 

                                    1 110023 15.06                      15.06 

Eldorado 234083 -                  stock 

                                    5 2010041 2,099.00            3,736.29      3,228.23      3,228.13      2,685.96      2,099.00 

Kirks 234081 -                  stock 
 no lead 

time given  3d 
 unapproved 

part  stock 

                                    1 2410015 16.06                      16.06 

Aftermarket Parts 234078 -                  5w 

                                    4 310038 571.55                  603.37         699.55      1,171.42 571.55       

Muncie 234086 -                  10w  30d  4w 30d

                                    6 410081 5.77                           7.60             5.88             6.18             6.12             5.77 6.59            

Gillig 234084 -                  stock  stock  10d  stock  stock 21d

                                    1 110038 1.14                           1.14 

Eldorado 234083 -                  2w 

                                    5 410091 1,155.54            1,571.29      1,155.54      1,604.94      1,203.38 1,219.88    

Neopart 234079 -                  6w  stock  30d  4w 30d

                                    1 210029 229.22                  229.22 

Aftermarket Parts 234078 -                  13w 

                                    1 2010091 5.07                           5.07 

Aftermarket Parts 234078 -                  4w 

                                    5 2010092 2,500.00            6,343.36      4,476.61      5,306.50      2,500.00 4,730.05    

Kirks 234081 -                  7w 
 no lead 

time given  105d  stock  21d 



Due 04/13/23 @ 3:00 
PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Vehicle 
Maintenance - 

NO BID

Rome Truck 
- NO BID

Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Aftermarket 
Parts

Interstate 
Power

Coffman Neopart Genfare - 
NO BID

Cummins Lakeside 
Intl

Kirks Suburban 
Truck

Prevost Eldorado Gillig Mohawk Muncie

Pace RFQ# 422436

                                    4 410135 64.52                      85.27           64.52         103.28 73.90         

Neopart 234079 -                  stock  stock  4w  60d 

                                    4 410136 89.26                    117.96           89.26         105.10 92.57         

Neopart 234079 -                  stock  stock  4w stock


	422436

