
Due:  03/28/23 at 
10:00 AM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Curved 
Glass

Interstate 
Power - NO 

BID

Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Battery 
Service

Neopart Kirks Eldorado Muncie Lakeside 
Intl

Aftermarket 
Parts

Gillig Mohawk Cummins P&G Translite Filter 
Services

                                  4 290415 592.34                601.34        695.42        788.99        592.34 

Gillig 234045 -                 3w  42d  stock  stock 

                                  1 151851 7.41                          7.41 

Aftermarket Parts 234052 -                 6w 

                                  2 71733 90.79                     90.79          97.02 

Aftermarket Parts 234052 -                 stock  stock 

                                  1 620034 147.16                147.16 

Gillig 234045  8w 

                                  4 170528 182.93                250.00        193.55        492.36        182.93 

Translite 234063 -                 stock  21d  stock  stock 

                                  1 620050 25.51                     25.51 

Gillig 234045 -                 7w 

                                  3 72121 64.51                     72.93          64.51          93.25 

Muncie 234053 -                 stock  42d  5w 

                                  5 151458 167.42                179.96        388.00        219.88        292.32        167.42 

Gillig 234045 -                 stock  6w  stock  stock  stock 

                                  5 71441 6.57                       17.95             6.57          15.14             7.08             7.52 

Muncie 234053 -                 2w  21d  19w  stock  4w 

                                  6 70220 7.65                       31.76          60.83          15.68          25.73          15.25             7.65 

Mohawk 234054  stock  2w  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                  1 160590 12.79                     12.79 

Eldorado 234044  stock 

                                  5 220339 3.33                          7.09             3.33             4.29             4.48             3.50 

Aftermarket Parts 234052  4w  MOQ  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part 

                                  4 210975 22.68                     79.87          26.99          43.52          22.68 

Pace RFQ# 422413



Due:  03/28/23 at 
10:00 AM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Curved 
Glass

Interstate 
Power - NO 

BID

Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Battery 
Service

Neopart Kirks Eldorado Muncie Lakeside 
Intl

Aftermarket 
Parts

Gillig Mohawk Cummins P&G Translite Filter 
Services

Pace RFQ# 422413

Mohawk 234054  2w  21d  14w  stock 

                                  6 290028 22.40                     36.78          27.96          30.26          22.47          32.26          22.40 

Mohawk 234054 -                 4w  stock  3d  stock  stock  stock 

                                  3 180794 10.18                     15.05          25.24          10.18 

Aftermarket Parts 234052  9w  8w 
 unapproved 

part 

                                  4 220080 2.90                          9.25             2.90             6.13             3.40 

Muncie 234053  stock  30d  20d  stock 

                                  - 71641 -                

-                

                                  3 290289 11.56                     11.56          31.84          14.19 

Neopart 234042 -                 3w  21d  stock 

                                  1 210834 21.46                     21.46 

Aftermarket Parts 234052 -                 3w 

                                  1 620113 203.56                203.56 

Aftermarket Parts 234052 -                 7w 

                                  1 620052 43.26                     43.26 

Aftermarket Parts 234052 -                 5w 

                                  6 72094 19.35                     19.61          33.95          24.90          19.35          28.66          26.57 

Vehicle Maintenance 234056 -                 stock  4w  30d 
 unapproved 

part  stock  30d 

                                  5 71442 6.45                       17.95             6.45          15.14             7.08             7.52 

Muncie 234053 -                 stock  21d  stock  stock  stock 

                                  4 220129 2.91                          7.36             2.91             4.09             4.89 

Eldorado 234044 -                 stock  stock  20d  6w 

                                  4 72109 777.92                777.92     1,578.49     1,968.57     1,539.23 

Eldorado 234044 -                 2w  90d  10w  18w 



Due:  03/28/23 at 
10:00 AM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Curved 
Glass

Interstate 
Power - NO 

BID

Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Battery 
Service

Neopart Kirks Eldorado Muncie Lakeside 
Intl

Aftermarket 
Parts

Gillig Mohawk Cummins P&G Translite Filter 
Services

Pace RFQ# 422413

                                  1 151960 7.53                          7.53 

Eldorado 234044 -                 stock 

                                  4 72156 21.99                     21.99          23.23          27.67          25.00 

Neopart 234042 -                 8w  42d  13w  12w 

                                  1 72163 591.15                591.15 

Eldorado 234044 -                 6w 

                                  1 72185 10.49                     10.49 

Eldorado 234044 -                 stock 

                                  2 152006 35.53                     35.53        137.98 

Eldorado 234044 -                 stock  13w 

                                  4 290674 249.00                928.76        287.78        370.07        249.00 

Gillig 234045 -                 4w  21d  stock  stock 

                                  3 72216 169.67                383.01        285.27        169.67 

Gillig 234045 -                 stock  stock  stock 

                                  2 180834 157.46                174.01        157.46 

Gillig 234045 -                 13w  12w 

                                  4 72295 26.59                     39.13          36.64          43.96          26.59 

Mohawk 234054 -                 6w  60d  stock  3w 

                                  4 72301 320.91                348.97        346.00        320.91        595.75 

Kirks 234046 -                 3w  stock 
 unapproved 

part  7w 

                                  3 211114 40.29                     42.99          58.73          40.29 

Mohawk 234054 -                 21d  stock  stock 

                                  3 170706 345.39                345.39        474.90        395.08 

Eldorado 234044 -                 stock  30d  stock 

                                  1 170708 157.09                157.09 



Due:  03/28/23 at 
10:00 AM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Curved 
Glass

Interstate 
Power - NO 

BID

Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Battery 
Service

Neopart Kirks Eldorado Muncie Lakeside 
Intl

Aftermarket 
Parts

Gillig Mohawk Cummins P&G Translite Filter 
Services

Pace RFQ# 422413

Eldorado 234044 -                 2w 

                                  4 290695 69.04                     75.74        110.18          69.04          93.31 

Muncie 234053 -                 stock  stock  stock  25w 

                                  5 290696 9.60                       32.56          53.94          29.25          26.33             9.60 

Aftermarket Parts 234052 -                 stock  16w  160d  6w 
 unapproved 

part 

                                  4 170715 781.41             1,725.96        786.49        913.91        781.41 

Gillig 234045 -                 4w  30d  stock  8w 

                                  3 170716 1,127.26          1,725.96     1,127.26     1,200.00 

Muncie 234053 -                 stock  30d  12w 

                                  1 211124 3.28              3.28           

Filter Services 234064 -                60d

                                  3 290700 185.58                315.64        185.58        245.95 

Muncie 234053 -                 16w  stock  26w 

                                  6 72388 38.25                     73.67        101.74          78.65          69.67          39.75          38.25 

Mohawk 234054 -                 9w  6w  45d  9w  stock  stock 

                                  4 170718 70.70                   124.16          70.70          94.74          84.56 

Muncie 234053 -                 6w  stock  stock  6w 

                                  1 152079 6.72                          6.72 

NOT AWARDED -                 stock 

                                  3 170722 88.41                     88.41        185.90        350.44 

Eldorado 234044 -                 2w  30d  stock 

                                  1 1710002 189.62                189.62 

Aftermarket Parts 234052 -                 13w 

                                  1 710004 33.95                     33.95 

Eldorado 234044 -                 2w 



Due:  03/28/23 at 
10:00 AM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Curved 
Glass

Interstate 
Power - NO 

BID

Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Battery 
Service

Neopart Kirks Eldorado Muncie Lakeside 
Intl

Aftermarket 
Parts

Gillig Mohawk Cummins P&G Translite Filter 
Services

Pace RFQ# 422413

                                  3 1610017 145.42                156.99        195.36        145.42 

Gillig 234045 -                 stock  3w  stock 

                                  2 1510007 31.48                     31.48          64.67 

Eldorado 234044 -                 stock  stock 

                                  3 2510007 727.70                758.53     1,006.83        727.70 

Gillig 234045 -                 10d  stock  4w 

                                  2 1610018 37.28                     44.53          37.28 

Gillig 234045 -                 stock  stock 

                                  4 710048 72.16                     82.00          76.94          94.84          72.16 

Cummins 234061 -                 30d  7d  5w  3d 

                                  1 710097 40.24                     40.24 

NOT AWARDED -                
 bid 3, need 

5 

                                  2 2910015 19.30                     27.65          19.30 

Aftermarket Parts 234052 -                 16w  stock 

                                  1 710115 80.24                     80.24 

Eldorado 234044 -                 stock 

                                  3 710116 37.77                     37.77          80.24          43.57 

Gillig 234045 -                 stock  stock  9w 

                                  5 710120 432.32                471.00        491.27        616.28        475.23        432.32 

P&G 234062 -                 60d  30d  stock  4w  120d 

                                  2 6510012 1,150.00          1,572.21     1,150.00 

Gillig 234045 -                 8w  12w 

                                  1 710130 214.93                214.93 

Eldorado 234044 -                 6w 

                                  2 1810036 146.28                170.04        146.28 



Due:  03/28/23 at 
10:00 AM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Curved 
Glass

Interstate 
Power - NO 

BID

Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Battery 
Service

Neopart Kirks Eldorado Muncie Lakeside 
Intl

Aftermarket 
Parts

Gillig Mohawk Cummins P&G Translite Filter 
Services

Pace RFQ# 422413

Gillig 234045 -                 13w  4w 

                                  3 710161 55.88                   150.23          66.33          55.88 

Mohawk 234054 -                 6w  9w  7w 

                                  2 2910022 105.00                243.42        105.00 

Gillig 234045 -                 6w  stock 

                                  4 2910028 127.90                127.90        148.35        166.27        130.38 

Neopart 234042 -                 3w  21d  5w  4w 

                                  1 1610099 538.20                538.20 

Eldorado 234044 -                 4w 

                                  3 2510148 24.32                     24.32          30.83          25.28 

Neopart 234042 -                 10d  6w  2w 

                                  3 2510149 27.35                     27.35          32.53          28.77 

Neopart 234042 -                 10d  6w  2w 

                                  2 2910042 51.75                     51.75          64.21 

Muncie 234053 -                 21d  5w 

                                  1 2110142 21.89                     21.89 

Aftermarket Parts 234052 -                 stock 

                                  1 710311 647.28                647.28 

Aftermarket Parts 234052 -                
 no lead 

time given 

                                  1 1610158 59.79                     59.79 

Eldorado 234044 -                 6w 

                                  2 2510164 5.28                          5.33             5.28 

Gillig 234045 -                 10d  2w 

                                  1 1510243 370.74                370.74 

Aftermarket Parts 234052 -                 5w 



Due:  03/28/23 at 
10:00 AM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Curved 
Glass

Interstate 
Power - NO 

BID

Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Battery 
Service

Neopart Kirks Eldorado Muncie Lakeside 
Intl

Aftermarket 
Parts

Gillig Mohawk Cummins P&G Translite Filter 
Services

Pace RFQ# 422413

                                  2 2110206 160.68                160.68        165.87 

Aftermarket Parts 234052 -                 9w  3w 

                                  2 2110208 260.69                260.69        350.67 

Muncie 234053 -                 90d  stock 

                                  1 1510295 755.29                755.29 

Aftermarket Parts 234052 -                 7w 

                                  3 2110212 67.50                     67.50          88.28          67.91 

Muncie 234053 -                 stock  stock  stock 

                                  2 2110264 2.76                          4.73             2.76 

Mohawk 234054 -                 stock  stock 

                                  2 2110265 6.85                       12.33             6.85 

Mohawk 234054 -                 stock  3w 

                                  1 710458 301.87                301.87 

Aftermarket Parts -                 5w 


	422413

