Due: 03/28/23 at

10:00 AM Pace RFQit 422412
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL -
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sku Winning bid | A&A Auto Rome Neopart Vehicle Genfare - | Crossline Kirks Eldorado | Coffman | Lakeside CBM Gillig Aftermarket| Mohawk Muncie | Cummins | Suburban
Truck - NO Maintenance| NQ BID Intl Parts Truck
NO # of Bids BID
5 60377 24.65 50.00 24.65 85.21 38.67 65.43
Kirks 234046 - 7d stock 20d stock 4w
6 130581 57.56 57.56 69.87 70.00 84.87 61.88 61.32
Coffman 234059 - stock 10d stock stock stock stock
6 130611 184.36 309.00 318.31 622.21 502.21 184.36 333.13
unapproved
Crossline 234057 - stock stock 20d stock part stock
1 110135 50.76 50.76
Eldorado 234044 stock
10 120488 18.23 21.49 31.77 18.23 27.50 21.01 34.51 24.41 22.60 21.48 21.56
Coffman 234059 - 3w 3w MOQ stock stock 20d 5w stock stock stock
6 81089 0.57 4.90 5.00 6.97 0.57 5.78 4.82
unapproved
Cummins 234061 - stock 7d 5w part 21d 3d
5 60375 21.88 51.69 21.88 25.18 46.38 39.89
Kirks 234046 - 2W stock 20d 14w 4w
9 110136 98.00 98.00 147.11 110.00 197.23 168.42 107.17 99.40 119.19 103.52
A&A Auto 234043 - 3w 3w stock stock 20d 4w 4w 30d stock
2 60742 4.12 4.12 5.37
Eldorado 234044 - stock 20d
7 100223 63.07 77.00 77.00 122.75 137.07 174.82 63.07 123.27
unapproved
Neopart 234042 stock stock stock 3d stock part stock
4 81397 686.25 686.25 765.56 1,194.12 688.91
Coffman 234059 stock 3d 5w 3d
6 81422 1.60 2.49 2.88 4.14 1.60 3.90 3.33
unapproved
Coffman 234059 stock 3d 7W part 30d 3d
6 81444 37.91 73.44 37.91 71.50 90.63 59.40 78.12




Due: 03/28/23 at

10:00 AM Pace RFQ# 422412
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL -
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
I I N A A
Sku Winning bid | A&A Auto Rome Neopart Vehicle Genfare - | Crossline Kirks Eldorado | Coffman | Lakeside CBM Gillig Aftermarket| Mohawk Muncie | Cummins | Suburban
Truck - NO Maintenance|  NO BID Intl Parts Truck
NO # of Bids BID
unapproved
Mohawk 234054 stock part stock 8w stock 60d
8 81517 280.00 397.26 280.00 639.92 716.75 1,068.77 759.32 644.98 365.48
Kirks 234046 - 3w stock stock 10d Ow 30d 3d stock
8 81519 65.00 66.67 106.01 65.00 95.75 105.16 85.00 146.44 69.00
unapproved
Kirks 234046 2W stock stock 14d 20d stock Ow part
10 81520 8.08 12.49 10.42 8.08 15.00 12.85 21.11 14.12 12.92 15.65 13.09
Vehicle Maintenance 234056 3w stock stock 30d stock 3d stock stock 21d stock
11 81521 17.97 22.19 22.09 17.97 27.00 22.18 36.44 33.50 28.10 21.35 18.98 23.20
Vehicle Maintenance 234056 - 4w stock stock stock stock 20d stock 3w stock stock stock
4 81534 39.00 39.00 94.43 44.03 42.99
A&A Auto 234043 - 2W 8w 15w 21d
7| 1010003 11.99 16.25 34.59 41.93 57.89 11.99 39.62 34.84
unapproved
Kirks 234046 - stock stock 3d 5w part 30d stock
1 610017 293.79 293.79
Eldorado 234044 - stock
9 610019 81.00 95.17 81.00 194.89 212.10 132.65 92.18 97.35 190.79 96.87
Kirks 234046 - 4w stock stock 3d 7w 30d 30d 3d stock
7| 1010012 1,239.00 1,330.25 1,239.00 2,686.31 3,873.85| 1,280.00f 1,674.52| 2,417.58
Kirks 234046 - 10d stock 30d Ow stock 30d 4d
7 810025 824.00 878.54 824.00 947.72| 1,063.65 1,356.48 985.25 957.19
Crossline 234057 - 4w stock stock 3d Ow 21d 4d
5 810026 1,118.69 1,118.69| 1,255.44 1,958.32 1,284.95| 1,129.85
Coffman 234059 - stock 3d stock stock 3d
5 810027 652.45 652.45 732.26 876.39 683.00 658.94
Coffman 234059 - stock 5d Ow 21d 3d




Due: 03/28/23 at

10:00 AM Pace RFQ# 422412
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL -
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sku Winning bid | A&A Auto Rome Neopart Vehicle Genfare - | Crossline Kirks Eldorado | Coffman | Lakeside CBM Gillig Aftermarket| Mohawk Muncie | Cummins | Suburban
Truck - NO Maintenance| NQ BID Intl Parts Truck
NO # of Bids BID
810028 44.50 209.50 71.05 109.00 44.50 132.69
Mohawk 234054 - 20w stock stock stock 120d
810030 1.39 3.79 2.85 3.43 4.05 1.39 3.32 2.76
unapproved
Cummins 234061 - stock stock 3d stock part stock stock
610025 39.57 39.57 47.96 56.64 45.57 39.87
Coffman 234059 - stock 3d FAYY, 30d 3d
610026 120.46 120.46 349.00 129.75 384.59 431.63 144.80 120.94 388.37
unapproved
Neopart 234042 - stock stock stock stock 7d stock part stock
810035 143.23 143.23 159.94 165.95 143.85
Coffman 234059 - stock 7d 30d 4d
1010015 989.00 1,156.45 989.00 1,746.29 997.80 2,499.47 1,040.25 1,457.32
Kirks 234046 - 10d stock stock 30d 13w stock 45d
1010016 2,892.27 2,892.27 3,229.77 4,657.57 3,420.89
Coffman 234059 - 6w 30d 9w 45d
610031 27.32 27.32 35.43 42.82 50.56 27.75 34.47 35.58
unapproved
Kirks 234046 - stock stock 7d stock part stock 3d
610036 3,858.09 3,858.09
Eldorado 234044 - 12w
810049 132.52 132.52 147.97 188.72 153.53 133.08
Coffman 234059 - stock 7d 5w stock 3d
610050 19.62 35.00 19.62 145.13 20.55 38.43 22.01 22.99 155.92
unapproved bid 10
Vehicle Maintenance 234056 - stock 7d stock stock part need 14 3d
810060 26.27 53.03 37.00 45.39 50.94 64.97 26.27 43.46 45.75
unapproved
Crossline 234057 - stock stock stock 7d stock part stock stock
810064 4,683.44 5,195.65 4,683.44 5,972.83 4,915.78




Due: 03/28/23 at

10:00 AM Pace RFQ# 422412
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL -
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sku Winning bid | A&A Auto Rome Neopart Vehicle Genfare - | Crossline Kirks Eldorado | Coffman | Lakeside CBM Gillig Aftermarket| Mohawk Muncie | Cummins | Suburban
Truck - NO Maintenance| NOQ BID Intl Parts Truck
NO # of Bids BID
Lakeside Intl 234051 - stock 20d stock 30d
810073 126.06 138.12 155.01 197.69 161.83 126.06 139.41
Muncie 234053 - stock 7d AV, 4w stock 3d
810084 744.00 750.00 744.00 977.44 1,084.93 1,390.06 956.91
Crossline 234057 - 4w stock stock 30d 6w stock
1210038 2,632.39 2,632.39 2,948.44 4,251.90| 3,434.24 2,653.52
Coffman 234059 - stock 7d Ow 4w 4d
610061 5.35 16.79 5.35
Aftermarket Parts 234052 - stock 11w
1010028 5.85 6.97 5.85 14.52 17.60 9.59 8.23 21.58 18.48
unapproved
Kirks 234046 - stock stock stock 7d stock part 30d stock
1010029 13.43 13.43 17.20 45.98 51.80 20.00 76.94 20.88 53.53 46.34
unapproved
Neopart 234042 - stock stock stock 7d stock stock part 30d stock
1010032 65.37 76.48 85.00 139.53 156.60 145.00 199.71 65.37 131.91 140.84
unapproved
Neopart 234042 - stock stock stock 7d stock stock part stock stock
unapproved
810094 21.59 21.59 26.10 part 25.25 21.65
Coffman 234059 - stock 7d 30d 3d
810101 237.66 265.31 297.16 378.98 237.66 267.35
Muncie 234053 4.68 stock 7d stock 4.68 stock 3d
810102 3.63 3.70 4.48 5.26 4w 4.20 3.63
Cummins 234061 - stock 7d 5w 30d stock
810110 288.18 1,355.00 1,745.18 288.18 1,864.71
Lakeside Intl 234051 - stock stock 30d stock
1010040 10.21 10.21 11.77 13.36 11.34
Coffman 234059 - stock 7d 30d 3d




Due: 03/28/23 at

10:00 AM Pace RFQ# 422412
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL -
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
I I N A A
Sku Winning bid | A&A Auto Rome Neopart Vehicle Genfare - | Crossline Kirks Eldorado | Coffman | Lakeside CBM Gillig Aftermarket| Mohawk Muncie | Cummins | Suburban
Truck - NO Maintenance|  NQ BID Intl Parts Truck
NO # of Bids BID
810137 180.00 192.12 214.53 334.63 180.00 192.98
Muncie 234053 - stock 7d 5w stock 3d
1210070 61.95 71.24 61.95 65.70 66.33 75.00 85.48 70.19 80.68
Coffman 234059 - 4w stock 3d stock 2W stock 4w stock
1210078 1,500.00 1,500.00
Eldorado 234044 - 8w
610082 20.74 20.74
Eldorado 234044 - stock
1010047 -
610097 268.89 268.89 395.49
Gillig 234045 - stock stock
610098 2.69 5.53 3.86 3.04 2.69 2.77
Mohawk 234054 - stock stock stock stock 30d
810209 25.71 25.71 29.65 32.86 28.79
Coffman 234059 - stock 30d 5w 30d
810230 3.75 108.91 4.62 5.46 5.30 4.45 3.75
Cummins 234061 - stock 7d 5w 4w 30d 3d
810231 272.25 282.35 302.61 385.92 314.85 272.25
Cummins 234061 - stock 20d stock 30d 3d
610111 38.50 38.50 43.10 53.11 42.97 47.74 40.97
Coffman 234059 - stock 7d Ow stock 30d stock
1310018 2,089.24 2,089.24 | 4,083.84
Coffman 234059 - stock 20d
1310019 15.93 15.93 31.13




Due: 03/28/23 at

10:00 AM Pace RFQit 422412
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL -
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sku Winning bid | A&A Auto Rome Neopart Vehicle Genfare - | Crossline Kirks Eldorado | Coffman | Lakeside CBM Gillig Aftermarket| Mohawk Muncie | Cummins | Suburban
Truck - NO Maintenance| NQ BID Intl Parts Truck
NO # of Bids BID
Coffman 234059 - stock 20d
1310022 5.28 5.28 10.32 11.03
Coffman 234059 - stock 20d 21d
1310024 4.02 4.02 7.85 4.30
Coffman 234059 - stock 20d 21d
610122 1.58 1.67 1.93 2.78 1.98 1.58
Cummins 234061 - stock 7d FAY, 21d stock
1010068 700.00 700.00 1,377.24 1,544.11 1,553.11 1,040.00 1,659.84
bid 3 need
Coffman 234059 - stock stock 7d stock 5 3d
1210113 801.83 801.83 899.92 952.88 809.83
Coffman 234059 - stock 7d 21d 3d
610133 181.93 225.05 202.25 242.06 212.88 181.93
no lead
Cummins 234061 - time given 30d stock 21d 4d
810303 221.95 868.60 221.95 1,230.81
unapproved
Coffman 234059 - stock part 12w
810308 309.00 309.00 430.00 466.44 594.86 503.77 428.10
Crossline 234057 - stock stock 7d 6w 21d stock
1210132 753.28 753.28 911.07
no lead
Gillig 234045 - stock | time given
1310037 4.02 4.02 7.85 4.30
Coffman 234059 - stock 7d 30d
810359 246.02 246.02 275.27 429.38 285.00 247.65
Coffman 234059 - stock 7d 4w 21d 3d
1010092 815.30 815.30
Eldorado 234044 - 12w




Due: 03/28/23 at

10:00 AM Pace RFQ# 422412
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL -
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
I I N A A
Sku Winning bid | A&A Auto Rome Neopart Vehicle Genfare - | Crossline Kirks Eldorado | Coffman | Lakeside CBM Gillig Aftermarket| Mohawk Muncie | Cummins | Suburban
Truck - NO Maintenance|  NO BID Intl Parts Truck

NO # of Bids BID

810372 275.27 868.60 275.27 1,230.81
Lakeside Intl 234051 - stock 7d 12w

810388 43.42 44.62 50.05 64.99 50.66 43.42
Cummins 234061 - stock 7d 5w 21d 3d

810389 319.00 319.00 371.20 400.24 510.40 417.50

no lead

Crossline 234057 - stock time given 30d 4w 21d

810407 18.00 18.00 19.46 23.51 27.80 32.78 22.30 19.52
Crossline 234057 - stock stock 7d 5w 4w 30d 2d

810412 3,699.35 3,699.35| 4,149.64 6,472.57 4,490.55| 3,734.58
Coffman 234059 - stock 7d Ow 21d 3d

1310043 2.74 2.74 3.31 2.96

Coffman 234059 - stock 20d 21d

810444 129.37 150.75 129.37 203.69 220.52

no lead

Lakeside Intl 234051 - time given 30d 10w 21d

610191 1,886.49 2,050.54| 1,886.49 1,924.03
Aftermarket Parts 234052 - 4w 22w 145d

810446 19.01 19.91 22.93 31.66 21.97 19.01
Cummins 234061 - stock 7d Ow 30d 3d

810447 22.21 22.21 26.78 36.98 25.66 22.22
Coffman 234059 - stock 7d Ow 30d 3d

810448 9.57 10.07 11.12 16.02 11.24 9.57
Cummins 234061 - stock 7d Ow 30d 3d

1210167 1,170.49 1,170.49
no lead

Aftermarket Parts 234052 - time given

810449 291.64 291.64 326.65 452.58 337.90 293.89




Due: 03/28/23 at

10:00 AM Pace RFQ# 422412
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sku Winning bid | A&A Auto Rome Neopart Vehicle Genfare - | Crossline Kirks Eldorado | Coffman | Lakeside CBM Gillig Aftermarket| Mohawk Muncie | Cummins | Suburban
Truck - NO Maintenance|  NO BID Intl Parts Truck
NO # of Bids BID
Coffman 234059 - stock 7d 6w 21d stock
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