
Due:  03/28/23 at 
10:00 AM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Neopart A&A Auto Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Interstate 
Power

Cummins - 
NO BID

Vehicle 
Maintenance - 

NO BID

Genfare - 
NO BID

Eldorado Gillig Illinois 
Auto - NO 

BID

Kirks Lakeside 
International

Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie Mohawk Coffman Suburban 
Truck

                                  5 41131 50.04                   103.27        126.96        126.86        124.33          50.04 

Mohawk 234054 -                 7w  10d  4w  60d  stock 

                                  5 200522 21.15                     56.68          74.89          32.70          37.50          21.15 

Mohawk 234054 -                 4w  5d  5w  stock  2w 

                                  7 10170 0.88                          1.94             2.25             3.06             2.44             2.49             0.88 2.21           

Mohawk 234054 -                 stock  stock  7d  stock  30d  stock stock

                                  7 40036 48.44                   144.69        110.68        151.54        169.22          72.76        150.69          48.44 

Mohawk 234054  4w  stock  stock  3d  3w  30d  stock 

                                  6 200541 67.25                   150.16          67.25        250.77        213.69        119.55        128.29 

Gillig 234045 -                 14d  14w  10d  7w 
 unapproved 

part  stock 

                                  9 200863 9.29                       15.53             9.29          10.83          15.09          10.54          10.75             9.45             9.61 10.83         

A&A Auto 234043 -                 3w  3w  stock  10d  3w  30d  30d  stock  stock 

                                  8 41227 15.10                     48.16          28.26          52.80          41.13          65.23          24.99          15.10 35.84         

Mohawk 234054 -                 stock  stock  stock  3d  5w  stock  stock stock

                                  8 200296 27.00                     69.18          70.03          27.00          30.67          89.31          74.04          57.44 35.84         

Kirks 234046 -                 4w  stock  stock  7d  stock  30d  stock stock

                                  7 10365 69.85                     89.66          90.29        221.78          69.85          86.79          76.36 167.82       

Aftermarket Parts 234052 -                 4w  stock  10d  stock  stock  stock stock

                                  4 200919 23.32                     45.94          28.55          23.32          28.56 

Muncie 234053  stock  stock  30d 
 unapproved 

part 

                                  5 10411 127.82                233.23        127.82        355.62        149.52        130.79 

Gillig 234045  stock  stock  60d  stock  stock 

                                  3 200932 44.14                   217.11          49.05          44.14 

Aftermarket Parts 234052  stock  stock  stock 

                                  3 10416 520.14                639.81        520.14        598.19 

Pace RFQ# 422410



Due:  03/28/23 at 
10:00 AM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Neopart A&A Auto Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Interstate 
Power

Cummins - 
NO BID

Vehicle 
Maintenance - 

NO BID

Genfare - 
NO BID

Eldorado Gillig Illinois 
Auto - NO 

BID

Kirks Lakeside 
International

Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie Mohawk Coffman Suburban 
Truck

Pace RFQ# 422410

Aftermarket Parts 234052  8w  stock  30d 

                                  5 200945 22.39                     34.64          22.39          51.73          28.71        236.29 

Eldorado 234044 -                 4w  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock  30d 

                                  9 200964 8.40                       40.66          44.59          49.92          42.23          63.75          44.99          49.87          40.55             8.40 

Mohawk 234054  4w  2d  stock  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part  4w  30d  stock 

                                  1 110003 322.40                322.40 

Eldorado 234044  4w 

                                  6 410000 106.10                126.06        198.59        185.38        106.10        132.32        126.70 

Aftermarket Parts 234052 -                 7w  6w  10d  stock  30d  stock 

                                  6 410001 984.11                984.11     2,487.46     1,235.70     1,154.03     1,072.00     1,564.54 

Neopart 234042 -                 3w  stock  10d  5w  stock  30d 

                                  6 410002 984.11                984.11     2,487.46     1,235.07     1,154.03     1,072.00     1,564.52 

Neopart 234042 -                 stock  stock  10d  stock  stock  30d 

                                  5 410006 229.14                251.29        229.14        354.71        307.96        245.31 

Gillig 234045 -                 6w  4w  10d  stock  30d 

                                  7 410009 125.70                128.41        198.51        206.26        146.90        133.58        125.70 156.07       

Mohawk 234054 -                 4w  6w  10d  8w  30d  30d stock

                                  8 410010 128.76                202.36        853.49        175.00        420.40        174.94        242.02        128.76 383.82       

Aftermarket Parts 234052 -                 stock  2w  stock  20d  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock 

                                  5 410012 111.44                229.14        295.81        266.41        245.31        111.44 

Gillig 234045 -                 4w  10d  stock  30d 
 unapproved 

part 

                                  1 110006 338.30                338.30 

Eldorado 234044 -                 16w 

                                  6 410020 329.88                329.88        350.64        362.08        397.52        342.10        445.40 

Neopart 234042 -                 4w  stock  20d  stock  stock  3w 



Due:  03/28/23 at 
10:00 AM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Neopart A&A Auto Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Interstate 
Power

Cummins - 
NO BID

Vehicle 
Maintenance - 

NO BID

Genfare - 
NO BID

Eldorado Gillig Illinois 
Auto - NO 

BID

Kirks Lakeside 
International

Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie Mohawk Coffman Suburban 
Truck

Pace RFQ# 422410

                                  4 110014 123.28                209.85        130.71        144.21        123.28 

Muncie 234053 -                 4w  stock  stock  stock 

                                  4 310008 125.00                217.65        125.00        363.89        129.46 

Gillig 234045 -                 stock  stock  20d  stock 

                                  1 110018 1,031.09          1,031.09 

Eldorado 234044 -                 stock 

                                  1 110019 53.75                     53.75 

Eldorado 234044 -                 stock 

                                  3 410036 452.90                523.89        452.90        506.18 

Aftermarket Parts 234052 -                 4w  stock  3w 

                                  1 110022 39.48                     39.48 

Eldorado 234044 -                 stock 

                                  1 410070 183.39                183.39 

Eldorado 234044 -                 12w 

                                  4 2010041 2,100.00          2,100.00     3,712.46     3,736.29     3,228.23 

Kirks 234046 -                 stock  20d  9w 
 no lead 

time given 

                                  1 110026 83.08                     83.08 

Eldorado 234044 -                 stock 

                                  4 410080 525.00                564.80        525.00        692.74        777.34 

Gillig 234045 -                 8w  10w  20d  10w 

                                  3 310042 26.43                     26.43          33.33          29.85 

Neopart 234042 -                 stock  stock  stock 

                                  4 410083 132.88                215.62        135.73        132.88        149.11 

Lakeside Intl 234051 -                 6w  4w  20d  9w 

                                  1 2010062 302.26                302.26 



Due:  03/28/23 at 
10:00 AM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Neopart A&A Auto Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Interstate 
Power

Cummins - 
NO BID

Vehicle 
Maintenance - 

NO BID

Genfare - 
NO BID

Eldorado Gillig Illinois 
Auto - NO 

BID

Kirks Lakeside 
International

Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie Mohawk Coffman Suburban 
Truck

Pace RFQ# 422410

Eldorado 234044 -                 2w 

                                  1 110054 0.12                          0.12 

Eldorado 234044 -                 stock 

                                  4 2010079 2,815.00          2,815.00     3,581.39     6,248.95     3,094.89 

Kirks 234046 -                 stock  20d  8w 
 no lead 

time given 

                                  2 410132 927.90                928.79        927.90 

Muncie 234053 -                 stock  30d 

                                  6 200548 20.69                     20.69          24.42          24.14          26.65          22.66          24.54 

Neopart 234042 -                 4w  stock  3d  5w  30d  4w 


	422410

