() pace

NOTE: The information contained on the tabulation is the quote received. The
low gquote does not assume award. Award is based on the low, responsive and

responsible quote.

RFQ Tabulation

RFQ Issue Date RFQ No. RFQ Due Time: RFQ Due Date
3/24/2023 422393 2:00 p.m. 4/10/2023
. Beary Landscape .
RFQ Bidder Name(s) Management Complete Landscaping Tecza Landscape Group
Line| o Landscape Maintenance for 8 Pace Unit Unit Unit Unit
y Divisions Cost Total Cost Total Cost Total Cost Total
1 1 |Fox Valley Division 16,400.00 16,400.00 30,800.00 | $ 30,800.00 NO BID $ -
2 1 [North Shore Division 23,000.00 23,000.00 50,800.00 | $ 50,800.00 | $ 13,200.00 | $ 13,200.00 $ -
3 1 |North Division 18,200.00 18,200.00 31,280.00 | $ 31,280.00 | $ 17,400.00 | $ 17,400.00 $ -
5 1 |River Division 21,000.00 21,000.00 28,800.00 | $ 28,800.00 | $ 11,760.00 | $ 11,760.00 $ -
6 1 |South Division 41,200.00 41,200.00 NO BID NO BID $ -
7 1 |Southwest Division 13,200.00 13,200.00 48,800.00 | $ 48,800.00 NO BID $ .
8 1 |West Divison 21,000.00 21,000.00 32,400.00 | $ 32,400.00 NO BID $ -
9 1 |Heritage 25,000.00 25,000.00 NO BID NO BID $ -
Total Bid Amount
179,000.00 $ 222,880.00 $ 42,360.00 $ -
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