
Due:  03/22/23 @ 
1:00 PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Genfare - 

NO BID
P&G Translite A&A Kirks Interstate 

Power
Illinois Auto Coffman Muncie Gillig Vehicle 

Maintenance
Prevost Neopart Aftermarket 

Parts
Eldorado Mohawk Battery 

Service

                                    5 290415 592.34                  677.15         592.34         804.55         601.34         788.99 

Gillig 234020 -                  45d  stock  75d  3w  stock 

                                    3 71733 90.79                      97.02         109.34           90.79 

Aftermarket Parts 234019 -                  stock  stock  stock 

                                    3 71875 5.35                           6.93           17.23             5.35 

Mohawk 234024 -                  stock  stock  stock 

                                    4 71101 0.38                           4.14             0.38             0.45             0.38 

Muncie 234025  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                    3 72121 33.37                      64.51           33.37           72.93 

NOT AWARDED -                  MOQ  stock  stock 

                                    5 71441 6.57                           6.57             7.08           15.14           17.95             7.40 

Muncie 234025 -                  stock  stock  19w  2w  stock 

                                    4 180789 45.06                      58.80           45.06           98.75         110.50 

Aftermarket Parts 234019 -                  195d  stock  180d  5w 

                                    4 72059 436.16                  436.16         741.05         995.25         563.08 

Muncie 234025 -                  stock  12w  stock  3w 

                                    3 290646 115.72                  115.72         152.07         164.74 

Muncie 234025 -                  30d  8w  stock 

                                    4 290653 18.99                      22.45           18.99           28.62           26.16 

Gillig 234020  30d  stock  75d  stock 

                                    4 170625 225.12                  225.12         313.36         304.38         318.80 

Muncie 234025  37d  7w  4w  3w 

                                    3 71178 0.04                           1.87             0.06             0.04 

Mohawk 234024  MOQ  stock  stock 

Pace RFQ# 422388



Due:  03/22/23 @ 
1:00 PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Genfare - 

NO BID
P&G Translite A&A Kirks Interstate 

Power
Illinois Auto Coffman Muncie Gillig Vehicle 

Maintenance
Prevost Neopart Aftermarket 

Parts
Eldorado Mohawk Battery 

Service

Pace RFQ# 422388

                                    4 72058 8.50                           8.50           14.10           86.85           24.50 

Vehicle Maintenance 234022  stock  3w  4w  stock 

                                    5 71179 0.52                           3.97             3.22             0.96             0.75             0.52 

Mohawk 234024 -                 
 no lead 

time given  MOQ  stock  stock  stock 

                                    5 71442 6.45                           6.45             7.08           15.14           17.95             7.30 

Muncie 234025  30d  stock  stock  stock  3w 

                                    3 71977 5.06                           5.06             5.15             6.03 

Muncie 234025  21d  stock  stock 

                                    5 290075 5.90                         37.00           13.72           22.99             6.25             5.90 

Aftermarket Parts 234019 -                  10d  stock  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part 

                                    3 72109 777.92               1,539.23      1,968.57         777.92 

Eldorado 234021 -                  14w  9w  stock 

                                    5 72148 87.70                    178.52         137.46         172.34         369.83           87.70 

Mohawk 234024 -                  60d  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                    3 72156 21.99                      23.23           21.99           27.67 

Neopart 234023 -                  60d  9w  13w 

                                    1 151985 50.56                      50.56 

Aftermarket Parts 234019 -                  stock 

                                    2 152006 35.53                    137.98           35.53 

Eldorado 234021 -                  13w  stock 

                                    5 290674 249.00                  287.78         249.00         327.22         370.07         928.76 

Gillig 234020 -                  30d  stock  75d  stock  16w 

                                    3 160847 163.03                  163.03         220.00         164.34 

Gillig 234020 -                  stock  105d  stock 



Due:  03/22/23 @ 
1:00 PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Genfare - 

NO BID
P&G Translite A&A Kirks Interstate 

Power
Illinois Auto Coffman Muncie Gillig Vehicle 

Maintenance
Prevost Neopart Aftermarket 

Parts
Eldorado Mohawk Battery 

Service

Pace RFQ# 422388

                                    4 72301 346.00                  419.00         346.00         595.75 348.97       

Kirks 234018 -                  4w  stock  stock 3w

                                    2 170707 345.39                  395.08         345.39 

Eldorado 234021 -                  stock  stock 

                                    4 72378 206.90                  243.10         206.90         288.75         239.27 

Gillig 234020 -                  60d  stock  9w  stock 

                                    3 170716 1,127.26            1,127.26      1,150.00      1,725.96 

Muncie 234025 -                  30d  12w  stock 

                                    6 72388 38.25                      78.65           39.75           73.30           69.67         101.74           38.25 

Mohawk 234024 -                  45d  stock  9w  9w  6w  stock 

                                    3 170719 88.41                    318.66         426.79           88.41 

Eldorado 234021 -                  stock  30d  stock 

                                    2 170722 88.41                    426.79           88.41 

Eldorado 234021 -                  30d  2w 

                                    1 1710003 192.36                  192.36 

Translite 234032 -                  stock 

                                    3 1710016 28.31                      28.31           33.99           57.89 

Muncie 234025 -                  30d  stock  stock 

                                    1 710004 33.95                      33.95 

Eldorado 234021 -                  2w 

                                    3 2510000 370.39                  755.56         370.39         794.14 

Neopart 234023 -                  stock  4w  stock 

                                    2 710039 39.65                      39.65           50.10 

Muncie 234025 -                  80d  stock 



Due:  03/22/23 @ 
1:00 PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Genfare - 

NO BID
P&G Translite A&A Kirks Interstate 

Power
Illinois Auto Coffman Muncie Gillig Vehicle 

Maintenance
Prevost Neopart Aftermarket 

Parts
Eldorado Mohawk Battery 

Service

Pace RFQ# 422388

                                    1 1510019 61.45                      61.45 

Eldorado 234021 -                  4w 

                                    1 1610040 1,428.70            1,428.70 

Aftermarket Parts 234019 -                  10w 

                                    5 2210021 1,350.00            1,446.00      1,370.55      1,350.00      1,557.36      2,708.84 

Gillig 234020 -                  stock  70d  12w  12w  3w 

                                    3 710116 37.11                      37.11           43.57           80.24 

Vehicle Maintenance 234022 -                  stock  9w  stock 

                                    6 710119 3,149.72            3,149.72      3,399.00      3,655.35      3,575.00      4,959.00      4,749.00 

P&G 234031 -                  stock  stock  60d  stock  105d  stock 

                                    6 710149 447.47                  523.74         447.47         456.48         577.83         663.74         467.50 

Coffman 234028 -                  stock  stock  21d  stock  5w  5w 

                                    1 710157 43.45                      43.45 

Eldorado 234021 -                  stock 

                                    3 710161 56.88                      66.33         150.23           56.88 

Mohawk 234024 -                  9w  4w  5w 

                                    2 1510130 18.54                      58.09           18.54 

Eldorado 234021 -                  6w  stock 

                                    5 2910027 106.49                  119.38         108.60         168.50         106.49         140.04 

Neopart 234023 -                  stock  stock  75d  stock  stock 

                                    3 1810045 65.52                      94.40           83.70           65.52 

Aftermarket Parts 234019 -                  12w  75d  stock 

                                    1 1810046 20.85                      20.85 

Prevost 234033 -                  135d 



Due:  03/22/23 @ 
1:00 PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Genfare - 

NO BID
P&G Translite A&A Kirks Interstate 

Power
Illinois Auto Coffman Muncie Gillig Vehicle 

Maintenance
Prevost Neopart Aftermarket 

Parts
Eldorado Mohawk Battery 

Service

Pace RFQ# 422388

                                    2 1810047 15.40                      29.10           15.40 

Prevost 234033 -                  12w  135d 

                                    1 1810048 136.38                  136.38 

Gillig 134020 -                  12w 

                                    1 1610099 538.20                  538.20 

Eldorado 234021 -                  2w 

710206 191.09                  191.09 

Eldorado 234021 -                  6w 

                                    2 2510123 239.05                  308.89         239.05 

Aftermarket Parts 234019 -                  stock  6w 

                                    3 1810067 49.90                      49.90           74.64           62.01 

Muncie 234025 -                  stock  8w  9w 

                                    1 1610158 58.81                      58.81 

Eldorado 234021 -                  stock 

                                    2 2510164 5.28                           5.28             5.33 

Gillig 234020 -                  4w  10d 

                                    3 710330 12.72                      25.10           13.50           12.72 

Aftermarket Parts 234019 -                  42d  stock  12w 

                                    3 710368 3.50                           3.52             3.50             4.35 

Aftermarket Parts 234019 -                  stock  stock  stock 

                                    2 2510186 921.11                  930.40         921.11 

Neopart 234023 -                  4w  10d 

                                    2 2510187 925.43                  934.76         925.43 

Neopart 234023 -                  4w  10d 



Due:  03/22/23 @ 
1:00 PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Genfare - 

NO BID
P&G Translite A&A Kirks Interstate 

Power
Illinois Auto Coffman Muncie Gillig Vehicle 

Maintenance
Prevost Neopart Aftermarket 

Parts
Eldorado Mohawk Battery 

Service

Pace RFQ# 422388

                                    1 710439 130.50                  130.50 

Eldorado 234021 -                  3w 

                                    1 1610212 296.26                  296.26 

Eldorado 234021 -                  12w 

                                    2 710456 10.92                      10.92           13.52 

Muncie 234025 -                  30d  5w 

                                    1 2210072 15.04                      15.04 

Aftermarket Parts 234019 -                  5w 

                                    1 2210073 33.22                      33.22 

Aftermarket Parts 234019 -                  4w 

                                    1 2210074 148.31                  148.31 

Aftermarket Parts 234019 -                  8w 

                                    1 2210075 125.48                  125.48 

Aftermarket Parts 234019 -                  9w 

                                    2 710457 490.11                  490.11         707.27 

Muncie 234025 -                  stock  5w 

                                    3 72184 6.13                           6.13             6.14           21.70 

Muncie 234025 -                  stock  stock  stock 

                                     - 1710004 -                 

-                 

                                     - 2110230 -                 

-                 

                                     - 1610209 -                 

-                 



Due:  03/22/23 @ 
1:00 PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Genfare - 

NO BID
P&G Translite A&A Kirks Interstate 

Power
Illinois Auto Coffman Muncie Gillig Vehicle 

Maintenance
Prevost Neopart Aftermarket 

Parts
Eldorado Mohawk Battery 

Service

Pace RFQ# 422388

                                    1 1510336 204.76                  204.76 

Aftermarket Parts 234019 -                  5w 


	422388

