Due: 03/22/23 @

1:00 PM Pace RFQ# 422387
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sku Winning bid |lllinois Auto| Genfare- | Triangle | Interstate Rome Kirks Eldorado Prevost Coffman Gillig ‘_/ehicle Crossline | Neopart | Cummins | Aftermarket | Muncie | Suburban
-NOBID | NOBID Service Power | Truck - NO Maintenance Parts Truck
NO # of Bids BID
6 130611 184.36 372.57 318.31 309.00 502.21 333.13 184.36
unapproved
Crossline 234029 - stock stock stock stock stock part
1 81055 161.46 161.46
Eldorado 234021 - stock
5 120476 5.62 7.98 7.92 11.36 9.22 5.62
unapproved
Cummins 234030 - stock 3d 4w 30d part
5 81089 0.57 4.90 4.82 6.97 5.67 0.57
unapproved
Cummins 234030 stock 3d 5w 30d part
6 60386 2.77 4.27 4.97 4.12 5.22 4.80 2.77
unapproved
Neopart 234023 - stock stock stock stock stock part
7 110136 107.00 159.70 107.00 214.98 147.11 107.17 119.19 108.18
Kirks 234018 - 5d stock stock 3w 4w 30d 5w
2 60743 4.67 4.67 103.52
Eldorado 234021 - stock stock
4 60748 53.78 98.09 88.25 72.68 53.78
Muncie 234025 - stock 90d 5w 60d
6 100223 63.07 122.14 116.00 77.00 123.27 174.82 63.07
unapproved
Neopart 234023 - stock stock stock stock 9w part
3 81346 207.37 207.37 208.94 312.16
Availability - no lead
Cummins 234030 time given Ad stock
1 60770 73.92 73.92
Eldorado 234021 stock
- 110142 -
2 120526 425.00 425.00 598.17




Due: 03/22/23 @

1:00 PM Pace RFQ# 422387
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sku Winning bid |lllinois Auto| Genfare- | Triangle | Interstate Rome Kirks Eldorado Prevost Coffman Gillig Vehicle Crossline | Neopart | Cummins | Aftermarket | Muncie | Suburban
-NOBID | NOBID Service Power | Truck - NO Maintenance Parts Truck
NO # of Bids BID
Triangle Service 234026 3d 7w
6 81438 8.24 19.20 18.85 19.16 25.61 22.12 8.24
unapproved
Crossline 234029 - stock stock stock 3w stock part
5 81441 42.79 82.58 53.62 111.52 62.59 42.79
unapproved
Cummins 234030 stock 4d stock stock part
6 81444 59.40 114.98 71.50 73.44 90.63 78.12 59.40
Gillig 234020 stock stock 6w 8w 60d stock
5 81503 10.81 24.64 24.73 41.14 28.68 10.81
unapproved
Coffman 234028 - stock 3d stock 45d part
6 81519 64.99 64.99 95.75 87.19 106.50 146.44 108.33
Kirks 234018 - stock 90d stock stock stock stock
11 81521 18.98 45.89 23.20 28.25 22.18 33.50 19.97 22.09 33.71 18.98 23.25 21.25
Availability - Vehicle
Maintenance 234022 - 5d stock stock stock stock stock stock stock 60d stock stock
7 1210003 22.22 24.93 37.48 22.22 23.61 37.89 29.15 23.69
Vehicle Maintenance 234022 - stock stock stock stock stock stock stock
4 810009 4.43 4.51 4.43 7.51 5.28
Cummins 234030 - stock stock stock 30d
7 1010011 862.00 862.00 1,613.99 1,171.60 1,630.19 2,310.12 1,346.99 1,185.00
Kirks 234018 - stock stock 10d 3d 6w 45d 3w
4 810026 1,118.69 1,118.69 1,129.85 1,958.32 1,285.45
Coffman 234028 - stock 4d 9w 30d
4 810027 652.45 652.45 658.94 876.39 683.00
Coffman 234028 - stock 3d 9w 21d
7 1010013 4.40 8.02 12.80 4.40 35.29 50.15 10.99 11.40
unapproved
Neopart 234023 - stock stock stock stock 9w stock part




Due: 03/22/23 @

1:00 PM Pace RFQ# 422387
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sku Winning bid |lllinois Auto| Genfare- | Triangle | Interstate Rome Kirks Eldorado Prevost Coffman Gillig Vehicle Crossline | Neopart | Cummins | Aftermarket | Muncie | Suburban
-NOBID | NOBID Service Power | Truck - NO Maintenance Parts Truck
NO # of Bids BID
6 1010014 2.67 2.67 7.16 11.21 16.03 3.99 5.14
unapproved
Kirks 234018 - stock stock stock stock stock part
5 810028 48.50 209.50 71.05 109.00 132.69 48.50
Eldorado 234021 - 2w 8w stock 120d stock
6 810030 1.39 2.86 3.88 2.76 4.05 3.32 1.39
unapproved
Cummins 234030 - stock stock stock stock stock part
7 610026 120.46 130.00 382.65 120.46 388.37 580.10 131.41 120.94
unapproved
Neopart 234023 - stock stock 4w stock stock stock part
7 1010015 980.00 980.00 1,746.28 1,156.45| 1,763.82| 2,499.47| 1,457.32 1,150.00
Kirks 234018 - stock stock 10d 3d 13w 45d stock
3 1010016 2,877.75 2,877.75 4,657.57 | 3,420.89
no lead
Coffman 234028 - time given 9w 30d
4 1010018 10.00 10.00 40.00 26.84 50.29
Coffman 234028 - stock stock 9w stock
4 1210027 30.44 30.44 30.65 40.89 35.78
Coffman 234028 - stock 3d 5w stock
5 610053 21.20 32.04 32.10 48.08 27.60 21.20
bid 3, need
Mohawk 234024 - stock 3d stock 5 stock
4 810064 4,215.02 5,235.65 4,215.02 5,972.83 4,915.78
Cummins 234030 - stock 4d stock 30d
5 810068 28.80 66.59 67.16 95.31 79.85 28.80
Mohawk 234024 - stock 4d 8w 30d 4w
6 1010024 68.71 71.81 69.49 68.71 92.83 82.39 91.86
Cummins 234030 - stock stock stock 7w stock 4w
5 810073 126.06 138.12 139.41 197.69 126.06 165.83




Due: 03/22/23 @

1:00 PM Pace RFQ# 422387
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
- (' | J | '/ [ | | J | [ [ | | | |
Sku Winning bid |lllinois Auto| Genfare- | Triangle | Interstate Rome Kirks Eldorado Prevost Coffman Gillig Vehicle Crossline | Neopart | Cummins | Aftermarket | Muncie | Suburban
-NOBID | NOBID Service Power | Truck - NO Maintenance Parts Truck
NO # of Bids BID
Muncie 234025 - stock 4d 7w stock 4w
5 810078 444.39 459.33 444 .39 463.87 657.45 533.99
Crossline 234029 - stock stock 3d stock 30d
5 810079 455.00 459.33 455.00 463.87 657.45 462.65
Crossline 234029 - stock stock 3d 9w stock
5 1010025 7.48 10.45 13.45 14.88 16.05 7.48
unapproved
Coffman 234028 - stock stock stock 30d part
5 810084 750.00 976.44 750.00 976.34 1,390.06 956.91
Neopart 234023 - stock 4w 3d 6w stock
5 1210039 1.48 1.58 1.48 2.91 1.90 3.07
Cummins 234030 - stock 3d Sw 30d Aw
8 1010032 64.39 139.53 145.00 94.00 76.66 140.84 199.71 131.91 64.39
unapproved
Neopart 234023 - stock stock stock stock stock 6w stock part
4 810101 237.66 2,654.45 267.35 378.98 237.66
Muncie 234025 - stock 3d stock stock
4 1010035 113.50 113.50 113.95 151.66 134.95
Coffman 234028 - stock 5d 7w 30d
4 1010036 113.50 113.50 113.95 137.36 134.95
Coffman 234028 - stock 5d 7w 30d
4 810110 1,385.00 1,385.00 1,755.18 1,402.15| 1,864.71
Kirks 234018 - stock stock 3d stock
5 1210056 6.65 6.72 6.65 9.56 8.15 8.00
Cummins 234030 - stock stock stock 30d 30d
6 810141 23.06 77.89 53.98 78.41 111.25 54.50 23.06
unaapproved
Crossline 234029 - stock stock stock 3w stock part




Due: 03/22/23 @

1:00 PM Pace RFQ# 422387
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
- . 4 . 1 | | | | | | | | |
Sku Winning bid |lllinois Auto| Genfare- | Triangle | Interstate Rome Kirks Eldorado Prevost Coffman Gillig Vehicle Crossline | Neopart | Cummins | Aftermarket | Muncie | Suburban
-NOBID | NOBID Service Power | Truck - NO Maintenance Parts Truck

NO # of Bids BID

1 1210078 913.46 913.46
Eldorado 234021 - stock

5 610080 163.80 206.62 196.52 286.91 163.80 187.48

bid 4, need unapproved

Cummins 234030 - stock stock 5w 5 part

5 1010044 247.00 311.86 330.00 313.33 444.13 247.00
Muncie 234025 - stock 4w 3d 5w stock

2 810165 1,435.16 1,771.61 1,435.16
Aftermarket Parts 234019 - 12w stock

1 610082 20.74 20.74
Eldorado 234021 - stock

2 810169 31.00 41.92 31.00
Availability -
Eldorado 234021 - stock 19w

5 810182 104.00 131.74 104.00 158.04 187.61 181.70
Crossline 234029 - stock stock 2d stock 30d

4 810194 54.28 54.31 54.28 75.54 61.80
Cummins 234030 - stock 3d stock 30d

5 610098 2.69 5.53 3.86 3.04 2.77 2.69
Mohawk 234024 - stock stock stock 30d stock

4 810205 76.82 76.91 76.82 102.29 90.50
Cummins 234030 - stock stock 9w 21d

3 1210091 1,219.18 1,272.63 1,219.18 1,760.81
Crossline 234029 - stock stock stock

3 810209 25.01 25.01 32.86 28.79
Coffman 234028 - stock 5w 30d

6 | 1210096 127.00 135.45 127.00 136.03 192.90 156.50 161.20




Due: 03/22/23 @

1:00 PM Pace RFQ# 422387
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
- (' | J | '/ [ | | J | [ [ | | | |
Sku Winning bid |lllinois Auto| Genfare- | Triangle | Interstate Rome Kirks Eldorado Prevost Coffman Gillig Vehicle Crossline | Neopart | Cummins | Aftermarket | Muncie | Suburban
-NOBID | NOBID Service Power | Truck - NO Maintenance Parts Truck

NO # of Bids BID
Crossline 234029 - stock stock 3d stock 30d 30d

5 810218 4.45 5.45 7.12 9.10 8.60 4.45

unapproved

Coffman 234028 - stock 3d 13w 21d part

5 810236 10.16 10.56 10.16 15.40 11.80 15.84
Cummins 234030 - stock 4d ow 30d 30d

4 810245 280.39 280.39 280.80 390.23 322.87
Coffman 234028 - stock 3d 9w 30d

4 610122 1.58 1.67 1.58 2.78 1.98
Cummins 234030 - stock stock 7w 21d

4 1010070 619.59 619.59 624.49 885.04 717.90
Coffman 234028 - stock 4d stock 21d

2 1210128 62.27 183.41 62.27
Aftermarket Parts 234019 - stock 9w

1 1010100 7,623.30 7,623.30
Aftermarket Parts 234019 - stock

2 1110009 1,947.73 1,947.73 2,610.98

no lead

Coffman 234028 - time given 9w

3 810438 137.93 137.93 138.36 157.33
Coffman 234028 - stock Ad 21d

3 810441 15.84 15.86 15.84 18.53
Cummins 234030 - stock 3d 30d

3 810442 11.00 11.60 11.00 13.20
Cummins 234030 - stock Ad 30d

4 810443 17.50 17.73 17.50 29.16 20.70
Cummins 234030 - stock 3d 9w 30d




Due: 03/22/23 @

1:00 PM Pace RFQ# 422387
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sku Winning bid |lllinois Auto| Genfare- | Triangle | Interstate Rome Kirks Eldorado Prevost Coffman Gillig ‘_/ehicle Crossline | Neopart | Cummins | Aftermarket | Muncie | Suburban
-NOBID | NOBID Service Power | Truck - NO Maintenance Parts Truck

NO # of Bids BID

2 1010112 1,174.08 2,499.47 1,174.08

unapproved

Aftermarket Parts 234019 - 13w part

2 1010113 2,653.52 2,653.52| 5,245.10

no lead

Aftermarket Parts 234019 - time given Sw

1 1010114 177.92 177.92
Aftermarket Parts 234019 - Sw

2 1010115 15.00 26.84 15.00
Muncie 234025 - stock stock

3 1210038 2,500.00 2,640.35 4,251.90 | 2,500.00

bid 2, need

Coffman 234028 - stock 9w 3

1 1210086 258.12 258.12
Eldorado 234021 - 3w

- | 1210162 -

- 610190 -




	422387

