

Due: 03/22/23 @ 1:00 PM

Pace

RFQ# 422386

WHITE=NO BID

TOTAL

		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
--	--	---	--	--	---	---	---	---	---	---	---	---	---	---	---	---	---

Green=Disqualified

	Sku	Winning bid	Illinois Auto - NO BID	Genfare - NO BID	Interstate Power - NO BID	Rome Truck - NO BID	Kirks	Aftermarket Parts	Prevost	Gillig	Suburban Truck	Cummins	Eldorado	Vehicle Maintenance	Neopart	Mohawk	Muncie	Coffman
NO # of Bids																		
6	41236	178.60						246.95		195.50			594.81		178.60	213.17	195.45	
Neopart	234023	-						5w		6w			6w		4w	21d	30d	
6	41237	113.27						155.90		118.64			508.72		113.27	127.76	122.89	
Neopart	234023	-						6w		stock			2w		4w	30d	30d	
6	40932	0.55						2.87	2.59		2.11				2.08	0.55	2.17	
Mohawk	234024	-						stock	stock		stock				stock	stock	stock	
7	30014	3.41						5.64	8.28	4.67	6.90				5.89	3.41	5.22	
Mohawk	234024	-						stock	stock	stock	stock				stock	stock	stock	
1	240058	16.37													16.37			
Vehicle Maintenance	234022	-												stock				
6	41238	112.75						155.90	139.26	128.00					112.75	127.76	120.29	
Neopart	234023	-						6w	75d	4w					4w	30d	30d	
8	40036	49.44					130.00	72.76	139.79	151.54			110.68		145.02	49.44	156.69	
Mohawk	234024	-					stock	4w	stock	stock			stock		4w	stock	30d	
6	41216	252.00						252.00		252.32			617.20		401.42	322.12	326.26	
Aftermarket Parts	234019	-						stock		4w			2w		10w	4w	120d	
6	40165	5.40					40.68	14.73		10.84					11.50	47.32	5.40	
Muncie	234025	-					stock	5w		stock					stock	2w	stock	
7	41217	96.36						97.00	210.20		167.82		227.50		112.52	107.43	96.36	
Muncie	234025	-						stock	75d		stock		6w		4w	stock	30d	
5	41169	46.15						56.19			50.98				46.15	51.67	49.70	
Neopart	234023	-						stock			stock				stock	stock	stock	
7	40907	55.50						107.06	114.55	85.38	97.70				88.05	55.50	85.84	

Due: 03/22/23 @ 1:00 PM

Pace

RFQ# 422386

WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL																
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified	Sku	Winning bid	Illinois Auto - NO BID	Genfare - NO BID	Interstate Power - NO BID	Rome Truck - NO BID	Kirks	Aftermarket Parts	Prevost	Gillig	Suburban Truck	Cummins	Eldorado	Vehicle Maintenance	Neopart	Mohawk	Muncie	Coffman
NO # of Bids																		
Mohawk	234024							stock	75d	stock	stock				stock	stock	stock	
7	200296	27.00					27.00	89.31	67.90	70.03					69.33	57.44	74.04	
Kirks	234018						stock	stock	75d	stock					4w	stock	30d	
7	10365	69.85						69.85	226.60	90.29	167.82				84.91	78.36	86.79	
Aftermarket Parts	234019	-						stock	stock	stock	stock				stock	stock	stock	
7	10366	73.36						85.02	226.60	90.29	167.82				73.36	88.75	74.40	
Neopart	234023							stock	stock	stock	stock				4w	4w	stock	
1	30411	370.42											370.42					
Eldorado	234021												8w					
4	10411	127.82						149.52		127.82			233.23				130.79	
Gillig	234020	-						stock		stock			stock				stock	
1	30177	1.51											1.51					
Eldorado	234021	-											stock					
1	30150	13.58											13.58					
Eldorado	234021	-											stock					
1	30023	23.26											23.26					
Eldorado	234021	-											stock					
6	41272	39.58						46.12			42.14		100.21		39.58	45.20	44.45	
Neopart	234023	-						5w			stock		2w		stock	5w	30d	
6	41273	39.96						45.89			41.94		78.38		39.96	45.20	44.45	
Neopart	234023	-						stock			stock		8w		stock	5w	30d	
3	10416	520.14						520.14					639.81				598.19	

Due: 03/22/23 @ 1:00 PM

Pace

RFQ# 422386

WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL																
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified	Sku	Winning bid	Illinois Auto - NO BID	Genfare - NO BID	Interstate Power - NO BID	Rome Truck - NO BID	Kirks	Aftermarket Parts	Prevost	Gillig	Suburban Truck	Cummins	Eldorado	Vehicle Maintenance	Neopart	Mohawk	Muncie	Coffman
NO # of Bids																		
Affermarket Parts	234019	-						stock					8w					30d
4	200949	925.00					925.00	1,600.08				1,129.10						1,120.17
Kirks	234018	-					R&R	9w				4d						stock
1	41281	59.00											59.00					
Eldorado	234021	-											stock					
1	41282	50.66											50.66					
Eldorado	234021	-											stock					
1	41283	63.62											63.62					
Eldorado	234021	-											stock					
1	110003	322.40											322.40					
Eldorado	234021	-											6w					
5	410003	204.84						281.92					654.23		204.84	219.64	214.50	
Neopart	234023	-						6w					3w		4w	4w	21d	
7	410010	128.76						174.94		175.00	383.82		853.49		202.36	128.76	242.02	
Affermarket Parts	234019	-						stock		stock	stock		3w		3w	Unapproved part	stock	
4	410036	452.90						452.90							523.89	526.18	520.33	
Affermarket Parts	234019	-						stock							4w	4w	21d	
1	110022	39.48											39.48					
Eldorado	234021	-											stock					
3	2010041	2,200.00					2,200.00	3,736.29										3,195.95
Kirks	231018	-					stock	stock										No lead time given
2	2010045	8.88						10.40						8.88				
Vehicle Maintenance	234022	-						stock						stock				

Due: 03/22/23 @  
1:00 PM

Pace

RFQ# 422386

WHITE=NO BID

TOTAL

		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
--	--	---	--	--	---	---	---	---	---	---	---	---	---	---	---	---	---

Green=Disqualified

	Sku	Winning bid	Illinois Auto - NO BID	Genfare - NO BID	Interstate Power - NO BID	Rome Truck - NO BID	Kirks	Aftermarket Parts	Prevost	Gillig	Suburban Truck	Cummins	Eldorado	Vehicle Maintenance	Neopart	Mohawk	Muncie	Coffman
NO # of Bids																		
	4	410080	525.00					777.34		525.00					567.40		665.50	
Gillig		234020	-					10w		12w					8w		45d	
	5	410090	1,164.06					1,571.29		1,207.46					1,164.06	1,243.38	1,191.77	
Neopart		234023	-					6w		4w					4w	4w	21d	
	5	410091	1,155.54					1,571.29		1,350.00					1,155.54	1,243.38	1,191.77	
Neopart		234023	-					6w		4w					4w	4w	30d	
	5	410095	98.78					102.25		98.78			182.96		117.50		113.88	
Gillig		234020	-					stock		stock			3w		7w		30d	
	5	310051	75.17					96.21		96.20					102.21	75.17	96.10	
Muncie		234025	-					5w		stock					stock	unapproved part	stock	
	3	410106	136.73					176.02							136.73		154.22	
Neopart		234023	-					9w							5w		60d	
	4	410107	136.73					176.02			143.22				136.73		154.22	
Neopart		234023	-					9w		stock					5w		60d	
	3	410109	586.96					1,381.54							850.00		586.96	
Muncie		234025	-					stock							4w		stock	
	3	410111	599.99					1,873.27							850.00		599.99	
Muncie		234025	-					stock							4w		stock	
	3	310060	175.41					181.16		200.00						175.41		
Mohawk		234024	-					8w		18w						stock		
	5	310062	263.95					340.01		267.80					263.95	306.57	299.90	
Neopart		234023	-					5w		stock					stock	4w	stock	

Due: 03/22/23 @  
1:00 PM

Pace

RFQ# 422386

WHITE=NO BID

Green=Disqualified

		TOTAL																
	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
	Skus	Winning bid	Illinois Auto - NO BID	Genfare - NO BID	Interstate Power - NO BID	Rome Truck - NO BID	Kirks	Aftermarket Parts	Prevost	Gillig	Suburban Truck	Cummins	Eldorado	Vehicle Maintenance	Neopart	Mohawk	Muncie	Coffman
NO # of Bids																		
1	2010062	139.68											139.68					
Eldorado	234021	-											2w					