
DUE:  03/06/23 @ 
3:00 pm

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Interstate 

Power
Triangle 
Service

Genfare - 
NO BID

Prevost - 
NO BID

Neopart Suburban 
Truck

A&A Auto Vehicle 
Maintenance

Coffman Mohawk Kirks Gillig Crossline Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie Cummins Eldorado

                                    4 130684 7.12                           7.12             7.20           14.94             7.44 

Coffman 233990 -                  stock  3w  8w  21d 

                                    5 120364 0.87                           2.22             0.87             3.71             2.57             2.14 

Cummins 233993 -                  stock 
 unapproved 

part  6w  21d  stock 

                                    4 120315 16.91                      16.91           17.72           26.88           21.19 

Vehicle Maintenance 233979 -                  stock  7d  30d  90d 

                                    5 130615 1.14                           1.67             1.43             1.14             3.10             1.44 

Mohawk 233983  20d  stock  4w  4w  21d 

                                    3 110100 2.49                           3.45             2.50             2.49 

Aftermarket Parts 233984 -                  stock  stock  stock 

                                 10 110136 91.29                    103.52         167.90         147.11         103.52           91.29         104.18         102.00         107.17         103.52 151.59       

A&A 233998 -                  10d  5d  3w  stock  3w  3w  stock  4w  30d  stock 

                                    6 100223 64.03                      77.00         122.14           64.03           94.00         174.82         123.27 

Neopart 233980 -                  stock  stock 
unapproved 

part  stock  9w  stock 

                                    2 120526 425.00                  425.00         598.17 

Triangle Service 233997 -                  5d  7w 

                                    3 120541 58.05                      58.05           67.92           58.24 

Coffman 233990 -                  stock  21d  stock 

                                    4 1010001 11.65                      13.39           11.65           18.34           12.60 

Gillig 233992  stock  stock  9w  30d 

                                    4 1210008 1,886.53            1,886.63      3,022.95      2,168.25      1,886.53 

Cummins 233993  stock  9w  21d  stock 

                                    1 1010006 57.20            57.20         

Eldorado 233986 4w

Pace RFQ# 422377



DUE:  03/06/23 @ 
3:00 pm

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Interstate 

Power
Triangle 
Service

Genfare - 
NO BID

Prevost - 
NO BID

Neopart Suburban 
Truck

A&A Auto Vehicle 
Maintenance

Coffman Mohawk Kirks Gillig Crossline Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie Cummins Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 422377

                                    5 1010003 11.99                      34.77           11.99           57.89           39.70           34.84 

Mohawk 233983  stock  stock  5w  21d  stock 

                                    6 1010011 862.00               1,171.60      1,613.99      1,125.00         862.00      2,310.12      1,346.99 

Kirks 233991 -                  10d  stock  3w  stock  6w  45d 

                                    6 1010012 1,229.00            1,330.70      1,335.00      1,229.00      3,873.85      1,675.88      2,417.58 

Kirks 233991 10d  stock  stock  9w  21d  stock 

                                    6 1010015 980.00               1,156.45      1,746.28      1,180.23         980.00      2,499.47      1,420.99 

Kirks 233991 10d  stock  stock  stock  13w  21d 

                                    3 1010016 2,887.75            2,887.75      4,657.57      3,288.08 

Muncie 233985 -                 
 no lead 

time given  9w  30d 

                                    4 1210027 30.50                      30.50           40.89           35.90           30.65 

Coffman 233990 -                  stock  5w  21d  2d 

                                    3 1210034 28.64                    974.00           28.64           30.99 

Aftermarket Parts 233984 -                  stock  7w  30d 

                                    7 1010032 65.37                      76.66         139.53           65.37         145.00           89.00         199.71         140.84 

Mohawk 233983 -                  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                    3 1010035 113.35                  113.35         131.64         113.95 

Coffman 233990 -                  stock  21d  3d 

                                    6 1210070 61.95                      70.98           61.95           66.00           85.48           80.96           68.61 

Coffman 233990 -                  4w  stock  3w  stock  21d  stock 

                                    4 1210077 416.87                  416.87         674.01         451.95         420.55 

Coffman 233990 -                  stock  4w  stock  stock 

                                    1 1210078 1,500.00       1,500.00    

Eldorado 233986 -                 stock



DUE:  03/06/23 @ 
3:00 pm

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Interstate 

Power
Triangle 
Service

Genfare - 
NO BID

Prevost - 
NO BID

Neopart Suburban 
Truck

A&A Auto Vehicle 
Maintenance

Coffman Mohawk Kirks Gillig Crossline Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie Cummins Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 422377

                                    1 1210082 1.05               1.05            

Eldorado 233986 -                 2w

                                     - 1210086 -                 

-                 

                                    4 1210092 35.07                      35.07           52.62           40.51           35.14 

Coffman 233990 -                  stock  5w  30d  2d 

                                    3 1210093 41.90                      62.72           48.22           41.90 

Cummins 233993 -                  7w  30d  3d 

                                    4 1010052 41.79                      41.79         151.66         160.22         136.13 

Coffman 233990 -                  stock  9w  21d  2d 

                                    3 1010060 2,816.95            2,816.95      3,241.14      2,822.85 

Coffman 233990 -                  stock  21d  3d 

                                    5 1010061 974.00                  993.60      1,168.00         974.00      1,972.48      1,269.77 

Kirks 233991 -                  stock  3w  stock  9w  21d 

                                    1 1210110 5,555.56            5,555.56 

Aftermarket Parts 233984 -                  stock 

                                    4 1010068 700.00               1,375.85         700.00      1,553.11      1,659.84 

Kirks 233991 -                  stock  stock  stock  2d 

                                    1 1010098 722.59                  722.59 

Aftermarket Parts 233984 -                  7w 

                                    1 1110009 1,947.73            1,947.73 

Coffman 233990 -                 
 no lead 

time given 

                                    1 1210166 4,561.08            4,561.08 

Coffman 233990 -                 
 no lead 

time given 



DUE:  03/06/23 @ 
3:00 pm

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Interstate 

Power
Triangle 
Service

Genfare - 
NO BID

Prevost - 
NO BID

Neopart Suburban 
Truck

A&A Auto Vehicle 
Maintenance

Coffman Mohawk Kirks Gillig Crossline Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie Cummins Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 422377

                                    1 1010101 181.16          181.16       

Eldorado 233986 -                  6w 

                                     - 1210162 -                 

-                 


	422377

