
DUE:  03/06/23 @ 
3:00 pm

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Interstate 
Power

Battery 
Service

Crossline Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Genfare - 
NO BID

Neopart Prevost P&G Eldorado A&A Auto Illinois Auto Coffman Mohawk Kirks Muncie Gillig Aftermarket 
Parts

                                  5 290415 592.34                 607.38        804.55        677.15 592.34       634.06        

Gillig 233992 -                 3w  75d  42d stock 7w

                                  2 290619 677.15                 677.15 788.99        

Muncie 233985 -                 42d 5w

                                  4 220309 45.93                      63.59           46.99 47.51         45.93          

Aftermarket Parts 233984 -                 75d  42d stock stock

                                  3 71733 90.79                   109.34 97.02         90.79          

Aftermarket Parts 233984  stock 8w stock

                                  5 290536 92.98                      92.98        138.45        109.32 94.00         109.87        

Neopart 233980 -                 stock  75d  21d stock stock

                                  5 290616 125.00                 125.71        173.37        139.18 125.00       164.94        

Gillig 233992 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock stock

                                  3 71875 5.45                        17.23             5.45 6.93            

Mohawk 233983 -                stock  stock stock

                                  2 71287 0.27                          0.27 0.47            

Mohawk 233983 -                 stock 5w

                                  6 151458 169.32                 179.96        245.73        388.00        211.48 169.32       292.32        

 Neopart 233980  stock  stock  stock  stock stock 5w

71441 6.57                        10.98           17.95             7.25             6.57 7.08           15.14          

Muncie 233985 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock stock 19w

                                  1 151952 57.62                      57.62 

Eldorado 233986  stock 

                                  3 160600 9.50                          9.50 9.50           12.59          

Muncie 233985  stock stock 11w

                                  4 290653 18.99                      28.62           22.45 18.99         26.88          

Pace RFQ# 422376



DUE:  03/06/23 @ 
3:00 pm

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Interstate 
Power

Battery 
Service

Crossline Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Genfare - 
NO BID

Neopart Prevost P&G Eldorado A&A Auto Illinois Auto Coffman Mohawk Kirks Muncie Gillig Aftermarket 
Parts

Pace RFQ# 422376

Gillig 233992  75d  21d stock 4w

                                  2 170625 254.68                 310.48        254.68 

Mohawk 233983  stock  stock 

                                  6 70659 5.69                        16.35             5.79             5.69           15.80 24.96         6.61            

Kirks 233991 -                 2w  stock  stock  21d 4w stock

                                  5 290537 187.02                 191.18        252.89        211.89 187.02       235.40        

Gillig 233992  3w  75d  30d stock stock

                                  1 180535 82.88            82.88          

Aftermarket Parts 233984 5w

                                  3 160596 170.94                 197.45 170.94       227.71        

Gillig 233992 -                 105d  stock  7w 

                                  7 72094 19.61                      19.61           21.00           33.95           24.00           26.97           25.00 28.66          

Vehicle Maintenance 233979 -                 stock  75d  6w  2w  30d  30d 5w

                                  4 71442 6.45                        17.95             7.30             6.45 15.14          

Muncie 233985 -                 stock  30d  stock 19w

                                  3 70725 0.16                          0.16             0.18 0.36            

Mohawk 233983 -                 stock  stock  stock 

                                  5 72148 89.04                   369.83           89.04        182.45 139.10       172.34        

Mohawk 233983 -                 stock  stock  50d stock stock

                                  4 72155 63.09                      65.45        130.38           63.09 79.04          

Muncie 233985 -                 7w  stock  42d 8w

                                  4 72156 21.99                      21.99           23.35 24.04         28.50          

Neopart 233980 -                 8w  42d 12w 16w

                                  4 72194 70.98                      70.98        153.07           93.37 92.79          

Neopart 233980 -                 9w  stock  60d stock



DUE:  03/06/23 @ 
3:00 pm

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Interstate 
Power

Battery 
Service

Crossline Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Genfare - 
NO BID

Neopart Prevost P&G Eldorado A&A Auto Illinois Auto Coffman Mohawk Kirks Muncie Gillig Aftermarket 
Parts

Pace RFQ# 422376

                                  5 290673 1,401.79           1,455.95     2,129.59     1,556.76 1,401.79    1,819.74     

Gillig 233992 -                 90d  4w  21d 6w stock

                                  3 160852 0.93                          1.52 0.93           1.46            

Gillig 233992 -                 stock 2w  stock 

                                  3 220389 1,491.91           1,491.91 1,759.23    1,938.50     

Muncie 233985 -                 60d 8w 15w

                                  4 72301 348.97                 348.97        418.00        450.00 571.26        

Battery Service 233994 -                 4d  4w  stock 5w

                                  4 290696 9.60                        53.94             9.60           29.25 26.33          

Aftermarket Parts 233984 -                 8w 
 unapproved 

part  stock stock

                                  3 170716 1,127.26           1,725.96     1,127.26 1,150.00    

Muncie 233985 -                 stock  30d 10w

                                   - 1710004 -                

-                

                                  3 1710015 37.65                      37.65 48.43         46.98          

Muncie 233985 -                 30d  4w 5w

                                  1 710004 33.95                      33.95 

Eldorado 233986 -                 stock 

                                  2 1510008 20.03                      26.64 20.03          

Aftermarket Parts 233984 -                 2w stock

                                  1 710032 165.42          165.42        

Aftermarket Parts 233984 -                stock

                                  2 2210005 2,478.61       2,478.61    3,141.98     

Gillig 233992 -                 10w stock

                                  1 2210015 213.33                 213.33 



DUE:  03/06/23 @ 
3:00 pm

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Interstate 
Power

Battery 
Service

Crossline Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Genfare - 
NO BID

Neopart Prevost P&G Eldorado A&A Auto Illinois Auto Coffman Mohawk Kirks Muncie Gillig Aftermarket 
Parts

Pace RFQ# 422376

Eldorado 233986 -                 4w 

                                  3 2110037 365.00                 365.00     1,689.71 2,475.44     

P&G 233995 -                 stock  2w 9w

                                  1 710105 1,285.31           1,285.31 

Eldorado 233986 -                 6w 

                                  2 710115 57.11                      57.11           80.24 

Vehicle Maintenance 233979 -                stock  stock 

                                  6 710120 432.32                 607.75        432.32        469.00        496.32 475.23       616.28        

P&G 233995 -                 stock  6w  60d  30d stock stock

                                  1 1810033 182.79                 182.79 

Eldorado 233986 -                 6w 

                                  1 710130 214.93                 214.93 

Eldorado 233986 -                 stock 

                                  3 2110064 11,205.88      11,205.88   11,608.78   13,528.68 

Eldorado 233986 -                 10w  6w  3w 

                                  3 710137 570.15              1,088.74 570.15       748.22        

Gillig 233992 -                 stock 12w  9w 

                                  1 1510112 28.27                      28.27 

Eldorado 233986 -                 1w 

                                  7 710149 412.00                 523.74        412.00        447.47        497.56        456.86 635.61       641.24        

Crossline 233989 -                 stock  stock  stock  30d  stock stock  stock 

                                  2 2110074 2,233.24           2,233.24     2,620.79 

Illinois Auto 233996 -                 6w  21d 

                                  5 710168 460.92                 460.92        505.00        637.95 563.33       618.24        

P&G 233995 -                 stock  stock  35d 6w  7w 



DUE:  03/06/23 @ 
3:00 pm

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Interstate 
Power

Battery 
Service

Crossline Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Genfare - 
NO BID

Neopart Prevost P&G Eldorado A&A Auto Illinois Auto Coffman Mohawk Kirks Muncie Gillig Aftermarket 
Parts

Pace RFQ# 422376

                                  5 710170 3,095.98           3,095.98     7,562.06     3,560.00     4,124.02 4,460.83     

P&G 233995 -                 stock  6w  8w  30d 15w

                                  2 1610084 84.99                      84.99 147.29        

Muncie 233985 -                 21d stock

                                  1 1610086 8.64                          8.64 

Eldorado 233986 -                 4w 

                                  1 1510151 217.53                 217.53 

Eldorado 233986 -                 4w 

                                  3 2510067 936.71                 975.57 936.71       1,281.21     

Gillig 233992 -                 10d 2w 7w

                                  2 2510112 430.79                 430.79 719.56        

Muncie 233985 -                 stock stock

                                  1 1510209 6.17                          6.17 

Eldorado 233986 -                 stock 

                                  1 710262 755.67          755.67        

Aftermarket Parts 233984 -                8w

                                  2 2210048 7.48                          7.48 15.70          

Muncie 233985 -                 21d 11w

                                  2 2210049 7.76                          7.76 8.93            

Muncie 233985 -                 126d 25w

                                  2 2110144 3,017.41           3,017.41     3,499.88 

Illinois Auto 233996 -                 2w  21d 

                                  1 710311 647.28          647.28        

Aftermarket Parts 233984 -                
 no lead 

time given 

                                  1 1610158 58.81                      58.81 



DUE:  03/06/23 @ 
3:00 pm

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Interstate 
Power

Battery 
Service

Crossline Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Genfare - 
NO BID

Neopart Prevost P&G Eldorado A&A Auto Illinois Auto Coffman Mohawk Kirks Muncie Gillig Aftermarket 
Parts

Pace RFQ# 422376

Eldorado 233986 -                 4w 

                                  1 710335 162.45                 162.45 

Eldorado 233986 -                 12w 

                                  1 1510267 324.60                 324.60 

Eldorado 233986 -                 4w 

                                  2 2110170 52.45                      52.45 53.18          

Muncie 233985 -                 stock 14w

                                  1 2110188 234.44          234.44        

Aftermarket Parts 233984 -                10w

                                  3 2110223 7,805.92           7,950.00     7,805.92 10,136.36   

Muncie 233985 -                 stock  160d 25w

                                  1 2110277 78.95                      78.95 

Eldorado 233986 -                 14w 

                                   - 1610209 -                

-                

                                  1 1610210 7,466.50       7,466.50     

Eldorado 233986 -                21w

                                  1 1610211 4,585.77       4,585.77     

Eldorado 233986 -                21w

                                   - 1510336 -                

-                

                                  1 710297 228.36                 228.36 

Eldorado 233986 -                 4w 

                                  1 710321 610.04                 610.04 

Eldorado 233986 -                 stock 



DUE:  03/06/23 @ 
3:00 pm

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Interstate 
Power

Battery 
Service

Crossline Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Genfare - 
NO BID

Neopart Prevost P&G Eldorado A&A Auto Illinois Auto Coffman Mohawk Kirks Muncie Gillig Aftermarket 
Parts

Pace RFQ# 422376

                                   - 2110230 -                

-                

                                  1 710455 62.98                      62.98 

Eldorado 233986 -                 12w 


	422376

