
DUE:  03/06/23 @ 
3:00 pm

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Crossline Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Genfare - 
NO BID

Triangle 
Service

Prevost Neopart Suburban 
Truck 

A&A Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Coffman Mohawk Kirks Gillig Eldorado Muncie Aftermarket 
Parts

Cummins

                                  6 81083 5.80                          9.86           10.89             5.80           12.59 15.45         10.80         

Crossline 233989 -                 stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part  30d stock stock

                                10 60494 9.18                          9.18           26.48           13.76           12.29           12.98           13.34           12.50           14.26 22.43         15.49         

Vehicle Maintenance 233979 -                 stock 
 no lead 

time given  stock  3w  stock  30d  30d  30d 4w
 no lead 

time given 

                                  6 81298 56.00                      77.64           68.00           74.02           56.00 72.78         83.04         

Aftermarket Parts 233984 -                
 bid 24, 
need 30 

 unapproved 
part  stock 

 unapproved 
part stock 3d

                                  7 81313 42.00                      55.53           97.00        112.75           42.00           53.38 96.69         113.49       

Muncie 233985  stock  2w  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock stock stock

                                  4 60748 53.45                      88.25           98.09           53.93 53.45         

Aftermarket Parts 233984 -                 90d  stock  60d 5w

                                  1 60770 73.92                      73.92 

Eldorado 233986 -                 stock 

                                  4 60771 90.00                   166.04           90.00        189.19 166.94       

Kirks 233991 -                 stock  stock  30d 2d

                                  5 81422 1.60                          2.48             1.60             3.93 4.14           3.33           

Coffman 233990 -                 stock 
 unapproved 

part  21d stock stock

                                  1 60792 212.29                 212.29 

Eldorado 233986 -                 stock 

                                  6 81444 59.40                   114.98           73.44           59.40           71.75           78.12 90.63         

Mohawk 233983  stock  6w  stock  stock  60d 8w

                                11 81521 17.97                      17.97           47.91           22.63           23.20           21.59           22.18           18.75           27.95           19.26 33.71         26.42         

Vehicle Maintenance 233979  stock 5d  stock  stock  3w  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock  60d stock 3d

                                  2 810013 2,865.84           2,865.84 2,885.74    
Availability - 
Cummins 233993

 no lead 
time given 3d

                                  4 810015 168.84                 168.84        180.66 244.14       169.84       

Pace RFQ# 422375



DUE:  03/06/23 @ 
3:00 pm

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Crossline Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Genfare - 
NO BID

Triangle 
Service

Prevost Neopart Suburban 
Truck 

A&A Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Coffman Mohawk Kirks Gillig Eldorado Muncie Aftermarket 
Parts

Cummins

Pace RFQ# 422375

Coffman 233990  stock  stock 7w 2d

                                  7 610014 11.13                      11.13           17.83           21.35           22.84           15.90 25.41         17.83         

Vehicle Maintenance 233979 -                 stock  stock  30d  4w  stock 7w stock

                                  3 810019 358.58                 358.58        392.11 456.89       

Muncie 233985
 no lead 

time given  30d 4w

                                  5 610018 18.90                      52.51           18.90           58.52 72.14         50.81         

Mohawk 233983  stock  stock  30d  stock 2d

                                  4 810026 1,118.69           1,118.69     1,285.45 1,958.32    1,129.85    

Coffman 233990 -                 stock  30d  9w  2d 

                                  4 810027 652.45                 652.45        757.54 876.39       658.94       

Coffman 233990 -                 stock  30d  9w stock

                                  5 810030 1.39                          2.85             1.39             3.21 4.05           2.76           

Cummins 233993 -                 stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock stock stock

                                  5 810031 2.38                          9.58             2.38           10.98 13.63         9.52           

Cummins 233993 -                 stock 
 unapproved 

part  21d 4w  2d 

                                  7 610028 32.00                      59.95           49.67           38.35           32.00           61.75 110.03       66.66         

Mohawk 233983 -                 stock  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock stock 3d

                                  4 610031 28.17                      35.50           28.17 50.56         35.58         

Coffman 233990 -                 stock 
 unapproved 

part  5w 2d

                                  1 610036 3,858.09           3,858.09 

Eldorado 233986 -                 12w 

                                  2 810046 534.99                 546.38 534.99       

Cummins 233993 -                 stock 3d

                                  5 610053 21.20                      32.10           21.20           27.60 48.06         32.10         

Mohawk 233983 -                 stock  stock  stock 7w stock



DUE:  03/06/23 @ 
3:00 pm

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Crossline Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Genfare - 
NO BID

Triangle 
Service

Prevost Neopart Suburban 
Truck 

A&A Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Coffman Mohawk Kirks Gillig Eldorado Muncie Aftermarket 
Parts

Cummins

Pace RFQ# 422375

                                  3 810064 4,215.02           5,195.65 5,972.83    4,215.02    

Cummins 233993 -                 stock 9w  4d 

                                  6 810066 80.37                      80.37           94.84           81.25        160.20 247.58       178.11       

Vehicle Maintenance 233979 -                 stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock  stock stock stock

                                  5 810073 128.98                 137.55        165.83        128.98 197.69       139.41       

Muncie 233985 -                 stock  3w  stock 7w 3d

                                  4 610058 48.87                      48.87        111.75 395.49       100.46       

Mohawk 233983 -                 stock  stock stock 2d

                                  5 810078 448.92                 448.92        459.33        520.97 657.45       463.87       

Crossline 233989 -                 stock  stock  30d stock 3d

                                  4 810079 456.62                 456.62        459.33 657.45       463.87       

Crossline 233989 -                 stock  stock 9w 3d

                                  2 610061 5.35                        16.79 5.35           

Aftermarket Parts 233984 -                 stock  11w 

                                  3 810092 30.33                      30.33           36.71 31.87         

Coffman 233990 -                 stock  30d  2d 

                                  5 810093 17.29                      17.29           17.73           36.05 61.00         37.46         

Vehicle Maintenance 233979 -                 stock  stock  21d 7w 3d

                                  5 610064 98.75                      98.75        116.68        113.15 132.63       99.64         

Coffman 233990 -                 stock  30d  stock stock stock

                                  3 810101 265.45                 265.45 378.98       267.35       

Coffman 233990 -                 stock  stock 2d

                                  5 810102 3.63                          3.71             4.75             4.20 5.29           3.63           

Cummins 233993 -                 stock  3w  30d  5w stock

                                  4 810110 1,397.00           1,705.18     1,397.00 1,864.71    1,402.15    



DUE:  03/06/23 @ 
3:00 pm

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Crossline Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Genfare - 
NO BID

Triangle 
Service

Prevost Neopart Suburban 
Truck 

A&A Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Coffman Mohawk Kirks Gillig Eldorado Muncie Aftermarket 
Parts

Cummins

Pace RFQ# 422375

Kirks 233991 -                 stock  stock stock 3d

810128 724.38                 724.38        820.00 1,036.82    731.60       

Coffman 233990 -                 stock  30d 9w stock

                                  4 810130 460.72                 460.72        535.49 657.45       463.87       

Coffman 233990 -                 stock  30d  9w 2d

                                  4 810140 180.81                 180.81        198.76 257.50       216.95       

Coffman 233990 -                 7d  stock stock 3d

                                  6 810141 23.41                      55.25           77.32           23.41           54.50 111.25       628.60       

Muncie 233985 -                 stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock 3w 2d

                                  1 610071 37.03                      37.03 

Eldorado 233986 -                 stock 

                                  5 610072 33.40                      45.23           33.40           51.80 60.63         45.49         

Coffman 233990 -                 stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock 5w 2d

                                  5 810152 525.00                 525.00        622.41        725.56 753.52       628.60       

Crossline 233989 -                 stock 
 no lead 

time given  30d 5w  2d 

                                  5 810164 1,850.00           1,850.00     2,007.12     2,851.49 3,296.70    2,424.59    

Crossline 233989 -                 stock  stock  21d 9w 2d

                                  1 610082 20.74                      20.74 

Eldorado 233986 -                 stock 

                                  2 810169 31.00                      41.92 31.00         

Aftermarket Parts 233984 -                 stock 19w

                                  4 610085 34.23                      34.23           39.85 51.37         34.30         

Coffman 233990 -                 stock  30d 4w  3d 

                                  3 810201 54.00                      54.00           75.62 65.37         

Coffman 233990 -                 stock  21d stock



DUE:  03/06/23 @ 
3:00 pm

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Crossline Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Genfare - 
NO BID

Triangle 
Service

Prevost Neopart Suburban 
Truck 

A&A Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Coffman Mohawk Kirks Gillig Eldorado Muncie Aftermarket 
Parts

Cummins

Pace RFQ# 422375

                                  2 810203 3,074.50           3,074.50 4,366.54    

Coffman 233990 -                 stock 9w

                                  5 810204 1,250.00           2,005.91     1,250.00     1,683.55 1,953.52    1,468.93    

Kirks 233991 -                 stock  stock  30d 9w 2d

                                  3 810206 12.35                      12.35           16.25 13.84         

Coffman 233990 -                 stock  21d 3d

                                  5 810208 0.18                          1.73             0.18             1.94 2.47           1.56           

Cummins 233993 -                 stock 
 unapproved 

part  30d 9w 3d

                                  1 610102 1,500.00           1,500.00 

Eldorado 233986 -                 4w 

                                  4 810209 24.61                      25.31           28.79 32.86         24.61         

Cummins 233993 -                 stock  30d 5w 3d

                                  5 810216 4.32                          4.32             5.84             5.04             5.97 5.04           

Vehicle Maintenance 233979 -                 STOCK  stock  stock  21d 3d

                                  5 810230 3.75                          3.95             5.38             4.49 5.46           3.75           

Cummins 233993 -                 stock 
 unapproved 

part  30d 5w 2d

                                  6 810232 418.00                 418.00        484.65        459.33        459.78 657.45       463.87       

Crossline 233989 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock stock stock

                                  3 810258 13.18                      13.18           19.05 16.90         

Coffman 233990 -                 stock  stock 3d

                                  5 810276 1,640.00           1,640.00     1,849.39     2,412.49 4,421.41    1,858.58    

Crossline 233989 -                 stock  stock  30d 6w stock

                                  6 610139 71.00                      71.00           85.45        102.16           95.99 110.97       83.35         

Crossline 233989 -                 stock  stock  30d  stock 7w 2d

                                  3 610163 3.58                          3.58             5.32 7.95           



DUE:  03/06/23 @ 
3:00 pm

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Crossline Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Genfare - 
NO BID

Triangle 
Service

Prevost Neopart Suburban 
Truck 

A&A Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Coffman Mohawk Kirks Gillig Eldorado Muncie Aftermarket 
Parts

Cummins

Pace RFQ# 422375

Gillig 233992 -                 stock  42d 11w

                                  1 610188 1,281.00       1,281.00    

Aftermarket Parts 233984 -                20w

                                  4 810440 169.00                 169.00        195.62 237.94       171.18       

Coffman 233990 -                 stock  112d 6w 2d

                                  4 810197 177.55                 177.55        222.45        197.32 229.15       

Coffman 233990 -                 stock  30d  30d 7w

                                   - 610190 -                

-                


	422375

