
DUE:  03/06/23 @ 
3:00 pm

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Genfare - 
NO BID

Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Cummins Neopart Suburban 
Truck

Illinois 
Auto - NO 

BID

Prevost Coffman Mohawk Kirks Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie Eldorado

                                    1 41237 508.72                  508.72 

Eldorado 233986 -                  2w 

                                    1 40615 125.93                  125.93 

Eldorado 233986 -                  6w 

                                    1 30406 253.82                  253.82 

Eldorado 233986 -                  stock 

                                    1 40932 2.17                           2.17 

Muncie 233985  stock 

                                    1 200522 37.50                      37.50 

Muncie 233985 -                  stock 

                                    1 200522 37.50                      37.50 

Muncie 233985 -                  stock 

                                    5 40504 1.16                           2.06             2.22             1.16             2.32             1.65 

Mohawk 233983 -                  stock  75d stock  stock  stock 

                                    5 200548 20.66                      20.69           20.66           24.91           26.65           24.42 

Prevost 233982 -                  4w  stock  3w  stock  stock 

                                    4 200547 478.19                  575.19         523.30         478.19         740.95 

Mohawk 233983 -                  4w  75d  3w  8w 

                                    4 40798 110.50                  110.50         119.17         129.52         148.13 

Neopart 233980 stock  stock  3w  7w 

Pace RFQ# 422374



DUE:  03/06/23 @ 
3:00 pm

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Genfare - 
NO BID

Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Cummins Neopart Suburban 
Truck

Illinois 
Auto - NO 

BID

Prevost Coffman Mohawk Kirks Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 422374

                                    8 40953 14.05                      14.05           22.08           33.51           19.05           36.79           49.57           24.73           14.80 

Vehicle Maintenance 233979  stock stock  stock  75d  5w  stock  stock  stock 

                                    6 41215 159.27                  159.27         174.34         184.52         216.71         193.96         393.21 

Neopart 233980 stock  stock  3w  5w  stock  2w 

                                    6 200863 9.40                         11.43           15.82             9.61             9.40           11.55           10.61 

Neopart 233980  3d 3w  stock  3w  stock  3w 

                                    4 41213 181.18                  295.09         186.13         187.12         181.18 

Muncie 233985 -                  14w 
 unapproved 

part  stock  30d 

                                    2 200370 5.43                           5.43           10.93 

Mohawk 233983  stock  stock 

                                    5 41035 1.05                           6.91             7.55             1.05             6.21             1.90 

Mohawk 233983 stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                    6 41217 97.00                    113.03         166.27         210.20         106.43           97.00         227.50 

Aftermarket Parts 233984 -                  6w  stock  75d  stock  stock  8w 

                                    3 10405 130.66                  130.66         191.65         253.82 

Mohawk 233983 -                  7w  stock  stock 

                                    4 41147 3.50                           3.94             4.09             5.95             3.50 

Aftermarket Parts 233984 -                  3w  stock  stock  6w 

                                    4 40922 17.35                      51.95           30.18           17.35           45.77 

Mohawk 233983 -                  stock  stock  stock  stock 



DUE:  03/06/23 @ 
3:00 pm

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Genfare - 
NO BID

Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Cummins Neopart Suburban 
Truck

Illinois 
Auto - NO 

BID

Prevost Coffman Mohawk Kirks Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 422374

                                    5 41205 1.06                           1.09             1.06             1.25             5.08             1.16 

Suburban Truck 233981 -                  MOQ  stock  75d  stock  stock 

                                    3 40185 24.50                      44.62           24.50         101.06 

Mohawk 233983 -                  17w  4w  26w 

                                    6 10001 0.37                           1.22             1.32             1.65             0.37             1.46             1.34 

Mohawk 233983 -                  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                    5 10365 76.36                      89.66         226.60           76.36           77.76           85.80 

Mohawk 233983 -                  6w  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                    6 10366 72.75                      73.36         166.27         226.60           72.75           90.47           74.40 

Mohawk 233983 -                  3w  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                    4 40090 0.72                           0.83             1.11             0.98             0.72 

Aftermarket Parts 233984 -                  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                    3 20535 48.07                      48.07           56.42           78.60 

Mohawk 233983 -                  stock  stock  stock 

                                    5 41019 0.99                           2.98             3.71             0.99             3.43             3.06 

Mohawk 233983 -                  3w  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                    4 41240 110.25                  112.45         121.84         139.94         110.25 

Muncie 233985 -                  stock  3w  stock  stock 

                                    1 30411 370.42                  370.42 

Eldorado 233986 -                  20w 



DUE:  03/06/23 @ 
3:00 pm

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Genfare - 
NO BID

Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Cummins Neopart Suburban 
Truck

Illinois 
Auto - NO 

BID

Prevost Coffman Mohawk Kirks Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 422374

                                    1 30421 248.61                  248.61 

Eldorado 233986 -                  6w 

                                    5 41272 39.58                      39.58           41.75           45.07           46.12         100.21 

Neopart 233980 -                  stock  stock  3w  5w  2w 

                                    5 41273 39.96                      39.96           41.55           48.51           45.84           45.89 

Neopart 233980 -                  7w  stock  75d  3w  7w 

                                    2 10416 520.14                  520.14         639.81 

Aftermarket Parts 233984 -                  stock  6w 

                                    1 10417 445.17                  445.17 

Eldorado 233986 -                  20w 

                                    5 41288 76.26                    129.83           76.26         144.25         127.51         169.41 

Muncie 233985 -                  7w 
 unapproved 

part  stock  stock  3w 

                                    2 20726 158.08                  158.08         188.34 

Aftermarket Parts 233984 -                  16w  12w 

                                    2 20727 439.13                  439.13         469.91 

Aftermarket Parts 233984 -                  10w  stock 

                                    1 10424 18.52                      18.52 

Eldorado 233986 -                  stock 

                                    3 41332 317.27                  587.19         616.14         317.27 

Neopart 233980 -                 11w  3w 
 unapproved 

part 



DUE:  03/06/23 @ 
3:00 pm

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Genfare - 
NO BID

Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Cummins Neopart Suburban 
Truck

Illinois 
Auto - NO 

BID

Prevost Coffman Mohawk Kirks Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 422374

                                    1 30483 182.77                  182.77 

Eldorado 233986 -                  stock 

                                    1 110003 322.40                  322.40 

Eldorado 233986 -                  6w 

                                    1 110006 338.30                  338.30 

Eldorado 233986 -                  8w 

                                    1 110007 326.20                  326.20 

Eldorado 233986 -                  stock 

                                    3 2010020 13.43                      59.21           13.43           76.28 

Neopart 233980 -                  4w 
 unapproved 

part  5w 

                                    3 2010021 28.57                    200.24           28.57         259.13 

Neopart 233980 -                  4w 
 unapproved 

part  5w 

                                    3 210008 107.64                  107.64         129.46         217.65 

Neopart 233980 -                  4w  stock  stock 

                                    2 310014 88.22                      99.26           88.22 

Aftermarket Parts 233984 -                  stock  stock 

                                    4 410034 272.17                  272.17         303.91         348.50         376.33 

Neopart 233980 -                  4w  75d  3w  stock 

                                     - 110022 -                 

-                 



DUE:  03/06/23 @ 
3:00 pm

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Genfare - 
NO BID

Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Cummins Neopart Suburban 
Truck

Illinois 
Auto - NO 

BID

Prevost Coffman Mohawk Kirks Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 422374

                                    5 2010037 548.31                  596.67         548.31         638.46         768.62         752.74 

Neopart 233980 -                  4w 
 No lead 

time given  3w  5w  stock 

                                    1 110026 83.08                      83.08 

Eldorado 233986 -                  4w 

                                    3 410081 5.59                           5.59             6.12             7.60 

Neopart 233980 -                  stock  stock  stock 

                                    1 410084 651.56                  651.56 

Aftermarket Parts 233984 -                  12w 

                                    4 410095 102.25                  121.42         155.94         102.25         182.96 

Aftermarket Parts 233984 -                  7w  stock  stock  stock 

                                     - 2010062 -                 

-                 

                                    1 110058 295.39                  295.39 

Aftermarket Parts 233984 -                  stock 

                                    2 310061 141.96                  141.96         154.02 

Aftermarket Parts 233984 -                 
 unapproved 

part  15w 

                                    1 20712 547.21                  547.21 

Eldorado 233986 -                  stock 

                                    1 310026 1,656.51           1,656.51 

Eldorado 233986 -                  20w 


	422374

