
DUE:  01/10/2023 @ 
3:00 PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Geib - NO 
BID

Genfare - 
NO BID

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Kirks - NO 
BID

Prevost Muncie Mohawk Gillig Neopart Aftermarket 
Parts

                                  3 160605 10.08                     10.08          11.25          48.49 

Muncie 233883 -                 21d  stock  stock 

                                  5 290536 94.00                   138.45        109.50          94.00          97.20        109.87 

Gillig 233886 -                 stock  21d  stock  3w  stock 

                                  3 250583 452.25                452.25        468.07        604.34 

Gillig 233886 -                 4w  10d  7w 

                                  3 160600 9.50                          9.50          10.25          12.98 

Muncie 233883  stock  stock  stock 

                                  2 180549 31.25                     36.27          31.25 

Aftermarket Parts 233889 -                 12w  stock 

                                  4 290043 0.21                          0.21             1.14             0.75             1.11 

Muncie 233883 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                  2 250585 25.74                     25.74          26.65 

Gillig 233886 -                 4w  10d 

                                  1 170593 11.62                     11.62 

Pace RFQ# 422289



DUE:  01/10/2023 @ 
3:00 PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Geib - NO 
BID

Genfare - 
NO BID

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Kirks - NO 
BID

Prevost Muncie Mohawk Gillig Neopart Aftermarket 
Parts

Pace RFQ# 422289

Aftermarket Parts 233889  stock 

                                  3 290645 53.53                     53.53          56.67          97.08 

Vehicle Maintenance 233881 stock  21d  stock 

                                  3 250595 3.90                          3.94             3.90             4.43 

Neopart 233880  2w  10d  6w 

                                  3 160596 170.94                174.90        170.94        190.15 

Gillig 233886  21d  stock  stock 

                                  3 250591 1.44                          1.44             1.80             1.90 

Gillig 233886 -                 2w  10d  4w 

                                  1 170615 347.77                347.77 

Aftermarket Parts 233889  8w 

                                  4 290652 3.50                          9.04             6.90             3.50             8.73 

Gillig 233886  75d  21d  stock  stock 

                                   - 151959 -                

-                



DUE:  01/10/2023 @ 
3:00 PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Geib - NO 
BID

Genfare - 
NO BID

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Kirks - NO 
BID

Prevost Muncie Mohawk Gillig Neopart Aftermarket 
Parts

Pace RFQ# 422289

                                  1 151964 48.96                     48.96 

Aftermarket Parts 233889 -                 stock 

                                  1 290666 27.48                     27.48 

Muncie 233883 -                 21d 

                                   - 180819 -                

-                

                                   - 152006 -                

-                

                                  3 290673 1,401.79          1,455.95     1,401.79     1,968.56 

Gillig 233886 -                 90d  6w  6w 

                                   - 290675 -                

-                

                                  3 250733 870.91                870.91        911.75     1,104.74 

Gillig 233886 -                 4w  10d  15w 

                                  3 152032 166.60                212.30        166.60        210.23 



DUE:  01/10/2023 @ 
3:00 PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Geib - NO 
BID

Genfare - 
NO BID

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Kirks - NO 
BID

Prevost Muncie Mohawk Gillig Neopart Aftermarket 
Parts

Pace RFQ# 422289

Muncie 233883 -                 75d  stock  5w 

                                  3 152033 166.50                212.26        166.50        210.23 

Muncie 233883 -                 75d  21d  5w 

                                  5 290690 557.95                771.89        653.99        557.95        585.79        768.58 

Gillig 233886 -                 75d  21d  stock  3w  3w 

                                   - 160899 -                

-                

                                  4 290694 98.24                   111.79        101.07          98.24        128.89 

Neopart 233880 -                 45d  stock  3w  4w 

                                  4 250784 241.48                399.98        292.88        241.48        357.24 

Gillig 233886 -                 stock  30d  stock  stock 

                                   - 170706 -                

-                

                                  2 290695 65.00                     65.00          93.31 

Muncie 233883 -                 stock  25w 



DUE:  01/10/2023 @ 
3:00 PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Geib - NO 
BID

Genfare - 
NO BID

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Kirks - NO 
BID

Prevost Muncie Mohawk Gillig Neopart Aftermarket 
Parts

Pace RFQ# 422289

                                  2 290701 175.60                175.60        234.21 

Muncie 233883 -                 stock  stock 

                                  4 170718 65.65                     99.16          65.65          76.41          94.74 

Muncie 233883 -                 75d  stock  6w  stock 

                                   - 170722 -                

-                

                                  3 1710015 35.85                     35.85          40.72          46.98 

Muncie 233883 -                 30d  stock  5w 

                                  3 1810001 440.00                788.97        440.00        631.95 

Gillig 233886 -                 stock  6w  19w 

                                  3 2510000 370.39                657.01        370.39        831.16 

Neopart 233880 -                 stock  4w  stock 

                                  3 1610017 145.42                152.00        145.42        196.16 

Gillig 233886 -                 30d  stock  stock 

                                  1 1510008 15.47                     15.47 



DUE:  01/10/2023 @ 
3:00 PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Geib - NO 
BID

Genfare - 
NO BID

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Kirks - NO 
BID

Prevost Muncie Mohawk Gillig Neopart Aftermarket 
Parts

Pace RFQ# 422289

Aftermarket Parts 233889 -                 stock 

                                  4 1610018 34.39                     51.57          34.39          37.99          46.05 

Muncie 233883 -                 75d  30d  stock  stock 

                                  3 1610026 33.87                     33.99          57.10          33.87 

Aftermarket Parts 233889 -                 stock  stock  stock 

                                   - 1510032 -                

-                

                                   - 1810033 -                

-                

                                  3 1810036 146.25                167.70        146.25        174.72 

Gillig 233886 -                 stock  12w  13w 

                                  2 1610071 18.07                     19.05          18.07 

Aftermarket Parts 233889 -                 stock  4w 

                                   - 1510151 -                

-                



DUE:  01/10/2023 @ 
3:00 PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Geib - NO 
BID

Genfare - 
NO BID

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Kirks - NO 
BID

Prevost Muncie Mohawk Gillig Neopart Aftermarket 
Parts

Pace RFQ# 422289

                                  3 2510070 4.69                          4.98             4.69             5.58 

Neopart 233880 -                 2w  10d  stock 

                                   - 1610099 -                

-                

                                   - 1610158 -                

-                

                                  2 2510163 33.97                     36.12          33.97 

Neopart 233880 -                 2w  10d 


	422289

