DUE: 01/10/2023 @

3:00 PM Pace RFQ# 422288
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
e -
Sku Winning bid | Geib - NO | Coffman Vehicle Muncie P&G Kirks Prevost Gillig Neopart Filter Cummins | Mohawk | Aftermarket | Eldorado

NO # of Bids BID Maintenance Services Parts

4 220309 43.89 46.19 63.59 53.71 43.89
Aftermarket Parts - 42d 75d stock stock

4 71733 90.85 90.85 109.34 93.68 100.93
Muncie - stock stock stock stock

5 71441 6.32 6.32 7.08 7.30 15.14 17.95
Muncie - stock stock stock 19w 1w

4 211005 1.47 16.90 1.47 5.25 19.48
Filter Services 35d 60d stock 10w

3 220340 745.44 768.00 745.44| 1,277.36
Aftermarket Parts - 14w stock stock

5 72143 11.25 13.05 11.25 12.60 12.35 19.26
Gillig - stock stock 10w stock stock

2 220130 13.70 194.99 13.70
Kirks - 21d stock

2 210883 3.53 4.79 3.53
Aftermarket Parts - 35d stock

4 211004 1.47 14.36 1.47 5.33 16.98
Filter Services - 21d 60d 60d 7w

2 220334 91.35 91.35 108.98
Muncie 30d stock




DUE: 01/10/2023 @

3:00 PM Pace RFQ# 422288
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
e -
Sku Winning bid | Geib - NO | Coffman Vehicle Muncie P&G Kirks Prevost Gillig Neopart Filter Cummins | Mohawk | Aftermarket | Eldorado

NO # of Bids BID Maintenance Services Parts

3 71100 0.08 0.12 0.08 0.09
Mohawk 60d stock stock

5 72135 57.63 72.39 57.63 78.34 65.61 128.06
Gillig 80d stock 10w stock 4w

3 210976 26.31 26.31 57.08 51.87
Mohawk stock 7w 2w

5 70706 5.16 34.18 15.75 5.16 28.09 57.52

unapproved

Gillig - stock stock part stock stock

5 72056 17.20 53.16 31.11 53.59 17.20 20.64

unapproved

Aftermarket Parts stock stock 3d part 7w

5 71442 6.45 6.45 7.08 7.30 15.14 17.95
Muncie stock stock 4w stock stock

4 220129 2.64 7.35 62.30 112.48 2.64
Eldorado - stock 6w 6w stock

4 72148 89.04 129.14 89.04 172.34 369.83
Mohawk - 6w stock stock stock

4 72156 21.99 22.24 24.04 21.99 28.50
Neopart - 42d 12w 10w stock

4 72184 6.14 7.49 11.98 6.14 21.70
Aftermarket Parts - stock stock stock stock




DUE: 01/10/2023 @

3:00 PM Pace RFQ# 422288
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
e -
Sku Winning bid | Geib - NO | Coffman Vehicle Muncie P&G Kirks Prevost Gillig Neopart Filter Cummins | Mohawk | Aftermarket | Eldorado
NO # of Bids BID Maintenance Services Parts
1 72203 29.26 29.26
Eldorado - stock
4 72255 6.40 15.02 6.40 24.31 32.66
unapproved
Muncie - stock part stock stock
3 72270 5.70 6.59 5.70 5.71
Muncie - stock 120d stock
5 220406 4.00 9.33 4.00 9.99 8.99 9.71
Kirks - 70d stock 75d stock stock
1 72366 237.55 237.55
Eldorado - 8w
3 220419 4.27 4.27 5.45 4.87
Muncie - 65d 75d 9w
6 72388 38.20 79.10 40.00 74.97 38.20 69.67 101.74
Mohawk - 45d stock 12w 4w 9w 6w
1 710042 1,402.80 1,402.80
Gillig - 8w
3 2110020 44.90 53.50 44.90 70.45
Mohawk - 21d stock stock
4 2110021 480.62 540.50 480.62 514.00 667.49
no lead
Gillig - 21d stock 2w time given




DUE: 01/10/2023 @

3:00 PM Pace RFQ# 422288
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
e -
Sku Winning bid | Geib - NO | Coffman Vehicle Muncie P&G Kirks Prevost Gillig Neopart Filter Cummins | Mohawk | Aftermarket | Eldorado
NO # of Bids BID Maintenance Services Parts
6 2210021 1,277.36 1,372.55 1,289.00 1,441.31 1,350.00 1,458.53 1,277.36
Eldorado - 70d 12w 105d 14w 12w stock
6 710119 3,149.72 3,755.50 3,149.72 3,400.00 4,959.00 3,750.00 4,673.33
P&G - 60d stock 6w 105d stock stock
6 710120 432.32 496.90 432.32 477.00 607.75 461.82 616.28
P&G - 30d stock stock stock stock stock
2 710128 711.07 711.07 1,061.83
Gillig - 8w 14w
1 710130 214.93 214.93
Eldorado - 8w
1 710157 43.45 43.45
Eldorado - 2w
1 2110073 62.03 62.03
Aftermarket Parts - stock
2 710177 7.70 7.70 8.80
bid 2, need
Aftermarket Parts - 10 stock
1 710206 143.31 143.31
Eldorado - 8w
1 710247 507.51 507.51
Eldorado - 12w




DUE: 01/10/2023 @

3:00 PM Pace RFQ# 422288
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
e -
Sku Winning bid | Geib - NO | Coffman Vehicle Muncie P&G Kirks Prevost Gillig Neopart Filter Cummins | Mohawk | Aftermarket | Eldorado
NO # of Bids BID Maintenance Services Parts
2 710260 540.46 540.46 737.26
Gillig - 8w 14w
5 710281 27.28 63.22 58.82 74.35 81.16 27.28
Eldorado - 30d stock 4w 5w stock
4 710300 49.30 50.80 57.49 49.30 70.00
Cummins - stock 21d 3d 6w
1 710321 545.85 545.85
Eldorado - stock
1 710323 18.31 18.31
Aftermarket Parts - 2w
2 2110174 549.77 549.77 637.73
Muncie - 21d 15w
3 2110175 130.96 130.96 136.40 185.80
Muncie - 21d 30d stock
2 2110185 51.75 51.75 57.50
Muncie - 30d stock
4 2110212 67.91 69.88 86.65 67.91 88.28
Gillig - 120d 75d stock stock
1 2110216 124.84 124.84
Aftermarket Parts - stock




DUE: 01/10/2023 @
3:00 PM Pace

WHITE=NO BID

TOTAL

RFQ# 422288

Sku Winning bid | Geib - NO | Coffman Vehicle Muncie P&G Kirks Prevost Gillig Neopart Filter Cummins | Mohawk | Aftermarket | Eldorado

NO # of Bids BID Maintenance Services Parts

2| 2110217 122.95 122.95 150.24
Muncie - 90d stock

2| 2110226 6.39 6.39 9.57
Muncie - 60d 11w

3| 2110264 2.76 4.10 2.76 4.73
Mohawk - MOoQ stock stock

3| 2110265 6.90 8.57 6.90 12.33
Mohawk - MOoQ 3w stock

4| 2110266 181.66 188.79 181.66 192.08 224.35
Gillig - 21d stock 3w stock

3| 2110267 5.18 6.65 5.18 5.38
Availability -
Aftermarket Parts - 21d 75d stock

2| 2110268 23.85 23.85 29.80
Muncie - 30d 8w

2| 2110269 19.59 19.59 27.18
Muncie - 30d 10w

2| 2110270 1.43 1.43 1.99
Muncie - 21d stock

1| 2110271 399.45 399.45
Muncie - 30d




DUE: 01/10/2023 @

3:00 PM Pace RFQ# 422288
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
[N A N
Sku Winning bid | Geib-NO | Coffman Vehicle Muncie P&G Kirks Prevost Gillig Neopart Filter Cummins | Mohawk | Aftermarket | Eldorado

NO # of Bids BID Maintenance Services Parts

1 2110272 14.23 14.23
Muncie - 30d

2 2110273 21.39 21.39 25.94
Muncie - 30d 8w

4 710449 18.74 18.74 23.49 20.26 26.69
Coffman - stock 30d 2d 4w




	422288

