
DUE:  01/10/2023 @ 
3:00 PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Geib - NO 
BID

Genfare - 
NO BID

A&A Auto Coffman Vehicle 
Maintenance

Suburban 
Truck

Prevost Neopart Crossline Kirks Triangle Gillig Interstate 
Power

Muncie Cummins Mohawk Aftermarket 
Parts

Eldorado

                                    3 60734 3.17                          3.17             5.42 4.30           

Vehicle Maintenance -                 stock  stock 12w

                                    3 60458 16.34                      16.34 32.14         21.29         

Muncie -                 stock 
 unapproved 

part stock

                                    3 81286 148.50                  148.50         163.07 173.30       

Muncie -                
 no lead 

time given  21d 4w

                                    4 110100 2.50                          2.50             3.20 3.40           2.57           

Gillig  stock  stock stock stock

                                    7 110136 83.00                      83.00         103.52         104.00         103.52 96.20         102.06               214.98 

A&A Auto -                 3w  5w  stock  5w 10w 4w  stock 

                                    4 81162 3.35                        22.86           15.06 3.35           19.63         

Mohawk -                 stock  21d  8w stock

                                    3 110058 3.20                          6.45 3.20           8.16           

Mohawk -                 21d stock stock

                                    3 60748 53.45                      88.25 53.45                   78.90 

Aftermarket Parts -                 90d stock  stock 

                                    4 81378 21.47                      43.00 21.47         23.00                   54.93 

Mohawk -                 2w stock stock  1w 

                                    1 130782 124.55                  124.55 

Eldorado  8w 

                                    2 120526 450.00                  450.00 598.17       

Triangle  3d 7w

                                    1 60789 286.38                  286.38 

Eldorado  stock 

                                    6 81444 59.40                    114.98           73.44           73.24           76.40 59.40         90.39         

Mohawk  stock  6w  6w  21d stock 6w

Pace RFQ# 422287



DUE:  01/10/2023 @ 
3:00 PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Geib - NO 
BID

Genfare - 
NO BID

A&A Auto Coffman Vehicle 
Maintenance

Suburban 
Truck

Prevost Neopart Crossline Kirks Triangle Gillig Interstate 
Power

Muncie Cummins Mohawk Aftermarket 
Parts

Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 422287

                                    5 81516 11.78                      12.08           12.05           11.78 12.86         16.83         

Cummins -                 stock  stock  2d 30d stock

                                 11 81521 17.67                      21.69           22.18           17.67           23.20           21.60           27.99           23.20           24.90           26.52 20.66         28.10         

Vehicle Maintenance  3w stock  stock  stock  4w  stock  10d  stock  stock stock 3w

                                    7 81533 14.34                      27.69           58.65           14.86           14.98           57.54 14.34         35.65         

Mohawk  2w stock  stock  42d  2d  stock stock

                                    3 610009 2.49                          5.35 2.49                     13.60 

Aftermarket Parts -                 stock  stock  2w 

                                    2 810019 356.68                  356.68 456.89       

Coffman -                 stock 4w

                                    1 1010005 552.02                  552.02 

Eldorado -                 4w 

                                    1 1010006 57.20                      57.20 

Eldorado -                 1w 

                                    6 1010003 11.99                      34.95           16.24           39.70           34.84 11.99         57.89         

Kirks -                 stock  stock  30d  stock 
 unapproved 

part 5w

                                    5 610018 18.55                      52.90           57.85           50.81 18.55         72.14         

Cummins -                 stock  30d  stock 
 unapproved 

part 5w

                                    6 1010011 862.00              1,613.99     1,171.60         862.00         863.33 1,100.00   2,310.12   

Kirks -                 stock  10d  stock  3d 30d 6w

                                    6 1010012 1,229.00          1,984.24     1,330.17     1,229.00     2,417.58 1,245.00   3,873.85   

Kirks -                 stock  10d  stock  stock stock 9w

                                    2 1210016 1,500.00      2,249.39       1,500.00 

Eldorado -                stock  20w 

                                    4 810026 1,118.65          1,118.65     1,269.95     1,129.85 1,912.81   

Coffman -                 stock  21d  2d  9w 



DUE:  01/10/2023 @ 
3:00 PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Geib - NO 
BID

Genfare - 
NO BID

A&A Auto Coffman Vehicle 
Maintenance

Suburban 
Truck

Prevost Neopart Crossline Kirks Triangle Gillig Interstate 
Power

Muncie Cummins Mohawk Aftermarket 
Parts

Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 422287

                                    4 810027 652.45                  652.45         739.54         658.94 846.15       

Coffman -                 stock  30d  2d 9w

                                    7 1010014 2.74                        11.32             2.74             3.20             3.40           11.21 5.30           16.03         

Neopart -                 stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part stock

                                    5 810031 1.98                          9.63             9.98             9.52 1.98           13.63         

Cummins -                 stock  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part 4w

                                    8 610026 126.55                  388.48         129.51         318.00         129.50         358.98         388.37 126.55       136.58       
Muncie - Cummins 
Only at this time -                 stock  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 

 unapproved 
part stock

                                    6 1010015 980.00              1,748.26     1,156.45         980.00     1,763.82 1,045.25   2,499.47   

Kirks -                 stock  10d  stock  3d stock 13w

                                    2 1010016 2,887.75          2,887.75 4,657.57   

Coffman -                 stock 9w

                                    6 610031 27.75                      35.60           27.75           33.33           35.58 28.60         50.56         

Kirks -                 stock  stock  stock  2d stock  5w 

                                    2 1210020 63.80            63.80                   80.85 

Aftermarket Parts -                6w  12w 

                                    4 810046 425.71                  561.38         425.71         534.99 767.14       

Muncie -                
 no lead 

time given  stock  stock 9w

                                    1 810050 138.30                  138.30 

Eldorado -                 stock 

                                    7 810060 27.08                      45.80           53.03           38.00           37.99           45.75 27.08         63.54         

Muncie -                 stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part stock

                                    3 810061 3,884.95          3,885.05     3,884.95 5,787.64   

Cummins -                 stock  4d 9w

                                    8 810066 81.37                    175.72           81.37           83.00           82.23         200.36         178.11 96.28         242.11       

Vehicle Maintenance -                 stock  stock  stock  stock  75d  stock 
 unapproved 

part 4w



DUE:  01/10/2023 @ 
3:00 PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Geib - NO 
BID

Genfare - 
NO BID

A&A Auto Coffman Vehicle 
Maintenance

Suburban 
Truck

Prevost Neopart Crossline Kirks Triangle Gillig Interstate 
Power

Muncie Cummins Mohawk Aftermarket 
Parts

Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 422287

                                    5 810068 28.80                      67.00           75.57           67.16 28.80         95.31         

Mohawk -                stock  21d  stock  stock 8w

                                    6 810071 769.00                  871.44     1,145.58         769.00         981.18         873.34 1,200.38   

Kirks -                 stock  stock  stock  30d  stock 9w

                                    5 1010024 69.71                      70.85           78.78           69.71 88.18         92.83         

Cummins -                 stock  21d  stock 30d 7w

                                    6 810073 121.00                  138.54         121.00         128.98         139.41 166.30       197.69       

Crossline -                 stock  stock  stock  stock 5w 7w

                                    6 610058 49.61                    122.57         105.85         113.13         100.46 49.61         395.49       

Cummins -                 stock  stock  30d  stock 
 unapproved 

part stock

                                    5 810078 460.97                  460.97         540.69         520.97         463.87 696.66       

Coffman -                 stock  stock  30d  2d  stock 

                                    3 810079 460.97                  460.97         463.87 657.45       

Coffman -                 stock  2d 9w

                                    4 810083 85.00                      88.20           95.60           85.00 205.92       

Cummins -                 stock  30d  3d  6w 

                                    4 810086 93.80                      95.95         105.88           93.80 124.87       

Cummins -                 stock  30d  4d  stock 

                                    5 1210038 2,628.15          2,628.15     3,985.00     2,653.52 3,689.58   4,251.90   

Coffman -                 stock  stock  2d 4w  9w 

                                    8 1010032 67.38                    139.94           79.57           78.00         147.73         121.21         140.84 67.38         199.71       

Crossline -                 stock  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part stock

                                    4 810110 1,377.00          1,715.25     1,377.00 1,925.62   1,864.71   

Kirks -                 stock  stock 12w 5w

                                    4 1010043 82.75                      82.75           97.15           83.51 241.64       

Coffman -                 stock  90d  2d 6w



DUE:  01/10/2023 @ 
3:00 PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Geib - NO 
BID

Genfare - 
NO BID

A&A Auto Coffman Vehicle 
Maintenance

Suburban 
Truck

Prevost Neopart Crossline Kirks Triangle Gillig Interstate 
Power

Muncie Cummins Mohawk Aftermarket 
Parts

Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 422287

                                    1 610071 51.84                      51.84 

Eldorado -                 stock 

                                    4 810143 19.99                      19.99           24.73           21.37 29.40         

Coffman -                 stock  30d  2d 9w

                                    5 810154 8.62                        10.38           11.99           10.28 8.62           17.20         

Cummins -                 stock  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part stock

                                    5 610080 101.00                  178.05         101.00         178.96 190.33       272.45       

Coffman -                 stock 
 unapproved 

part  2d 
 unapproved 

part stock

                                    2 810168 41.92            82.24                   41.92 

Eldorado -                stock  stock 

                                    1 810170 2.84                          2.84 

Eldorado -                 stock 

                                    6 810173 16.80                      29.64           25.48           33.59           29.04 16.80         41.29         

Crossline -                 stock  stock  21d  3d 
 unapproved 

part 6w

                                    4 810180 7.70                          7.70             8.98 9.72           12.77         

Coffman -                 stock  21d 5w stock

                                    4 810181 2.71                          2.80             3.30             2.71 4.66           

Cummins -                 stock  30d  stock 6w

                                    5 810184 72.00                      78.17           72.00           87.29           76.07 101.29       

Crossline -                 stock  stock  30d  stock 4w

                                    5 810192 1,050.00          1,742.59     1,050.00     1,560.00     1,716.14 2,237.51   

Neopart -                 stock  stock  stock  3d 6w

                                    4 810194 54.28                      54.81           61.93           54.28 75.54         

Cummins -                 stock  30d  2d stock

                                    4 810207 175.79                  176.44         200.49         175.79 257.50       

Cummins -                 stock  30d  stock stock



DUE:  01/10/2023 @ 
3:00 PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Geib - NO 
BID

Genfare - 
NO BID

A&A Auto Coffman Vehicle 
Maintenance

Suburban 
Truck

Prevost Neopart Crossline Kirks Triangle Gillig Interstate 
Power

Muncie Cummins Mohawk Aftermarket 
Parts

Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 422287

                                    5 1210109 602.81                  611.09         630.00         687.99         602.81 786.03       

Cummins -                 stock  stock  30d  2d stock

                                    3 1310024 4.02                          4.02             4.70             4.26 

Coffman -                 stock  stock  30d 

                                    4 1010067 289.65                  289.65         332.89         291.46 413.14       

Coffman -                 stock  30d  2d stock

                                    5 1010068 700.00              1,277.86         700.00         837.56     1,659.84 1,553.11   

Kirks -                 stock  stock 
 bid 8, need 

10  3d stock

                                    7 810271 31.39                      98.50           31.47           31.39         112.65           99.04 110.54       129.26       

Kirks -                
 no lead 

time given  stock  stock  30d  3d 5w 8w

                                    5 810277 32.79                      34.45           32.81           41.24 32.79         52.35         

Mohawk -                 stock  stock  3d stock 9w

                                    4 1010076 113.15                  113.15         131.56         113.95 151.66       

Coffman -                 stock  stock  2d 9w

                                    4 810345 289.65                  289.65         332.89         291.46 413.14       

Coffman -                 stock  stock  2d stock

                                    4 810412 3,699.35          3,699.35     4,244.15     3,734.58 6,472.57   

Coffman -                 stock  21d  2d 9w

                                    3 810413 250.07                  250.07         288.76 357.88       

Coffman -                 7d  30d 9w


	422287

