
Due:  01/17/2023 @ 
3:00 PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Illinois 
Auto - NO 

BID

Geib - NO 
BID

Kirks Neopart Coffman Vehicle 
Maintenance

Suburban 
Truck

Muncie Gillig Cummins Prevost Eldorado Aftermarket 
Parts

Mohawk

                                    3 20705 42.55                      73.25           66.00           42.55 

Mohawk -                  42d  stock  stock 

                                    7 40108 3.42                           3.64             4.21             3.62             3.55             4.18             5.27             3.42 

Mohawk -                  stock  3w  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                    8 40615 37.00                    154.00           91.20           97.05           90.41           87.70         118.80         121.07           37.00 

Mohawk -                  stock  4w  30d  4w  75d  6w  5w  stock 

                                    5 41131 50.04                    103.40         115.91         121.97         126.86           50.04 

Mohawk  stock  stock  60d  9w  stock 

                                    7 40106 2.50                           7.38           34.65             2.50             7.30           10.33             9.42             3.60 

Muncie -                  stock  stock  stock  stock  75d  stock  stock 

                                    6 40932 0.62                           1.98             2.10             2.20             2.59             2.87             0.62 

Mohawk -                  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                    4 200522 21.25                      59.86           37.50           66.57           21.25 

Mohawk -                  4w  stock  5w  stock 

                                    1 20701 250.95                  250.95 

Eldorado -                  stock 

                                    6 40504 1.16                           1.57             1.82             1.67             2.22             2.32             1.16 

Mohawk -                  stock  stock  stock  75d  stock  stock 

                                    5 40798 110.50                  110.50         125.13         120.00         237.67         148.13 

Neopart  stock  21d  2w  2w  7w 

Pace RFQ# 422286



Due:  01/17/2023 @ 
3:00 PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Illinois 
Auto - NO 

BID

Geib - NO 
BID

Kirks Neopart Coffman Vehicle 
Maintenance

Suburban 
Truck

Muncie Gillig Cummins Prevost Eldorado Aftermarket 
Parts

Mohawk

Pace RFQ# 422286

                                    6 40991 1.03                           1.33             1.67             1.80             2.07             2.14             1.03 

Mohawk  stock  stock  30d  75d  stock  stock 

                                    7 40174 1.58                         25.70           28.38           29.86           23.99           33.75           33.07             1.58 

Mohawk  stock  stock  21d  stock  75d  stock  stock 

                                    8 40953 14.50                      22.08           14.50           33.82           43.60           14.50           19.05           35.26           36.20 

Vehicle Maintenance  stock  stock  stock  21d  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                    7 200863 8.95                         11.50           16.95             9.61           10.83           11.43           10.88             8.95 

Mohawk -                  stock  3w  stock  stock  2d  2w  5w 

                                    6 40165 3.20                         11.55           35.11             5.48           10.93           14.73             3.20 

Mohawk  stock  stock  stock  stock  5w  2w 

                                    8 41217 90.50                    120.37         164.71           90.50         135.00         210.20         227.50           98.17         107.43 

Muncie  3w  stock  21d  8w  75d  4w  stock  stock 

                                    7 40079 8.10                         18.17           20.07           18.49           17.50           23.30           23.16             8.10 

Mohawk -                  stock  stock  stock  stock  75d  stock  stock 

                                    6 40922 17.35                      53.63           31.06           40.00         110.08           45.77           17.35 

Mohawk -                  6w  stock  stock  2w  stock  stock 

                                    6 41205 1.05                           1.27             1.05             1.15             1.25             1.16             4.58 

Suburban Truck -                  stock  stock  21d  75d  stock  stock 

                                    6 40842 5.59                           5.59             8.49             7.30           10.02             9.74             5.66 

Neopart -                  stock  stock  stock  75d  5w  30d 



Due:  01/17/2023 @ 
3:00 PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Illinois 
Auto - NO 

BID

Geib - NO 
BID

Kirks Neopart Coffman Vehicle 
Maintenance

Suburban 
Truck

Muncie Gillig Cummins Prevost Eldorado Aftermarket 
Parts

Mohawk

Pace RFQ# 422286

                                    7 40162 0.34                           1.60             1.39             1.52             1.55             1.76             1.60             0.34 

Mohawk -                  stock  stock  21d  stock  75d  stock  stock 

                                    7 40090 0.71                           0.87             1.00             0.71             0.75             1.11             0.72             1.04 

Muncie -                  stock  stock  21d  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                    6 40373 1.75                           2.67             2.88             3.14             4.10             6.68             1.75 

Mohawk -                  stock  stock  21d  stock  stock  stock 

                                    4 20535 48.07                      78.10           55.56           58.07           48.07 

Mohawk -                  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                    7 40596 0.46                           1.89             2.05             0.62             2.29             3.13             2.36             0.46 

Mohawk -                  stock  stock  stock  stock  75d  stock  stock 

                                    5 41132 51.75                    104.40         115.91         124.85         122.34           51.75 

Mohawk -                  stock  stock  60d  9w  stock 

                                    1 30411 346.18                  346.18 

Eldorado -                  16w 

                                    4 10411 125.32                  125.32         132.33         233.23         149.52 

Muncie -                  stock  4w  2w  stock 

                                    3 20727 427.04                  427.47         469.91         427.04 

Mohawk -                  12w  stock  10w 

                                    2 41295 22.97                      22.97           43.28 

Gillig -                  stock  3w 



Due:  01/17/2023 @ 
3:00 PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Illinois 
Auto - NO 

BID

Geib - NO 
BID

Kirks Neopart Coffman Vehicle 
Maintenance

Suburban 
Truck

Muncie Gillig Cummins Prevost Eldorado Aftermarket 
Parts

Mohawk

Pace RFQ# 422286

                                    9 30161 23.10                      51.48           45.97           24.57           68.39           23.10           25.69           37.42           43.80           46.10 

Muncie -                  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock  75d  19w  stock 

                                    6 41332 320.00                  593.44         599.52         683.73         525.00         320.00         615.31 

Gillig -                  10w 
 no lead 

time given  30d  stock 
 unapproved 

part  10d 

                                    1 30483 182.77                  182.77 

Eldorado -                  stock 

                                    7 410000 106.10                  149.29         164.71         132.59         210.55         198.59         106.10         127.70 

Aftermarket Parts -                  3w  stock  21d  75d  6w  3w  4w 

                                    7 410009 128.70                  148.29         164.71         129.88         210.55         198.59         147.78         128.70 

Mohawk -                  3w  stock  21d  75d  6w  8w  stock 

                                    1 210002 446.61                  446.61 

Eldorado -                  stock 

                                    6 2010016 131.76                  182.90         201.33         190.29         131.76         227.18         207.21 

Eldorado -                  stock  30d  stock  stock  5w  4w 

                                    6 2010018 31.65                      66.12           31.65           88.95           67.90           65.40           98.20 

Aftermarket Parts -                  8w 
 unapproved 

part  stock  60d  stock  2w 

                                    5 110014 120.99                  123.68         120.99         132.30         199.85         144.21 

Muncie -                  10w  stock  stock  3w  stock 

                                    6 2010037 548.31                  585.82         620.75         610.55         548.31         752.74         730.79 

Prevost -                  4w  stock  30d  stock  stock  5w 



Due:  01/17/2023 @ 
3:00 PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Illinois 
Auto - NO 

BID

Geib - NO 
BID

Kirks Neopart Coffman Vehicle 
Maintenance

Suburban 
Truck

Muncie Gillig Cummins Prevost Eldorado Aftermarket 
Parts

Mohawk

Pace RFQ# 422286

                                    1 110026 58.44                      58.44 

Eldorado -                  6w 

                                    4 310028 5,159.00           5,181.56     5,159.00     5,250.00     5,973.45 

Muncie -                  14w  60d  10w  3w 

                                    5 410080 362.20                  565.55         658.00         485.00         777.34         362.20 

Mohawk -                  stock  45d  stock  10w  stock 

                                    5 110037 5.87                           5.87             6.39           19.13             8.10             6.64 

Muncie -                  MOQ  30d  stock  stock  5w 

                                    1 110039 0.22                           0.22 

Eldorado -                  2w 

                                    1 410104 58.81                      58.81 

Eldorado -                  2w 

                                    3 2010081 25.61                      25.61           26.32           34.15 

Neopart -                  4w  30d  stock 


	422286

