
DUE:  01/10/2023 @ 
3:00 PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Interstate 

Power
P&G A&A Auto Coffman Eldorado Prevost Aftermarket 

Parts
Kirks CBM Cummins Suburban 

Truck
Crossline Vehicle 

Maintenance
Neopart Muncie Gillig

                                  5 290415 555.00                804.55        634.06        606.91        677.83        555.00 

Gillig 233877 -                 stock  stock  3w  45d  stock 

                                  4 220309 43.89                      63.59           43.89           46.19           49.73 

Aftermarket Parts 233869 -                 75d  stock  45d  stock 

                                  4 71733 89.34                   109.34           89.34           90.85        137.74 

Aftermarket Parts 233869 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                  1 170537 550.76                550.76 

Aftermarket Parts 233869  stock 

                                  1 620050 24.40                      24.40 

Aftermarket Parts 233869 -                 7w 

                                  5 151458 160.71                388.00        245.73        242.51        211.72        160.71 

Gillig 233877 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock  4w 

                                  5 71441 6.32                        17.95           11.60           11.50             6.32             7.08 

Muncie 233876 -                 1w  19w  stock  stock  stock 

                                  4 220340 745.44             1,277.36        745.44        770.00        790.42 

Aftermarket Parts 233869 -                 stock  stock  14w  90d 

                                  3 250583 452.25                545.67        468.07        452.25 

Gillig 233877 -                 7w  10d  4w 

                                  4 200520 34.48                      37.65           43.27           34.48           39.70 

Muncie 233876  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                  2 200522 37.50                      66.57           37.50 

Muncie 233876  5w  stock 

                                  2 200522 37.50                      66.57           37.50 

Pace RFQ# 422278



DUE:  01/10/2023 @ 
3:00 PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Interstate 

Power
P&G A&A Auto Coffman Eldorado Prevost Aftermarket 

Parts
Kirks CBM Cummins Suburban 

Truck
Crossline Vehicle 

Maintenance
Neopart Muncie Gillig

Pace RFQ# 422278

Muncie 233876  5w  stock 

                                  2 72054 50.28                      51.13           50.28 

Aftermarket Parts 233869 stock  stock 

                                  5 130581 57.16                      72.21           57.16           84.87           62.25           73.70 

Coffman 233865 -                 stock  stock  stock  30d  stock 

                                  1 160590 12.79                      12.79 

Eldorado 233866 2w

                                  3 170620 10.18                      14.52           10.18           13.05 

Muncie 233876  stock  stock  stock 

                                  4 290645 53.53                      89.12           87.27           53.53           56.21 

Vehicle Maintenance 233874 -                 2w  10w  stock  30d 

                                  2 620154 0.92                          0.92             0.99 

Vehicle Maintenance 233874 -                 stock  30d 

                                  4 41216 252.32                617.20        312.12        312.65        252.32 

Gillig 233877 -                 2w  stock  75d  stock 

                                  1 220228 19.62                      19.62 

Aftermarket Parts 233869 -                 stock 

                                  7 41215 158.89                302.21        205.13        185.71        175.96        159.30        158.89        170.34 

Muncie 233876 -                 2w  75d  5w  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                  8 200863 9.47                        10.83             9.79             9.61             9.47           11.43           10.83           16.10           13.05 

Aftermarket Parts 233869 -                 10d  3w  stock  3w  2d  stock  6w  21d 

                                  5 200072 11.25                      11.25           13.48           11.77           11.75           12.51 

Prevost 233868 -                 75d  5w  4w  30d  stock 



DUE:  01/10/2023 @ 
3:00 PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Interstate 

Power
P&G A&A Auto Coffman Eldorado Prevost Aftermarket 

Parts
Kirks CBM Cummins Suburban 

Truck
Crossline Vehicle 

Maintenance
Neopart Muncie Gillig

Pace RFQ# 422278

                                  3 210976 33.60                      51.87           58.62           33.60 

Muncie 233876 -                 2w  7w  21d 

                                  4 71175 0.72                          4.59             0.72             0.99             1.70 

Aftermarket Parts 233869 -                 10d  stock  stock  stock 

                                  7 110136 82.99                   103.52           82.99        102.51        214.98        102.06        102.00        101.29 

A&A Auto 233864 -                 6w  3w  10d  stock  4w  stock  30d 

                                  3 71442 7.08                        17.95           14.02             7.08 

Gillig 233877 -                 stock  stock  stock 

                                  6 200537 8.49                          8.49           10.95           12.62           10.86           10.77           10.75 

Eldorado 233866 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                  4 71087 0.06                          1.27             0.06             0.07             0.15 

Aftermarket Parts 233869 -                 10d  stock  stock  stock 

                                  4 41132 104.94                122.34        115.92        104.94        126.22 

Neopart 233875 -                 stock  stock  stock  60d 

                                  1 71090 0.57                          0.57 

Aftermarket Parts 233869 -                 stock 

                                  7 81313 38.25                      96.66        113.60           96.69           38.25        113.49           57.43           53.49 

CBM 233871 -                 2w  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                  4 200751 193.63                193.63        238.54        202.76        209.10 

Prevost 233868 -                 75d  5w  4w  30d 

                                  5 60771 88.00                   167.05        195.00           88.00        166.94        189.88 

Kirks 233870 -                 stock  9w  stock  stock  21d 

                                  6 100226 1,120.00          2,512.50     2,491.94     1,209.00     2,512.37     1,120.00     2,921.22 



DUE:  01/10/2023 @ 
3:00 PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Interstate 

Power
P&G A&A Auto Coffman Eldorado Prevost Aftermarket 

Parts
Kirks CBM Cummins Suburban 

Truck
Crossline Vehicle 

Maintenance
Neopart Muncie Gillig

Pace RFQ# 422278

Neopart 233875 -                 stock  9w  stock  stock  10d  21d 

                                  5 100227 883.00             1,563.50     1,794.50        883.00     1,563.37        892.00 

Kirks 233870 -                 stock  12w  stock  stock  10d 

                                  2 1520009 0.80                          2.74             0.80 

Aftermarket Parts 233869 -                 1w  stock 

                                  7 41270 38.07                      71.27           46.76           41.49           56.44           40.19           40.33           38.07 

Gillig 233877 -                 stock  75d  stock  stock  stock  21d  stock 

                                  7 41271 38.07                      71.27           46.76           41.49           56.44           40.19           40.00           38.07 

Gillig 233877 -                 stock  75d  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                  3 290673 1,401.79          2,317.22     1,562.58     1,401.79 

Gillig 233877 -                4w  stock  stock 

                                  1 290675 91.35                      91.35 

Eldorado 233866 -                 2w 

                                  1 10417 445.17                445.17 

Eldorado 233866 -                 12w 

                                  5 81444 73.44                   109.23           89.30           73.44           76.40           76.50 

Neopart 233875 -                 stock  stock  6w  21d  stock 

                                  1 200974 110.92                110.92 

Eldorado 233866 -                 stock 

                                  4 41325 988.37             1,312.25        988.37     1,155.73     1,193.98 

Suburban Truck 233873 -                 stock  stock  stock  21d 

                                  4 81515 9.32                          9.43           13.05             9.32           11.08 

Cummins 233872 -                 stock  6w  stock  30d 



DUE:  01/10/2023 @ 
3:00 PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Interstate 

Power
P&G A&A Auto Coffman Eldorado Prevost Aftermarket 

Parts
Kirks CBM Cummins Suburban 

Truck
Crossline Vehicle 

Maintenance
Neopart Muncie Gillig

Pace RFQ# 422278

                                  9 81520 8.08                        13.09           12.59           12.85           12.58           15.32           13.09             8.08           10.87             9.42 

Vehicle Maintenance 233874 -                 stock  3w  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                10 81521 17.57                      23.20           22.19           22.18           25.29           28.00           26.52           23.20           17.57           20.85           25.00 

Vehicle Maintenance 233874 -                 stock 
 no lead 

time given  stock  3w  30d  stock  stock  stock  4w  stock 

                                  4 72382 294.90                493.76        332.32        294.90        325.00 

Muncie 233876 -                 12w  15w  90d  12w 

                                  4 72384 7.25                        20.47           20.77           12.90             7.25 

Gillig 233877 -                 2w  4w  stock  stock 

                                  2 170719 88.41                      88.41        322.66 

Eldorado 233866 -                 stock  10w 

                                  1 710008 210.59                210.59 

Eldorado 233866 -                 stock 

                                  6 410009 128.41                198.59        210.55        147.78        156.07        128.41        129.88 

Neopart 233875 -                 4w  75d  8w  stock  3w  21d 

                                  5 1610013 178.76                418.56        260.83        214.64        199.46        178.76 

Gillig 233877 -                 4w  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                  3 1610017 145.42                168.06        152.00        145.42 

Gillig 233877 -                 3w  30d  stock 

                                  6 1210003 22.20                      24.93           34.44           29.81           22.20           24.05           28.77 

Vehicle Maintenance 233874 -                 stock  8w  stock  stock  4w  stock 

                                  5 2010016 131.76                131.76        190.29        227.18        179.18        201.33 

Eldorado 233866 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock  30d 

                                  1 1510019 61.45                      61.45 



DUE:  01/10/2023 @ 
3:00 PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Interstate 

Power
P&G A&A Auto Coffman Eldorado Prevost Aftermarket 

Parts
Kirks CBM Cummins Suburban 

Truck
Crossline Vehicle 

Maintenance
Neopart Muncie Gillig

Pace RFQ# 422278

Eldorado 233866 -                 2w 

                                  4 2010020 54.00                      54.00           69.03           59.21           60.59 

Prevost 233868 -                 stock  5w  4w  30d 

                                  1 1010006 57.20                      57.20 

Eldorado 233866 -                 stock 

                                  3 710052 2,685.00          2,685.00     4,134.13     2,725.00 

P&G 233863 -                 stock  6w  stock 

                                  4 810031 9.52                          9.63           12.26             9.52             9.98 

Cummins 233872 -                 stock  2w  stock  stock 

                                  3 810032 1,253.57          1,253.57     1,897.66     1,300.00 

Coffman 233865 -                 stock  3d  stock 

                                  4 710057 75.54                      75.54        102.06           76.43           95.47 

Coffman 233865 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                  5 1010018 17.40                      47.50           24.85           17.40           46.44           44.99 

Cummins 233872 -                 stock  stock  2d  stock  stock 

                                  1 110019 53.75                      53.75 

Eldorado 233866 -                 stock 

                                  5 610031 27.50                      35.69           45.33           27.50           35.58           33.33 

Kirks 233870 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                  2 710095 59.60                      70.16           59.60 

Muncie 233876 -                 stock  stock 

                                  1 210013 309.14                309.14 

Eldorado 233866 -                 12w 



DUE:  01/10/2023 @ 
3:00 PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Interstate 

Power
P&G A&A Auto Coffman Eldorado Prevost Aftermarket 

Parts
Kirks CBM Cummins Suburban 

Truck
Crossline Vehicle 

Maintenance
Neopart Muncie Gillig

Pace RFQ# 422278

                                  4 610049 7.40                          7.51             8.94             7.40             7.84 

Cummins 233872 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                  5 610050 20.55                      34.03           20.55        155.92           21.12           23.50 

CBM 233871 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                  4 610053 28.01                      32.21           37.85           32.10           28.01 

Muncie 233876 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                  3 2210021 595.00             1,277.36     1,458.53        595.00 

Kirks 233870 -                 stock  12w  stock 

                                  3 810064 4,215.02          5,245.65     4,801.10     4,215.02 

Cummins 233872 -                 stock  8w  3d 

                                  3 2510041 222.86                297.40        305.73        222.86 

Gillig 233877 -                 stock  60d  stock 

                                  5 810073 128.98                139.52        174.83        139.41        129.00        128.98 

Muncie 233876 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                  7 1010028 5.80                        14.68             7.77             5.80           18.48             6.97           16.67           17.99 

Kirks 233870 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock  stock  30d  stock 

                                  4 1210042 99.74                      99.85        134.55           99.74        117.46 

Cummins 233872 -                 stock  3w  stock  30d 

                                  5 810093 17.73                      37.82           55.93           17.73           37.46           44.19 

Kirks 233870 -                 stock  7w  stock  stock  30d 

                                  4 810101 229.66                267.46        317.37        267.35        229.66 

Muncie 233876 -                 stock  6w  stock  stock 

                                  1 1210069 279.59                279.59 



DUE:  01/10/2023 @ 
3:00 PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Interstate 

Power
P&G A&A Auto Coffman Eldorado Prevost Aftermarket 

Parts
Kirks CBM Cummins Suburban 

Truck
Crossline Vehicle 

Maintenance
Neopart Muncie Gillig

Pace RFQ# 422278

Eldorado 233866 -                 2w 

                                  6 1210070 60.95                      60.95           79.15           63.61           68.71           70.98           72.50 

Coffman 233865 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                  1 1610086 8.64                          8.64 

Eldorado 233766 -                 8w 

                                  1 1210078 1,500.00          1,500.00 

Eldorado 233866 -                 stock 

                                  4 810179 65.20                      84.48           68.62           83.28           65.20 

Muncie 233876 -                 stock  4w  stock  stock 

                                  4 810181 2.71                          2.82             3.35             2.71             3.30 

Cummins 233872 -                 stock  6w  stock  30d 

                                  3 610096 166.94                167.05        241.93        166.94 

Cummins 233872 -                 stock  6w  stock 

                                  1 710248 151.04                151.04 

Eldorado 233866 -                 4w 

                                  1 1310016 4.62                          4.62 

Eldorado 233866 -                 1w 

                                  4 810224 256.82                261.88        297.69        256.82        296.45 

Cummins 233872 -                 stock  7w  stock  30d 

                                  2 710286 2.15                          3.14             2.15    

Aftermarket Parts 233869 -                 2w  5w 

                                  4 810256 34.86                      35.47           50.16           34.86           40.62 

Cummins 233872 -                 stock  stock  stock  21d 



DUE:  01/10/2023 @ 
3:00 PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Interstate 

Power
P&G A&A Auto Coffman Eldorado Prevost Aftermarket 

Parts
Kirks CBM Cummins Suburban 

Truck
Crossline Vehicle 

Maintenance
Neopart Muncie Gillig

Pace RFQ# 422278

                                  2 1210132 753.28                796.39        753.28 

Gillig 233877 -                
 no lead 

time given  8w 

                                  1 410118 165.48                165.48 

Aftermarket Parts 233869 -                 stock 

                                  4 810348 4.16                          4.26             4.94             4.16             4.93 

Cummins 233872 -                 stock  7w  stock  30d 

                                  4 810350 14.02                      14.13           16.67           14.02           15.45 

Cummins 233872 -                 stock  5w  stock  stock 

                                  1 710395 32.41                      32.41 

Aftermarket Parts 233869 -                 stock 

                                  1 710438 220.59                220.59 

Eldorado 233866 -                 6w 

                                  1 1510328 133.45                133.45 

Aftermarket Parts 233869 -                 stock 

                                  1 1510329 172.77                172.77 

Aftermarket Parts 233869 -                 5w 

                                  1 1510330 302.20                302.20 

Aftermarket Parts 233869 -                 5w 

                                  1 1510331 10.38                      10.38 

Aftermarket Parts 233869 -                 stock 

                                  1 1510332 1.45                          1.45 

Aftermarket Parts 233869 -                 stock 

                                  1 1510333 0.12                          0.12 



DUE:  01/10/2023 @ 
3:00 PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Interstate 

Power
P&G A&A Auto Coffman Eldorado Prevost Aftermarket 

Parts
Kirks CBM Cummins Suburban 

Truck
Crossline Vehicle 

Maintenance
Neopart Muncie Gillig

Pace RFQ# 422278

Aftermarket Parts 233869 -                 stock 

                                  1 1810102 211.65                211.65 

Aftermarket Parts 233869 -                 stock 

                                  3 810431 58.70                      58.70           70.70           82.35 

Coffman 233865 -                 stock  stock  30d 

                                  3 710448 12.15                      12.46           12.15           16.81 

Muncie 233876 -                 stock  stock  stock 

                                   - 60411 -                

-                

                                  1 620112 172.54                172.54 

Aftermarket Parts 233869 -                 9w 

                                  1 620113 188.48                188.48 

Aftermarket Parts 233869 -                 7w 

                                  2 72170 48.88                      48.88           49.43 

Eldorado 233866 -                 2w  16w 

                                  1 1010046 192.27                192.27 

Eldorado 233866 -                 stock 

                                  1 610143 37.03                      37.03 

Eldorado 233866 -                 stock 

                                  1 1010092 815.30                815.30 

Eldorado 233866 -                 8w 

                                   - 1010098 -                

-                



DUE:  01/10/2023 @ 
3:00 PM

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Interstate 

Power
P&G A&A Auto Coffman Eldorado Prevost Aftermarket 

Parts
Kirks CBM Cummins Suburban 

Truck
Crossline Vehicle 

Maintenance
Neopart Muncie Gillig

Pace RFQ# 422278

                                   - 1010101 -                

-                

                                   - 2110230 -                

-                

                                   - 2110231 -                

-                

                                  1 710437 1,223.30          1,223.30 

Eldorado 233866 -                 12w 

                                  1 1610206 171.53                171.53 

Eldorado 233866 -                 4w 

                                  1 1610207 15.60                      15.60 

Eldorado 233866 -                 4w 


	422278

