
Due:  12/19/2022

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Illinois 
Auto - NO 

BID

Translite Muncie Neopart Genfare - 
NO BID

Mohawk Kirks - NO 
BID

Prevost Gillig Aftermarket 
Parts

Hydraulic 
Electric - 

LATE

Eldorado - 
LATE

                                  3 160605 10.10                     10.10          11.50          10.48 

Aftermarket Parts 233832 -                
 no lead 

time given  stock  stock 

                                  6 151458 160.71                211.72        179.96        245.73        160.71        242.51        388.00 

Gillig 233830 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock  5w  stock 

                                  1 160590 12.79                     12.79 

Eldorado 233828 -                 stock 

                                  6 290028 22.47                     29.86          34.37          22.94          27.02          28.99          22.47 

Aftermarket Parts 233832  stock 4w  30d  75d  stock  stock 

                                  5 151457 164.63                211.90        245.73        164.63        287.17        388.00 

Gillig 233830 -                 stock  75d  stock  5w  stock 

                                  3 290289 11.00                     14.23          14.19          11.00 

Aftermarket Parts 233832 -                 75d  3w  stock 

                                  3 160596 164.76                174.90        164.76        190.15 

Gillig 233830 -                 110d stock  stock 

                                  3 170013 13.80                     13.80          21.80          54.56 

Muncie 233833 -                 45d  stock  2w 

                                  3 170615 225.51                225.51        240.00        266.53 

Muncie 233833 -                 45d  4w  8w 

Pace RFQ# 422258



Due:  12/19/2022

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Illinois 
Auto - NO 

BID

Translite Muncie Neopart Genfare - 
NO BID

Mohawk Kirks - NO 
BID

Prevost Gillig Aftermarket 
Parts

Hydraulic 
Electric - 

LATE

Eldorado - 
LATE

Pace RFQ# 422258

                                  3 250646 17.72                     17.72          20.39          21.76 

Neopart 233826 10d  2w  4w 

                                  1 152006 25.75                     25.75 

Eldorado 233828  stock 

                                  1 290675 91.35                     91.35 

Eldorado 233828  2w 

                                  4 290679 50.00                     91.50          61.00          70.40          50.00 

Gillig 233830  75d  stock  4w  stock 

                                  3 152033 135.15                135.15        210.23        298.16 

Muncie 233833 -                 stock  5w  stock 

                                  3 180834 113.17                136.91        113.17        160.86 

Gillig 233830  135d  8w  13w 

                                  7 290690 545.00                615.15        554.38        733.30        545.00        682.33        671.00     1,267.26 

Gillig 233830  30d stock  75d  stock  3w  stock  8w 

                                  4 290696 9.60                       29.25            9.60          26.33          53.94 

Availability - Muncie 233833 -                 stock 
 unapproved 

part  12w  6w 

                                  3 170715 755.37                765.33        755.37        788.22 

Gillig 233830 -                 30d  8w  stock 



Due:  12/19/2022

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Illinois 
Auto - NO 

BID

Translite Muncie Neopart Genfare - 
NO BID

Mohawk Kirks - NO 
BID

Prevost Gillig Aftermarket 
Parts

Hydraulic 
Electric - 

LATE

Eldorado - 
LATE

Pace RFQ# 422258

                                  3 170716 1,103.54          1,103.54     1,129.32     1,326.56 

Muncie 233833 -                 30d  8w  stock 

                                  3 170722 88.41                   350.44        758.53          88.41 

Translite 233842 -                 3w  10d  2w 

                                  3 1710015 35.85                     35.85          40.55          40.57 

Muncie 233833 -                 30d  6w  5w 

                                  5 1610013 88.71                   190.94          88.71        178.76        214.64        418.56 

Gillig 233830 -                 30d 
 unapproved 

part  4w  stock  4w 

                                  2 2510007 727.70                727.70        942.33 

Gillig 233830 -                 4w  5w 

                                  3 2910007 42.71                     42.71          57.32          83.82 

Muncie 233833 -                 67d  stock  12w 

                                  1 1710053 81.00                     81.00 

Eldorado 233828 -                 stock 

                                  1 1510107 19.70                     19.70 

Eldorado 233828 -                 5w 

                                  1 1510109 283.52                283.52 

Aftermarket Parts 233832 -                 13w 



Due:  12/19/2022

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Illinois 
Auto - NO 

BID

Translite Muncie Neopart Genfare - 
NO BID

Mohawk Kirks - NO 
BID

Prevost Gillig Aftermarket 
Parts

Hydraulic 
Electric - 

LATE

Eldorado - 
LATE

Pace RFQ# 422258

                                  4 1810036 103.00                144.00        110.00        161.64        103.00 

Gillig 233830 -                 stock  6w  13w  stock 

                                  3 2510046 18.93                     18.93          19.45          30.18 

Neopart 233826 -                 10d  2w  5w 

                                  1 1610081 49.38                     49.38 

Eldorado 233828 -                 8w 

                                  3 2510067 936.71                975.57        936.71     1,211.96 

Gillig 233830 -                 10d  4w  7w 

                                  1 1810046 19.81                     19.81 

Prevost 233837 -                 135d 

                                  1 1810047 14.63                     14.63 

Prevost 233837 -                 135d 

                                  4 1710088 142.42                142.42        161.68        155.21        143.59 

Muncie 233833 -                 30d  75d  12w  stock 

                                  2 1510243 180.00                180.00        307.57 

Gillig 233830 -                 stock  stock 

                                   - 1610206 -                

-                



Due:  12/19/2022

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Illinois 
Auto - NO 

BID

Translite Muncie Neopart Genfare - 
NO BID

Mohawk Kirks - NO 
BID

Prevost Gillig Aftermarket 
Parts

Hydraulic 
Electric - 

LATE

Eldorado - 
LATE

Pace RFQ# 422258

                                   - 1610207 -                

-                

                                  1 1810101 3,287.80          3,287.80 

Gillig 233830 -                 12w 


	422258

