Due: 12/19/2022 Pace RFQ# 422257

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sku Winning bid |lllinois Auto| Rome Interstate | A&A Auto | Coffman Muncie Genfare- | Neopart Kirks Prevost Gillig Cummins | Aftermarket | Crossline | Mohawk | Eldorado -
Truck-NO | Power NO BID Parts LATE
NO # of Bids BID
4 130684 7.12 8.33 7.12 8.52 14.94
Coffman 233831 - 20d stock 21d stock
5 130473 0.10 4.86 1.60 0.10 0.15 0.17
Muncie 233833 - 2w 10d stock stock stock
6 130581 56.66 72.21 56.66 61.55 75.22 84.87 62.26
Coffman 233831 - stock stock 21d stock stock stock
6 130613 2.17 20.68 17.67 18.69 15.73 38.37 2.17
unapproved
Neopart 233826 stock stock stock stock stock part
3 220080 3.41 65.75 8.40 3.41
Aftermarket Parts 233832 - 30d stock stock
3 220346 56.13 56.13 59.88 62.50
Muncie 233833 - stock 4w stock
5 130611 192.91 372.57 318.31 340.44 486.06 192.91
unapproved
Coffman 233831 - stock stock stock stock part
3 210976 25.98 58.62 25.98 51.87
Mohawk 233829 - 7w stock 2w
3 110100 2.25 2.25 2.57 3.49
Gillig 233830 - stock 2w stock
6 110136 82.79 100.02 82.79 108.00 102.06 97.00 214.68
A&A Auto 233841 10w 3w stock 4w 30d stock
6 100223 66.00 116.38 110.99 70.00 116.28 167.75 66.00
unapproved
Neopart 233826 stock stock stock stock stock part
3 211121 33.34 42.54 48.47 33.34




Due: 12/19/2022 Pace RFQ# 422257

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
- ! ! J ' | | '/ | | | | | |
Sku Winning bid |lllinois Auto| Rome Interstate | A&A Auto | Coffman Muncie Genfare- | Neopart Kirks Prevost Gillig Cummins | Aftermarket | Crossline | Mohawk | Eldorado -
Truck-NO | Power NO BID Parts LATE
NO # of Bids BID
Mohawk 233829 2w 11w stock
1 1010005 552.02 552.02
Eldorado 233828 6w
5 2110021 456.18 456.18 502.91 482.50 667.49 484.00
no lead
Illinois Auto 233840 - 2w 21d stock time given stock
2 2210015 164.88 164.88 213.33
Aftermarket Parts 233832 10w 2w
5 1010018 17.40 44.63 46.99 45.67 17.40 24.85
Cummins 233827 stock stock stock stock stock
3 2110032 656.93 656.93 900.25 757.90
Illinois Auto 233840 - 2w 10w 2w
2 1210024 180.02 180.02 401.70
Aftermarket Parts 233832 - stock 20w
4 | 2210018 7.30 7.30 8.86 8.53 12.91
Muncie 233833 - 64d 75d stock 30d
2 1310008 57.28 57.28 148.79
Aftermarket Parts 233832 - 15w stock
4 | 2210021 1,225.00 1,350.50| 1,424.99| 1,225.00 1,458.53
Gillig 233830 - 14w 105d 14w 12w
1 1310009 160.47 160.47
Eldorado 233828 - 12w
2 1210034 28.75 28.75 29.35




Due: 12/19/2022 Pace RFQ# 422257

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
- ! ! J ' | | '/ | | | | | |
Sku Winning bid |lllinois Auto| Rome Interstate | A&A Auto | Coffman Muncie Genfare- | Neopart Kirks Prevost Gillig Cummins | Aftermarket | Crossline | Mohawk | Eldorado -
Truck-NO | Power NO BID Parts LATE
NO # of Bids BID
Muncie 233833 - 30d 7w
1| 2110067 935.16 935.16
Aftermarket Parts 233832 - stock
7 | 1010030 83.00 114.16 111.69 131.22 114.06 151.48 106.00 83.00
unapproved
Crossline 233836 - stock stock stock stock stock stock part
5 1210054 155.69 155.79 176.80 155.69 206.11 166.81
Cummins 233827 - stock stock stock 3w 4w
6 | 1210070 56.87 56.87 72.65 70.98 64.81 79.15 61.22
Coffman 233831 - stock stock stock stock stock stock
5 1010044 214.00 247.12 280.81 247.01 329.29 214.00
Crossline 233836 - stock stock stock stock stock
3 | 2210030 196.90 196.90 278.23 232.97
Muncie 233833 - 60d 120d 10w
- | 1010046 -
- | 1310016 -
4 | 1010060 2,645.85 2,645.85| 3,089.55 2,668.43 | 3,889.88
Coffman 233831 - stock 21d 2d 9w
6 | 1010061 974.00 1,390.09| 1,572.95 993.60 974.00 1,781.08 990.00
Kirks 233835 - stock 30d stock stock 9w 21d
4 | 1010067 225.52 225.62 254.79 225.52 299.33
Cummins 233827 - stock stock stock stock




Due: 12/19/2022 Pace RFQ# 422257

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
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Sku Winning bid |lllinois Auto| Rome Interstate | A&A Auto | Coffman Muncie Genfare- | Neopart Kirks Prevost Gillig Cummins | Aftermarket | Crossline | Mohawk | Eldorado -
Truck-NO | Power NO BID Parts LATE

NO # of Bids BID

2 | 2210048 7.12 7.12 8.29
Muncie 233833 - 21d 11w

1| 2110142 21.89 21.89
Aftermarket Parts 233832 - stock

4| 1210121 8.71 9.05 10.32 8.71 10.89
Cummins 233827 - stock 30d stock 9w

2 | 2210056 175.00 175.00 400.40
Gillig 233830 - stock stock

2 1010085 3,737.52 3,737.52 5,264.27
Coffman 233831 - 12w 9w

- | 1010092 -

- | 2110230 -

- | 2110231 -

1| 2110263 2,939.28 2,939.28
Aftermarket Parts 233832 - 3w

7 | 1210160 32.37 32.57 38.97 34.33 54.75 38.99 44.42 32.37

bid 9 ONLY, no lead

Mohawk 233829 - stock need 48 3w stock stock time given 30d

6 | 1210161 50.17 50.17 57.99 84.32 60.10 69.67 50.17

bid 4 ONLY, no lead

Mohawk 233829 - stock need 48 stock stock time given 4w




Due: 12/19/2022 Pace RFQi#t 422257
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
- ! ! J ' | | '/ | | | | | |
Sku Winning bid |lllinois Auto| Rome Interstate | A&A Auto | Coffman Muncie Genfare- | Neopart Kirks Prevost Gillig Cummins | Aftermarket | Crossline | Mohawk | Eldorado -
Truck-NO | Power NO BID Parts LATE
NO # of Bids BID
- | 2110026 - NLA
- NLA
- | 1010098 -

- 1010101
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