Due: 12/19/2022 Pace RFQ# 422256
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
I I N N N e
Sku Winning bid Illinois Rome Coffman Muncie Cummins Prevost Mohawk | Kirks - NO Gillig Neopart | Aftermarket | Crossline | Eldorado -
Auto - NO | Truck - NO BID Parts LATE
NO # of Bids BID BID
71925 6.40 15.07 6.40 17.99 2431
Mohawk 233829 - stock stock stock stock
71733 89.34 93.39 109.34 89.34
Aftermarket Parts 233832 - stock stock stock
620079 944.25 944.25 1,308.65
Gillig 233830 - 8w 8w
71875 5.24 5.24 5.70 17.23
Mohawk 233829 stock stock stock
620109 95.92 95.92
Aftermarket Parts 233832 - 7w
72121 33.37 62.72 33.37 74.67 72.93
Prevost 233837 - 45d stock 5w 6w
71441 6.32 6.32 7.30 7.08 11.60 17.95
Muncie 233833 - 30d 4w stock 19w stock
70220 7.65 15.78 7.65 15.25 23.01 25.73 60.83
Mohawk 233829 - stock stock stock stock 17w 2w
71539 36.79 36.79
Eldorado 233828 - stock




Due: 12/19/2022 Pace RFQ# 422256
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
I I N N N e
Sku Winning bid Illinois Rome Coffman Muncie Cummins Prevost Mohawk | Kirks - NO Gillig Neopart | Aftermarket | Crossline | Eldorado -
Auto - NO | Truck - NO BID Parts LATE
NO # of Bids BID BID
1 620042 18.70 18.70
Mohawk 233829 aw
- 620112 -
- 620113 -
5 71442 6.50 6.50 7.30 7.08 14.02 17.95
Muncie 233833 30d 30d stock stock stock
1 620057 109.61 109.61
Aftermarket Parts 233832 - 8w
1 72144 57.67 57.67
Eldorado 233828 stock
4 72156 21.99 22.24 25.39 21.99 24.42
Neopart 233826 60d 10w 8w stock
- 72170 =
1 72177 14.32 14.32
Eldorado 233828 - stock




Due: 12/19/2022 Pace RFQ# 422256

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
I I N N N e
Sku Winning bid Illinois Rome Coffman Muncie Cummins Prevost Mohawk | Kirks - NO Gillig Neopart | Aftermarket | Crossline | Eldorado -
Auto - NO | Truck - NO BID Parts LATE
NO # of Bids BID BID
1 620249 7.84 7.84
Aftermarket Parts 233832 - 8w
3 72216 155.53 155.53 213.75 348.84
Gillig 233830 - 4w stock stock
1 710008 210.59 210.59
Eldorado 233828 - 2w
1 710032 165.42 165.42
Aftermarket Parts 233832 - stock
5 710057 56.31 84.42 96.02 56.31 63.98 115.71
unapproved
Cummins 233827 - stock 30d 2d part 9w
4 710058 23.61 23.72 26.72 23.61 28.56
Cummins 233827 - stock 30d stock stock
1 710130 214.93 214.93
Eldorado 233828 - 6w
3 710136 527.85 527.85 954.22 738.17
Gillig 233830 - 8w 9w stock
1 6210054 215.32 215.32
Aftermarket Parts 233832 - 10w




Due: 12/19/2022 Pace RFQ# 422256

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
I I N N N e
Sku Winning bid Illinois Rome Coffman Muncie Cummins Prevost Mohawk | Kirks - NO Gillig Neopart | Aftermarket | Crossline | Eldorado -
Auto - NO | Truck - NO BID Parts LATE
NO # of Bids BID BID
1 710157 43.45 43.45
Eldorado 233828 - stock
5 710213 2,134.82 2,134.82 2,396.63 2,528.99 2,843.57 2,344.00
Coffman 233831 - stock 30d stock 12w stock
2 710242 241.54 262.55 241.54
Aftermarket Parts 233832 - 10w 29w
1 710247 205.57 205.57
Eldorado 233828 - 6w
1 710278 1,565.86 1,565.86
Eldorado 233828 - 8w
3 710292 21.28 21.28 22.88 41.45
Muncie 233833 - 30d 5w 6w
1 710310 647.28 647.28
Aftermarket Parts 233832 - 160d
1 710311 647.28 647.28
Aftermarket Parts 233832 - 160d
1 710321 556.84 556.84
Eldorado 233828 - 6w




Due: 12/19/2022 Pace RFQ# 422256

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
I I N N N e
Sku Winning bid Illinois Rome Coffman Muncie Cummins Prevost Mohawk | Kirks - NO Gillig Neopart | Aftermarket | Crossline | Eldorado -
Auto - NO | Truck - NO BID Parts LATE
NO # of Bids BID BID
1 710364 6.30 6.30
Aftermarket Parts 233832 - 1lw
4 710368 3.52 3.52 4.92 7.06 3.75
Muncie 233833 - stock stock stock stock
3 710374 15.57 16.34 15.66 15.57
Aftermarket Parts 233832 - stock stock stock
- 710437 =
1 710446 575.97 575.97
Eldorado 233828 - 6w




	422256

