
Due:  12/19/2022

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Ilinois Auto 
- NO BID

Interstate 
Power

Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Vehicle 
Maintenance

A&A Auto Prevost Coffman Genfare - 
NO BID

Suburban 
Truck

Cummins Kirks Gillig Muncie Aftermarket 
Parts

Crossline Mohawk Neopart Eldorado - 
LATE

Hydraulic 
Electric - 

LATE

                                  1 60734 12.99                     12.99 

Kirks 233835 -                 stock 

                                  2 60605 5.30                         5.41            5.30 

Mohawk 233829 -                 stock  30d 

                                  2 60588 4.65                         4.65            6.96 

Mohawk 233829 -                 MOQ  6w 

                                11 81262 5.61                         7.41            5.61            6.39            6.77            7.41            8.02            7.99          11.25            6.12            7.81            6.90 

Vehicle Maintenance 233834  stock  stock stock  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                  3 81311 139.93                139.93        143.05        295.16 

Muncie 233833 -                
 no lead 

time given  30d  5w 

                                  2 60412 18.58                     18.58          38.78 

Aftermarket Parts 233832 -                 10w  4w 

                                  9 60494 9.36                       13.43            9.36          11.69          11.97          13.43          14.23          13.09          14.87          11.63 

Vehicle Maintenance 233834 -                 14d  stock  2w  stock  stock stock  30d  stock  30d 

                                  5 81156 29.11                     80.02          58.62          65.66          29.11 61.50         

Mohawk 233829 -                 stock  21d  stock  stock stock

                                  7 81313 42.00                     55.45          93.79        102.01        101.91          53.49          96.69          42.00 

Muncie 233833 -                 stock  1w  stock  stock  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part 

                                  4 60748 52.97                     88.08          53.65          52.97 78.90          

Aftermarket Parts 233832  90d  60d  stock stock

                                  1 60755 59.35            59.35          

Eldorado 233828 stock

                                  1 60770 73.92            73.92          

Eldorado 233828 16w

                                  1 60772 25.18            25.18          

Eldorado 233828 2w

                                  3 60790 561.48                561.48        734.95 1,137.99    

Muncie 233833 -                 stock  8w 5w

Pace RFQ# 422255



Due:  12/19/2022

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Ilinois Auto 
- NO BID

Interstate 
Power

Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Vehicle 
Maintenance

A&A Auto Prevost Coffman Genfare - 
NO BID

Suburban 
Truck

Cummins Kirks Gillig Muncie Aftermarket 
Parts

Crossline Mohawk Neopart Eldorado - 
LATE

Hydraulic 
Electric - 

LATE

Pace RFQ# 422255

                                  6 81444 59.40                   109.23          71.00          76.29          90.39          59.40 73.44         

Mohawk 233829  stock  3w  60d  stock  3w 6w

                                  2 81472 5.12                         5.22            5.12 

Muncie 233833  stock  30d 

                                  8 81519 60.97                     94.33        104.78          65.54          89.06          87.48        128.49          60.97 107.29      

Kirks 233835 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock 

                                12 81521 17.57                     22.31          17.57          21.49          21.39          22.31          25.57          26.25          33.75          17.99          25.26          20.66 20.47         

Vehicle Maintenance 233834 -                 14d  stock  3w  stock  stock  3d  stock  4w  60d  3w  stock  stock 

                                  6 81533 15.00                     16.91          53.71          51.61          15.00          35.65          24.34 

Muncie 233833 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                  5 610014 14.80                     16.93          16.82          14.80          22.55          21.35 

Muncie 233833 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                  5 810026 1,076.59          1,076.70     1,076.59     1,205.89     1,771.12 1,119.31   

Cummins 233827 -                 stock  stock  stock  9w stock

                                  4 810027 621.64                621.75        621.64        694.15        783.47 

Cummins 233827 -                 stock  stock  30d  stock 

                                  8 610028 24.98                     46.64          62.59          32.00          87.66          61.89          99.65          24.98 59.95         

Coffman 233831 -                 stock  2d 
 unapproved 

part  4w  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part stock

                                  4 610032 2.30                         2.50            2.30            2.79            3.55 

Cummins 233827 -                 stock  2d  30d  9w 

                                  1 610044 31.83                     31.83 

Aftermarket Parts 233832 -                 stock 

                                  4 810049 125.67                125.78        125.67        140.39        170.90 

Cummins 233827 -                 stock  stock  stock  5w 

                                  5 610049 6.92                         7.03            6.92            7.90            8.94            9.72 

Cummins 233827 -                 stock  stock  30d  stock  3w 

                                  2 810064 4,801.10          4,903.70     4,801.10 

Aftermarket Parts 233832 -                
 no lead 

time given  2w 



Due:  12/19/2022

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Ilinois Auto 
- NO BID

Interstate 
Power

Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Vehicle 
Maintenance

A&A Auto Prevost Coffman Genfare - 
NO BID

Suburban 
Truck

Cummins Kirks Gillig Muncie Aftermarket 
Parts

Crossline Mohawk Neopart Eldorado - 
LATE

Hydraulic 
Electric - 

LATE

Pace RFQ# 422255

                                  9 810066 83.17                     83.17        169.46        166.63          97.00        189.45        224.18          86.00          97.75          99.00 

Vehicle Maintenance 233834 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock  70d  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock 

                                  6 810073 122.00                131.62        131.51        124.26        174.83        122.00        165.83 

Crossline 233836 -                 stock  stock  stock  7w  stock  6w 

                                  7 610058 46.30                   113.49          92.12        102.08        125.10        342.95          46.30 134.00      

Cummins 233827 -                 stock  stock  stock  30d  stock 
 unapproved 

part stock

                                  7 810078 450.00                453.19        454.09        523.56        645.06        450.00        699.99 540.69      

Crossline 233836 -                 stock  stock  30d  stock  stock  6w  stock 

                                  4 810084 744.00                932.82     1,399.02        744.00 750.00      

Crossline 233836 -                 stock  6w  stock stock

                                  2 610061 5.35                         5.35 11.36          

Aftermarket Parts 233832 -                 stock 6w

                                  5 610064 94.11                     94.22          94.11        105.51        120.13        109.72 

Cummins 233827 -                 stock  stock  30d  stock  30d 

                                  5 810102 3.43                         3.54            3.43            4.03            4.80            4.26 

Cummins 233827 -                 stock  stock  30d  5w  6w 

                                  4 810110 1,398.00          1,578.27     1,398.00     1,567.22     1,825.62 

Kirks 233835 -                 stock  stock  5w  6w 

                                  5 810112 5.10                         5.21            5.10            6.07          10.27            7.77 

Cummins 233827 -                 stock  stock  30d  6w  6w 

                                  3 810128 690.19                690.30        690.19        937.52 

Cummins 233827 -                 stock  stock  stock 

                                  3 810130 645.06                665.69        683.59        645.06 

Aftermarket Parts 233832 -                 stock  3d  9w 

                                  1 610071 51.84            51.84          

Eldorado 233828 -                stock

                                  7 610072 31.91                     42.44          42.34          47.44          54.12          42.00          31.91 46.68         

Crossline 233836 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part stock



Due:  12/19/2022

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Ilinois Auto 
- NO BID

Interstate 
Power

Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Vehicle 
Maintenance

A&A Auto Prevost Coffman Genfare - 
NO BID

Suburban 
Truck

Cummins Kirks Gillig Muncie Aftermarket 
Parts

Crossline Mohawk Neopart Eldorado - 
LATE

Hydraulic 
Electric - 

LATE

Pace RFQ# 422255

                                  1 610074 28.44                     28.44 

Aftermarket Parts 233832 -                 4w 

                                  1 610075 34.72                     34.72 

Aftermarket Parts 233832 -                 stock 

                                  6 610080 101.00                163.85        163.74        101.00        226.76        252.27        190.18 

Cummins 233827 -                 stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part 

                                  6 810155 296.00                313.98        308.94        344.30        415.68        296.00        367.72 

Crossline 233836 -                 stock  stock  21d  4w  stock  6w 

                                  1 810166 87.50            87.50          

Eldorado 233828 -                 stock 

                                  1 610087 11,139.57    11,139.57  

Eldorado 233828 -                 stock 

                                  1 610089 16,128.75    16,128.75  

Eldorado 233828 -                 8w 

                                  5 810192 1,022.72          1,673.22     1,635.18     1,991.87     1,240.00 1,022.72   

Neopart 233826 -                 stock  stock  6w  stock stock

                                  3 610092 383.75                383.75        418.72 851.74        

Muncie 233833 -                 30d 
 no lead 

time given 12w

                                  3 810197 165.10                171.96        165.10        206.53 

Cummins 233827 -                 stock  2d  7w 

610097 235.66                346.16        275.00        235.66        342.95 

Muncie 233833 -                 75d  6w  stock  stock 

                                  4 610098 2.50                         2.50            3.04            2.69 5.26            

Muncie 233833 -                 30d  10w  2w stock

                                  6 810207 160.00                198.48        161.55        190.00        222.63        160.00        195.94 

Crossline 233836 -                 stock  stock  30d  stock  stock  4w 

                                  6 810208 0.18                         1.65            1.44            1.79            2.49            0.18            1.25 

Cummins 233827 -                 stock  stock  30d  9w 
 unapproved 

part  stock 



Due:  12/19/2022

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Ilinois Auto 
- NO BID

Interstate 
Power

Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Vehicle 
Maintenance

A&A Auto Prevost Coffman Genfare - 
NO BID

Suburban 
Truck

Cummins Kirks Gillig Muncie Aftermarket 
Parts

Crossline Mohawk Neopart Eldorado - 
LATE

Hydraulic 
Electric - 

LATE

Pace RFQ# 422255

                                  8 810225 555.80                809.22        794.70        885.00        993.64        644.00        938.82 555.80             630.00 

Neopart 233826 -                 stock  stock  21d  7w  stock  30d stock  stock 

                                  4 810239 4.45                         4.70            4.45            5.17            5.68 

Cummins 233827 -                 stock  stock  30d  5w 

                                  4 610123 42.35                     46.45          42.35          48.24          57.68 

Cummins 233827 -                 stock  2d  45d  9w 

                                  7 810271 31.47                     31.47          84.50          83.94          32.95          93.62        106.10          33.00 

Vehicle Maintenance 233834 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock  30d  stock 
 no lead 

time given 

                                  4 610138 835.87             2,082.90     2,044.29        865.30        835.87 

Aftermarket Parts 233832 -                
 no lead 

time given  3d  stock  stock 

                                  1 810329 47.12                     47.12 

Aftermarket Parts 233832 -                 stock 

                                  3 810418 97.01                   112.53          97.01        201.89 

Aftermarket Parts 233832 -                 stock  13w 
 unapproved 

part 

                                  1 610189 2,597.97          2,597.97 

Aftermarket Parts 233832 -                 15w 

                                   - 610143 -                

-                


	422255

