
Due:  12/19/2022

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Interstate 
Power

Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Neopart A&A Auto Cummins Eldorado Genfare - 
NO BID

Provost Mohawk Kirks Gillig Suburban 
Truck

Coffman Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie

                                  5 41131 49.50                   103.99           49.50        115.92        123.40        118.75 

Mohawk 233829 -                 stock  stock  stock  9w  60d 

                                  5 200522 20.15                      37.06           59.86           20.15           65.18           37.50 

Mohawk 233829 -                 10d  4w  stock  5w  stock 

                                  5 200522 20.15                      37.06           59.86           20.15           65.18           37.50 

Mohawk 233829 -                 10d  4w  stock  5w  stock 

                                  3 20701 250.95                250.95        433.87        450.95 

Eldorado 233828  stock  17w  60d 

                                  6 30014 3.41                          4.54             8.28             3.41             5.73             4.88             4.95 

Mohawk 233829 -                 MOQ  75d  stock  6w  stock  30d 

                                  6 200548 19.95                      22.20           24.42           20.66           21.23           23.81           19.95 

Muncie 233833 -                 4w  stock  stock  4w  stock  30d 

                                  8 200863 8.99                        10.52             8.99           10.90           11.85           10.52             9.17             9.47           17.53 

Coffman 233831 -                 14d 
 no lead 

time given  2d  stock  stock  stock  3w  30d 

                                  7 10001 0.37                          1.22             1.52             0.37             1.42             1.30             1.30             1.37 

Mohawk 233829 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock  MOQ 

                                  7 40373 2.67                          2.67             4.10             2.91             3.31             2.85             5.02             2.95 

Neopart 233826 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock  21d 

                                  3 20535 48.07                      48.07           57.08           78.39 

Mohawk 233829  stock  9w  stock 

                                  6 40596 0.46                          1.89             2.09             0.46             2.08             2.36             0.63 

Mohawk 233829  stock  75d  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                  1 20712 547.21                547.21 

Pace RFQ#  422254



Due:  12/19/2022

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Interstate 
Power

Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Neopart A&A Auto Cummins Eldorado Genfare - 
NO BID

Provost Mohawk Kirks Gillig Suburban 
Truck

Coffman Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie

Pace RFQ#  422254

Eldorado 233828  stock 

                                  3 10416 520.14                639.81        520.14        612.55 

Aftermarket Parts 233832  stock  7w  30d 

                                  1 10417 445.17                445.17 

Eldorado 233828 -                 12w 

                                  1 30445 615.92                615.92 

Eldorado 233828  24w 

                                  5 410001 982.45                993.22     2,487.46     1,564.52     1,109.01        982.45 

Muncie 233833  stock  6w  30d  stock  stock 

                                  5 410002 982.45                993.22     2,487.46     1,564.52     1,109.01        982.45 

Muncie 233833 -                 stock  6w  30d  5w  stock 

                                  6 410006 105.02                238.19        105.02        210.00        306.34        266.41        241.89 

Gillig 233830 -                 6w 
 unapproved 

part  3w  stock  stock  21d 

                                  6 410010 126.46                202.36        853.49        126.46        199.95        175.13        148.98 

Muncie 233833 -                 stock  2w 
 unapproved 

part  stock  stock  21d 

                                  6 2010004 18.86                      34.34           18.86           30.54           38.42           39.52           33.65 

Eldorado 233828 -                 4w  8w  75d  stock  5w  30d 

                                  1 110006 338.30                338.30 

Eldorado 233828 -                 stock 

                                  1 110007 326.20                326.20 

Eldorado 233828 -                 stock 

                                  5 2010021 29.00                   115.65           29.00        185.00        222.59        142.00 



Due:  12/19/2022

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Interstate 
Power

Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Neopart A&A Auto Cummins Eldorado Genfare - 
NO BID

Provost Mohawk Kirks Gillig Suburban 
Truck

Coffman Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie

Pace RFQ#  422254

Neopart 233826 -                 4w 
 unapproved 

part  stock  5w  30d 

                                  3 110014 144.21                199.85        226.32        144.21 

Aftermarket Parts 233832 -                 4w  stock  6w 

                                  1 110038 1.14                          1.14 

Eldorado 233828 -                 2w 

                                  2 410103 33.33                      68.21           33.33 

Aftermarket Parts 233832 -                 stock  5w 

                                  3 2010066 3,323.16          3,849.70     3,323.16     4,411.56 
Availability - 
Cummins 233827 -                 2d 

 no lead 
time given  11w 

                                  3 210040 28.83                      28.83           73.72           51.29 

Muncie 233833 -                
 unapproved 

part  15w  71d 


	422254

