O pace RFQ Tabulation

NOTE: The information contained on the tabulation is the quote
received. The low quote does not assume award. Award is based on
the low, responsive and responsible quote.

RFQ Issue Date RFQ No. RFQ Due Time: RFQ Due Date

12/29/2022 421887 2:00 p.m. 1/18/2023

RFQ Bidder Name(s) Grcij%r/né):stseen Local Venﬁl]i(r;g Service

=g Gy VBl SEEEs gg:t Total lCJ:g:t Total lCJ:g:t Total ggistt Total
1 1 [Heritage $ 27.00]($ 27001 $  1830( $ 18.30 $ - $ -
2 1 |South $ 9150 $ 91.50 NO BID NO BID $ - $ -
3 1 |[South Holland $ 27.00|$% 27.00 NO BID NO BID $ - $ -
4 1 |Southwest $ 27.00]($ 27.00 NO BID NO BID $ - $ -
5 1 [Fox Valley $ 27.00]($ 27001 $ 1830( $ 18.30 $ - $ -
6 1 [|River $ 27.00]($ 27001 $ 1830( $ 18.30 $ - $ -
7 1 |ElginTC $ 3500 $ 3500/ $ 1830( $ 18.30 $ - $ -
8 1 [East Dundee Outstation $ 4350|$ 4350 [ $ 2250 $ 22.50 $ - $ -
10 1 [|West $ 137.00 | $ 13650 [ $ 7050 | $ 70.50 $ - $ -
11 1 |North $ 27.00($ 27001 $ 1830( $ 18.30 $ - $ -
12 1 [North Shore $ 27.00($ 27001 $ 1830( $ 18.30 $ - $ -
Total Bid Amount $ 495,50 $ 202.80 $ - $ -
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