
DUE:  12/08/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid A&A Auto MW Bus CBM P&G Vehicle 
Maintenance

GFI - 
Genfare - 
NO BID

Filter 
Services

Prevost Suburban 
Truck

Illinois 
Auto

Interstate 
Power

Neopart Crossline Kirks Translite Eldorado Hydraulic 
Electric

Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie Cummins Mohawk Coffman

                                  3 20703 999.00                   999.00     1,562.77 1,451.36   

Aftermarket Parts 233806 -                 R&R ONLY  stock 15w

                                  3 130744 16.66                    56.80 23.29                  16.66 

Muncie 233807 -                 stock 5w  45d 

                                  3 60734 2.47                         2.82            7.99            2.47 

Muncie 233807 -                 stock  stock  30d 

                                  7 72079 209.10                215.00        209.10        337.33        265.00 265.95             238.00        312.13 

P&G 233795  5d  90d  90d  stock stock  165d  5w 

                                  1 211019 8.72                         8.72 

Filter Services 233797 -                 60d 

                                  2 60411 19.66                    19.66          36.25 

Muncie 233807 -                 60d  6w 

                                  2 72102 74.99                  154.99          74.99 

Muncie 233807 -                 stock  30d 

                                  7 120487 10.66                    11.19          11.13          11.40 21.57                  12.77          10.66          10.66 
Availability - 
Coffman 233811 -                 2w  stock  stock stock  stock  3w  stock 

                                  2 220326 1.70              2.35                      1.70 

Muncie 233807 -                6w  45d 

                                  5 200520 14.72                    35.77          38.06 43.27                  34.48          14.72 

Mohawk 233810  stock  4w stock  stock  stock 

                                  4 200522 20.15                    59.86 65.23                  37.50          20.15 

Mohawk 233810  4w 5w  stock  stock 

                                  5 70220 7.65                       23.01          60.83 25.73                  15.78            7.65 

Mohawk 233810  stock  2w 16w  stock  stock 

                                  4 72143 11.56                    12.39          19.31 11.56                  13.10 

Aftermarket Parts 233806  8w  3w stock  75d 

                                  4 130473 0.15                         1.60 0.15                      0.20            0.18 

Aftermarket Parts 233806 -                 MOQ stock  stock  stock 

                                  5 130581 56.16                    72.21 84.87                  62.00          62.26          56.16 

Coffman 233811  stock stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                  1 240058 14.86                    14.86 

Pace RFQ# 422231



DUE:  12/08/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid A&A Auto MW Bus CBM P&G Vehicle 
Maintenance

GFI - 
Genfare - 
NO BID

Filter 
Services

Prevost Suburban 
Truck

Illinois 
Auto

Interstate 
Power

Neopart Crossline Kirks Translite Eldorado Hydraulic 
Electric

Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie Cummins Mohawk Coffman

Pace RFQ# 422231

Vehicle Maintenance 233796 stock

                                  1 72138 61.42                    61.42 

Eldorado 233804 -                 stock 

                                  3 290471 12.84                    14.25          19.53 12.84         

Eldorado 233804 -                 2w  stock 27w

                                  4 151457 211.90                245.73        388.00 212.46             211.90 

Muncie 233807 -                 75d  stock 5w  stock 

                                  5 120416 7.65              13.92                  10.08            8.57            7.65            8.68 

Cummins 233811 -                 stock  30d  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock 

                                  4 170625 233.68                286.25        310.48 250.79             233.68 

Mohawk 233810 -                 75d  4w 7w  6w 

                                  1 110135 50.76                    50.76 

Eldorado 233804 -                 4w 

                                  9 120488 17.55                    21.49          17.55          19.39          21.14          21.14 26.65                  18.50          19.80          19.63 

CBM 233794 -                 2w  stock  stock  stock  10d stock  stock 
 no lead 

time given  stock 

                                  2 160596 174.90         190.15             174.90 

Muncie 233807 -                stock  110d 

                                  5 220342 159.00                169.55        232.54        194.91 191.05             159.00 

Muncie 233807 -                 16w  75d  6w 27w  30d 

                                  8 60745 59.57                    94.59          59.57        111.00 90.80                  70.00        106.71        132.13        108.81 

Vehicle Maintenance 233796 -                 1w  stock  stock  4w  stock  stock  6w  stock 

                                  3 41213 187.12         187.12             256.00        188.96 

Aftermarket Parts 233806 -                10w  120d 
 unapproved 

part 

                                  5 30361 5.58                       12.80            9.61 7.28                    10.72            5.58 

Mohawk 233810 -                 75d  MOQ stock  stock  stock 

                                  1 72077 71.13                    71.13 

Eldorado 233804 -                 stock 

                                  4 70706 5.16                       23.65          51.35 24.95                    5.16 

Neopart 233799 -                 stock  stock stock
 unapproved 

part 

                                  6 72094 19.61                    19.61          21.00          31.23 22.65                  23.72          27.80 

Vehicle Maintenance 233796 -                 stock  stock  2w stock  30d  30d 



DUE:  12/08/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid A&A Auto MW Bus CBM P&G Vehicle 
Maintenance

GFI - 
Genfare - 
NO BID

Filter 
Services

Prevost Suburban 
Truck

Illinois 
Auto

Interstate 
Power

Neopart Crossline Kirks Translite Eldorado Hydraulic 
Electric

Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie Cummins Mohawk Coffman

Pace RFQ# 422231

                                  4 71442 6.50                       17.95 17.97                    6.50            7.30 

Muncie 233807 -                 stock stock  stock  30d 

                                  4 81090 93.33           126.96             104.99          93.33          93.44 

Cummins 233808 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                  5 200724 20.15                  331.88        348.82 401.45             348.75          20.15 

Mohawk 233810 -                 stock  4w 5w  80d  stock 

                                  2 70211 21.15                    27.28          21.15 

Muncie 233807 -                 stock  stock 

                                  5 81156 1.23                       80.02            1.23 1.31                    58.92          29.55 

Neopart 233799 -                 75d  stock stock
 Bid 10, 
need 50 

 unapproved 
part 

                                  3 20535 48.07           57.08                  78.39          48.07 

Mohawk 233810 -                stock  stock  stock 

                                  1 72144 57.67                    57.67 

Eldorado 233804 -                 stock 

                                  4 60748 52.97                    95.00          78.90 52.97                  53.15 

Aftermarket Parts 233806 -                 90d  stock stock  60d 

                                  3 72156 21.99                    21.99 24.42                  22.25 

Neopart 233799 -                 8w stock  42d 

                                  5 200913 13.48                    20.31          22.44 14.18                  13.48          23.96 

Muncie 233807 -                 stock  6w stock  stock  6w 

                                  7 100223 66.00                    70.00          73.00 167.75             110.99        116.28          66.00        116.39 

Mohawk 233810 -                 stock  stock 8w  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                  3 72184 6.10                       21.70 6.14                      6.10 

Muncie 233807 -                 stock stock  stock 

                                  4 81352 63.84           174.61             129.63          63.84        129.74 

Mohawk 233810 -                7w  stock  stock  stock 

                                  1 250710 36.71                    36.71 

Eldorado 233804 -                 stock 

                                  1 72233 2.57                         2.57 

Eldorado 233804 -                 4w 

                                  1 72234 1.58                         1.58 



DUE:  12/08/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid A&A Auto MW Bus CBM P&G Vehicle 
Maintenance

GFI - 
Genfare - 
NO BID

Filter 
Services

Prevost Suburban 
Truck

Illinois 
Auto

Interstate 
Power

Neopart Crossline Kirks Translite Eldorado Hydraulic 
Electric

Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie Cummins Mohawk Coffman

Pace RFQ# 422231

Eldorado 233804 -                 stock 

                                  4 290679 50.00                    91.50 50.00         70.40                  68.42 

Hydraulic Electric 233805 -                 75d stock  stock  21d 

                                  2 81412 33.91                    34.17 33.91         

Aftermarket Parts 233806 -                 stock  23w 

                                  1 81416 3.01                         3.01 

Eldorado 233804 -                 stock 

                                  1 81417 34.12                    34.12 

Eldorado 233804 -                 stock 

                                  3 81423 20.96                    29.50 20.96                  20.99 

Aftermarket Parts 233806 -                 12w stock  stock 

                                  1 41281 59.00                    59.00 

Eldorado 233804 -                 stock 

                                  4 81430 340.08         462.24             387.95        340.08        340.19 

Cummins 233808 -                stock  30d  stock  stock 

                                  6 81431 992.13             1,334.67     1,089.00     1,050.00 1,324.01          992.13        992.25 

Cummins 233808 -                 stock  stock  stock 7w  stock  stock 

                                  3 152032 161.23                298.21 161.23             163.88 

Aftermarket Parts 233806 -                 stock stock  stock 

                                  3 152033 135.15                298.21 155.54             135.15 

Muncie 233807 -                 stock 5w  stock 

                                  5 81437 4.52              19.27                  16.22          14.09            4.52          14.20 

Cummins 233808 -                stock  21d  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock 

                                  6 81441 44.00           44.00         69.99                  62.15          53.62          48.52          69.40 

Cummins 233808 -                
 no part # 
identified stock  stock  stock 

 unapproved 
part  stock 

                                  5 81444 59.40                  109.23          74.00 90.39                  76.41          59.40 

Mohawk 233810 -                 stock  stock stock  60d  stock 

                                  1 180833 156.80         156.80      

Aftermarket Parts 233806 -                13w

                                  2 170692 82.69           82.69                111.91 

Aftermarket Parts 233806 -                6w  35d 



DUE:  12/08/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid A&A Auto MW Bus CBM P&G Vehicle 
Maintenance

GFI - 
Genfare - 
NO BID

Filter 
Services

Prevost Suburban 
Truck

Illinois 
Auto

Interstate 
Power

Neopart Crossline Kirks Translite Eldorado Hydraulic 
Electric

Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie Cummins Mohawk Coffman

Pace RFQ# 422231

                                  2 72303 1.41                         5.16 1.41           

Aftermarket Parts 233806 -                 stock stock

                                  5 120548 0.97              4.09                      2.99            2.45            0.97            2.56 

Cummins 233808 -                stock  14d  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock 

                               10 81502 25.39                    25.39          34.56          54.02          28.11          28.11 28.56                  31.38          32.11          26.20          26.84 

A&A Auto 233793 -                 3w  stock  75d  stock  10d 9w  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                  1 72348 35.02           35.02         

Aftermarket Parts 233806 -                stock

                                  2 170706 345.39                420.08        345.39 

Eldorado 233804 -                 stock  3w 

                                  8 81519 66.00                    72.37          67.67        107.45          66.00 128.49             104.78          99.00          92.33 

Kirks 233801 -                 stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock  stock stock  stock  stock  stock 

                               10 81521 17.67                    21.59          17.67          22.31          22.31          20.47 25.04                  17.99          25.57          20.86          21.39 

Vehicle Maintenance 233796 -                 1w  stock  stock  10d  stock 3w  stock  2d  stock  stock 

                                  4 290696 9.60                       53.94 26.33                  29.33            9.60 

Aftermarket Parts 233806 -                 6w 23w  120d 
 unapproved 

part 

                                  3 290700 171.70                300.63 195.24             171.70 

Muncie 233807 -                 stock 23w  stock 

                                  5 410003 197.30                235.00        205.78 235.85             197.30        216.52 

Muncie 233807 -                 75d  4w 6w  28d  3w 

                                  6 2210000 52.98                    58.55          71.82        117.76 63.41                  52.98          92.06 

Muncie 233807 -                 7d  75d  stock stock  stock  7w 

                                  2 1510007 24.21                    29.92 24.21         

Aftermarket Parts 233806 -                 stock stock

                                  2 1510008 15.47                    25.31 15.47         

Aftermarket Parts 233806 -                 stock stock

                                  8 1210003 20.69                    20.69          22.02          23.61 21.00         34.66                  29.41          24.12          24.67 

Neopart 233799 -                
 unapproved 

part  stock  4w 
 no part # 
identified 9w  2d  stock  stock 

                                  2 1610026 33.99           38.96                  33.99 

Muncie 233807 -                stock  stock 

                                  3 710026 466.23                827.71 567.83             466.23 



DUE:  12/08/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid A&A Auto MW Bus CBM P&G Vehicle 
Maintenance

GFI - 
Genfare - 
NO BID

Filter 
Services

Prevost Suburban 
Truck

Illinois 
Auto

Interstate 
Power

Neopart Crossline Kirks Translite Eldorado Hydraulic 
Electric

Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie Cummins Mohawk Coffman

Pace RFQ# 422231

Mohawk 233810 -                 8w 5w  stock 

                                  1 710032 165.42         165.42      

Aftermarket Parts 233806 -                stock

                                  3 610009 2.49                       13.60 2.49                      5.35 

Aftermarket Parts 233806 -                 stock stock  21d 

                                  3 2010021 195.78                201.16 222.59             195.78 

Muncie 233807 -                 4w 5w  35d 

                                  5 610018 18.83           65.33                  54.08          48.08          18.83          49.58 

Cummins 233808 -                stock  14d  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock 

                                  8 610019 83.00                    96.87        104.86          83.00 109.86               92.25        165.09          91.18        165.20 

Kirks 233801 -                 stock  6w  stock 7w  35d  stock  stock  stock 

                                  3 710052 2,536.10          2,536.10     2,700.00     4,134.13 

P&G 233795 -                 stock  60d  4w 

                                  7 1010011 863.33             1,183.20        980.00 2,087.66       1,346.99        863.33     1,110.00     1,536.76 

Cummins 233808 -                 10d  stock 6w  35d  2d  21d  stock 

                                  7 1010012 1,234.00          1,343.34     1,234.00 3,610.92       1,675.88     2,289.21     1,245.00     2,289.31 

Kirks 233801 -                 10d  stock 6w  35d  stock  stock  stock 

                                  5 810025 878.54                878.54 1,228.38       1,037.17        912.61        912.72 

Neopart 233799 -                 stock 9w  14d  stock  stock 

                                  5 810027 618.00                618.00 783.47             694.74        621.64        621.75 

Crossline 233800 -                 stock stock  14d  stock  stock 

                                  6 810030 1.39                         3.98 3.71                      3.03            2.60            1.39            2.71 

cummins 233808 -                 stock stock  19d  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock 

                                  8 610026 120.46                134.70        120.46        320.00        131.00 129.68             369.76        128.48        369.86 

Neopart 233799 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock 19w  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock 

                                  5 1010015 984.00                1,167.90        984.00 2,277.45       1,045.25     1,670.40 

Kirks 233801 -                 10d  stock 13w  stock  stock 

                                  2 1010016 2,752.85      4,223.86       2,752.85 

Coffman 233811 -                9w  stock 

                                  3 2910007 42.71                    83.82 57.32                  42.71 

Muncie 233807 -                 12w stock  70d 



DUE:  12/08/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid A&A Auto MW Bus CBM P&G Vehicle 
Maintenance

GFI - 
Genfare - 
NO BID

Filter 
Services

Prevost Suburban 
Truck

Illinois 
Auto

Interstate 
Power

Neopart Crossline Kirks Translite Eldorado Hydraulic 
Electric

Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie Cummins Mohawk Coffman

Pace RFQ# 422231

                                  5 610031 28.00                    28.00 45.77                  33.59          28.55          33.70 

Kirks 233801 -                 stock stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock 

                                  1 610036 3,858.09          3,858.09 

Eldorado 233804 -                 stock 

                                  2 2910015 19.19                    27.65 19.19         

Aftermarket Parts 233806 -                 16w stock

                                  5 610049 6.92              8.94                      7.98            6.92            9.36            7.03 

Cummins 233808 -                stock  30d  stock  3w  stock 

                                  8 610050 19.75                    19.75          21.23          28.41 34.44                  24.40        146.53          22.00        122.77 

CBM 233794 -                 stock  stock  4w stock  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock 

                                  4 610053 21.52           43.14                  30.02          21.52          30.13 

Mohawk 233810 -                7w  stock  stock  stock 

                                  2 810050 95.54                  138.30 95.54         

Aftermarket Parts 233806 -                 stock stock

                                  2 2210020 279.73         324.77             279.73 

Muncie 233807 -                5w  stock 

                                  2 2210021 1,295.00          1,295.00 1,458.53   

Kirks 233801 -                 stock 12w

                                  7 810060 38.00                    53.03          38.00 58.83                  39.99          43.20          72.49          43.30 

Crossline 233800 -                 stock  stock stock  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock 

                                  3 710115 57.11                    57.11          67.89 76.94         

Vehicle Maintenance 233796 -                 stock  stock 5w

                                  2 810064 4,704.40      4,801.10       4,704.40 

Coffman 233811 -                8w  stock 

                                  5 810078 454.09                540.69 645.06             570.30        454.09        454.19 

Cummins 233808 -                 stock stock  21d  stock  stock 

                                  5 1010025 7.59              13.47                  15.05          12.69            7.59            9.93 

Coffman 233811 -                stock  30d  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock 

                                  1 710130 214.93                214.93 

Eldorado 233804 -                 6w 

                                  3 2010041 2,099.00          2,099.00 3,736.29       2,949.02 



DUE:  12/08/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid A&A Auto MW Bus CBM P&G Vehicle 
Maintenance

GFI - 
Genfare - 
NO BID

Filter 
Services

Prevost Suburban 
Truck

Illinois 
Auto

Interstate 
Power

Neopart Crossline Kirks Translite Eldorado Hydraulic 
Electric

Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie Cummins Mohawk Coffman

Pace RFQ# 422231

Kirks 233801 -                 stock stock  90d 

                                  5 1210039 1.40              2.03                      1.80            1.40            3.12            1.51 

Cummins 233808 -                5w  30d  stock  6w  stock 

                                  3 2110063 35.40                    35.40 52.93                155.84 

Illinois Auto 233798 -                 1w 8w
 unapproved 

part 

                                  7 1010029 13.43                    13.43          17.20 69.68                  49.30          43.76          21.08          43.86 

Neopart 233799 -                 stock  stock stock  30d  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock 

                                  1 110026 98.75                    98.75 

Eldorado 233804 -                 2w 

                                  1 110027 1.19                         1.19 

Eldorado 233804 -                 stock 

                                  1 710142 1.10              1.10           

Aftermarket Parts 233806 -                5w

                                  6 810098 287.95                318.60 391.42             323.00        287.95        347.45        288.05 

Cummins 233808 -                 stock stock  21d  stock  stock  stock 

                                  3 410077 72.93                    72.93 84.05                  85.70 

Neopart 233799 -                 stock 7w  42d 

                                  2 1210053 10.30           10.30                  68.94 

Aftermarket Parts 233806 -                stock  stock 

                                  3 810110 1,423.00          1,423.00 1,567.22       1,548.27 

Kirks 233801 -                 stock 5w  stock 

                                  1 710157 43.45                    43.45 

Eldorado 233804 -                 stock 

                                  4 810112 5.10              10.27                    5.10            7.89            5.21 

Cummins 233808 -                6w  stock  30d  stock 

                                  4 1010039 435.00                435.00 617.27             440.11        652.72 

Crossline 233800 -                 stock 14w  stock  stock 

                                  4 810125 40.80           157.72             110.04          40.80        113.14 

Cummins 233808 -                stock  2d 
 unapproved 

part  stock 

                                  1 610069 813.53         813.53      

Aftermarket Parts 233806 -                16w



DUE:  12/08/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid A&A Auto MW Bus CBM P&G Vehicle 
Maintenance

GFI - 
Genfare - 
NO BID

Filter 
Services

Prevost Suburban 
Truck

Illinois 
Auto

Interstate 
Power

Neopart Crossline Kirks Translite Eldorado Hydraulic 
Electric

Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie Cummins Mohawk Coffman

Pace RFQ# 422231

                                  7 1210070 57.67                    57.91          70.66 79.15                  72.90          64.81          58.85          57.67 

Coffman 233811 -                 stock  stock stock  30d  stock  stock  stock 

                                  7 610073 6.29                         6.59            6.29            7.98 9.15                      7.73            6.66            6.52 

Vehicle Maintenance 233796 -                 3w  stock  stock stock  stock  7w  stock 

                                  3 1210076 14.60           19.98                  14.60          14.71 

Cummins 233808 -                5w  stock  stock 

                                  1 1210078 1,500.00          1,500.00 

Eldorado 233804 -                 8w 

                                  1 610082 20.74                    20.74 

Eldorado 233804 -                 stock 

                                  4 1110003 112.71         149.97             137.37        112.71        112.82 

Cummins 233808 -                stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                  3 810206 11.79           15.34                  13.07          11.79 

Coffman 233811 -                5w  stock  stock 

                                  3 1010055 107.72         137.36             128.54        107.72 

Coffman 233811 -                14w  stock  stock 

                                  3 810230 3.53                         3.53            5.86            3.73 

Cummins 233808 -                 stock  30d  stock 

                                  2 1010062 31.21                    31.21          31.32 

Cummins 233808 -                 stock  stock 

                                  2 810233 4.89                         4.89            5.00 

Cummins 233808 -                 stock  stock 

                                  1 710278 1,565.86          1,565.86 

Cummins 233808 -                 20w 

                                  6 1010068 700.00                905.67        700.00 1,553.11          837.56     1,571.90     1,316.12 

Kirks 233801 -                 stock  stock stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                  1 110058 295.39         295.39      

Aftermarket Parts 233806 -                stock

                                  2 810301 663.13         1,018.90          663.13 

Coffman 233811 -                9w  90d 

                                  3 1010075 107.61         137.36             107.61        107.72 



DUE:  12/08/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid A&A Auto MW Bus CBM P&G Vehicle 
Maintenance

GFI - 
Genfare - 
NO BID

Filter 
Services

Prevost Suburban 
Truck

Illinois 
Auto

Interstate 
Power

Neopart Crossline Kirks Translite Eldorado Hydraulic 
Electric

Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie Cummins Mohawk Coffman

Pace RFQ# 422231

Cummins 233808 -                5w  2d  stock 

                                  - 610143 -                

-                

                                  1 110065 439.70         439.70      

Aftermarket Parts 233806 -                12w

                                  4 810359 232.74                244.00 386.96             232.74        232.85 

Cummins 233808 -                 stock 4w  stock  stock 

                                  3 2110208 260.69                265.00 300.44             260.69 

Muncie 233807 -                 16w stock  stock 

                                  - 1010098 -                

-                

                                  1 1510305 1,354.84      1,354.84   

Aftermarket Parts 233806 -                11w

                                  1 810415 209.85                209.85 

Eldorado 233804 -                 stock 

                                  1 810416 11.06                    11.06 

Eldorado 233804 -                 stock 

                                  3 1010111 2,439.07      4,343.57       2,439.07     2,439.18 

Cummins 233808 -                stock  stock  stock 

                                  2 1110009 1,854.26          1,854.26     1,854.36 

Cummins 233808 -                 stock  stock 

                                  2 2110263 2,150.00      2,939.28       2,150.00 

Muncie 233807 -                7w  stock 

                                  4 810422 75.27           96.83                  75.27          89.40          75.37 

Cummins 233808 -                stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock 

                                  3 810423 282.45         360.30             282.45        282.56 

Cummins 233808 -                5w  stock  stock 

                                  4 810424 114.73         146.42             130.99        114.73        114.84 

Cummins 233808 -                7w  stock  stock  stock 

                                  4 810425 16.64           22.06                  18.98          18.49          16.64 

Coffman 233811 -                9w  stock  stock  stock 



DUE:  12/08/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid A&A Auto MW Bus CBM P&G Vehicle 
Maintenance

GFI - 
Genfare - 
NO BID

Filter 
Services

Prevost Suburban 
Truck

Illinois 
Auto

Interstate 
Power

Neopart Crossline Kirks Translite Eldorado Hydraulic 
Electric

Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie Cummins Mohawk Coffman

Pace RFQ# 422231

                                  5 810426 1.29                         2.45 2.22                      1.29            2.50            1.40 

Cummins 233808 -                 stock stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                  3 810427 2.29              6.05                      2.29            2.40 

Cummins 233808 -                stock  stock  stock 

                                  3 810428 8.00              12.61                    8.00            8.30 

Cummins 233808 -                stock  stock  stock 

                                  4 810429 7.46                         8.46 12.00                    7.46            7.86 

Cummins 233808 -                 stock stock  stock  stock 

                                  1 710446 336.44                336.44 

Eldorado 233804 -                 3w 

                                  2 810430 225.57                225.57        225.68 

Cummins 233808 -                 stock  stock 

                                  1 30445 663.56                663.56 

Eldorado 233804 -                 8w 

                                  7 410000 103.48                210.55        160.41        129.74        198.59 103.48             127.79        131.70 

Aftermarket Parts 233806 -                 75d  stock  4w  5w stock  30d  30d 

                                  3 710058 23.61           28.56                  23.61          23.72 

Cummins 233808 -                stock  stock  stock 

                                  - 2110026 -                

-                

                                  - 410048 -                

-                

                                  2 1010035 107.72         137.36             107.72 

Coffman 233811 -                7w  stock 

                                  1 810198 737.43                737.43 

Eldorado 233804 -                 20w 

                                  - 6710017 -                

-                

                                  - 1010101 -                

-                

                                  - 2110230 -                



DUE:  12/08/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid A&A Auto MW Bus CBM P&G Vehicle 
Maintenance

GFI - 
Genfare - 
NO BID

Filter 
Services

Prevost Suburban 
Truck

Illinois 
Auto

Interstate 
Power

Neopart Crossline Kirks Translite Eldorado Hydraulic 
Electric

Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie Cummins Mohawk Coffman

Pace RFQ# 422231

-                

                                  - 2110231 -                

-                

                                  - 710437 -                

-                

                                  - 1610206 -                

-                

                                  - 1610207 -                

-                

                                  - 1810099 -                

-                


	422231

