
DUE:  11/22/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Vehicle 
Maintenance

Battery 
Service

Triangle 
Radiator

Coffman SPX-
Genfare - 
NO BID

Suburban 
Truck

Neopart Kirks Translite Prevost Crossline Eldorado CBM Interstate 
Power

Mohawk Aftermarket 
Parts

Cummins Muncie

                                    2 160605 10.10                      10.48 10.10         

Muncie 233777 -                 stock 42d

                                    5 41237 106.79                  106.96         139.26         106.79         130.44 110.26       

Mohawk 233773 -                 3w  75d  3w  6w 35d

                                    4 40108 3.55                          5.65             3.72             4.09 3.55           

Muncie 233777 -                 3w  stock  stock stock

                                    1 620025 3.14                          3.14 

Aftermarket Parts 233775  8w 

                                    1 620055 17.79                      17.79 

Aftermarket Parts 233775 -                 10w 

                                    3 60735 1,278.32          1,278.32     3,448.97 3,369.05   

Eldorado 233772 -                 24w  9w 70d

                                    3 71287 0.25                          0.43             0.25             0.47 

Mohawk 233773 -                 stock  stock  5w 

                                    5 71441 6.32                          7.10           17.95             7.29           11.60 6.32           

Muncie 233777 -                 stock  stock  stock  19w stock

                                    4 72143 11.56                      12.56           19.31           11.56 13.13         

Aftermarket Parts 233775 -                 10w  10w  stock 56d

                                    6 130581 52.36                      59.58           57.90           72.21           52.36           84.87 62.25         

Mohawk 233773  stock  3w  stock  stock  6w 30d

                                    3 290646 96.45                    164.74         124.66 96.45         

Muncie 233777  stock  8w 35d

                                    5 41238 105.98                  105.98         139.26         106.71         130.44 110.88       

Neopart 233768  4w  75d  3w  6w 21d

                                    5 40798 107.83                  107.83         237.67         128.52         130.48 126.26       

Neopart 233768  3w  2w  3w  7w 28d

Pace RFQ# 422208



DUE:  11/22/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Vehicle 
Maintenance

Battery 
Service

Triangle 
Radiator

Coffman SPX-
Genfare - 
NO BID

Suburban 
Truck

Neopart Kirks Translite Prevost Crossline Eldorado CBM Interstate 
Power

Mohawk Aftermarket 
Parts

Cummins Muncie

Pace RFQ# 422208

                                    2 170611 92.53                      92.53         144.86 

Mohawk 233773 -                 4w  7w 

                                    1 170630 90.96                      90.96 

Translite 233770  12w 

                                    3 220080 2.63                          8.44             3.41 2.63           

Muncie 233777  stock  stock 35d

                                    2 70958 4.71                          6.67             4.71 

Aftermarket Parts 233775 -                 stock  7w 

                                    3 290658 129.05                  151.66         160.03 129.05       

Muncie 233777 -                 stock  stock 21d

                                    3 71519 67.11                      67.11           81.35         129.08 

Vehicle Maintenance 233763 -                 stock  stock  9w 

                                    4 72142 10.48                      10.78           19.31           10.48 11.25         

Aftermarket Parts 233775 -                 10w  stock  13w  63d 

                                    8 120488 19.39                      19.39           19.63           21.14           21.14           25.54           21.25 23.46         19.42         

Vehicle Maintenance 233763 -                 stock  stock  stock  14d  stock  5w 3d stock

                                    3 170013 14.05                      54.56           21.80 14.05         

Muncie 233777 -                 4w  stock 49d

                                    3 210976 25.78                      79.17           25.78 33.60         

Mohawk 233773 -                 stock  stock 35d

                                    2 220350 930.00              1,047.06 930.00       

Muncie 233777 -                 stock 168d

                                    6 20670 56.37                      56.37         292.20         385.37         245.76         335.76 296.93       

Suburban Truck 233767 -                 stock  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock 21d

                                    2 620058 40.75                      40.75           57.96 

Mohawk 233773 -                 2w  8w 



DUE:  11/22/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Vehicle 
Maintenance

Battery 
Service

Triangle 
Radiator

Coffman SPX-
Genfare - 
NO BID

Suburban 
Truck

Neopart Kirks Translite Prevost Crossline Eldorado CBM Interstate 
Power

Mohawk Aftermarket 
Parts

Cummins Muncie

Pace RFQ# 422208

                                    5 41035 1.05                          7.00           10.08             1.05             4.97 5.38           

Mohawk 233773 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock 120d

                                    7 41227 15.10                      23.23           36.51           47.89           59.30           15.10           52.09 24.99         

Mohawk 233773 -                 stock  stock  stock  75d  stock  stock stock

                                    5 130612 46.57                    101.41         118.69           46.57         153.94 109.77       

Coffman 233766 -                 stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock stock

                                    5 110085 16.16                    110.08           16.16         148.93 105.98       122.55       

Cummins 233776 -                 stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock 3d 21d

                                    6 60739 27.89                      29.29           45.09           34.24           27.89 44.99         51.24         

Aftermarket Parts 233775 -                 stock  stock  stock  6w 3d stock

                                    1 72055 203.30                  203.30 

Aftermarket Parts 233775 -                 7w 

                                    3 110100 2.57                          3.44             2.57 3.20           

Aftermarket Parts 233775 -                 stock  stock  stock 

                                    4 71442 6.50                        17.95             7.30           17.97 6.50           

Muncie 233777 -                 stock  stock  stock stock

                                    5 220129 2.91                          6.76             2.91           55.30             4.50 94.77         

Eldorado 233772 -                 stock  stock  5w  6w 30d

                                    2 10278 0.91                          0.91             1.58 

Mohawk 233773 -                 stock  stock 

                                    3 72148 89.04                    369.83           89.04         149.34 

Mohawk 233773 -                 4w  stock  stock 

                                    4 72162 28.74                      39.13           28.74           53.04 37.28         

Mohawk 233773 -                 2w  stock  7w 30d

                                    1 130774 142.17                  142.17 

Aftermarket Parts 233775 -                 stock 



DUE:  11/22/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Vehicle 
Maintenance

Battery 
Service

Triangle 
Radiator

Coffman SPX-
Genfare - 
NO BID

Suburban 
Truck

Neopart Kirks Translite Prevost Crossline Eldorado CBM Interstate 
Power

Mohawk Aftermarket 
Parts

Cummins Muncie

Pace RFQ# 422208

                                    1 30411 370.42                  370.42 

Eldorado 233772 -                 20w 

                                    1 120498 425.00                  425.00 

Triangle Radiator 233765 -                 3d 

                                    6 41272 39.58                      42.61           39.58         100.21           46.07           45.37 44.10         

Neopart 233768 -                 stock  stock  1w  5w  5w 30d

                                    5 41273 39.96                      39.96           48.51           45.84           45.14 43.25         

Neopart 233768 -                 4w  75d  5w  stock 30d

                                    3 10416 520.14                  639.81         520.14 614.88       

Aftermarket Parts 233775 -                 stock  2w 30d

                                    2 81423 20.96                      29.50           20.96 

Aftermarket Parts 233775 -                 4w  stock 

                                    5 81422 1.60                          2.37             1.60             3.75 3.15           3.77           

Coffman 233766 -                 stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock stock 30d

                                    2 20726 118.03                  177.68         118.03 

Aftermarket Parts 233775 -                 10w  16w 

                                    6 81441 49.26                      70.40           50.30           49.26           69.99 53.62         51.35         

Neopart 233768 -                 stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part  5w stock  stock 

                                    5 81444 59.40                      74.50         109.23           59.40           90.39 76.50         

Mohawk 233773 -                 3w  stock  stock  8w  60d 

                                    2 72301 342.97                  342.97         435.04 

Battery Service 233764 -                 60d  13w 

                                    6 30161 23.20                      25.62           46.57           37.42           43.76           23.20 23.87         

Aftermarket Parts 233775 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock  stock stock

                                    1 100247 3.07                          3.07 

Coffman 233766 -                 stock 



DUE:  11/22/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Vehicle 
Maintenance

Battery 
Service

Triangle 
Radiator

Coffman SPX-
Genfare - 
NO BID

Suburban 
Truck

Neopart Kirks Translite Prevost Crossline Eldorado CBM Interstate 
Power

Mohawk Aftermarket 
Parts

Cummins Muncie

Pace RFQ# 422208

                                    3 290695 65.11                    110.18           93.31 65.11         

Muncie 233777 -                 stock  25w stock

                                    4 290696 9.60                        53.94             9.60           26.33 29.33         

Aftermarket Parts 233775 -                 8w 
 unapproved 

part  stock 30d

                                    4 170718 65.65                      99.16         104.41           76.25 65.65         

Muncie 233777 -                 75d  stock  stock stock

                                    7 410000 103.48                  153.18         128.41         210.55         198.59         128.70         103.48 131.65       

Aftermarket Parts 233775 -                 stock  6w  75d  4w  30d  stock 30d

                                    7 410009 128.41                  153.18         128.41         210.55         198.59         128.70         149.58 131.65       

Neopart 233768  stock  6w  75d  4w  stock  8w 30d

                                    2 1510007 24.21                      27.28           24.21 

Aftermarket Parts 233775 -                 8w  stock 

                                    7 1210003 22.20                      22.20           24.67           23.83           30.97           34.66 29.51         28.78         

Vehicle Maintenance 233763 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock  stock stock stock

                                    2 810019 333.85                  333.85         417.00 

Coffman 233766 -                 stock  4w 

                                    1 1010005 552.02                  552.02 

Eldorado 233772 -                 2w 

                                    8 610019 85.00                    165.20           96.87         108.14           85.00           85.18         109.86 165.09       185.68       

Kirks 233769 -                 stock  stock  3w  stock  stock  7w stock stock

                                    4 110014 120.99                  121.51         199.85         144.21 120.99       

Muncie 233777 -                 3w  4w  13w stock

                                    5 310008 107.64                  107.64         207.28         129.46 1,076.59   110.67       

Neopart 233768 -                 6w  stock  13w stock stock

                                    2 1210016 1,500.00          1,500.00     2,444.99 

Eldorado 233772 -                 24w  stock 



DUE:  11/22/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Vehicle 
Maintenance

Battery 
Service

Triangle 
Radiator

Coffman SPX-
Genfare - 
NO BID

Suburban 
Truck

Neopart Kirks Translite Prevost Crossline Eldorado CBM Interstate 
Power

Mohawk Aftermarket 
Parts

Cummins Muncie

Pace RFQ# 422208

                                    1 310009 136.15                  136.15 

Aftermarket Parts 233775 -                 5w 

                                    6 810026 1,076.59          1,076.69     1,161.15     1,170.00     1,771.12 1,076.59   1,208.69   

Cummins 233776 -                 stock  stock  stock  9w stock stock

                                    6 810027 621.64                  621.74         637.84         675.00         783.47 621.64       694.74       

Cummins 233776 -                 stock  6w  stock  stock stock 21d

                                    6 810031 1.98                          9.07           10.99             1.98           12.45 8.97           10.01         

Cummins 233776 -                 stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part  4w stock stock

                                    6 1010015 984.00              1,070.38     1,100.00         984.00     1,000.25     2,277.45 1,419.00   

Kirks 233769 -                 stock  10d  stock  stock  13w 21d

                                    2 1010016 2,752.85          2,752.85     4,223.86 

Coffman 233776 -                 stock  9w 

                                    4 610033 632.00                  828.65         632.00     1,105.53 991.41       

Kirks 233769 -                 stock  stock  5w stock

                                    1 710105 1,285.31          1,285.31 

Eldorado 233772 -                 10w 

                                    8 610050 19.64                      29.29           29.41         120.00           21.55           19.64           34.44 146.53       24.40         

Muncie 233777 -                 stock  4w  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock stock stock

                                    4 610053 21.52                      30.13           21.52           43.14 30.02         

Mohawk 233773 -                 stock  stock  stock stock

                                    2 810050 95.54                    138.30           95.54 

Aftermarket Parts 233775 -                 stock  stock 

                                    1 810051 98.02                      98.02 

Aftermarket Parts 233775 -                 stock 

                                    7 810060 27.91                      43.30           53.03           38.00           27.91           58.83 43.20         39.99         

Crossline 233771 -                 stock  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock stock stock



DUE:  11/22/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Vehicle 
Maintenance

Battery 
Service

Triangle 
Radiator

Coffman SPX-
Genfare - 
NO BID

Suburban 
Truck

Neopart Kirks Translite Prevost Crossline Eldorado CBM Interstate 
Power

Mohawk Aftermarket 
Parts

Cummins Muncie

Pace RFQ# 422208

                                    2 810061 4,760.05          4,760.05     5,358.93 

Coffman 233766 -                 stock  9w 

                                    3 710115 37.11                      37.11           67.89           76.94 

Vehicle Maintenance 233763 -                 stock  stock  5w 

                                    3 710116 37.11                      37.11           67.89           39.61 

Vehicle Maintenance 233763 -                 stock  5w  9w 

                                    2 810064 5,454.51          5,528.69     5,454.51 

Aftermarket Parts 233775 -                 90d  6w 

                                    7 810071 796.25                  796.36     1,070.46         899.00     1,104.00     1,111.46 796.25       893.35       

Cummins 233776 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock  9w stock 30d

                                    1 710129 4,565.40          4,565.40 

Eldorado 233772 -                 stock 

                                    5 810078 454.09                  454.19         539.92         645.06 454.09       510.69       

Cummins 233776 -                 stock  stock  stock stock 30d

                                    5 810079 447.16                  454.19         550.00         645.06 454.09       447.16       

Muncie 233777 -                 stock  8w  9w stock stock

                                    1 710130 214.93                  214.93 

Eldorado 233772 -                 4w 

                                    4 810084 750.00                  932.81         750.00         815.00     1,399.02 

Neopart 233768 -                 stock  3w  stock  6w 

                                    1 110027 1.19                          1.19 

Eldorado 233772 -                 stock 

                                    5 610064 94.11                      94.25         115.72         120.13 94.11         105.51       

Cummins 233776 -                 stock  stock  stock stock stock

                                    5 810102 3.43                          3.54                4.26             4.80 3.43           4.03           

Cummins 233776 -                 stock  4w  5w stock 30d



DUE:  11/22/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Vehicle 
Maintenance

Battery 
Service

Triangle 
Radiator

Coffman SPX-
Genfare - 
NO BID

Suburban 
Truck

Neopart Kirks Translite Prevost Crossline Eldorado CBM Interstate 
Power

Mohawk Aftermarket 
Parts

Cummins Muncie

Pace RFQ# 422208

                                    5 710149 427.26                  447.47         523.74         427.26         641.24 457.10       

Mohawk 233773 -                 stock 
 no lead 

time given  4w  stock 30d

                                    4 810110 1,299.00          1,558.27     1,299.00     1,895.62     1,567.22 

Kirks 233769 -                 stock  stock  12w  5w 

                                    5 810122 9.65                        32.35             9.65           43.94 32.24         36.63         

Mohawk 233773 -                 stock  stock  6w stock 30d

                                    5 810123 64.68                      64.78           77.80           86.28 64.68         64.70         

Cummins 233776 -                 stock  stock  stock stock stock

                                    1 610068 70.36                      70.36 

Eldorado 233772 -                 10w 

                                    1 610070 79.37                      79.37 

Eldorado 233772 -                 stock 

                                    3 2910023 202.27                  202.27         416.14         216.15 

Neopart 233768 -                 3w  5w  stock 

                                    3 410080 570.04                  570.04         658.36 1,047.25   

Neopart 233768 -                 8w  10w 45d

                                    3 410081 5.59                          5.59             6.75 6.43           

Neopart 233768 -                 stock  stock 21d

                                    1 1610099 538.20                  538.20 

Eldorado 233772 -                 2w 

                                    1 2510088 262.45                  262.45 

Aftermarket Parts 233775 -                 15w 

                                    1 710206 143.31                  143.31 

Eldorado 233772 -                 stock 

                                    2 710233 67.11                      67.11           81.35 

Vehicle Maintenance 233763 -                 stock  stock 



DUE:  11/22/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Vehicle 
Maintenance

Battery 
Service

Triangle 
Radiator

Coffman SPX-
Genfare - 
NO BID

Suburban 
Truck

Neopart Kirks Translite Prevost Crossline Eldorado CBM Interstate 
Power

Mohawk Aftermarket 
Parts

Cummins Muncie

Pace RFQ# 422208

                                    1 810215 21.50                      21.50 

Eldorado 233772 -                 1w 

                                    4 410095 102.41                  102.41         182.96         107.99 105.10       

Neopart 233768 -                 8w  stock  stock stock

                                    1 310049 2.59                          2.59 

Eldorado 233772 -                 stock 

                                    2 410103 33.33                      68.21           33.33 

Aftermarket Parts 233775 -                 stock  stock 

                                    1 1710107 4,556.79          4,556.79 

Aftermarket Parts 233775 -                 14w 

                                    1 710321 556.84                  556.84 

Eldorado 233772 -                 8w 

                                    4 1010075 107.61                  107.71         137.36 107.61       121.05       

Cummins 233776 -                 stock  5w 3d 30d

                                    1 710366 1,555.34          1,555.34 

Eldorado 233772 -                 6w 

                                    4 710380 732.98                  733.08     1,049.77 732.98       833.95       

Cummins 233776 -                 stock  stock stock 65d

                                    1 2110188 226.01                  226.01 

Aftermarket Parts 233775 -                 10w 

                                    1 2110215 25.94                      25.94 

Aftermarket Parts 233775 -                 8w 

                                    3 2010085 199.45                  225.21         219.93 199.45       

Muncie 233777 -                
 unapproved 

part  stock 42d

                                    - 1010104 -                
 not 

available 

-                



DUE:  11/22/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Vehicle 
Maintenance

Battery 
Service

Triangle 
Radiator

Coffman SPX-
Genfare - 
NO BID

Suburban 
Truck

Neopart Kirks Translite Prevost Crossline Eldorado CBM Interstate 
Power

Mohawk Aftermarket 
Parts

Cummins Muncie

Pace RFQ# 422208

                                    - 1010105 -                
 not 

available 

-                

                                    - 1010106 -                
 not 

available 

-                

                                    - 1010107 -                
 not 

available 

-                

                                    1 210049 59.44                      59.44 

Aftermarket Parts 233775 -                 stock 

                                    3 1310043 2.74                          2.74             3.20 2.99           

Coffman 233766 -                 stock  stock 21d

                                    1 810421 32.69                      32.69 

Aftermarket Parts 233775 -                 stock 

                                    2 1810100 210.56                  488.82         210.56 

Aftermarket Parts 233775 -                 6w  stock 


	422208

