
due:  10/25/2022

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Vehicle 

Maintenance
A&A Auto Curved 

Glass
Coffman Neopart Kirks Interstate 

Power
Muncie Cummins Rome 

Truck
P&G Suburban 

Truck
Hydraulic 
Electric

Translite Aftermarket 
Parts

Prevost Mohawk Eldorado Gillig

                                    3 220351 56.79                      56.79           63.38           60.65 

Muncie 233707 -                 stock  5w  stock 

                                    5 170528 162.50                  237.00         163.43         162.50         240.44         419.21 

Translite 233710 -                 stock  14d  stock  stock  stock 

                                    3 170535 30.22                      34.17           36.97           30.22 

Aftermarket Parts 233712 -                 35d  stock  stock 

                                    1 160795 7.90              7.90           

Eldorado 233715 stock

                                    5 151458 160.71                  218.02         197.25         245.73 388.00               160.71 

Aftermarket Parts 233712 -                 stock  5w  40d stock
 no part # 
identified 

                                    3 200522 19.33                      37.50           58.65 19.33         

Mohawk 233714 -                 90d  5w  stock 

                                    6 200548 19.70                      19.70           20.00           23.15           20.66 20.54         24.42         

Neopart 233704 -                 4w  35d  5w  stock 4w stock

                                    4 160600 9.03                          9.57           10.01           13.56             9.03 

Gillig 233716 -                 stock  stock  65d  stock 

                                    4 210995 552.66                  599.13         802.24 552.70               552.66 

Gillig 233716 -                 14w  stock 3w  8w 

                                    1 170630 69.95                      69.95 

Translite 233710  stock 

                                    5 290028 22.51                      29.86           22.95           27.02 22.51                   29.50 

Mohawk 233714  stock  stock  stock stock  stock 

                                    6 290653 17.00                      22.50           17.00           22.45           28.62 35.61                   20.00 

Hydraulic Electric 233709  21d  stock  stock  35d 4w  stock 

                                    6 290537 187.05                  191.18         212.05         199.00         212.63         252.89         187.05 

Gillig 233716 3w  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                    3 220346 53.22                      56.13           58.46           53.22 

Pace RFQ# 422158



due:  10/25/2022

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Vehicle 

Maintenance
A&A Auto Curved 

Glass
Coffman Neopart Kirks Interstate 

Power
Muncie Cummins Rome 

Truck
P&G Suburban 

Truck
Hydraulic 
Electric

Translite Aftermarket 
Parts

Prevost Mohawk Eldorado Gillig

Pace RFQ# 422158

Gillig 233716 -                 stock  12w  6w 

                                    4 290289 11.00                      11.54           11.00           11.52           14.23 

Hydraulic Electric 233709 3w  stock  stock  stock 

                                    1 220228 18.31                      18.31 

Aftermarket Parts 233712  stock 

                                    3 160596 164.76                  174.93         184.91         164.76 

Gillig 233716 -                 stock  11w  4w 

                                    5 290484 2.85                          3.96             2.85             6.50             3.06 9.29           

Muncie 233707 -                 stock  stock  stock  5w 
 unapproved 

part 

                                    3 170615 222.85                  222.85         244.30         240.00 

Muncie 233707 -                 42d  8w  4w 

                                    9 200863 8.89                          8.89             9.17           15.22           10.52           10.90           10.52             9.15           17.40 9.40           

Aftermarket Parts 233712 -                
 part # not 
identified  2w  6w  5w  3d  stock  4w  25d 5w

                                    5 220345 28.05                      28.05           35.55           37.38           42.70           34.28 

Neopart 233704 -                 4w  stock  6w  80d  4w 

                                    3 220350 930.39                  943.98         988.12         930.39 

Gillig 233716 -                 175d  4w  6w 

                                    3 290647 99.80                      99.85         159.95           99.80 

Aftermarket Parts 233712 -                 35d  7d  stock 

                                    3 290644 48.50                      53.53           56.21           48.50 

Vehicle Maintenance 233703 -                 stock  35d 
 no part # 
identified 

                                    6 200622 54.94                    133.03           64.64         122.39           55.61         150.53 54.94         

Mohawk 233714 -                 3w  stock  stock  5w  stock stock

                                    4 160615 97.04                      99.65         105.37         131.68           97.04 

Gillig 233716 -                 stock  stock  35d  4w 

                                    5 200582 23.45                      99.99         102.10         107.96           97.39 23.45         

Prevost 233713 -                 4w  stock  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part 



due:  10/25/2022

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Vehicle 

Maintenance
A&A Auto Curved 

Glass
Coffman Neopart Kirks Interstate 

Power
Muncie Cummins Rome 

Truck
P&G Suburban 

Truck
Hydraulic 
Electric

Translite Aftermarket 
Parts

Prevost Mohawk Eldorado Gillig

Pace RFQ# 422158

                                    6 200537 10.40                      10.51           10.77           12.06           10.40 12.10                   10.75 

Prevost 233713 -                 stock  30d  stock  stock stock  stock 

                                    4 220129 1.98                          5.19             6.81             1.98 55.60         

Aftermarket Parts 233712 -                 2w  stock  6w 4w

                                    2 200919 26.69                      26.69           32.94 

Aftermarket Parts 233712 -                 8w  45d 

                                    - 290665 -                

-                

                                    4 200935 20.92                      21.03           23.59           20.92           23.02 

Cummins 233708 -                 stock  30d  stock  stock 

                                    3 160842 207.13                  207.13         304.00         214.20 

Aftermarket Parts 233712 -                 22w  105d  8w 

                                    4 200949 925.00              1,094.10         925.00     1,094.00     1,301.74 

Coffman 233705 -                 stock  R&R Only  3d  8w 

                                    6 290690 545.00                  554.37         615.51         599.00         621.84         733.30         545.00 

Gillig 233716 -                 3w  21d  stock  3w  35d  stock 

                                    4 170692 71.51                    111.91           77.58           98.71           71.51 

Gillig 233716 -                 30d  stock  55d  stock 

                                    - 200974 -                

-                

                                    5 220406 4.00                          4.00             8.45             8.53             9.49             9.99 

Kirks 233706 -                 stock  90d  stock  55d  stock 

                                    1 170706 395.08                  395.08 

Translite 233710 -                 stock 

                                    3 290695 43.50                      65.11           90.59           43.50 

Prevost 233713 -                 stock  25w  stock 

                                    4 290696 9.60                        29.55           27.83           15.33 9.60           



due:  10/25/2022

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Vehicle 

Maintenance
A&A Auto Curved 

Glass
Coffman Neopart Kirks Interstate 

Power
Muncie Cummins Rome 

Truck
P&G Suburban 

Truck
Hydraulic 
Electric

Translite Aftermarket 
Parts

Prevost Mohawk Eldorado Gillig

Pace RFQ# 422158

Prevost 233713 -                 45d  stock  25d 
 unapproved 

part 

                                    3 170715 755.37                  770.55         788.22         755.37 

Gillig 233716 -                 30d  7w  8w 

                                    2 170716 1,103.54          1,103.54     1,129.32 

Muncie 233707 -                 30d  8w 

                                    3 290700 171.70                  171.70         189.86         221.03 

Muncie 233707 -                 stock  24w  175d 

                                    3 290701 175.59                  175.60         175.59         223.89 

Availability - Muncie 233707 -                 stock  22w  175d 

                                    1 1710002 170.46                  170.46 

Aftermarket Parts 233712 -                 13w 

                                    3 1710015 35.85                      35.85           38.06           40.55 

Muncie 233707 -                 30d  5w  4w 

                                    3 2510000 341.40                  341.40         605.42         629.05 

Neopart 233704 -                 4w  13w  stock 

                                    5 1610013 90.06                    192.56         201.36         260.83 90.06                 178.76 

Gillig 233716 -                 90d  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock 

                                    1 1510007 24.21                      24.21 

Aftermarket Parts 233712 -                 stock 

                                    1 1510008 14.70                      14.70 

Aftermarket Parts 233712 -                 stock 

                                    4 1610018 34.39                      34.39           41.40           51.57           52.42 

Muncie 233707 -                 30d  stock  stock  4w 

                                    4 2010016 180.77                  185.59         192.02         209.17         180.77 

Prevost 233713 -                 4w  30d  stock  stock 

                                    5 2910003 2.20                          2.20             3.95             3.59             2.66             2.77 

Muncie 233707 -                 stock  MOQ  stock  stock  stock 



due:  10/25/2022

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Vehicle 

Maintenance
A&A Auto Curved 

Glass
Coffman Neopart Kirks Interstate 

Power
Muncie Cummins Rome 

Truck
P&G Suburban 

Truck
Hydraulic 
Electric

Translite Aftermarket 
Parts

Prevost Mohawk Eldorado Gillig

Pace RFQ# 422158

                                    4 2010020 13.84                      56.21           57.79           63.54 13.84         

Neopart 233704 -                 4w  30d  stock 
 unapproved 

part 

                                    6 2010021 27.41                    115.65         195.78         320.00         215.20 27.41                 185.00 

Neopart 233704 -                 4w  30d  stock  5w 
 unapproved 

part  4w 

                                    3 1610045 17.88                      18.64           27.32           17.88 

Gillig 233716 -                 stock  105d  4w 

                                    3 2210004 3,814.29          3,956.98     4,234.90 3,814.29   

Eldorado 233715 -                 165d  7w 6w

                                    3 2210006 2,401.61          2,401.61     2,556.68     2,508.11 

Muncie 233707 -                 stock  stock  8w 

                                    2 2510014 5.10                          5.10           84.65 

Muncie 233707 -                 stock  7w 

                                    3 2910007 43.73                      43.73           58.45 83.82         

Muncie 233707 -                 120d  stock 12w

                                    - 2110026 -                

-                

                                    3 2110037 547.44              1,776.12     1,972.23 547.44       

Mohawk 233714 -                 21d  9w 4w

                                    2 2910015 19.19                      19.19 27.65         

Aftermarket Parts 233712 -                 stock stock

                                    5 2210021 1,225.00          1,380.00     1,355.81     1,354.31     1,424.99     1,225.00 

Gillig 233716 -                 11w  75d  12w  105d  16w 

                                    1 1710052 47.18            47.18         

Eldorado 233715 -                3w

                                    1 1710053 81.00            81.00         

Eldorado 233715 -                3w

                                    2 2210022 87.32                      88.60           87.32 



due:  10/25/2022

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Vehicle 

Maintenance
A&A Auto Curved 

Glass
Coffman Neopart Kirks Interstate 

Power
Muncie Cummins Rome 

Truck
P&G Suburban 

Truck
Hydraulic 
Electric

Translite Aftermarket 
Parts

Prevost Mohawk Eldorado Gillig

Pace RFQ# 422158

Aftermarket Parts 233712 -                 stock  7w 

                                    1 1810033 182.79          182.79       

Eldorado 233715 -                stock

                                    1 1510084 122.37                  122.37 

Aftermarket Parts 233712 -                 stock 

                                    5 2010041 2,132.00          2,249.42     3,003.01     2,132.00     2,949.32     3,262.07 

Kirks 233706 -                 90d  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                    1 2010043 4.14                          4.14 

Aftermarket Parts 233712 -                 stock 

                                    - 1510106 -                

-                

                                    2 2110070 28.30                      48.24 28.30         

Mohawk 233714 -                 8w 14d

                                    4 2910023 188.56                  188.56         210.20 416.14               225.00 

Neopart 233704 -                 3w  stock 4w  8w 

                                    3 2110085 416.77                  416.77         449.00 429.70       

Muncie 233707 -                 30d  stock 60d

                                    3 2210028 321.18                  321.18         351.52 1,222.06   

Muncie 233707 -                 90d  10w 20w

                                    1 2910030 322.38                  322.38 

Aftermarket Parts 233712 -                 stock 

                                    1 2910031 321.38                  321.38 

Aftermarket Parts 233712 -                 stock 

                                    1 1510173 90.16            90.16         

Eldorado 233715 -                stock

                                    2 1510175 21.55                      21.55 24.69         

Aftermarket Parts 233712 -                 16w stock



due:  10/25/2022

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Vehicle 

Maintenance
A&A Auto Curved 

Glass
Coffman Neopart Kirks Interstate 

Power
Muncie Cummins Rome 

Truck
P&G Suburban 

Truck
Hydraulic 
Electric

Translite Aftermarket 
Parts

Prevost Mohawk Eldorado Gillig

Pace RFQ# 422158

                                    2 2510104 207.10                  214.36         207.10 

Gillig 233716 -                 10d  2w 

                                    5 2210034 1,225.00          1,380.00     1,356.56     1,541.53 1,586.80       1,225.00 

Gillig 233716 -                 stock  30d  34w 8w  14w 

                                    2 2910036 72.13                      80.22           72.13 

Aftermarket Parts 233712 -                 120d  stock 

                                    1 1710083 681.61                  681.61 

Aftermarket Parts 233712 -                 7w 

                                    1 1610153 254.82                  254.82 

Aftermarket Parts 233712 -                 stock 

                                    1 1610158 59.79            59.79         

Eldorado 233715 -                6w

                                    2 1810083 2,400.00          3,389.85     2,400.00 

Gillig 233716 -                 15w  12w 

                                    1 2910056 1,531.78          1,531.78 

Aftermarket Parts 233712 -                 stock 

                                    1 1510276 21.31            21.31         

Eldorado 233715 -                2w

                                    3 1610186 166.78                     166.78         257.91         200.00 

Aftermarket Parts 233712 -                 stock  stock  4w 

                                    2 2210066 374.75                  374.75         440.88 

Muncie 233707 -                 63d  stock 

                                    1 2010083 198.42          198.42       

Eldorado 233715 -                10w

                                    2 2910072 76.98                      76.98         108.57 

Muncie 233707 -                 90d  4w 

                                    1 2910074 428.14                  428.14 



due:  10/25/2022

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Vehicle 

Maintenance
A&A Auto Curved 

Glass
Coffman Neopart Kirks Interstate 

Power
Muncie Cummins Rome 

Truck
P&G Suburban 

Truck
Hydraulic 
Electric

Translite Aftermarket 
Parts

Prevost Mohawk Eldorado Gillig

Pace RFQ# 422158

Aftermarket Parts 233712 -                 5w 

                                    1 2910075 474.31                  474.31 

Aftermarket Parts 233712 -                 8w 

                                    - 1610206 -                

-                

                                    - 1610207 -                

-                

                                    1 1510327 27.89                      27.89 

Neopart 233704 -                 4w 

                                    - 1710153 -                

-                

                                    1 160590 12.79            12.79         

Eldorado 233715 -                1w

                                    1 151960 7.53              7.53           

Eldorado 233715 -                stock

                                    1 290663 59.87            59.87         

Eldorado 233715 -                stock

                                    1 180819 20.24            20.24         

Eldorado 233715 -                4w

                                    1 250709 64.68            64.68         

Eldorado 233715 -                stock

                                    1 152079 273.89          273.89       

Eldorado 233715 -                stock

                                    1 1610081 49.38            49.38         

Eldorado 233715 -                4w

                                    1 2110082 54.93            54.93         

Eldorado 233715 -                2w



due:  10/25/2022

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Vehicle 

Maintenance
A&A Auto Curved 

Glass
Coffman Neopart Kirks Interstate 

Power
Muncie Cummins Rome 

Truck
P&G Suburban 

Truck
Hydraulic 
Electric

Translite Aftermarket 
Parts

Prevost Mohawk Eldorado Gillig

Pace RFQ# 422158

                                    1 1610099 538.20          538.20       

Eldorado 233715 -                2w

                                    1 1510313 80.73            80.73         

Eldorado 233715 -                3w


	422158

