
due:  10/21/2022

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Vehicle 
Maintenance

Rome Truck- 
NO BID

Kirks Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Prevost Muncie Neopart Aftermarket 
Parts

Mohawk Eldorado CBM Gillig

                                    6 41237 106.96                  139.26         110.26         106.96         122.02         108.42         107.25 

Neopart 233704 -                  30d  35d  4w  6w  4w  stock 

                                    5 41131 49.50                      61.20         119.89         101.18         115.76           49.50 

Mohawk 233714 -                  14d  63d  stock  9w  21d 

                                    7 40106 2.05                         29.35             9.17             2.35             7.27             7.61             2.05             7.40 

Mohawk 233714 -                  stock  30d  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                    5 40932 0.62                           2.30             2.22             1.85             2.17             0.62 

Mohawk 233714 stock  21d  stock  stock  stock 

                                    3 20701 250.95                  451.65         398.83         250.95 

Eldorado 233715 -                  63d  17w  stock 

                                    6 40109 1.30                           2.51             3.60             3.08             3.40             1.30             3.63 

Mohawk 233714 -                  stock  stock 
 MOQ 20, 
need 12  stock  7w  stock 

                                    5 40504 1.05                           2.10             1.94             1.57             1.70             1.05 

Mohawk 233714 -                  25d  21d  stock  5w  stock 

                                    6 41238 105.98                  139.26         110.88         105.98         126.85         108.34         125.00 

Neopart 233704 -                  20d  21d  4w  6w  4w  4w 

Pace RFQ# 422153



due:  10/21/2022

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Vehicle 
Maintenance

Rome Truck- 
NO BID

Kirks Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Prevost Muncie Neopart Aftermarket 
Parts

Mohawk Eldorado CBM Gillig

Pace RFQ# 422153

                                    7 40798 107.83                  169.24         126.95         107.83         118.24         127.96         237.67         123.71 

Neopart 233704 -                  230d  28d  stock  7w  21d  4w  stock 

                                    8 40953 13.60                      15.05           46.95           49.89           25.60           22.09           13.60           36.89           14.75 

Aftermarket Parts 233712  stock  stock 30d
 bid 18, 
need 20  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                    6 41213 172.13                  236.33         202.16         172.13         191.66         197.13         182.80 

Aftermarket Parts 233712 80d  119d  stock 
 unapproved 

part  16w  stock 

                                    6 41217 91.71                    210.20           97.19         111.37           91.71         109.43         227.50 

Aftermarket Parts 233712 50d  21d  6w  stock  stock  4w 

                                    5 10405 133.28                  175.57         145.02         135.70         253.82         133.28 

Gillig 233716  70d  stock  60d  stock  6w 

                                    6 40907 55.50                    108.83           65.39           87.05           90.80           55.50           86.64 

Mohawk 233714 -                  60d  stock  stock  stock  stock  4w 

                                    6 40079 8.10                         22.13           18.49           17.90           20.02             8.10           18.89 

Mohawk 233714 30d  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                    3 40185 24.50                      87.02           24.50           59.62 

Mohawk 233714  26w  stock  12w 



due:  10/21/2022

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Vehicle 
Maintenance

Rome Truck- 
NO BID

Kirks Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Prevost Muncie Neopart Aftermarket 
Parts

Mohawk Eldorado CBM Gillig

Pace RFQ# 422153

                                    4 41132 49.50                    118.67         101.18         114.75           49.50 

Mohawk 233714 -                  63d  stock  9w  stock 

                                    5 20708 104.92                  141.60         129.88         104.92         118.60         235.47 

Neopart 233704 -                  25d  35d  stock  6w  stock 

                                    3 30421 127.98                  129.45         236.76         127.98 

Gillig 233716 -                  stock  2w  4w 

                                    6 41273 38.30                      48.51           43.25           38.30           40.91           45.84           78.38 

Neopart 233704 -                  55d  35d  stock  stock  4w  6w 

                                    3 10416 259.16                  593.90         497.43         259.16 

Eldorado 233715 -                  35d  5w  stock 

                                    8 30161 23.20                      25.12           51.90           37.42           23.87           45.64           23.20           44.43           24.50 

Aftermarket Parts 233712 -                  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                    6 41332 320.51                  429.66         498.15         457.16         320.51         468.31         450.00 

Prevost 233713 -                  stock  35d  22w 
 unaproved 

part  21d  12w 

                                    1 110003 302.72                  302.72 

Eldorado 233715 -                  6w 



due:  10/21/2022

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Vehicle 
Maintenance

Rome Truck- 
NO BID

Kirks Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Prevost Muncie Neopart Aftermarket 
Parts

Mohawk Eldorado CBM Gillig

Pace RFQ# 422153

                                    5 410002 954.86                  983.58         954.86         982.62     1,564.52     2,487.46 

Neopart 233704 -                  30d  stock  5w  5w  stock 

                                    5 410003 192.51                  235.00         197.38         192.51         219.33         212.52 

Neopart 233704 -                  30d  30d  4w  6w  5w 

                                    7 410010 128.39                  261.48         148.98         192.73         155.17         128.39         851.98         175.00 

Muncie 233707 -                  25d  30d  stock  5w 
 unapproved 

part  1w  stock 

                                    5 410012 102.56                  233.82         237.80         236.05         102.56         210.00 

Gillig 233716 -                  stock  10w  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock 

                                    5 410023 62.78                      89.43           73.52           62.78           74.69           91.48 

Neopart 233704 -                  45d  37d  stock  stock  5w 

                                    6 410024 278.62                  516.49         282.12         278.62         324.48         309.22         288.52 

Neopart 233704 -                  45d  stock  4w  stock  5w  stock 

                                    3 110014 121.55                  128.09         199.85         121.55 

Gillig 233716 -                  9w  stock  8w 

                                    1 310009 132.18                  132.18 

Aftermarket Parts 233712 -                  5w 



due:  10/21/2022

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Vehicle 
Maintenance

Rome Truck- 
NO BID

Kirks Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Prevost Muncie Neopart Aftermarket 
Parts

Mohawk Eldorado CBM Gillig

Pace RFQ# 422153

                                    3 310012 80.22                      80.22           99.31         113.09 

Neopart 233704 -                  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part 

                                    1 310013 107.42                  107.42 

Aftermarket Parts 233712 -                  stock 

                                    5 410035 458.43                  596.90         473.73         458.43         522.95         479.66 

Neopart 233704 -                  50d  30d  4w  6w  5w 

                                    1 110022 39.48                      39.48 

Eldorado 233715 -                  stock 

                                    1 110026 98.75                      98.75 

Eldorado 233715 -                  2w 

                                    5 410080 327.02              1,254.26         915.27         596.59         327.02         490.57 

Mohawk 233714 -                  75d  8w  10w  stock  stock 

                                    1 310039 773.45                  773.45 

Eldorado 233715 -                  6w 

                                    1 310040 868.57                  868.57 

Eldorado 233715 -                  4w 



due:  10/21/2022

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Vehicle 
Maintenance

Rome Truck- 
NO BID

Kirks Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Prevost Muncie Neopart Aftermarket 
Parts

Mohawk Eldorado CBM Gillig

Pace RFQ# 422153

                                    5 410081 5.59                           7.32             6.47             5.59             6.28             6.25 

Neopart 233704 -                  70d  30d  stock  stock  stock 

                                    1 110070 42.07                      42.07 

Aftermarket Parts 233712 -                  stock 

                                    3 310057 259.60                  378.09         265.35         259.60 

Mohawk 233704 -                  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part 

                                     - 30045 -                 

-                 

                                    1 410046 45.00                      45.00 

Kirks 233706 -                  stock 

                                     - 410048 -                 

-                 


	422153

