
DUE 08/26/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Hydraulic 
Electric

Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Muncie Neopart Gillig Prevost Mohawk Aftermarket 
Parts

Vehicle 
Maintenance - 

NO BID

Eldorado

                                  4 290415 534.01                593.66        534.01        561.88        593.97 

Neopart 233604 -                 65d  3w  stock  stock 

                                  4 180669 180.00                180.00        227.69        192.99        456.73 

Gillig 233605 -                 10w  120d  11w  6w 

                                  3 250583 452.25                459.52        452.25        501.17 

Gillig 233605 -                 10d  4w  7w 

                                  1 160590 12.79                     12.79 

Eldorado 233612  2w 

                                  6 290028 23.00                     29.86          32.13          29.99          27.02          23.09          23.00 

Aftermarket Parts 233610 -                 stock  3w  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock 

                                  1 170622 305.39                305.39 

Eldorado 233612 -                 4w 

                                  3 170625 231.62                241.01        231.62        614.41 

Aftermarket Parts 233610 -                 3w  stock  stock 

                                  4 290658 127.00                129.22        127.00        151.66        160.03 

Pace RFQ# 422028



DUE 08/26/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Hydraulic 
Electric

Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Muncie Neopart Gillig Prevost Mohawk Aftermarket 
Parts

Vehicle 
Maintenance - 

NO BID

Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 422028

Gillig 233605 -                 21d  stock  stock  7w 

                                  6 150830 0.29                          0.29             0.56             0.60             0.57             0.31             0.46 

Muncie 233609 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock  stock  2w 

                                  3 160596 164.76                178.99        164.76        174.64 

Gillig 233605  45d  stock  stock 

                                  1 290663 59.87                     59.87 

Eldorado 233612  stock 

                                  1 152006 25.75                     25.75 

Eldorado 233612  stock 

                                  4 160847 115.92                136.60        135.00        170.68        115.92 

Aftermarket Parts 233610  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                  3 152032 138.88                138.88        148.24        298.21 

Muncie 233609 -                 stock  2w  stock 

                                  6 290690 545.00                601.00        616.10        549.11        545.00        621.84     1,267.26 

Gillig 233605  14d  21d 3w  stock  3w  1w 



DUE 08/26/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Hydraulic 
Electric

Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Muncie Neopart Gillig Prevost Mohawk Aftermarket 
Parts

Vehicle 
Maintenance - 

NO BID

Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 422028

                                  3 290695 65.11                     65.11          85.59        110.18 

Muncie 233609  stock  25w  stock 

                                  4 290696 9.60                       29.55             9.60          20.73          53.94 

Availability - Muncie 233609 -                 stock 
 unapproved 

part  6w  12w 

                                  4 170715 728.24                770.55        735.37        728.24     1,155.60 

Aftermarket Parts 233610 -                 30d  10w  7w  4w 

                                  3 170716 1,103.54          1,103.54     1,129.32     1,725.96 

Muncie 233609 -                 30d  8w  stock 

                                  2 290697 9.40                          9.40          17.51 

Muncie 233609 -                 stock  stock 

                                  3 290700 171.72                173.03        171.72        300.63 

Aftermarket Parts 233610 -                 stock  26w  stock 

                                  3 290701 175.65                176.76        175.65        300.63 

Aftermarket Parts 233610 -                 30d  26w  stock 

                                  4 170718 66.09                     66.52          76.55          66.09        104.41 



DUE 08/26/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Hydraulic 
Electric

Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Muncie Neopart Gillig Prevost Mohawk Aftermarket 
Parts

Vehicle 
Maintenance - 

NO BID

Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 422028

Aftermarket Parts 233610 -                 stock  10w  5w  stock 

                                  1 170722 88.41                     88.41 

Eldorado 233612 -                 2w 

                                  4 1710014 22.69                     22.75          23.99          22.69          56.17 

Aftermarket Parts 233610 -                 21d  stock  stock  stock 

                                  3 1810001 434.67                434.67        604.40        464.55 

Gillig 233605 -                 stock  stock  stock 

                                  3 2510000 341.40                341.40        635.00        605.42 

Neopart 233604 -                 3w  stock  stock 

                                  2 2510001 1,468.84          1,639.45     1,468.84 

Aftermarket Parts 233610 -                 stock  stock 

                                  2 2510002 1,612.83          1,612.83     1,728.04 

Gillig 233605 -                 8w  13w 

                                  5 1610013 103.77                192.66        178.76        103.77        188.09        418.56 

Gillig 233605 -                 stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part  8w  12w 



DUE 08/26/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Hydraulic 
Electric

Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Muncie Neopart Gillig Prevost Mohawk Aftermarket 
Parts

Vehicle 
Maintenance - 

NO BID

Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 422028

                                  3 1610017 145.42                152.66        145.42        154.15 

Gillig 233605 -                 90d  4w  stock 

                                  3 2510009 18.13                     18.13          20.39          20.08 

Neopart 233604 -                 10d  stock  9w 

                                  3 2510025 75.82                     77.18          75.82          87.00 

Gillig 233605 -                 10d  stock  stock 

                                  2 2910015 18.05                     18.05          27.65 

Aftermarket Parts 233610 -                 stock  stock 

                                  3 2510042 13.62                     13.62          13.68          14.20 

Neopart 233604 -                 10d  2w  5w 

                                  3 2510048 72.08                     72.08          82.41          82.41 

Neopart 233604 -                 10d  4w  stock 

                                  2 2510049 40.78                     40.78          45.24 

Neopart 233604 -                 10d  4w 

                                   - 1610078 -                



DUE 08/26/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Hydraulic 
Electric

Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Muncie Neopart Gillig Prevost Mohawk Aftermarket 
Parts

Vehicle 
Maintenance - 

NO BID

Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 422028

-                

                                  1 1610086 8.64                          8.64 

Eldorado 233612 -                 2w 

                                  5 2910026 1,069.39          1,150.00     1,183.88     1,077.83     1,069.39     1,206.75 

Gillig 233605 -                 14d  30d 3w  stock  stock 

                                  3 2510067 920.00                974.75        920.00     1,137.01 

Gillig 233605 -                 10d  4w  7w 

                                  1 1610099 538.20                538.20 

Eldorado 233612 -                 2w 

                                  2 2510088 232.28                232.28        235.82 

Gillig 233605 -                 12w  8w 

                                  1 2510111 683.40                683.40 

Aftermarket Parts 233610 -                 stock 

                                  2 1610115 1,773.97          2,112.95     1,773.97 

Aftermarket Parts 233610 -                 6w  stock 



DUE 08/26/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Hydraulic 
Electric

Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Muncie Neopart Gillig Prevost Mohawk Aftermarket 
Parts

Vehicle 
Maintenance - 

NO BID

Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 422028

                                  3 1610066 255.00                255.00        345.11        275.68 

Gillig 233605 -                 12w  90d  10w 

                                  1 1710083 681.61                681.61 

Aftermarket Parts 233610 -                 stock 

                                  1 1710084 708.50                708.50 

Aftermarket Parts 233610 -                 stock 

                                  3 2510163 33.97                     33.97          36.12          41.67 

Neopart 233604 -                 10d  2w  5w 

                                  2 1810083 2,400.00          2,400.00     2,655.53 

Gillig 233605 -                 12w  15w 

                                  1 1510241 217.36                217.36 

Aftermarket Parts 233610 -                 10w 

                                  1 1510242 278.29                278.29 

Aftermarket Parts 233610 -                 4w 

                                  1 1510249 581.10                581.10 



DUE 08/26/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Hydraulic 
Electric

Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Muncie Neopart Gillig Prevost Mohawk Aftermarket 
Parts

Vehicle 
Maintenance - 

NO BID

Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 422028

Aftermarket Parts 233610 -                 8w 

                                  1 1510265 134.18                134.18 

Aftermarket Parts 233610 -                 stock 

                                  1 1510266 1,400.17          1,400.17 

Aftermarket Parts 233610 -                 5w 

                                  4 1810087 8.96                       16.26          18.40             8.96          13.02 

Aftermarket Parts 233610 -                 7d  8w 
 unapproved 

part  stock 

                                  4 2910070 11.00                     11.00 22.75          14.00          22.99 

Hydraulic Electric 233614 -                 stock  30d  stock  2w 

                                  2 1610194 156.47                165.47        156.47 

Aftermarket Parts 233610 -                 4w  10w 

                                  1 1610199 2.36                          2.36 

Aftermarket Parts 233610 -                 stock 

                                  1 1610200 2.36                          2.36 

Aftermarket Parts 233610 -                 stock 



DUE 08/26/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Hydraulic 
Electric

Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Muncie Neopart Gillig Prevost Mohawk Aftermarket 
Parts

Vehicle 
Maintenance - 

NO BID

Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 422028

                                  1 2510189 42.46                     42.46 

Aftermarket Parts 233610 -                 5w 

                                  2 2510190 6.62                          6.62             8.93 

Neopart 233604 -                 10d  5w 

                                  2 2510191 6.90                          6.90             9.37 

Neopart 233604 -                 10d  5w 

                                  3 2510194 262.68                331.72        262.68        378.67 

Gillig 233605 -                 10d  4w  4w 

                                  3 2510195 259.35                259.35        262.68        296.05 

Neopart 233604 -                 10d  4w  4w 


	422028

