DUE 08/26/22 Pace RFQ# 422026

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
- J [ |/ ' | | . | | | | | | | | |
Sku Winning bid Rome Interstate | Hydraulic |lllinois Auto| Prevost Neopart Coffman Kirks Crossline | Suburban | Mohawk | Aftermarket | Cummins Vehicle Gillig Eldorado
Truck-NO | Power Electric Truck Parts Maintenance |

NO # of Bids BID NO BID

6 130628 3.54 4.18 3.58 3.54 5.77 4.06 3.92

unapproved

Coffman 233616 - stock stock part stock stock 30d

4 200334 4.31 6.47 431 10.50 10.95
Aftermarket Parts 233610 - 90d stock stock 21d

4 200520 9.46 35.77 15.30 9.46 34.88
Aftermarket Parts 233610 - stock stock 5w stock

2 200522 19.33 19.33 58.73
Mohawk 233608 stock 5w

6 130581 47.53 60.17 47.53 48.73 63.59 58.50 54.38
Coffman 233608 - stock stock stock 4w stock stock

2 110098 2.39 7.27 2.39

no lead

Aftermarket Parts 233610 - time given stock

5 130613 2.49 17.24 14.73 2.49 24.02 15.40

unapproved

Muncie 233609 - 5d stock part stock stock

3 210995 476.90 476.90 582.00 599.13
lllinois Auto 233620 - stock 8w 14w

4 220336 217.23 270.27 233.75 217.23 471.94
Muncie 233609 - stock stock stock 8w

3 210993 673.62 673.62 745.83 855.99
lllinois Auto 233620 6w 3w stock

5 200679 25.85 78.44 74.86 25.85 68.40 61.42
Mohawk 233608 75d 8w stock stock stock

4 120440 1.44 1.44 1.73 1.44 1.69
Coffman 233616 stock stock 5d 21d

1 200813 2.60 2.60




DUE 08/26/22 Pace RFQ# 422026

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
-/ ' | | | [ | | | '/ | | | | |
Sku Winning bid Rome Interstate | Hydraulic |lllinois Auto| Prevost Neopart Coffman Kirks Crossline | Suburban | Mohawk | Aftermarket | Cummins Vehicle Gillig Eldorado
Truck-NO | Power Electric Truck Parts Maintenance |
NO # of Bids BID NO BID
Aftermarket Parts 233610 stock
1 110138 7.28 7.28
Eldorado 233612 - stock
6 130611 198.83 310.48 265.27 209.00 198.83 313.55 270.96
Mohawk 233608 stock stock stock stock stock 21d
7 200622 55.61 124.00 140.94 149.99 120.16 58.82 55.61 56.56
Aftermarket Parts 233610 stock 3w stock stock iw 3w stock
3 140064 32.00 32.00 90.90 83.25
Mohawk 233608 - stock stock stock
4 110084 6.13 7.00 7.65 7.50 6.13
Muncie 233609 - stock stock stock stock
5 200582 23.45 99.99 23.45 107.96 100.80 46.41
Mohawk 233608 - 4w stock stock 30d stock
3 110058 2.86 2.86 5.51 6.60
Mohawk 233608 - 30d stock 21d
6 200913 12.75 18.58 19.76 21.96 13.31 12.75 13.75
Gillig 233605 - 6w stock 2w stock stock stock
6 100223 62.33 116.38 64.00 62.33 134.76 116.38 106.98
unapproved bid 9, need
Crossline 233617 - stock stock part w stock 18
3 220365 42.82 49.88 58.66 42.82
Muncie 233609 - stock 4w 30d
3 120502 106.14 138.79 120.00 106.14
Muncie 233609 - stock stock stock
3 211036 626.72 626.72 784.69 774.16
lllinois Auto 233620 - 6w 6w 10w




DUE 08/26/22 Pace RFQ# 422026

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
- J [ |/ ' | | . | | | | | | | | |
Sku Winning bid Rome Interstate | Hydraulic |lllinois Auto| Prevost Neopart Coffman Kirks Crossline | Suburban | Mohawk | Aftermarket | Cummins Vehicle Gillig Eldorado
Truck-NO | Power Electric Truck Parts Maintenance |

NO # of Bids BID NO BID

2 120509 23.61 23.61 29.30
Coffman 233616 - 90d 4w

3 200932 40.20 40.20 54.28 188.44
Aftermarket Parts 233610 - stock stock stock

4 200935 21.02 21.02 23.16 21.02 23.58
Coffman 233616 - stock stock stock 21d

4 211064 1,668.67 1,668.67 1,953.00 | 2,042.95 1,955.36

no lead

Illinois Auto 233620 - 8w 6w time given 60d

4 200949 900.00 1,094.10 900.00 1,250.26 1,229.29
Kirks 233603 - stock stock 8w 21d

200951 481.82 677.07 649.14 767.59 691.19 481.82

Eldorado 233612 - 4w 4w stock 30d stock

1 200956 176.77 176.77
Eldorado 233612 - stock

6 200964 8.40 41.71 8.40 41.38 43.38 37.57 47.10
Mohawk 233608 - stock 2w stock stock 30d stock

1 200974 94.60 94.60
Eldorado 233612 - stock

2 200977 34.24 34.24 106.41
Aftermarket Parts 233610 - 4w stock

5 120548 0.98 2.55 0.98 2.96 2.55 3.05

unapproved

Coffman 233616 - stock part stock stock 30d

4 211114 35.36 35.36 41.46 40.02 40.40
lllinois Auto 233620 - stock stock stock 21d

3 2010004 8.56 34.63 33.68 8.56




DUE 08/26/22 Pace RFQ# 422026
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
-/ ' | | | [ | | | '/ | | | | |
Sku Winning bid Rome Interstate | Hydraulic |lllinois Auto| Prevost Neopart | Coffman Kirks Crossline | Suburban | Mohawk | Aftermarket | Cummins Vehicle Gillig Muncie Eldorado
Truck - NO Power Electric Truck Parts Maintenance
NO # of Bids BID NO BID
Eldorado 233612 - 5w 30d stock
1210002 29.72 32.32 30.42 32.32 29.72 32.49 33.69
no lead
Mohawk 233608 - 14d stock stock stock time given stock
1410000 857.14 857.14 987.52
Aftermarket Parts 233610 - stock stock
1010002 4.50 4.50 7.99 4.50 12.25
Aftermarket Parts 233610 - stock stock stock stock
1010006 36.83 36.83
Eldorado 233612 - stock
1010007 199.97 199.97
Eldorado 233612 - stock
2210002 895.47 910.00 1,073.74 895.47 | 1,277.36
Muncie 233609 - 90d 28w 90d stock
2210004 3,814.29 3,873.07 3,814.29
Eldorado 233612 - 7w 8w
1210011 85.16 85.16 224.91
Aftermarket Parts 233610 - Aw 2w
1210016 1,506.46 1,978.67 1,506.46
Eldorado 233612 - 2w 10w
1010014 3.04 10.65 3.04 6.50 12.12 10.65 3.40
unapproved
Kirks 233603 - stock stock part stock stock stock
2110019 292.32 292.32 365.00 375.77 320.00 340.89
no lead
Illinois Auto 233620 - 6w 3w time given stock 21d
2110021 437.78 437.78 489.50 559.52 485.73 513.13
Illinois Auto 233620 - stock stock stock 6w 21d




DUE 08/26/22 Pace RFQ# 422026

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
- J [ |/ ' | | . | | | | | | | | |
Sku Winning bid Rome Interstate | Hydraulic |lllinois Auto| Prevost Neopart Coffman Kirks Crossline | Suburban | Mohawk | Aftermarket | Cummins Vehicle Gillig Eldorado
Truck-NO | Power Electric Truck Parts Maintenance |
NO # of Bids BID NO BID
6 | 1010015 988.00 1,145.00| 1,670.38 988.00 1,050.54| 1,899.19 1,423.52
Kirks 233603 - 10d stock stock stock 13w 21d
3 | 1010016 2,752.80 2,752.80 3,168.08 3,191.80
Coffman 233616 - stock w 30d
4 211034 63.76 63.76 65.34 81.02 74.68
lllinois Auto 233620 - stock stock stock 21d
2 | 1210024 180.02 180.02 370.32
Aftermarket Parts 233610 - 6w 3w
4| 2210018 7.30 8.86 14.38 7.69 7.30
Muncie 233609 - 90d 4w stock 65d
1| 1310009 120.97 120.97
Eldorado 233612 - stock
5| 1210033 29.23 33.73 29.50 29.23 36.26 49.44
Mohawk 233608 - 6w 90d 3w 8w 30d
3 | 1010024 68.93 68.93 75.54 75.77
Coffman 233616 - stock 7w 30d
6 | 1010025 3.75 9.92 3.75 7.71 10.43 12.79 11.15
unapproved
Kirks 233603 - stock stock part stock stock 30d
5| 1010026 14.97 22.13 22.96 20.85 17.04 14.97
Muncie 233609 - 75d stock stock 8w 85d
2 | 1210038 2,485.38 2,485.38 2,882.64
Coffman 233616 - stock w
2 | 2110064| 10,601.59 10,601.59 28,107.45
lllinois Auto 233620 - 8w 18w
6 | 1010028 5.75 13.83 5.75 7.79 13.83 15.72 15.70




DUE 08/26/22 Pace RFQ# 422026
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
-/ ' | | | [ | | | '/ | | | | |
Sku Winning bid Rome Interstate | Hydraulic |lllinois Auto| Prevost Neopart | Coffman Kirks Crossline | Suburban | Mohawk | Aftermarket | Cummins Vehicle Gillig Muncie Eldorado
Truck - NO Power Electric Truck Parts Maintenance
NO # of Bids BID NO BID
Kirks 233603 - stock stock stock stock stock 30d
1010032 65.00 79.65 132.96 65.00 65.43 147.87 132.96 121.21
unapproved
Crossline 233617 - stock stock stock part stock stock stock
1010036 107.71 107.71 126.29 122.40
Coffman 233616 - stock 7w 30d
1210055 0.30 0.30
Eldorado 233612 - stock
2110074 1,659.84 1,659.84 2,499.48 1,997.29
Illinois Auto 233620 - 8w 20w 7w
1210070 57.67 66.44 57.67 64.18 74.10 64.91 70.55 72.93
bid 34,
Coffman 233616 - stock stock stock 3w 10d 4w need 36
2110079 1,239.64 1,239.64 1,612.32
lllinois Auto 233620 - stock Sw
1210077 387.77 420.00 397.48 455.08 397.48 387.77
Muncie 233609 - stock stock w stock stock
1210078 1,357.84 1,357.84
Eldorado 233612 - 12w
1010044 247.11 247.11 254.00 276.14 247.11 280.81
Coffman 233616 - stock stock 5w stock 4w
1210091 958.00 1,231.32 958.00 1,367.39 1,327.33
Crossline 233617 - stock stock stock 21d
1210096 120.00 120.00 127.94 121.00 148.42 150.01 127.94 145.33
Hydraulic Electric 233614 - stock stock stock 30d 7w 10d 30d
2110136 138.08 138.08 168.67
Illinois Auto 233620 - stock stock




DUE 08/26/22 Pace RFQ# 422026

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
- J [ |/ ' | | . | | | | | | | | |
Sku Winning bid Rome Interstate | Hydraulic |lllinois Auto| Prevost Neopart Coffman Kirks Crossline | Suburban | Mohawk | Aftermarket | Cummins Vehicle Gillig Eldorado
Truck-NO | Power Electric Truck Parts Maintenance |

NO # of Bids BID NO BID

2 | 2310000 2222 34.94 22.22
Muncie 233609 - 3w stock

2 | 2210056 175.00 280.09 175.00
Gillig 233605 - 5w stock

3 | 1010080 908.93 908.93 1,040.75 967.00
Coffman 233616 - stock Sw 21d

2 | 2110208 238.75 281.86 238.75
Muncie 233609 - stock 30d

1| 2110228 340.73 340.73
Aftermarket Parts 233610 - 21w

- | 2110230 -

- | 2110231 -

2 | 1210156 32.88 32.88 39.46
Coffman 233616 - stock 1o0d

1| 2010090 33.08 33.08
Eldorado 233612 - stock




	422026

