
DUE 08/26/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Battery 

Service
A&A Auto Interstate 

Power
Hydraulic 
Electric

Illinois Auto P&G Prevost Neopart Eldorado Coffman Kirks Muncie Mohawk Cummins Aftermarket 
Parts

Gillig Vehicle 
Maintenance

                                  6 72139 372.89                 436.45        372.89        383.45        422.72        431.37        450.00 

Coffman 233616 -                 10d  stock  21d  3w  stock  stock 

                                  3 71733 89.34                   109.34           90.85           89.34 

Aftermarket Parts 233610 -                 stock  stock  3w 

                                  2 71294 0.16                          0.16             0.16 

Mohawk 233608 -                 stock  stock 

                                  1 620055 17.37                      17.37 

Aftermarket Parts 233610  10w 

                                  1 72125 20.84                      20.84 

Eldorado 233612 -                 stock 

                                  2 71287 0.25                          0.25             0.37 

Mohawk 233608 -                 stock  5w 

                                  2 71500 34.60                      51.87           34.60 

Gillig 233605 -                 stock  stock 

                                  3 72102 74.99                   154.99           74.99           76.32 

Muncie 233609 -                 stock  30d  7w 

                                  5 72121 33.37                      33.37           72.93           62.95           69.23           55.00 

Prevost 233606 -                 stock  2w  42d  5w  8w 

                                  4 72059 401.99                 947.85        401.99        576.36        450.00 

Muncie 233609  stock  stock  5w  6w 

                                  4 72143 10.50                      16.86           13.00           10.99           10.50 

Gillig 233605  2w  42d  12w  4w 

                                  3 71357 12.37                      23.70           12.99           12.37 

Aftermarket Parts 233610  2w  stock  stock 

                                  2 620058 19.75                      19.75           45.03 

Pace RFQ# 422025



DUE 08/26/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Battery 

Service
A&A Auto Interstate 

Power
Hydraulic 
Electric

Illinois Auto P&G Prevost Neopart Eldorado Coffman Kirks Muncie Mohawk Cummins Aftermarket 
Parts

Gillig Vehicle 
Maintenance

Pace RFQ# 422025

Hydraulic Electric 233614  stock  8w 

                                  3 620092 18.72                      23.00           18.72           76.54 

Mohawk 233608 -                 stock  stock  stock 

                                   - 620053 -                

                                  6 71091 0.09                          0.60             3.13             0.56             0.09             0.18             0.14 

Muncie 233609  5d 6w
 bid 142, 
need 150  stock  stock  stock 

                                  4 71442 6.90                        17.95             6.90           10.58             7.08 

Mohawk 233608 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                  1 72120 114.60                 114.60 

Eldorado 233612 -                 6w 

                                  2 71434 111.95                 111.95        129.00 

Battery Service 233618 -                 3d  stock 

                                  3 72109 777.92                 777.92     1,553.89     1,200.00 

Eldorado 233612 -                 4w  9w  16w 

                                  1 72144 57.67                      57.67 

Eldorado 233612 -                 stock 

                                  3 72156 21.99                      21.99           22.38           22.35 

Neopart 233604 -                 10w  42d  stock 

                                  1 72163 530.17                 530.17 

Eldorado 233612 -                 8w 

                                  1 72190 26.12                      26.12 

Eldorado 233612 -                 stock 

                                  3 72184 6.15                        16.44             6.15             6.15 

Muncie 233609 -                 stock  stock  stock 



DUE 08/26/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Battery 

Service
A&A Auto Interstate 

Power
Hydraulic 
Electric

Illinois Auto P&G Prevost Neopart Eldorado Coffman Kirks Muncie Mohawk Cummins Aftermarket 
Parts

Gillig Vehicle 
Maintenance

Pace RFQ# 422025

                                  2 72211 62.87                      62.87           80.51 

Aftermarket Parts 233610 -                 stock  stock 

                                  3 72216 144.00                 383.01        159.52        144.00 

Gillig 233605 -                 6w  stock  stock 

                                  3 72221 14.32                      30.28           17.85           14.32 

Aftermarket Parts 233610 -                 stock  35d  8w 

                                  1 72252 32.09                      32.09 

Eldorado 233612 -                 stock 

                                  1 72253 105.74                 105.74 

Eldorado 233612 -                 stock 

                                  4 72255 6.40                        32.66           12.91             6.40           18.32 

Mohawk 233608 -                 1w  stock  stock  stock 

                                  4 72266 30.35                      34.81           37.13           30.35           38.51 

Aftermarket Parts 233610 -                 10w  60d  2w  12w 

                                  4 72270 5.71                          8.14             5.89             5.71 6.09           

Mohawk 233608 -                 stock  30d  17w stock

                                  3 72301 320.49                 320.49        390.00        361.77 

Battery Service 233618 -                 60d  4w  5w 

                                  1 710004 33.95                      33.95 

Eldorado 233612 -                 stock 

                                  4 710007 17.17                      25.71           17.17           24.39 21.12         

Muncie 233609 -                 4w  stock  5w  stock 

                                  5 710043 276.83                 276.83        394.55        327.00        312.89        330.72 

P&G 233619 -                 8w  75d  stock  30d  13w 

                                  3 710052 2,386.80           2,386.80     4,134.13     2,700.00 



DUE 08/26/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Battery 

Service
A&A Auto Interstate 

Power
Hydraulic 
Electric

Illinois Auto P&G Prevost Neopart Eldorado Coffman Kirks Muncie Mohawk Cummins Aftermarket 
Parts

Gillig Vehicle 
Maintenance

Pace RFQ# 422025

P&G 233619 -                 stock  10w  stock 

                                  3 710062 11.60                      11.97           11.70           11.60 

Aftermarket Parts 233610 -                 30d  stock  stock 

                                  1 710072 40.29                      40.29 

Eldorado 233612 -                 stock 

                                  1 710105 1,285.31           1,285.31 

Eldorado 233612 -                 4w 

                                  6 710119 2,943.66           2,943.66     4,959.00     3,333.00     3,357.48     3,799.50     3,462.24 

P&G 233619 -                 stock  105d  stock  60d  9w  stock 

                                  6 710120 404.04                 404.04        577.37        475.00        448.96        489.53        450.00 

P&G 233619 -                 6w  stock  45d  30d  stock  4w 

                                  1 710129 4,565.40           4,565.40 

Eldorado 233612 -                 8w 

                                  6 710149 372.89                 436.45        372.89        383.45        422.72        431.37        450.00 

Coffman 233616 -                 20d  stock  30d  3w  stock  stock 

                                  6 710166 250.63                 301.60        277.30        250.63        295.80        277.30        325.12 

Muncie 233609 -                 stock  90d  stock  4w  stock  stock 

                                  1 710206 143.31                 143.31 

Eldorado 233612 -                 stock 

                                  1 710219 32.50                      32.50 

Eldorado 233612 -                 6w 

                                  1 710247 507.51                 507.51 

Eldorado 233612 -                 4w 

                                   - 6710017 -                

-                



DUE 08/26/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Battery 

Service
A&A Auto Interstate 

Power
Hydraulic 
Electric

Illinois Auto P&G Prevost Neopart Eldorado Coffman Kirks Muncie Mohawk Cummins Aftermarket 
Parts

Gillig Vehicle 
Maintenance

Pace RFQ# 422025

                                  3 710281 27.28                      27.28           58.76           64.55 

Eldorado 233612 -                 stock  30d  5w 

                                  2 710293 6.74                          8.27             6.74 

Aftermarket Parts 233610 -                 47w  20w 

                                  1 710297 228.36                 228.36 

Eldorado 233612 -                 stock 

                                  1 710306 96.28                      96.28 

Eldorado 233612 -                 stock 

                                  1 710366 1,555.34           1,555.34 

Eldorado 233612 -                 3w 

                                  2 710381 1,755.61           1,755.61     2,047.75 

Coffman 233616 -                 90d  9w 

                                  1 710385 472.75                 472.75 

Aftermarket Parts 233610 -                
 no lead 

time given 

                                  3 710435 107.40                 107.40        116.26        123.37 

Coffman 233616 -                 90d  30d  9w 

                                  1 710436 36.37                      36.37 

Aftermarket Parts 233610 -                 stock 


	422025

