
DUE 08/26/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Rome Truck 
- NO BID

A&A Auto Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Interstate 
Power

Hydraulic 
Electric

Prevost Neopart CBM Gillig Coffman Kirks Crossline Muncie Suburban 
Truck

Mohawk Vehicle 
Maintenance

Aftermarket 
Parts

                                    3 60342 2.25                           2.67             2.25 2.74            

Mohawk 233608 -                  stock  stock stock

                                    9 81262 5.79                           6.49             7.41           11.50             6.77             7.97             5.79             7.41             6.94 7.31            

Muncie 233609 -                  2w  14d  6w  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 3w

                                     - 81055 -                 

-                 

                                    8 60745 46.75                      91.69           46.75         109.81         110.99           70.00         140.30           59.57 87.79         

CBM 233615  2w  stock  stock  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock 4w

                                    4 60561 41.27                    136.87         148.18           41.27 186.41       

Mohawk 233608 -                  stock  30d  4w 5w

                                    7 60494 11.59                      11.59           13.43           11.97           13.13           13.43           11.62 11.60         

A&A Auto 233613 -                  3w  14d  stock  30d  stock  4w  3w 

                                    5 81298 56.00                      56.00           70.06           68.34           68.57 68.25         

Hydraulic Electric 233614 -                  14d 90d  stock  stock stock

                                    7 81313 36.75                      92.19           36.75         102.01           53.83           39.15           57.57 89.66         

CBM 233615 -                  2w  stock  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock stock

                                    2 60748 47.71                      53.35 47.71         

Aftermarket Parts 233610 -                  60d 5w

                                     - 60772 -                 

                                    1 81423 23.83            23.83         

Aftermarket Parts 233610 stock

                                    4 81422 1.60                           2.37             2.87             1.60 2.71            

Coffman 233616  stock  30d 
 unapproved 

part stock

Pace RFQ# 422024



DUE 08/26/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Rome Truck 
- NO BID

A&A Auto Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Interstate 
Power

Hydraulic 
Electric

Prevost Neopart CBM Gillig Coffman Kirks Crossline Muncie Suburban 
Truck

Mohawk Vehicle 
Maintenance

Aftermarket 
Parts

Pace RFQ# 422024

                                    2 60790 561.48                  561.48 662.23       

Muncie 233609  97d 8w

                                    6 81441 42.50                      42.50           63.72           71.90           49.20           51.81 61.10         

Hydraulic Electric 233614 -                  14d  4w  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part stock

                                    6 81444 59.40                    109.23           74.80           74.03           76.76           59.40 83.81         

Mohawk 233608  stock  6w  stock  60d  stock 
 no lead 

time given 

                                    2 81472 5.05                           5.30             5.05 

Mohawk 233608  stock  30d 

                                    1 60805 24.00            24.00         

Aftermarket Parts 233610 -                  4w 

                                    2 81497 2,375.75            2,375.75 2,890.44    

Coffman 233616 -                  stock  5w 

                                    4 81516 10.97                      10.97           12.12           12.86 12.30         

Coffman 233616 -                  stock  30d 
 unapproved 

part stock

                                    3 81518 6.54                           6.54             7.11 7.39            

Coffman 233616 -                  stock  30d 7w

                                    6 81519 64.17                      79.50           85.00           92.33           64.17           90.84 114.18       

Kirks 233603 -                  21d  stock  90d  stock  stock 9w

                                 10 81521 17.99                      22.59           22.31           20.47           32.56           21.39           17.99           22.31           20.90           18.15 22.99         

Muncie 233609 -                  4w  14d  stock  stock  stock  30d  stock  stock  stock  3w 

                                    6 81533 12.69                      53.50           50.45           14.92           12.69           15.85 30.41         

Mohawk 233608 -                  stock  90d  stock  stock  stock stock

                                    2 81534 37.22                      38.12 37.22         

Aftermarket Parts 233610 -                  2w stock



DUE 08/26/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Rome Truck 
- NO BID

A&A Auto Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Interstate 
Power

Hydraulic 
Electric

Prevost Neopart CBM Gillig Coffman Kirks Crossline Muncie Suburban 
Truck

Mohawk Vehicle 
Maintenance

Aftermarket 
Parts

Pace RFQ# 422024

                                    4 810017 68.64                      68.64           89.99           82.77 75.09         

Coffman 233616 -                  stock  stock  4w 
 no lead 

time given 

                                    3 810019 343.85                  343.85         364.12 387.87       

Coffman 233616 -                  stock  30d 4w

                                    5 610018 18.13                      52.99           50.08           54.18           18.13 54.79         

Coffman 233616 -                  stock  stock  30d 
 unapproved 

part stock

                                    7 610019 84.00                    104.86         165.19           84.00           92.30           94.72           91.18 101.87       

Kirks 233603 -                  3w  stock  stock  30d  stock  30d 7w

                                    3 810025 620.00                  620.00      1,207.71 1,072.29    

Neopart 233604 -                  stock  stock 9w

                                    3 810026 1,076.69            1,076.69      1,350.00 1,200.86    

Coffman 233616 -                  stock  stock 9w

                                    4 810027 621.74                  621.74         649.00         697.74 708.06       

Coffman 233616 -                  stock  stock  21d 9w

                                    4 810031 1.94                           9.07           10.77             1.94 10.45         

Coffman 233616 -                  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part  4w 

                                    8 610026 90.00                      90.00         136.25         144.10         369.86         131.00         127.95         165.83 126.06       

Hydraulic Electric 233614 -                  stock  4w  stock  stock  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part stock

                                    8 610028 15.10                      45.75           59.95           15.10           85.00           46.64           57.34           26.14 90.06         

Hydraulic Electric 233614 -                  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part stock

                                    5 610031 27.00                      33.69           27.00           35.77           39.61 37.96         

Kirks 233603 -                  stock  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part stock

                                    3 610033 650.00                  828.65         650.00 965.05       

Kirks 233603 -                  stock  stock  5w 



DUE 08/26/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Rome Truck 
- NO BID

A&A Auto Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Interstate 
Power

Hydraulic 
Electric

Prevost Neopart CBM Gillig Coffman Kirks Crossline Muncie Suburban 
Truck

Mohawk Vehicle 
Maintenance

Aftermarket 
Parts

Pace RFQ# 422024

                                    3 810048 23.88                      23.88           26.81 24.40         

Coffman 233616 -                  stock  21d  7w 

                                    6 810060 29.60                      42.11           43.30           34.00           39.99           29.60 50.19         

Crossline 233617 -                  stock  stock  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part stock

                                    2 810064 4,427.93            4,804.40 4,427.93    

Aftermarket Parts 233610 -                  90d 5w

                                    4 810070 1,135.10            1,135.10      1,206.68      1,199.00 1,335.54    

Neopart 233604 -                  stock  90d  stock  7w 

                                    6 810073 96.00                      96.00         131.61         117.98         114.90         165.83 145.79       

Hydraulic Electric 233614 -                  stock  stock  stock  stock  2w 7w

                                    6 610058 48.13                      97.05           98.30         111.49         125.75           48.13 310.77       

CBM 233615 -                  stock  stock  stock  21d 
 unapproved 

part stock

                                    5 810078 440.00                  440.00         559.18         454.19         507.95 547.09       

Hydraulic Electric 233614 -                  stock  stock  stock  21d stock

                                    2 810079 454.19                  454.19 547.09       

Coffman 233616 -                  stock 9w

                                    4 810084 645.00                  645.00         932.81         831.00 1,049.86    

Neopart 233604 -                  stock  stock  stock 6w

                                    1 610061 5.35               5.35            

Aftermarket Parts 233610 -                 stock

                                    6 810093 17.99                      17.99           36.99           19.48           28.80           19.19 41.41         

Hydraulic Electric 233614 -                  stock  stock  stock  21d  stock 7w

                                    5 810098 280.00                  288.05         280.00         323.05         349.94 343.69       

Crossline 233617 -                  stock  stock  30d  30d stock



DUE 08/26/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Rome Truck 
- NO BID

A&A Auto Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Interstate 
Power

Hydraulic 
Electric

Prevost Neopart CBM Gillig Coffman Kirks Crossline Muncie Suburban 
Truck

Mohawk Vehicle 
Maintenance

Aftermarket 
Parts

Pace RFQ# 422024

                                    4 610064 94.21                      94.21         105.51         115.72 109.19       

Coffman 233616 -                  stock  30d  4w stock

                                    4 810101 229.00                  252.59         229.00         229.66 289.46       

Crossline 233617 -                  stock  stock  stock 6w

                                    3 810102 3.53                           3.53             3.98 4.05            

Coffman 233616 -                  stock  30d 5w

                                    4 810110 1,408.35            1,578.27      1,433.00      1,717.77 1,408.35    

Aftermarket Parts 233610 -                  stock  stock  21d stock

                                    5 810122 9.80                         12.50           32.34           36.72             9.80 37.91         

Hydraulic Electric 233614 -                  stock  stock  30d 
 unapproved 

part  6w 

                                     - 610068 -                 

-                 

                                    6 610072 25.90                      37.00           42.44           42.00           47.79           25.90 48.90         

Hydraulic Electric 233614 -                  stock  stock  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock 

                                    8 610073 6.19                           6.19             7.39           10.32             6.52             8.00             8.50             6.37 8.17            

A&A Auto 233613 -                  14d  stock  stock  stock  21d  stock 5w

                                    2 810167 58.99                      58.99 63.90         

Gillig 233605 -                  stock stock

                                    2 810168 58.99                      58.99 63.90         

Gillig 233605 -                  stock stock

                                     - 810171 -                 

-                 

                                    3 810178 201.45                  201.45         223.99 222.13       

Coffman 233616 -                  stock  stock stock



DUE 08/26/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Rome Truck 
- NO BID

A&A Auto Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Interstate 
Power

Hydraulic 
Electric

Prevost Neopart CBM Gillig Coffman Kirks Crossline Muncie Suburban 
Truck

Mohawk Vehicle 
Maintenance

Aftermarket 
Parts

Pace RFQ# 422024

                                    3 810180 7.28                           7.28             8.18 8.68            

Coffman 233616 -                  stock  30d stock

                                    6 610088 31.22                      31.22         122.77           42.57           35.90           44.44 62.85         

CBM 233615 -                  stock  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock stock

                                    3 810187 9.65                           9.65           10.99 10.98         

Coffman 233616 -                  stock  30d 4w

                                    1 610092 383.79          383.79       

Aftermarket Parts 233610 -                 
 no lead 

time given 

                                    4 610097 235.66                  346.16         246.00         235.66 310.77       

Muncie 233609 -                  75d  stock  stock stock

                                    3 610098 2.45                           2.45             2.56 2.51            

Muncie 233609 -                  21d  stock 3w

                                    4 810204 1,450.00            1,705.83      1,450.00      1,879.99 1,597.19    

Kirks 233603 -                  stock  stock  30d stock

                                    5 810208 0.16                           1.25             1.64             1.81             0.16 2.12            

Hydraulic Electric 233614 -                  stock  stock  30d 
 unapproved 

part 9w

                                    3 810211 3,074.50            3,074.50      3,808.29 3,811.66    

Coffman 233616 -                  90d  30d 9w

                                    5 810232 400.00                  483.45         454.19         400.00         515.95 553.38       

Crossline 233617 -                  stock  stock  stock  stock stock

                                     - 610110 -                 

-                 

                                    4 610111 36.08                      36.08           39.99           42.97 41.74         

Coffman 233616 -                  stock  30d  stock 9w



DUE 08/26/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Rome Truck 
- NO BID

A&A Auto Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Interstate 
Power

Hydraulic 
Electric

Prevost Neopart CBM Gillig Coffman Kirks Crossline Muncie Suburban 
Truck

Mohawk Vehicle 
Maintenance

Aftermarket 
Parts

Pace RFQ# 422024

                                    3 610122 1.58                           1.58             1.76 2.56            

Coffman 233616 -                  stock  30d  7w 

                                    6 810271 33.00                      33.00           85.39           34.15           93.85           34.47 95.89         

Hydraulic Electric 233614 -                  stock  stock  stock  30d  stock 8w

                                    4 810277 32.12                      48.99           32.86           32.12 45.13         

Mohawk 233608 -                  4w  stock  stock 7w

                                    5 810280 945.00                  957.82         945.00         950.20         949.20 1,066.48    

Gillig 233605 -                  6w  8w  45d  30d 10w

                                    3 810282 637.53                  637.53         690.40 715.06       

Coffman 233616 -                  stock  30d 7w

                                    4 810286 25.59                      29.61           32.90           25.59 34.72         

Coffman 233616 -                  stock  30d 
 unapproved 

part stock

                                    3 810302 27.38                      27.38           31.31 32.67         

Coffman 233616 -                  stock  30d stock

                                    2 810303 839.96                  839.96 974.05       

Coffman 233616 -                  stock 12w

                                    4 810350 13.27                      13.27           15.15           20.36 15.83         

Coffman 233616 -                  stock  30d 
 unapproved 

part 5w

                                    3 810371 12.52                      12.52           14.29 14.65         

Coffman 233616 -                  stock  30d 5w

                                    2 610163 4.99                           4.99 7.37            

Muncie 233608 -                  45d stock

                                    3 810402 58.71                      58.71           64.94 67.28         

Coffman 233616 -                  stock  30d stock



DUE 08/26/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Rome Truck 
- NO BID

A&A Auto Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Interstate 
Power

Hydraulic 
Electric

Prevost Neopart CBM Gillig Coffman Kirks Crossline Muncie Suburban 
Truck

Mohawk Vehicle 
Maintenance

Aftermarket 
Parts

Pace RFQ# 422024

                                    4 810408 1,500.00            1,500.00      2,911.93      1,880.00 3,315.72    

Hydraulic Electric 233614 -                  14d  90d  stock 9w


	422024

