
DUE 08/26/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Rome Truck 
- NO BID

Kirks Neopart Gillig Prevost Suburban 
Truck

Mohawk Muncie Aftermarket 
Parts

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Eldorado

                                    7 41236 167.85                  167.85         200.00         252.40         170.20         174.63         193.82         229.00 

Neopart 233604 -                  3w  6w  75d  30d  21d  5w  stock 

                                    8 40615 38.00                      99.99           87.88           90.44           84.85           38.00           91.45           95.20         118.80 

Prevost 233606 -                  stock  4w  4w  75d 
 unapproved 

part  35d  5w  16w 

                                    7 10192 8.88                         22.99           14.77             9.69           10.36             9.75           11.16             8.88 

Vehicle Maintenance 233611 -                  stock  4w  stock  2w  21d  11w  stock 

                                    4 30406 133.28                  133.28         185.91         201.70         253.82 

Gillig 233605 6w  126d  23w  stock 

                                    6 10194 9.86                         16.00           12.51           12.82           13.00           13.66             9.86 

Vehicle Maintenance 233611 -                  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                    3 20701 250.95                  451.65         399.98         250.95 

Eldorado 233612 -                  63d  17w  stock 

                                    1 240058 11.89                      11.89 

Vehicle Maintenance 233611 -                  stock 

                                    7 40798 107.86                  109.36         123.71         107.86         142.16         128.50         118.24         237.67 

Suburban Truck 233607 -                  stock  4w  stock  1w  28d  7w  2w 

Pace RFQ# 422023



DUE 08/26/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Rome Truck 
- NO BID

Kirks Neopart Gillig Prevost Suburban 
Truck

Mohawk Muncie Aftermarket 
Parts

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 422023

                                    6 10193 14.37                      21.42           17.05           18.25           17.29           19.66           14.37 

Suburban Truck 233607 -                  stock  stock  60d  stock  stock 
 no lead 

time given 

                                    2 30356 209.56                  209.56         254.28 

Aftermarket Parts 233610  MOQ  stock 

                                    2 30376 60.10                      67.04           60.10 

Aftermarket Parts 233610  stock  stock 

                                    7 20599 33.51                      42.18           40.36           50.72           33.51           42.38           45.47           79.50 

Gillig 233605  stock 4w  stock 
 unapproved 

part  21d  5w  2w 

                                    9 40953 8.34                         40.81           22.08           15.00           18.10           38.51             8.34           14.95           27.89           14.05 

Vehicle Maintenance 233611  stock  stock stock  75d  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock  5w  stock 

                                    4 41216 252.32                  252.32         280.19         314.72         617.20 

Gillig 233605 -                  stock  126d  stock  16w 

                                    5 41213 172.13                  172.37         188.49         202.16         172.13         261.82 

Aftermarket Parts 233610 stock
 unapproved 

part  126d  6w  16w 

                                    8 40869 51.51                    125.00           83.84           69.87           57.48           58.49           58.25           90.30           51.51 

Vehicle Maintenance 233611  stock  stock stock  stock  stock  stock  10w  stock 



DUE 08/26/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Rome Truck 
- NO BID

Kirks Neopart Gillig Prevost Suburban 
Truck

Mohawk Muncie Aftermarket 
Parts

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 422023

                                    5 41035 0.99                           6.88             0.99             5.38             4.53           14.02 

Mohawk 233608 -                  stock  stock  126d  stock  stock 

                                    5 10405 125.70                  133.29         125.70         175.57         145.02         253.82 

Mohawk 233608 -                  stock  stock  42d  stock  stock 

                                    5 30361 6.98                           9.44           12.80             6.98           10.90             7.28 

Aftermarket Parts 233610 -                  MOQ  75d 
 unapproved 

part  28d  stock 

                                    6 10288 5.61                           7.60             5.84             6.69             6.35             6.46             5.61 

Vehicle Maintenance 233611 -                  stock  stock  stock  21d  5w  stock 

                                    5 40077 0.61                           1.35             1.18             0.61             1.12             1.10 

Mohawk 233608 -                  MOQ  stock  stock  21d  5w 

                                    6 40131 13.37                      18.59           15.64           17.16           16.49           22.01           13.37 

Vehicle Maintenance 233611 -                  stock  stock  30d  stock  18w  stock 

                                    3 40185 24.50                      54.32           24.50           87.28 

Mohawk 233608 -                  10w  stock  26w 

                                    7 10001 0.37                           1.13             1.42             1.52             1.25             0.37             1.30             1.21 

Mohawk 233608 -                  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock  28d  stock 



DUE 08/26/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Rome Truck 
- NO BID

Kirks Neopart Gillig Prevost Suburban 
Truck

Mohawk Muncie Aftermarket 
Parts

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 422023

                                    7 10365 69.90                    133.88           90.29         143.89         166.27           78.51           69.90           73.65 

Muncie 233609 -                  4w  stock  75d  stock  stock  stock  4w 

                                    6 40162 0.34                           1.34             1.55             1.31             0.34             1.30             1.30 

Mohawk 233608 -                  MOQ  stock  75d  stock  28d  stock 

                                    6 10366 72.53                    112.87           90.29         143.89           82.07           75.91           72.53 

Aftermarket Parts 233610 -                  4w  stock  75d  stock  14d  stock 

                                    6 40596 0.46                           1.93             2.08             2.09             0.46             0.65             1.88 

Mohawk 233608 -                  stock  stock  75d  stock  stock  stock 

                                    5 41255 5.12                           5.12             5.70             6.34             5.83             5.86 

Neopart 233604 -                  stock  stock  2w  35d  stock 

                                    1 30411 346.18                  346.18 

Eldorado 233612 -                  10w 

                                    6 20707 104.92                  104.92         141.60         120.86         125.50         111.96         259.03 

Neopart 233603 -                  stock  75d  stock  35d  6w  1w 

                                    1 20709 920.81                  920.81 

Eldorado 233612 -                  stock 



DUE 08/26/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Rome Truck 
- NO BID

Kirks Neopart Gillig Prevost Suburban 
Truck

Mohawk Muncie Aftermarket 
Parts

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 422023

                                    4 10411 120.57                  126.02         120.57         125.74         223.35 

Muncie 233609 -                  4w  35d  stock  2w 

                                    3 30421 127.98                  127.98         130.00         236.76 

Gillig 233605 -                  stock  stock  2w 

                                    5 41266 900.00              1,301.86         984.48         900.00     1,222.94     1,473.69 

Muncie 233609 -                  6w  stock  stock  12w  16w 

                                    7 41270 30.68                      38.70           38.07           44.42           62.71           30.68           39.02           71.27 

Muncie 233609 -                  stock  stock  75d  2w  stock  5w  stock 

                                    6 41271 30.68                      38.70           38.07           62.71           30.68           41.53           71.27 

Muncie 233609 -                  stock  stock  2w  stock  5w  stock 

                                     - 30445 -                 

-                 

                                    2 41294 1,563.21           1,563.21     2,289.81 

Aftermarket Parts 233610 -                  14w  20w 

41295 21.03                    201.01           21.03 

Aftermarket Parts 233610 -                 stock  stock 



DUE 08/26/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Rome Truck 
- NO BID

Kirks Neopart Gillig Prevost Suburban 
Truck

Mohawk Muncie Aftermarket 
Parts

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 422023

                                    5 41332 290.34                  464.78         425.00         461.31         535.75         290.34 

Gillig 233605 -                  14w  stock  30d  35d 
 unapproved 

part 

                                    1 30483 182.77                  182.77 

Eldorado 233612 -                  stock 

                                    1 2410001 366.63                  366.63 

Muncie 233609 -                  70d 

                                    3 2410002 253.25                  270.30         253.25         274.73 

Muncie 233609 -                  4w  35d  5w 

                                    1 110004 182.77                  182.77 

Eldorado 233612 -                  stock 

                                    5 410001 946.10                  946.10     1,564.52         984.21         982.62     2,487.46 

Neopart 233604 -                  stock  4w  28d  stock  stock 

                                    5 410002 954.86                  954.86     1,564.52         983.93         982.62     2,487.46 

Neopart 233604 -                  stock  4w  stock  stock  stock 

                                    5 410004 157.98                  157.98         174.46         186.35         180.75         357.83 

Neopart 233604 -                  stock  stock  35d  stock  stock 



DUE 08/26/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Rome Truck 
- NO BID

Kirks Neopart Gillig Prevost Suburban 
Truck

Mohawk Muncie Aftermarket 
Parts

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 422023

                                    5 410006 112.81                  231.48         200.00         112.81         239.15         236.05 

Gillig 233605 -                  6w  stock 
 unapproved 

part  21d  stock 

                                    7 410009 128.70                  145.93         210.55         154.63         128.70         132.09         139.51         198.59 

Mohawk 233608 -                  4w  75d  stock  1w  21d  8w  4w 

                                    7 410010 138.43                  196.30         195.00         362.16         138.43         148.98         155.17         853.49 

Muncie 233609 -                  stock  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock  stock  2w 

                                    6 410017 1,150.29           1,150.29     1,400.00     1,297.68     1,193.44     1,302.36     2,679.14 

Neopart 233604 -                  4w  10w  4w  21d  26w  10w 

                                    1 110006 317.66                  317.66 

Eldorado 233612 -                  2w 

                                    2 2410008 3.50                           3.50             4.83 

Muncie 233609 -                  stock  5w 

                                    4 210003 292.66                  928.97         324.59         292.66         587.70 

Aftermarket Parts 233610 -                  stock  90d  14w  2w 

                                    4 110014 116.40                  121.55         116.40         128.09         199.85 

Muncie 233609 -                  16w  stock  stock  8w 



DUE 08/26/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Rome Truck 
- NO BID

Kirks Neopart Gillig Prevost Suburban 
Truck

Mohawk Muncie Aftermarket 
Parts

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 422023

                                    4 310008 103.12          107.64         103.12         108.64         207.28 

Muncie 233609 -                  5w  stock  13w  stock 

                                    4 410036 419.03                  419.03         481.66         475.50         521.42 

Neopart 233604 -                  stock  4w  28d  stock 

                                    1 110022 36.88                      36.88 

Eldorado 233612 -                  stock 

                                    2 410041 8.65                           9.32             8.65 

Muncie 233609 -                  stock  35d 

                                    2 410046 49.25                      49.75           49.25 

Muncie 233609 -                  stock  35d 

                                    3 410047 11.39                      11.39         442.74           12.11 

Kirks 233603 -                  stock  stock  stock 

                                    2 110026 98.75                    514.68           98.75 

Eldorado 233612 -                  16w  2w 

                                    1 410086 208.61                  208.61 

Eldorado 233612 -                  10w 



DUE 08/26/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Rome Truck 
- NO BID

Kirks Neopart Gillig Prevost Suburban 
Truck

Mohawk Muncie Aftermarket 
Parts

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 422023

                                    3 110045 470.55                  526.15         470.55     1,005.20 

Aftermarket Parts 233610 -                  35d  17w  2w 

                                    3 110046 603.57                  603.84         603.57     1,005.20 

Aftermarket Parts 233610 -                  35d  18w  stock 

                                    6 410095 82.16                      99.67           82.16         152.77         106.35         101.31         182.96 

Gillig 233605 -                  8w  stock  stock  35d  stock  stock 

                                    3 410103 33.33                    164.95           33.33           68.21 

Aftermarket Parts 233610 -                  42d  stock  stock 

                                    4 410105 19.53                      20.11           28.74           19.53           85.79 

Aftermarket Parts 233610 -                  8w  stock  15w  stock 

                                    1 110064 1,564.78           1,564.78 

Aftermarket Parts 233610 -                  11w 

                                    1 110065 426.89                  426.89 

Aftermarket Parts 233610 -                  11w 

                                    4 310060 157.57                  187.24         166.58         157.57         168.03 

Aftermarket Parts 233610 -                  20w 
 unapproved 

part  70d  15w 



DUE 08/26/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Illinois Auto 
- NO BID

Rome Truck 
- NO BID

Kirks Neopart Gillig Prevost Suburban 
Truck

Mohawk Muncie Aftermarket 
Parts

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 422023

                                    4 310061 144.12                  163.51         144.12         157.57         154.02 

Aftermarket Parts 233610 -                  20w 
 unapproved 

part  140d  15w 

                                    1 210041 1,528.89           1,528.89 

Aftermarket Parts 233610 -                  15w 


	422023

