
Due:  08/04/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid I/O 

Controls
A&A Auto Interstate 

Power
Battery 
Service

P&G Muncie Prevost Kirks Filter 
Services

Coffman Aftermarket 
Parts

Neopart Hydraulic 
Electric

Gillig Mohawk Vehicle 
Maintenance

Curved 
Glass

Translite Eldorado

                                    4 170527 183.05                  183.05         218.53 272.00       193.43       

Muncie 233578 -                 30d  stock 7d stock

                                    4 71089 0.05                          0.42             0.10             0.05             0.05 

Aftermarket Parts 233570 -                 5d  stock  stock  stock 

                                    4 71733 78.98                      90.85         109.34           78.98         110.00 

Aftermarket Parts 233570 -                 stock  stock  5w  6w 

                                    3 72102 75.90                      75.90         139.63         154.99 

Muncie 233578  30d  32w 
 bid week 

late 

                                    6 151458 160.71                  174.65         244.46         187.89         179.96         160.71         388.00 

Gillig 233567 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 
 bid week 

late 

                                    4 170616 85.99                      85.99         104.99           92.87         125.00 

Muncie 233578 -                 42d  75d  7w  6w 

                                    4 180669 180.00                  227.69         192.99         180.00         488.82 

Gillig 233567 -                 stock  stock  stock 
 bid week 

late 

                                    5 211005 1.40                        15.82             1.40           16.35           49.27             4.83 

Filter Services 233584 -                 21d  60d  10w  5w  5w 

                                    4 72057 4.85                          5.10             9.37           15.27             4.85 

Vehicle Maintenance 233569 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                    5 72143 10.50                      13.05           11.04           12.33           10.50         180.42 

Gillig 233567  70d  5w  10w  4w 
 bid week 

late 

                                    3 210995 567.55                  567.55         602.55         582.00 

Muncie 233578  21d  stock  5w 

                                    4 170620 3.74                        10.18           15.03           10.99             3.74 

Muncie 233578  stock  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part 

                                    1 290471 19.53                      19.53 

Eldorado 233571  1w 

                                    5 151457 164.63                  176.50         245.73         186.84         164.63         388.00 

Pace RFQ# 421974



Due:  08/04/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid I/O 

Controls
A&A Auto Interstate 

Power
Battery 
Service

P&G Muncie Prevost Kirks Filter 
Services

Coffman Aftermarket 
Parts

Neopart Hydraulic 
Electric

Gillig Mohawk Vehicle 
Maintenance

Curved 
Glass

Translite Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 421974

Gillig 233567 -                 stock  75d  stock  stock 
 bid week 

late 

                                    2 250585 23.72                      23.72           29.19 

Neopart 233565  10d  2w 

                                    3 290100 15.40                      26.42           69.25           15.40 

Mohawk 233568  stock  10w  stock 

                                    5 170625 219.32                  219.32         231.62         275.00         244.68         344.87 

Muncie 233578 -                 42d  7w  6w  3w 
 bid week 

late 

                                    4 290645 53.53                      56.32           87.78           53.53           70.02 

Vehicle Maintenance 233569 -                 stock  7w  stock 
 bid week 

late 

                                    3 220346 46.99                      56.50           54.82           46.99 

Gillig 233567 -                 stock  stock  stock 

                                    3 71357 12.37                      12.37           13.23           23.70 

Aftermarket Parts 233570 -                 stock  stock 
 bid week 

late 

                                    6 180648 142.52                  286.97         222.54         185.00         194.94         142.52         577.48 

Hydraulic Electric 233579 -                 120d  stock  14d  stock 
 no part # 
identified 

 bid week 
late 

                                    3 160596 164.76                  174.05         176.08         164.76 

Gillig 233567 -                 70d  stock  stock 

                                    4 211004 1.40                        14.45             1.40           14.26             4.90 

Filter Services 233584 -                 21d  60d  7w  30d 

                                    1 220341 119.24                  119.24 

Eldorado 233571 -                 stock 

                                    4 72135 57.57                      72.85           57.57           57.63         128.06 

Aftermarket Parts 233570 -                 80d  9w  6w 
 bid week 

late 

                                    4 170615 222.85                  222.85         244.30         240.00         353.58 

Muncie 233578 -                 42d  8w  6w 
 bid week 

late 

                                    4 210976 21.15                      33.60           21.15           22.31           79.17 

Aftermarket Parts 233570 -                 30d  6w  stock 
 bid week 

late 



Due:  08/04/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid I/O 

Controls
A&A Auto Interstate 

Power
Battery 
Service

P&G Muncie Prevost Kirks Filter 
Services

Coffman Aftermarket 
Parts

Neopart Hydraulic 
Electric

Gillig Mohawk Vehicle 
Maintenance

Curved 
Glass

Translite Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 421974

                                    5 220345 28.05                      35.55           35.31           28.05           30.75           48.06 

Neopart 233565 -                 stock  stock  stock 
 no lead 

time given  3w 

                                    2 290647 97.04                      97.04         167.61 

Aftermarket Parts 233570 -                 7w 
 bid week 

late 

                                    4 72058 5.50                        14.43           14.89             5.50           85.12 

Vehicle Maintenance 233569 -                 stock  stock  stock 
 bid week 

late 

                                    5 290652 4.00                          7.00             8.59             6.73             4.00             4.75 

Hydraulic Electric 233579 -                 21d  75d  stock  stock  stock 

                                    2 210965 0.53                          3.95             0.53 

Mohawk 233568 -                 stock  stock 

                                    7 70706 5.10                        27.91           16.05           23.13           23.83           15.75             5.10           45.10 

Gillig 233567 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part 
 bid week 

late 

                                    6 72094 20.64                      24.26           21.00           92.25           20.64           25.50           29.16 

Aftermarket Parts 233570 -                 30d  stock  stock  stock  stock 
 bid week 

late 

                                    5 71442 6.50                          6.50           10.64             7.08             7.30           17.95 

Muncie 233578 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock 
 bid week 

late 

                                    1 72120 114.60                  114.60 

Eldorado 233571 -                 3w 

                                    3 70211 10.75                      21.22           10.75           27.28 

Aftermarket Parts 233570 -                 stock  stock 
 bid week 

late 

                                    5 180661 48.00                      62.60         120.76           56.64           48.00           69.37 

Hydraulic Electric 233579 -                 30d  75d  stock  stock  stock 

                                    4 72109 777.92              1,290.02     1,562.77     1,200.00         777.92 

Gillig 233567 -                 12w  10w  12w 
 bid week 

late 

                                    1 151959 3.90                          3.90 

Eldorado 233571 -                 stock 

                                    1 72144 57.67                      57.67 



Due:  08/04/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid I/O 

Controls
A&A Auto Interstate 

Power
Battery 
Service

P&G Muncie Prevost Kirks Filter 
Services

Coffman Aftermarket 
Parts

Neopart Hydraulic 
Electric

Gillig Mohawk Vehicle 
Maintenance

Curved 
Glass

Translite Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 421974

Eldorado 233571 -                 4w 

                                    3 72155 63.09                      63.09           63.56         130.38 

Muncie 233578 -                 42d  8w 
 bid week 

late 

                                    4 72156 21.99                      22.30           22.42           21.99           25.00 

Neopart 233565 -                 42d  stock  10w  12w 

                                    4 72162 28.34                      32.32           49.76           28.34           36.00 

Mohawk 233568 -                 30d  7w  stock 
 bid week 

late 

                                    4 72167 38.25                      47.08           38.68           43.53           38.25 
                                     
Gillig 233567 -                 42d  stock  10w  12w 

                                    3 151976 1,025.00          1,025.00     1,065.87     2,181.09 

Muncie 233578 -                 30d  6w 
 bid week 

late 

                                    1 290664 2.42                          2.42 

Eldorado 233571 -                 stock 

                                    2 72181 425.87                  615.64         425.87 

Gillig 233567 -                 8w 
 bid week 

late 

                                    3 290666 27.48                      27.48           28.30           32.59 

Muncie 233578 -                 30d  7w 
 bid week 

late 

                                    3 211036 734.44                  734.44         778.50         796.64 

Muncie 233578 -                 35d  10w  5w 

                                    4 72194 70.98                      94.00           74.47           70.98         153.07 

Neopart 233565 -                 42d  stock  10w 
 bid week 

late 

                                    1 290671 17.50                      17.50 

Muncie 233578 -                 30d 

                                    4 220384 19.92                      21.43           23.08           19.92           20.00 

Aftermarket Parts 233570 -                 21d  stock  4w  stock 

                                    4 290673 1,024.51          1,611.90     1,024.51     1,401.79     2,317.22 

Aftermarket Parts 233570 -                 21d  6w  6w 
 bid week 

late 



Due:  08/04/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid I/O 

Controls
A&A Auto Interstate 

Power
Battery 
Service

P&G Muncie Prevost Kirks Filter 
Services

Coffman Aftermarket 
Parts

Neopart Hydraulic 
Electric

Gillig Mohawk Vehicle 
Maintenance

Curved 
Glass

Translite Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 421974

                                    4 160847 115.92                  144.95         170.68         115.92         116.00 

Aftermarket Parts 233570 -                 stock  105d  stock  stock 

                                    2 250728 21.20                      21.20           24.27 

Neopart 233565 -                 10d  2w 

                                    4 72259 4.37                          8.31             4.37             5.53           14.15 

Aftermarket Parts 233570 -                 stock  stock  stock 
 bid week 

late 

                                    4 72301 324.47                  362.00         324.47         445.00         401.70 

Battery Service 233581 -                 5w  3w  stock  13w 

                                    3 211114 39.55                      40.40           40.02           39.55 

Aftermarket Parts 233570 -                 stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part 

                                    3 290695 65.11                      65.11           86.22         110.18 

Muncie 233578 -                 stock  stock 
 bid week 

late 

                                    3 170716 1,116.49          1,116.49     1,129.32     1,725.96 

Gillig 233567 -                
 no lead 

time given  6w 
 bid week 

late 

                                    2 170722 88.41            155.12                 88.41 

Translite 233585 -                stock
 bid week 

late 

                                    1 1710009 85.90            85.90         

Translite 233585 -                stock

                                    4 1710016 27.79                      27.79           27.87           32.75           56.17 

Muncie 233578 -                 30d  stock  4w 
 bid week 

late 

                                    5 1610013 97.52                    192.67         188.09         178.76           97.52         418.56 

Gillig 233567 -                 stock  5w  stock 
 unapproved 

part 
 bid week 

late 

                                    3 1610017 145.42                  152.69         154.15         145.42 

Gillig 233567 -                 stock  3w  stock 

                                    2 1510007 22.61                      22.61           27.28 

Aftermarket Parts 233570 -                 stock 
 bid week 

late 

                                    1 710020 53.45                      53.45 



Due:  08/04/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid I/O 

Controls
A&A Auto Interstate 

Power
Battery 
Service

P&G Muncie Prevost Kirks Filter 
Services

Coffman Aftermarket 
Parts

Neopart Hydraulic 
Electric

Gillig Mohawk Vehicle 
Maintenance

Curved 
Glass

Translite Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 421974

Aftermarket Parts 233570 -                 6w 

                                    1 710041 233.28                  233.28 

Aftermarket Parts 233570 -                 13w 

                                    5 710043 276.83                  276.83         313.10         394.55         350.00         332.61 

P&G 233582 -                 15w  30d  75d  stock  14w 

                                    2 1610040 923.53                  925.33         923.53 

Prevost 233583 -                 30d  90d 

                                    2 2210004 3,814.29          3,873.07     3,814.29 

Aftermarket Parts 233570 -                 7w 
 bid week 

late 

                                    4 710057 43.00                      74.91           63.36           43.00           66.28 

Hydraulic Electric 233579 -                 90d  13w  14d 
 unapproved 

part 

                                    2 710058 20.36                      22.77           20.36 

Aftermarket Parts 233570 -                 stock  5w 

                                    2 2110032 765.90                  765.90         860.81 

Aftermarket Parts 233570 -                 10w  3w 

                                    3 710128 660.80                  677.20         780.25         660.80 

Gillig 233567 -                 12w  14w  14w 

                                    1 2110064 26,025.42      26,025.42 
Award Pending part 
confirmation -                 18w 

                                    1 1510107 19.70                      19.70 

Eldorado 233571 -                 stock 

                                    1 710157 43.45                      43.45 

Eldorado 233571 -                 4w 

                                    3 710161 45.10                      50.46           45.10         101.84 

Mohawk 233568 -                 9w  4w 
 bid week 

late 

                                    1 1510136 193.80                  193.80 

Eldorado 233571 -                 1w 



Due:  08/04/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid I/O 

Controls
A&A Auto Interstate 

Power
Battery 
Service

P&G Muncie Prevost Kirks Filter 
Services

Coffman Aftermarket 
Parts

Neopart Hydraulic 
Electric

Gillig Mohawk Vehicle 
Maintenance

Curved 
Glass

Translite Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 421974

                                    1 1610086 8.64                          8.64 

Eldorado 233571 -                 12w 

                                    2 710177 7.39                          8.90             7.39 

Aftermarket Parts 233570 -                 MOQ  stock 

                                    1 1510151 217.53                  217.53 

Eldorado 233571 -                 stock 

                                    2 2110091 28.00                      28.00           28.05 

Muncie 233578 -                 stock 
 no lead 

time given 

                                    3 2510074 220.08                  288.30         266.27         220.08 

Gillig 233567 -                 stock  10d  2w 

                                    4 710260 470.20                  470.20         533.20         586.37         553.18 

I/O Controls 233580 -                 12w  60d  14w  8w 

                                    1 2110145 3,421.12          3,421.12 

Muncie 233578 -                 21d 

                                    1 710310 619.14                  619.14 

Aftermarket Parts 233570 -                 15w 

                                    1 710311 619.14                  619.14 

Aftermarket Parts 233570 -                 15w 

                                    2 1610160 105.24                     105.24         132.37 

Aftermarket Parts 233570 -                 21w  8w 

                                    2 1610161 95.00                    103.61           95.00 

Gillig 233567 -                 10w  8w 

                                    1 710323 17.34                      17.34 

Aftermarket Parts 233570 -                 stock 

                                    2 1610193 69.47                      69.47           85.00 

Aftermarket Parts 233570 -                 stock  6w 

                                    2 1610194 156.47                  156.47         165.47 



Due:  08/04/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid I/O 

Controls
A&A Auto Interstate 

Power
Battery 
Service

P&G Muncie Prevost Kirks Filter 
Services

Coffman Aftermarket 
Parts

Neopart Hydraulic 
Electric

Gillig Mohawk Vehicle 
Maintenance

Curved 
Glass

Translite Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 421974

Aftermarket Parts 233570 -                 10w  6w 

                                    3 2210069 125.00                  126.25         125.42         125.00 

Gillig 233567 -                 stock  5w  6w 

                                    1 1810089 28.72                      28.72 

Aftermarket Parts 233570 -                 6w 

                                    - 2110230 -                

-                

                                    - 2110231 -                

-                

                                    1 2110251 5,480.79          5,480.79 

Aftermarket Parts 233570 -                 12w 

                                    3 710434 251.77                  297.72         251.77         345.98 

Coffman 233566 -                 30d  90d  8w 


	421974

