
Due:  08/04/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Rome Truck 
- NO BID

A&A Auto Interstate 
Power

CBM Prevost Kirks Coffman Neopart Vehicle 
Maintenance

Crossline Mohawk Gillig Muncie Hydraulic 
Electric

Aftermarket 
Parts

Eldorado

                                    3 60734 2.49                           5.43             2.82             2.49 

Muncie 233568 -                  stock  stock  30d 

                                    2 60735 1,278.32            3,219.45      1,278.32 

Muncie 233578 -                  65d 
 bid week 

late 

                                    4 130473 0.10                           1.60             0.18             0.10             0.13 

Muncie 233578 -                  7d  stock  stock  stock 

                                    6 130613 2.70                         17.24           14.73           15.73             2.70           15.40           18.50 

Coffman 233566  stock  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock  stock 

                                    9 81262 5.25                           6.29             7.41             9.32             6.77             5.25             9.25           11.75             5.79             9.24 

Vehicle Maintenance 233569 -                  stock 
no lead 

time given  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                    1 81297 77.27                      77.27 

Eldorado 233571 -                  stock 

                                    4 120315 10.43                      10.43           16.55           14.35           26.53 

Vehicle Maintenance 233569 -                 
 unapproved 

part  90d  8w  3w 

                                    6 130611 208.60                  310.48         265.27         209.00         208.60         270.96         313.55 

Crossline 233577 -                  stock  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock  stock 

                                    1 81055 161.46                  161.46 

Eldorado 233571 -                  stock 

                                    4 60690 19.20                      19.20           34.89           27.10           30.82 

Coffman 233566  stock  3w  stock  stock 

                                    6 60739 13.05                      31.25           43.29           20.00           13.05           51.35           25.56 

Mohawk 233568  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock  6w 

                                    9 110136 69.65                      81.69         100.02         111.00           96.71           69.65         165.84           96.86         120.78         214.98 

Vehicle Maintenance 233569  stock  9w 
 bid 30 - no 
lead on bal  90d  14d  3w  30d  9w 

 bid week 
late 

Pace RFQ# 421971



Due:  08/04/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Rome Truck 
- NO BID

A&A Auto Interstate 
Power

CBM Prevost Kirks Coffman Neopart Vehicle 
Maintenance

Crossline Mohawk Gillig Muncie Hydraulic 
Electric

Aftermarket 
Parts

Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 421971

                                    5 81298 51.00                      70.06           57.77           68.34           51.00           60.88 

Hydraulic Electric 233579  90d 
 unapproved 

part  stock  14d 
 no lead 

time given 

                                    7 81313 35.55                      92.00           35.55           97.93           60.00           42.00           54.20           90.18 

CBM 233573 -                 
 no lead 

time given  stock  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock  stock 

                                    3 60748 47.71                      47.89           47.71           78.90 

Aftermarket Parts 233570  60d  stock 
 bid week 

late 

                                    1 60760 302.30                  302.30 

Aftermarket Parts 233570  stock 

                                    3 81342 12.37                      12.37           13.95           13.69 

Coffman 233566 -                  stock  30d  7w 

                                    5 81345 111.15                  168.34         147.00         111.15         197.82         198.40 

Crossline 233577 -                  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part  21d  stock 

                                    1 60770 73.92                      73.92 

Eldorado 233571 -                  stock 

                                    5 81378 19.47                      42.25           43.45           19.47           51.51           51.82 

Mohawk 233568 -                  stock  stock  stock  stock 
 bid week 

late 

                                    1 81412 34.17                      34.17 

Eldorado 233571 -                  6w 

                                    5 81430 287.60                  325.55         287.60         586.69         384.65         396.55 

Crossline 233577 -                  stock  stock  4w  30d  5w 

                                    1 140076 864.08                  864.08 

Eldorado 233571 -                  8w 

                                    6 81431 1,100.00            1,100.00      1,341.38      1,314.00      1,195.00      1,595.40      1,585.50 

Kirks 233574 -                  stock  90d  stock  stock  21d  5w 



Due:  08/04/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Rome Truck 
- NO BID

A&A Auto Interstate 
Power

CBM Prevost Kirks Coffman Neopart Vehicle 
Maintenance

Crossline Mohawk Gillig Muncie Hydraulic 
Electric

Aftermarket 
Parts

Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 421971

                                    3 60790 561.48                  561.48         665.99      1,137.99 

Muncie 233578 -                  stock  8w 
 bid week 

late 

                                    1 60792 212.29                  212.29 

Eldorado 233571 -                  6w 

                                    6 81444 59.40                    109.23           74.80           59.40           75.56           77.00           84.30 

Mohawk 233568 -                  stock  6w  stock  stock  60d  stock 

                                    5 81498 696.55                  696.55         729.00         859.55         826.22         859.25 

Coffman 233566 -                  stock  stock  3w  30d  5w 

                                    7 81519 65.00                      65.00           92.33         106.13           90.84           80.14           87.48         114.83 

Kirks 233574 -                  stock  90d  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                 10 81521 17.53                      22.19           22.31           28.00           21.39           18.90           17.53           21.29           31.36           23.48           27.99 

Vehicle Maintenance 233569 -                  4w  10d  30d  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                    5 81533 12.69                      48.29           17.17           12.69           13.99           30.58 

Mohawk 233568 -                  90d  stock  2w  stock  stock 

                                    1 810000 46.14                      46.14 

Eldorado 233571 -                  stock 

                                    3 810007 419.85                  439.39         419.85         514.25 

Aftermarket Parts 233570 -                  stock  stock 
 bid week 

late 

                                    1 810013 2,755.98            2,755.98 

Coffman 233566 -                  90d 

                                    3 1210009 39.79                      39.79           47.15           49.46 

Coffman 233566 -                  stock  30d  9w 

                                    5 810017 65.00                      65.00           68.64           84.03           89.99           75.09 

Coffman 233566 -                 
 unapproved 

part  stock  4w  stock  stock 



Due:  08/04/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Rome Truck 
- NO BID

A&A Auto Interstate 
Power

CBM Prevost Kirks Coffman Neopart Vehicle 
Maintenance

Crossline Mohawk Gillig Muncie Hydraulic 
Electric

Aftermarket 
Parts

Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 421971

                                    3 610014 14.80                      16.24           14.80           19.35 

Muncie 233578 -                  stock  stock  stock 

                                    1 610017 293.79                  293.79 

Eldorado 233571 -                  stock 

                                    1 610020 363.80                  363.80 

Eldorado 233571 -                  8w 

                                    1 1210016 1,978.67            1,978.67    

Aftermarket Parts 233570 -                  18w 
 bid week 

late 

                                    5 810030 1.39                           2.60             4.88             1.39             3.02             3.07 

Coffman 233566 -                  stock 
 bid 23, 
need 30 

 unapproved 
part  stock  stock 

                                    8 610026 90.00                    146.66         131.00         349.33         165.84         164.00         175.94           90.00         126.55 

Hydraulic Electric 233579 -                  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock  stock 

                                    5 1010015 989.00                  989.00      1,586.86      1,145.00      1,045.25      1,931.60 

Kirks 233574 -                  stock  stock  10d  stock  stock 

                                    3 1010016 2,620.67            2,620.67      3,200.99      3,186.18 

Coffman 233566 -                  stock  21d  9w 

                                    8 610028 21.50                      21.50           32.00           46.64           59.95           26.54           80.15           57.34           90.58 

Coffman 233566 -                 
 unapproved 

part 
 unapproved 

part  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock  stock  stock 

                                    5 610031 32.28                      42.98           32.28           40.61           35.77           38.17 

Coffman 233566 -                  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock  stock 

                                    4 610033 632.00                  632.00         789.45         948.94         970.72 

Kirks 233574 -                  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part  5w 

                                    3 810045 595.00                  800.06         595.00         629.77 

Crossline 233577 -                  stock  stock  7w 



Due:  08/04/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Rome Truck 
- NO BID

A&A Auto Interstate 
Power

CBM Prevost Kirks Coffman Neopart Vehicle 
Maintenance

Crossline Mohawk Gillig Muncie Hydraulic 
Electric

Aftermarket 
Parts

Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 421971

                                    3 810049 120.49                  120.49         141.30         150.06 

Coffman 233566 -                  stock  stock  5w 

                                    6 610053 17.52                      28.78           28.92           17.52           27.60           24.00           35.11 

Mohawk 233568 -                  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                    2 810064 5,052.93            5,379.40      5,052.93 

Aftermarket Parts 233570 -                  90d  9w 

                                    7 610058 48.86                      97.05         116.49         104.50           48.86           98.30         125.75         310.77 

CBM 233573 -                  stock  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock  21d  stock 

                                    3 810078 435.02                  435.02         507.95         550.22 

Coffman 233566 -                  stock  21d  9w 

                                    5 1010030 86.01                    109.03           94.00           86.01         106.60         125.62 

Crossline 233577 -                  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock  stock 

                                    6 1010032 65.00                    127.38           79.65           65.00           66.43         121.21         147.87 

Crossline 233577 -                  stock  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock  6w 

                                     - 1210051 -                 

-                 

                                    6 810098 275.95                  275.95         299.60         280.00         353.87         329.55         331.97 

Coffman 233566 -                  stock  stock  stock  stock  30d  stock 

                                    4 810101 229.66                  241.98         268.68         229.66         291.10 

Muncie 233578 -                  stock  4w  stock  6w 

                                    4 810125 40.80                    114.14           40.80         123.45         126.95 

Coffman 233566 -                  stock 
 unapproved 

part  30d  stock 

                                    1 1110002 93.81                      93.81 

Eldorado 233571 -                  stock 



Due:  08/04/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Rome Truck 
- NO BID

A&A Auto Interstate 
Power

CBM Prevost Kirks Coffman Neopart Vehicle 
Maintenance

Crossline Mohawk Gillig Muncie Hydraulic 
Electric

Aftermarket 
Parts

Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 421971

                                    3 810130 435.02                  435.02         514.60         547.09 

Coffman 233566 -                  stock  30d  9w 

                                    2 1010042 410.75                  410.75         496.64 

Coffman 233566 -                  90d  9w 

                                    4 610080 99.00                      99.00         156.96         192.92         188.14 

Coffman 233566 -                 
 unapproved 

part  stock  30d  5w 

                                    5 810155 200.00                  317.96         244.00         344.65         200.00         356.60 

Hydraulic Electric 233579 -                  stock  stock  100d  stock  stock 

                                    3 810177 11.22                      11.22           12.19           14.28 

Coffman 233566 -                  stock  30d  7w 

                                    1 610087 11,139.57       11,139.57 

Eldorado 233571 -                  stock 

                                    4 610098 2.45                           2.53             2.45             2.52             5.26 

Muncie 233578 -                  2w  stock  stock 
 bid week 

late 

                                    4 810204 1,350.00            1,350.00      1,705.80      1,879.99      1,602.21 

Kirks 233574 -                  stock  stock  30d  5w 

                                    1 610102 1,479.92            1,479.92 

Eldorado 233571 -                  stock 

                                    2 810211 2,936.15            2,936.15      3,834.08 

Coffman 233566 -                  90d  9w 

                                    3 1010052 103.40                  103.40         123.15         124.14 

Coffman 233566 -                  stock  30d  9w 

                                    3 1010055 103.40                  103.40         123.15         125.57 

Coffman 233566 -                  stock  30d  14w 



Due:  08/04/22

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Rome Truck 
- NO BID

A&A Auto Interstate 
Power

CBM Prevost Kirks Coffman Neopart Vehicle 
Maintenance

Crossline Mohawk Gillig Muncie Hydraulic 
Electric

Aftermarket 
Parts

Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 421971

                                    2 810229 15.19                      15.19           18.45 

Coffman 233566 -                  stock  7w 

                                    4 810234 246.30                  246.30         247.00         265.99         269.09 

Coffman 233566 -                  stock  stock  stock  7w 

                                    3 810237 31.91                      31.91           34.50           35.81 

Coffman 233566 -                  stock  30d  5w 

                                    6 810271 21.00                      21.00           34.49           84.39           35.45           93.85           96.44 

A&A Auto 233572 -                  3w  stock  stock  stock  30d  8w 

                                    5 810276 1,100.00            1,676.61      1,397.00      2,319.88      1,100.00      3,138.79 

Hydraulic Electric 233579 -                  stock  stock  30d  stock  6w 

                                    4 810365 29.15                      56.51           29.15           64.95           65.50 

Coffman 233566 -                  stock 
 unapproved 

part  30d  stock 

                                     - 1010101 -                 

-                 


	421971

